Bid Tab for Bid# 5788

Quote (18463) IMS GROUP INC (18729) DL STEINER INC (13637) SQUARE D C (06506) MGI INC
Info: <Quote: 00001306> <Quote: 00001307> <Quote: 00001308> <Quote: 00001309>

Item Info: Deliv Days: 10 Deliv Days: 180
Electrical Journeyma [2BO] $75.00 $85.00 $95.00 $75.00
<1.000> $30,000.00 $34,000.00 $38,000.00 $30,000.00
HR 400.0

Electrical Helper [2BO] $65.00 $85.00 $95.00 $50.00
<2.000> $26,000.00 $34,000.00 $38,000.00 $20,000.00
HR 400.0 .
8:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m [2BO] $85.00 $128.00 $95.00 $75.00
<3.000> $1,020.00 $1,536.00 $1,140.00 $900.00
HR 12.0

5:00 p.m. - 8:00 a.m [2BO] $128.00 $128.00 $145.00 $112.50
<4.000> $1,536.00 $1,536.00 $1,740.00 $1,350.00
HR 12.0

Saturday, Sunday, or [2BO $170.00 $170.00 $190.00 $112.50
<5.000> $1,360.00 $1,360.00 $1,520.00 $900.00
HR 8.0

8:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m [2BO] $75.00 $128.00 $95.00 $50.00
<6.000> $900.00 $1,536.00 $1,140.00 $600.00
HR 12.0 .
5:00 p.m. - 8:00 a.m [2BO] $113.00 $128.00 $145.00 $75.00
<7.000> $2,712.00 $3,072.00 $3,480.00 $1,800.00
HR 24.0

Saturday, Sunday or [2BO $150.00 $170.00 $190.00 $75.00
<8.000> $1,200.00 $1,360.00 $1,520.00 $600.00
HR 8.0

Oil Sampling Testing [2BO] $185.00 $290.00 No Bid $150.00
<9.000> $4,625.00 $7,250.00 $3,750.00
EA 25.0 NB * Tie




Bid Tab for Bid# 5788

Quote  (18463) IMS GROUP INC (18729) DL STEINER INC (13637) SQUARE D C (06506) MGI INC
Info: <Quote: 00001306> <Quote: 00001307> <Quote: 00001308> <Quote: 00001309>
Item Info: Deliv Days: 10 Deliv Days: 180
Infrared Inspection [2BO] $100.00 $90.00 No Bid $150.00
<10.000> $8,000.00 $7,200.00 $12,000.00
HR 80.0 NB
Harmonic Analysis [2BO] $95.00 $95.00 No Bid $250.00
<11.000> $9,500.00 $9,500.00 $25,000.00
HR 100.0 * Tie * Tie NB
Totals: Net $ Total: $86,853.00 $102,350.00 $86,540.00 $96,900.00
$ Discount: $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
$ Awarded: $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Eval Codes: NI

"Evaluation Code Descriptions:

* = Low Item Price or Low Quote Total

NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All ltems

No Bid Quotes:

Quote: 00001305 Vendor: A&E ELECTRIC CO INC
Quote: 00001304 Vendor: CONTROLLED POWER CO
Quote: 00001303 Vendor: PADGETT SWANN MACHINERY CO INC

Quote: 00001302 Vendor: DELGADO ELECTRIC COMPANY
Quote: 00001301 Vendor: ELECTRIC MACHINERY DIVSION
Quote: 00001300 Vendor: BLACKWELDER & ASSOCIATES




Bid Tab for Bid# 5788

Quote (17028) CUTLER-HAM (00420) MERCER TES
Info: <Quote: 00001310> <Quote: 00001311>

Item Info: Deliv Days: 2 Deliv Days: 1
Electrical Journeyma [2BO] $105.00 $65.00
<1.000> $42,000.00 $26,000.00
HR 400.0 .
Electrical Helper [2BO] $65.00 $55.00
<2.000> $26,000.00 $22,000.00
HR 400.0

8:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m [2BO] $157.50 $65.00
<3.000> $1,890.00 $780.00
HR 12.0 *
5:00 p.m. - 8:00 a.m [2BO] $157.50 $85.00
<4.000> $1,890.00 $1,020.00
HR 12.0 x
Saturday, Sunday, or [2BO $210.00 $85.00
<5.000> $1,680.00 $680.00
HR 8.0 *
8:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m [2BO] $97.50 $55.00
<6.000> $1,170.00 $660.00
HR 12.0

5:00 p.m. - 8:00 a.m [2BO] $97.50 $65.00
<7.000> $2,340.00 $1,560.00
HR 24.0 .
Saturday, Sunday or [2BO $130.00 $65.00
<8.000> $1,040.00 $520.00
HR 8.0 x
Oil Sampling Testing [2BO] $150.00 $250.00
<9.000> $3,750.00 $6,250.00

EA 25.0

* Tie




Bid Tab for Bid# 5788

Quote (17028) CUTLER-HAM (00420) MERCER TES
Info: <Quote: 00001310> <Quote: 00001311>

Item Info: Deliv Days: 2 Deliv Days: 1
Infrared Inspection [2BO] $115.00 $80.00
<10.000> $9,200.00 $6,400.00
HR 80.0 *
Harmonic Analysis [2BO] $115.00 $95.00
<11.000> $11,500.00 $9,500.00
HR 100.0 * Tie
Totals: Net $ Total: $102,460.00 $75,370.00
$ Discount: $0.00 $0.00
$ Awarded: $0.00 $0.00

Comments:




