
(00890) BEST LOCKI
<Quote: 00001138>

(01215) ANDERSON S
<Quote: 00001139>

Bid Tab for Bid# 5851

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

MFG./MODEL# Schlage [2BPO]
<1.000>

300.0EA NB

No Bid $0.95

$285.00

*

MFG./MODEL# Sargent [2BPO]
<2.000>

100.0EA NB

No Bid $0.95

$95.00

*

MFG./MODEL# Yale [2BPO]
<3.000>

100.0EA NB

No Bid $0.95

$95.00

*

MFG./MODEL# Medeco [2BPO]
<4.000>

100.0EA NB

No Bid $4.50

$450.00

*

MFG./MODEL# Best [2BPO]
<5.000>

500.0EA

$1.98

$990.00

* NB

No Bid

MFG./MODEL# Schlage [2BPO]
<6.000>

100.0EA NB

No Bid $0.95

$95.00

*

MFG./MODEL# Sargent [2BPO]
<7.000>

50.0EA NB

No Bid $0.95

$47.50

*

MFG./MODEL# Yale [2BPO]
<8.000>

50.0EA NB

No Bid $0.95

$47.50

*

MFG./MODEL# Medeco [2BPO]
<9.000>

50.0EA NB

No Bid $4.50

$225.00

*

MFG./MODEL# Best [2BPO]
<10.000>

200.0EA

$1.98

$396.00

* NB

No Bid

Domestic [2BPO]
<11.000>

100.0EA NB

No Bid $0.95

$95.00

*



(00890) BEST LOCKI
<Quote: 00001138>

(01215) ANDERSON S
<Quote: 00001139>

Bid Tab for Bid# 5851

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

Foreign [2BPO]
<12.000>

100.0EA NB

No Bid $3.00

$300.00

*

MFG./MODEL# Schlage [2BPO]
<13.000>

50.0EA NB

No Bid $8.50

$425.00

*

MFG./MODEL# Sargent [2BPO]
<14.000>

20.0EA NB

No Bid $8.50

$170.00

*

MFG./MODEL# Yale [2BPO]
<15.000>

20.0EA NB

No Bid $8.50

$170.00

*

MFG./MODEL# Medeco [2BPO]
<16.000>

20.0EA NB

No Bid $15.50

$310.00

*

MFG./MODEL# Best [2BPO]
<17.000>

50.0EA

$7.50

$375.00

* NB

No Bid

MFG./MODEL# Schlage [2BPO]
<18.000>

100.0EA NB

No Bid $90.50

$9,050.00

*

MFG./MODEL# Sargent [2BPO]
<19.000>

50.0EA NB

No Bid $90.50

$4,525.00

*

MFG./MODEL# Yale [2BPO]
<20.000>

50.0EA NB

No Bid $90.50

$4,525.00

*

MFG./MODEL# Medeco [2BPO]
<21.000>

50.0EA NB

No Bid $17.50

$875.00

*

MFG./MODEL# Best [2BPO]
<22.000>

200.0EA

$15.00

$3,000.00

* NB

No Bid



(00890) BEST LOCKI
<Quote: 00001138>

(01215) ANDERSON S
<Quote: 00001139>

Bid Tab for Bid# 5851

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

Change Safe  combin [2BPO]
<23.000>

30.0EA NB

No Bid $25.00

$750.00

*

Replace file Cabine [2BPO]
<24.000>

30.0EA NB

No Bid $17.50

$525.00

*

Service Call Includ [2BPO]
<25.000>

500.0JOB

$97.50

$48,750.00

$65.00

$32,500.00

*

Hourly Rate after se [2BPO]
<26.000>

25.0HR

$60.00

$1,500.00

$55.00

$1,375.00

*

Eval Codes: NI Eval Codes: NI

Totals: Net $ Total:

$ Discount:

$ Awarded:

Evaluation Code Descriptions:

NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All Items

$55,011.00

$0.00

$4,761.00

$56,935.00

$0.00

$56,935.00


