Bid Tab for Bid# 5904

Quote (18884) SAFETY COATINGS (18885) SPEEDLINER OF C (03093) PRIDE OF F (02294) FLORIDA TR (13112) ENNIS PAIN (10518) DURON PAIN
Info: <Quote: 00001249> <Quote: 00001251> <Quote: 00001252> <Quote: 00001253> <Quote: 00001255> <Quote: 00001256>

Iltem Info: Deliv Days: 21 Deliv Days: 5 Deliv Days: 3 Deliv Days: 21 Deliv Days: 30
Paint, traffic, pave [2BO] $297.00 $517.50 $242.50 $252.45 $244.75 No Bid
<1.000> 630-66-16188-4 $12,474.00 $21,735.00 $10,185.00 $10,602.90 $10,279.50
EA 42.0 * NB
Paint, traffic, pave [2BO] $313.50 $517.50 $267.50 $243.65 $235.24 No Bid
<2.000> 630-66-66160-2 $29,469.00 $48,645.00 $25,145.00 $22,903.10 $22,112.56
EA 94.0 * NB
Paint, traffic, wate [2BO] $30.00 $53.44 $28.25 $24.75 $24.99 $32.09
<3.000> 630-66-52300-0 $1,500.00 $2,672.00 $1,412.50 $1,237.50 $1,249.50 $1,604.50
EA 50.0 *
Paint, traffic, wate [2BO] $28.50 $47.25 $25.75 $26.35 $25.85 $28.20
<4.000> 630-66-66165-1 $2,850.00 $4,725.00 $2,575.00 $2,635.00 $2,585.00 $2,820.00
EA 100.0 *
Paint, traffic, wate [2BO] $32.00 $54.54 $25.45 $22.50 $21.79 $32.79
<5.000> 630-66-66175-0 $320.00 $545.40 $254.50 $225.00 $217.90 $327.90

EA 10.0




Bid Tab for Bid# 5904

Quote (18884) SAFETY COATINGS

(18885) SPEEDLINER OF C

(03093) PRIDE OF F

(02294) FLORIDA TR

(13112) ENNIS PAIN

(10518) DURON PAIN

Info: <Quote: 00001249> <Quote: 00001251> <Quote: 00001252> <Quote: 00001253> <Quote: 00001255> <Quote: 00001256>
Iltem Info: Deliv Days: 21 Deliv Days: 5 Deliv Days: 3 Deliv Days: 21 Deliv Days: 30
Paint, traffic, wate [2BO] $42.00 $54.54 $43.75 $24.75 $24.47 $34.44
<6.000> 630-66-661883 $1,050.00 $1,363.50 $1,093.75 $618.75 $611.75 $861.00
EA 25.0 *
Totals: Net $ Total: $47,663.00 $79,685.90 $40,665.75 $38,222.25 $37,056.21 $5,613.40
$ Discount: $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
$ Awarded: $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Eval Codes: NI

"Evaluation Code Descriptions:

NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All Items

No Bid Quotes:

Quote: 00001254 Vendor: MID-STAR CONSTRUCTION
Quote: 00001250 Vendor: SCOTT PAINT CORP

Quote: 00001248 Vendor: SAFETY ZONE SPECIALIST




Bid Tab for Bid# 5904

Quote (14583) CENTERLINE
Info: <Quote: 00001257>

Item Info: Deliv Days: 30

Paint, traffic, pave [2BO] $260.70
<1.000> 630-66-16188-4 $10,949.40
EA 42.0

Paint, traffic, pave [2BO] $266.75
<2.000> 630-66-66160-2 $25.074.50
EA 94.0

Paint, traffic, wate [2BO] $25.13
<3.000> 630-66-52300-0 $1.256.50
EA 50.0

Paint, traffic, wate [2BO] $224.565
<4.000> 630-66-66165-1 $22.456.50
EA 100.0

Paint, traffic, wate [2BO] $24.10
<5.000> 630-66-66175-0 $241.00

EA 10.0




Bid Tab for Bid# 5904

Quote (14583) CENTERLINE

Info: <Quote: 00001257>
Item Info: Deliv Days: 30
Paint, traffic, wate [2BO] $27.25
<6.000> 630-66-661883 $681.25
EA 25.0
Totals: Net $ Total: $60,659.15
$ Discount: $0.00
$ Awarded: $0.00

Comments:



