Bid Tab for Bid# 5961

Quote (14023) ACCENT PRI (03354) BAYPRINT (00189) XEROGRAPHI
Info: <Quote: 00001526> <Quote: 00001529> <Quote: 00001530>

Item Info:

Duplicating, collati [2BO] $0.042 $0.018 $0.0175
<1.000> $126,000.00 $54,000.00 $52,500.00
SHT 3000000.0 *
Duplicating, collati [2BO] $0.045 $0.0185 $0.0175
<2.000> $1,350.00 $555.00 $525.00
SHT 30000.0 .
Duplicating, collati [2BO] $0.045 $0.0185 $0.0175
<3.000> $22.50 $9.25 $8.75
SHT 500.0 x
Color, copy, 8-1/2" [2BO] $0.49 $0.45 $0.52
<4.000> $343.00 $315.00 $364.00
SHT 700.0 *

Color, copy, 8-1/2" [2BO] $0.69 $0.60 $0.52
<5.000> $483.00 $420.00 $364.00
SHT 700.0 x
Color, copy, 11~' x 1 [2BO] $0.99 $0.60 $0.95
<6.000> $198.00 $120.00 $190.00
EA 200.0 *

Special handling for [2BO] $55.00 $20.00 $12.00
<7.000> $11,000.00 $4,000.00 $2,400.00
HR 200.0 .
Special handling for [2BO] $55.00 $20.00 $12.00
<8.000> $11,000.00 $4,000.00 $2,400.00
HR 200.0 .
Standard Xerox Print [2BO] No Bid $0.20 $0.10
<9.000> $140.00 $70.00

EA 700.0

NB




Bid Tab for Bid# 5961

Quote (14023) ACCENT PRI (03354) BAYPRINT (00189) XEROGRAPHI
Info: <Quote: 00001526> <Quote: 00001529> <Quote: 00001530>

Item Info:

Graphics and typeset [2BC $48.00 $35.00 $35.00
<10.000> $3,360.00 $2,450.00 $2,450.00
HR 70.0 * Tie * Tie
Digital, Riso or sim [2BO] No Bid No Bid $0.02
<11.000> $40.00
EA 2000.0 NB NB *
Finishing, pad w/bac [2BO] $0.35 $0.15 $0.05
<12.000> $175.00 $75.00 $25.00
EA 500.0 *
Bindery, GBC, 1/2" [2BO] $1.25 $0.30 $1.00
<13.000> $1,250.00 $300.00 $1,000.00
EA 1000.0 *

Bindery, Coil, 1/2" [2BO] No Bid No Bid $1.25
<14.000> $1.250.00
EA 1000.0 NB NB *
Bindery, Velo, 1/2" [2BO] No Bid No Bid $1.00
<15.000> $100.00
EA 100.0 NB NB *
Bindery, Tape 1/4" [2BO] No Bid $0.75 $0.50
<16.000> $75.00 $50.00
EA 100.0 NB *
Bindery, Acco, 8-1/2 [2BO] No Bid $0.75 $0.40
<17.000> $375.00 $200.00
EA 500.0 NB *
Bindery, Acco, 2-1/2 [2BO] No Bid $0.45 $0.10
<18.000> $225.00 $50.00

EA 500.0

NB




Bid Tab for Bid# 5961

Quote (14023) ACCENT PRI (03354) BAYPRINT (00189) XEROGRAPHI
Info: <Quote: 00001526> <Quote: 00001529> <Quote: 00001530>

Item Info:
Bindery, Brass brad [2BO] No Bid $0.20 $0.06
<19.000> $20.00 $6.00
EA 100.0 NB *
Bindery, Bookmake [2BO] No Bid $0.20 $0.20
<20.000> $20.00 $20.00
EA 100.0 NB * Tie * Tie
Bindery, Channel bin [2BO] No Bid No Bid $3.00
<21.000> $300.00
EA 100.0 NB NB *
Bindery, Saddle stit [2BO] No Bid $0.20 $0.20
<22.000> $20.00 $20.00
EA 100.0 NB * Tie * Tie
Totals: Net $ Total: $155,181.50 $67,119.25 $64,332.75

$ Discount: $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

$ Awarded: $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Eval Codes: NI Eval Codes: NI

"Evaluation Code Descriptions:

* = Low ltem Price or Low Quote Total

NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All Items

No Bid Quotes:

Quote: 00001528 Vendor: COLONIAL PRESS INTERNATIONAL
Quote: 00001527 Vendor: DIXIE PRINTING OF

Quote: 00001525 Vendor: ROBERT LIVINGSTON
Quote: 00001524 Vendor: PROMOTIONAL PRODUCTS UNLIMITED
Quote: 00001523 Vendor: LASERTECH INC

Quote: 00001522 Vendor: WILDERNESS GRAPHICS INC

Quote: 00001521 Vendor: PROSCREEN
Quote: 00001520 Vendor: QUIK PROMOTIONS




