
(11369) INDUSTRIAL
<Quote: 00001761>

(03209) UNIFIRST C
<Quote: 00001762>

(02929) CINTAS COR
<Quote: 00001763>

(01268) NATIONAL U
<Quote: 00001764>

Bid Tab for Bid# 5962A

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

3~' x 4~' [2BO]
<1.000>

1.0EA

$1.95

$1.95

$2.28

$2.28

NB

No Bid $1.90

$1.90

*

3~' x 5~' [2BO]
<2.000>

1.0EA

$1.95

$1.95

$2.55

$2.55

$1.75

$1.75

*

$2.00

$2.00

3~' x 10~' [2BO]
<3.000>

1.0EA

$3.95

$3.95

$4.55

$4.55

$3.85

$3.85

*

$4.00

$4.00

4~' x 6~' [2BO]
<4.000>

1.0EA

$2.95

$2.95

*

$3.46

$3.46

$3.00

$3.00

$3.00

$3.00

3~' x 4~' [2BO]
<5.000>

1.0EA

$2.95

$2.95

*

$3.48

$3.48

NB

No Bid $3.75

$3.75

3~' x 5~' [2BO]
<6.000>

1.0EA

$2.95

$2.95

$3.75

$3.75

$2.45

$2.45

*

$3.90

$3.90

3~' x 10~' [2BO]
<7.000>

1.0EA

$4.95

$4.95

$5.73

$5.73

$4.45

$4.45

*

$7.50

$7.50

4~' x 6~' [2BO]
<8.000>

1.0EA

$3.95

$3.95

$4.68

$4.68

$3.85

$3.85

*

$5.75

$5.75

3~' x 4~' [2BO]
<9.000>

1.0EA

$3.95

$3.95

*

$4.48

$4.48

NB

No Bid $7.50

$7.50



(11369) INDUSTRIAL
<Quote: 00001761>

(03209) UNIFIRST C
<Quote: 00001762>

(02929) CINTAS COR
<Quote: 00001763>

(01268) NATIONAL U
<Quote: 00001764>

Bid Tab for Bid# 5962A

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

3~' x 5~' [2BO]
<10.000>

1.0EA

$3.95

$3.95

*

$4.75

$4.75

$4.00

$4.00

$7.80

$7.80

3~' x 10~' [2BO]
<11.000>

1.0EA

$5.95

$5.95

*

$6.73

$6.73

$7.00

$7.00

$15.00

$15.00

4~' x 6~' [2BO]
<12.000>

1.0EA

$4.95

$4.95

*

$5.67

$5.67

$5.00

$5.00

$11.50

$11.50

"Coffee Mug" Logo 3 [2BO]
<13.000>

1.0EA

$2.95

$2.95

$2.52

$2.52

$2.40

$2.40

$2.25

$2.25

*

"Welcome" mat - Prov [2BO]
<14.000>

1.0EA

$6.50

$6.50

$3.75

$3.75

$5.00

$5.00

$3.25

$3.25

*

24" [2BO]
<15.000>

1.0EA

$0.35

$0.35

*

$0.48

$0.48

$0.65

$0.65

$1.15

$1.15

30" [2BO]
<16.000>

1.0EA

$0.60

$0.60

*,Tie

$0.60

$0.60

*,Tie

$0.80

$0.80

$1.35

$1.35

42" [2BO]
<17.000>

1.0EA

$0.85

$0.85

$0.84

$0.84

*

$1.05

$1.05

$1.45

$1.45

24" [2BO]
<18.000>

1.0EA

$0.45

$0.45

*

$0.72

$0.72

$0.80

$0.80

$2.20

$2.20



(11369) INDUSTRIAL
<Quote: 00001761>

(03209) UNIFIRST C
<Quote: 00001762>

(02929) CINTAS COR
<Quote: 00001763>

(01268) NATIONAL U
<Quote: 00001764>

Bid Tab for Bid# 5962A

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

30" [2BO]
<19.000>

1.0EA

$0.70

$0.70

*

$0.90

$0.90

$0.95

$0.95

$2.65

$2.65

42" [2BO]
<20.000>

1.0EA

$0.95

$0.95

*

$1.26

$1.26

$1.30

$1.30

$2.80

$2.80

24" [2BO]
<21.000>

1.0EA

$0.70

$0.70

*

$0.88

$0.88

$2.45

$2.45

$4.40

$4.40

30" [2BO]
<22.000>

1.0EA

$0.95

$0.95

*

$1.11

$1.11

$3.75

$3.75

$5.30

$5.30

42" [2BO]
<23.000>

1.0EA

$1.20

$1.20

*

$1.55

$1.55

$4.25

$4.25

$5.60

$5.60

Eval Codes: NI

Totals: Net $ Total:

$ Discount:

$ Awarded:

Evaluation Code Descriptions:

NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All Items

$60.60

$0.00

$0.00

$66.72

$0.00

$0.00

$58.75

$0.00

$0.00

$106.00

$0.00

$0.00


