Bid Tab for Bid# 5993A

Quote (19524) BUCCANEER BLUEP

(19443) THE RIGHT EQUIP

(00738) JIFFY REPR

(02286) TAMPA REPR

Info: <Quote: 00002296> <Quote: 00002297> <Quote: 00002298> <Quote: 00002299>

Iltem Info:

Blueprints, standard [2BO] $0.27 No Bid No Bid $0.055
<1.000> $675.00 $137.50
EA 2500.0 NB NB *
Blueprints, full siz [2BO] $0.40 No Bid No Bid $0.055
<2.000> $40.00 $5.50
EA 100.0 NB NB *
Blueprint, size, 16 [2BO] $0.31 No Bid No Bid $0.055
<3.000> $620.00 $110.00
EA 2000.0 NB NB *
Blueprint, size, 15 [2BO] $0.23 No Bid No Bid $0.055
<4.000> $11.50 $2.75
EA 50.0 NB NB *
Print, size, 24" x 3 [2BO] $0.54 $0.30 $0.45 $0.065
<5.000> $1,350.00 $750.00 $1,125.00 $162.50
EA 2500.0 *
Print, full size, 30 [2BO] $0.81 $0.44 $0.72 $0.065
<6.000> $81.00 $44.00 $72.00 $6.50
EA 100.0 *
Print, size, 16" x 3 [2BO] $0.36 $0.18 $0.26 $0.065
<7.000> $720.00 $360.00 $520.00 $130.00
EA 2000.0 *
Print, size, 15 1/4 [2BO] $0.36 $0.20 $0.38 $0.065
<8.000> $18.00 $10.00 $19.00 $3.25
EA 50.0 *
Print, size 24" x 36 [2BQO] $7.50 $1.00 $5.40 $1.00
<9.000> $2,250.00 $300.00 $1,620.00 $300.00
EA 300.0 * Tie *Tie




Bid Tab for Bid# 5993A

Quote (19524) BUCCANEER BLUEP

(19443) THE RIGHT EQUIP

(00738) JIFFY REPR

(02286) TAMPA REPR

Info: <Quote: 00002296> <Quote: 00002297> <Quote: 00002298> <Quote: 00002299>
Item Info:
Print, size, 24" x 3 [2BO] $4.69 $1.10 $2.10 $0.42
<10.000> $469.00 $110.00 $210.00 $42.00
EA 100.0 *
Print, half size, 15 [2BO] $0.49 $0.30 $0.50 $0.065
<11.000> $24.50 $15.00 $25.00 $3.25
EA 50.0 .
Print, full size, 24 [2BO] $7.50 $1.00 $8.00 $1.00
<12.000> $1,500.00 $200.00 $1,600.00 $200.00
EA 200.0 * Tie * Tie
Print, full size, 24 [2BO] $5.10 $1.10 $4.00 $0.42
<13.000> $1,530.00 $330.00 $1,200.00 $126.00
EA 300.0 *
Print, full sizes, 2 [2BO] $4.80 $0.30 $2.00 $0.065
<14.000> $1,440.00 $90.00 $600.00 $19.50
EA 300.0 *
Bind, up to 150 prin [2BO] $0.25 $0.22 $0.35 $0.25
<15.000> $500.00 $440.00 $700.00 $500.00
EA 2000.0 *
Bind, over 150 print [2BO] $0.50 $1.25 $1.50 $0.75
<16.000> $25.00 $62.50 $75.00 $37.50
EA 50.0 *
Scan full size, 24" [2BO] $1.85 $5.50 $1.10 $2.25
<17.000> $2,035.00 $6,050.00 $1,210.00 $2,475.00
EA 1100.0 *
Scan to Print, Bond, [2BO] $0.80 $0.20 $0.38 $0.065
<18.000> $560.00 $140.00 $266.00 $45.50

EA 700.0




Bid Tab for Bid# 5993A

Quote (19524) BUCCANEER BLUEP

(19443) THE RIGHT EQUIP

(00738) JIFFY REPR

(02286) TAMPA REPR

Info: <Quote: 00002296> <Quote: 00002297> <Quote: 00002298> <Quote: 00002299>

Item Info:
Scan to Print, Bond, [2BO] $0.54 $0.30 $0.45 $0.065
<19.000> $918.00 $510.00 $765.00 $110.50
EA 1700.0 *
Scan to Print, Bond, [2BO] $33.75 $20.50 $15.00 $0.065
<20.000> $675.00 $410.00 $300.00 $1.30
EA 20.0 *
Scan to Print, Bond, [2BO] $0.40 $0.18 $4.30 $0.065
<21.000> $40.00 $18.00 $430.00 $6.50
EA 100.0 *
Totals: Net $ Total: $15,482.00 $9,839.50 $10,737.00 $4,425.05
$ Discount: $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
$ Awarded: $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

"Evaluation Code Descriptions:

NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All ltems

No Bid Quotes:

Quote: 00002295 Vendor: CITY BLUEPRINT CO INC
Quote: 00002294 Vendor: INTEGRITECH GROUP

Eval Codes: NI

Eval Codes: NI




