
(02783) CENTRAL OI
<Quote: 00002100>

Deliv Days: 3

(09246) J H WILLIA
<Quote: 00002101>

Deliv Days: 2

(04097) WARD OIL C
<Quote: 00002102>

Deliv Days: 3

(05873) SPARTAN OI
<Quote: 00002103>

Deliv Days: 3

Bid Tab for Bid# 5994 Oils and Lubricants

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

Multi-Purpose Gear L [2BO]
<1.000>

7.0PAIL

$24.88

$174.16

$34.65

$242.55

$25.88

$181.16

$22.75

$159.25

*

Multi-Purpose Gear L [2BO]
<2.000>

7.0PAIL

$25.23

$176.61

$35.17

$246.19

$25.88

$181.16

$24.50

$171.50

*

Multi-Purpose Gear L [2BO]
<3.000>

7.0PAIL

$25.23

$176.61

$35.17

$246.19

$25.88

$181.16

$24.50

$171.50

*

Multi-Purpose Gear L [2BO]
<4.000>

7.0PAIL

$25.94

$181.58

$34.44

$241.08

$26.29

$184.03

$24.75

$173.25

*

Multi-Purpose Gear L [2BO]
<5.000>

7.0PAIL

$26.59

$186.13

$34.72

$243.04

$26.70

$186.90

$24.75

$173.25

*

Multi-Purpose Gear L [2BO]
<6.000>

7.0PAIL

$30.63

$214.41

$34.52

$241.64

$27.94

$195.58

$25.70

$179.90

*

Turbine Oil, R & 032 [2BO]
<7.000>

5.0PAIL

$28.82

$144.10

$19.97

$99.85

*

$23.90

$119.50

$21.85

$109.25

Turbine Oil, R & 068 [2BO]
<8.000>

3.0PAIL

$28.82

$86.46

$31.26

$93.78

$23.90

$71.70

$21.85

$65.55

*

Turbine Oil, R & 100 [2BO]
<9.000>

5.0PAIL

$23.75

$118.75

$24.87

$124.35

$23.90

$119.50

$22.55

$112.75

*



(02783) CENTRAL OI
<Quote: 00002100>

Deliv Days: 3

(09246) J H WILLIA
<Quote: 00002101>

Deliv Days: 2

(04097) WARD OIL C
<Quote: 00002102>

Deliv Days: 3

(05873) SPARTAN OI
<Quote: 00002103>

Deliv Days: 3

Bid Tab for Bid# 5994

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

Turbine Oil, R & 022 [2BO]
<10.000>

65.0PAIL

$23.75

$1,543.75

$25.20

$1,638.00

$24.47

$1,590.55

$21.90

$1,423.50

*

Cylinder Oil, 460, 5 [2BO]
<11.000>

1.0DM

$422.83

$422.83

$278.30

$278.30

$267.85

$267.85

$228.25

$228.25

*

Cylinder Oil, 680, 5 [2BO]
<12.000>

1.0DM

$422.83

$422.83

$278.30

$278.30

$267.85

$267.85

$236.50

$236.50

*

Oil, gear, Spec N. I [2BO]
<13.000>

2.0PAIL

$41.94

$83.88

$34.52

$69.04

$27.94

$55.88

$25.70

$51.40

*

Oil, hydraulic, Spec [2BO]
<14.000>

4.0DM

$183.75

$735.00

$115.72

$462.88

*

$135.30

$541.20

$187.00

$748.00

Oil, hydraulic, Spec [2BO]
<15.000>

4.0PAIL

$19.82

$79.28

$15.90

$63.60

*

$16.50

$66.00

$20.75

$83.00

Oil, hydraulic, Spec [2BO]
<16.000>

4.0PAIL

$19.82

$79.28

$25.61

$102.44

$16.50

$66.00

*

$21.00

$84.00

Oil, hydraulic, Spec [2BO]
<17.000>

5.0PAIL

$19.82

$99.10

$15.90

$79.50

*

$16.50

$82.50

$21.25

$106.25

Oil, hydraulic, Spec [2BO]
<18.000>

6.0DM

$193.47

$1,160.82

$183.90

$1,103.40

$152.32

$913.92

*

$210.10

$1,260.60



(02783) CENTRAL OI
<Quote: 00002100>

Deliv Days: 3

(09246) J H WILLIA
<Quote: 00002101>

Deliv Days: 2

(04097) WARD OIL C
<Quote: 00002102>

Deliv Days: 3

(05873) SPARTAN OI
<Quote: 00002103>

Deliv Days: 3

Bid Tab for Bid# 5994

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

Oil, hydraulic, Spec [2BO]
<19.000>

2.0DM

$200.59

$401.18

$187.34

$374.68

*

$214.23

$428.46

$212.30

$424.60

Oil, hydraulic, Spec [2BO]
<20.000>

20.0PAIL

$21.73

$434.60

$20.03

$400.60

*

$23.29

$465.80

$21.50

$430.00

Oil, hydraulic and g [2BO]
<21.000>

5.0PAIL

$20.12

$100.60

$15.90

$79.50

*

$16.50

$82.50

$21.25

$106.25

Oil, lubricant, gene [2BO]
<22.000>

4.0PAIL

$30.63

$122.52

$34.52

$138.08

$27.94

$111.76

$25.70

$102.80

*

Oil, lubricant, gene [2BO]
<23.000>

4.0PAIL

$26.59

$106.36

$34.72

$138.88

$26.70

$106.80

$24.75

$99.00

*

Oil, lubricant, gene [2BO]
<24.000>

4.0PAIL

$25.94

$103.76

$34.44

$137.76

$26.29

$105.16

$24.75

$99.00

*

Oil, lubricant, gene [2BO]
<25.000>

4.0PAIL

$25.23

$100.92

$34.90

$139.60

$26.29

$105.16

$24.50

$98.00

*

Oil, gear, Spec. N I [2BO]
<26.000>

8.0PAIL

$24.59

$196.72

$34.67

$277.36

$25.88

$207.04

$23.00

$184.00

*

Oil, gear, Spec. N,  [2BO]
<27.000>

4.0PAIL

$24.88

$99.52

$34.65

$138.60

$25.88

$103.52

$22.75

$91.00

*



(02783) CENTRAL OI
<Quote: 00002100>

Deliv Days: 3

(09246) J H WILLIA
<Quote: 00002101>

Deliv Days: 2

(04097) WARD OIL C
<Quote: 00002102>

Deliv Days: 3

(05873) SPARTAN OI
<Quote: 00002103>

Deliv Days: 3

Bid Tab for Bid# 5994

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

Oil, gear, Spec N, I [2BO]
<28.000>

10.0PAIL

$25.23

$252.30

$35.17

$351.70

$25.88

$258.80

$24.50

$245.00

*

Oil, gear, Spec N, I [2BO]
<29.000>

4.0DM

$218.06

$872.24

*

$310.15

$1,240.60

$291.64

$1,166.56

$242.00

$968.00

Oil, gear, Spec N, I [2BO]
<30.000>

4.0PAIL

$25.24

$100.96

$34.90

$139.60

$26.29

$105.16

$24.50

$98.00

*

Oil, gear, Spec. N,  [2BO]
<31.000>

2.0PAIL

$25.94

$51.88

$34.44

$68.88

$26.29

$52.58

$24.75

$49.50

*

Oil, gear, Spec N, I [2BO]
<32.000>

2.0PAIL

$26.59

$53.18

$34.72

$69.44

$26.70

$53.40

$24.75

$49.50

*

Oil, motor, ISO V.G. [2BO]
<33.000>

1.0PAIL

$24.12

$24.12

$23.75

$23.75

$20.93

$20.93

*

$23.40

$23.40

Oil, motor, ISO V.G. [2BO]
<34.000>

150.0PAIL

$24.41

$3,661.50

$23.40

$3,510.00

$18.40

$2,760.00

*

$22.00

$3,300.00

Oil, hydraulic, gene [2BO]
<35.000>

2.0PAIL

$21.08

$42.16

*

$24.87

$49.74

$23.90

$47.80

$22.55

$45.10

Gear lube, ISO V.G.  [2BO]
<36.000>

7.0PAIL

$21.74

$152.18

*

$35.17

$246.19

$24.47

$171.29

$22.80

$159.60



(02783) CENTRAL OI
<Quote: 00002100>

Deliv Days: 3

(09246) J H WILLIA
<Quote: 00002101>

Deliv Days: 2

(04097) WARD OIL C
<Quote: 00002102>

Deliv Days: 3

(05873) SPARTAN OI
<Quote: 00002103>

Deliv Days: 3

Bid Tab for Bid# 5994

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

Gear lube, ISO V.G.  [2BO]
<37.000>

1.0PAIL

$25.23

$25.23

$35.17

$35.17

$25.88

$25.88

$24.50

$24.50

*

Gear oil, medium, IS [2BO]
<38.000>

1.0PAIL

$23.73

$23.73

$34.90

$34.90

$24.47

$24.47

$21.90

$21.90

*

Oil, cylinder, ISO V [2BO]
<39.000>

3.0PAIL

$31.70

$95.10

$36.27

$108.81

$27.44

$82.32

* NB

No Bid

Oil, hydraulic, ISO  [2BO]
<40.000>

1.0PAIL

$19.82

$19.82

$25.61

$25.61

$16.50

$16.50

*

$21.00

$21.00

Oil, hydraulic, ISO  [2BO]
<41.000>

22.0PAIL

$19.82

$436.04

$15.90

$349.80

$14.65

$322.30

*

$21.25

$467.50

Gear Lube, ISO V.G.  [2BO]
<42.000>

22.0PAIL

$25.24

$555.28

$34.44

$757.68

$26.29

$578.38

$24.75

$544.50

*

Lube, general, ISO V [2BO]
<43.000>

1.0PAIL

$26.59

$26.59

$34.72

$34.72

$26.70

$26.70

$24.75

$24.75

*

Grease, 1 Temp Lithi [2BO]
<44.000>

24.0TUBE

$1.18

$28.32

*

$1.39

$33.36

$1.40

$33.60

$1.33

$31.92

Transmission Fluid,  [2BO]
<45.000>

24.0QT

$1.26

$30.24

$1.42

$34.08

$1.23

$29.52

*

$1.35

$32.40



(02783) CENTRAL OI
<Quote: 00002100>

Deliv Days: 3

(09246) J H WILLIA
<Quote: 00002101>

Deliv Days: 2

(04097) WARD OIL C
<Quote: 00002102>

Deliv Days: 3

(05873) SPARTAN OI
<Quote: 00002103>

Deliv Days: 3

Bid Tab for Bid# 5994

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

Oil, White Mineral,  [2BO]
<46.000>

22.0PAIL

$35.23

$775.06

$33.84

$744.48

$33.29

$732.38

* NB

No Bid

Oil, engine, SAE 40, [2BO]
<47.000>

675.0GAL

$3.31

$2,234.25

$3.60

$2,430.00

$2.92

$1,971.00

*

$3.25

$2,193.75

Oil, engine, SAE 15W [2BO]
<48.000>

7500.0GAL

$3.39

$25,425.00

$3.30

$24,750.00

$2.97

$22,275.00

*

$3.26

$24,450.00

Transmission Fluid,  [2BO]
<49.000>

3600.0GAL

$3.29

$11,844.00

$3.20

$11,520.00

$3.12

$11,232.00

*

$3.30

$11,880.00

TranSynd - Allsion/C [2BO]
<50.000>

20.0DM NB

No Bid $1,650.00

$33,000.00

* NB

No Bid

NB

No Bid

Tractor, hydraulic f [2BO]
<51.000>

18.0DM

$252.35

$4,542.30

$209.00

$3,762.00

$185.35

$3,336.30

*

$214.50

$3,861.00

Oil, Tractor hydraul [2BO]
<52.000>

900.0GAL

$3.33

$2,997.00

$3.60

$3,240.00

$3.15

$2,835.00

*

$3.30

$2,970.00

Gear Lube, 85W-140,  [2BO]
<53.000>

26.0KG

$86.02

$2,236.52

$105.00

$2,730.00

$85.12

$2,213.12

$84.48

$2,196.48

Grease, multi-purpos [2BO]
<54.000>

900.0TUBE

$1.05

$945.00

*

$1.09

$981.00

$1.09

$981.00

$1.33

$1,197.00



(02783) CENTRAL OI
<Quote: 00002100>

Deliv Days: 3

(09246) J H WILLIA
<Quote: 00002101>

Deliv Days: 2

(04097) WARD OIL C
<Quote: 00002102>

Deliv Days: 3

(05873) SPARTAN OI
<Quote: 00002103>

Deliv Days: 3

Bid Tab for Bid# 5994

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

Grease, multi-purpos [2BO]
<55.000>

10.0DM

$447.04

$4,470.40

*

$560.00

$5,600.00

$539.46

$5,394.60

$492.00

$4,920.00

Grease, multi-purpos [2BO]
<56.000>

12.0CAN

$149.65

$1,795.80

*

$216.00

$2,592.00

$167.51

$2,010.12

$154.08

$1,848.96

Moly Grease, tubes,  [2BO]
<57.000>

300.0TUBE

$1.21

$363.00

*

$1.26

$378.00

$1.51

$453.00

$1.62

$486.00

Gear Lube, Synthetic [2BO]
<58.000>

10.0CAN

$104.88

$1,048.80

$93.19

$931.90

$87.14

$871.40

*

$94.20

$942.00

Gear Lube, Synthetic [2BO]
<59.000>

15.0CAN

$333.74

$5,006.10

$325.00

$4,875.00

$315.30

$4,729.50

$96.54

$1,448.10

*

Oil, hydraulic, Spec [2BO]
<60.000>

9000.0GAL

$2.11

$18,990.00

*

$2.40

$21,600.00

$2.19

$19,710.00

$2.40

$21,600.00



(02783) CENTRAL OI
<Quote: 00002100>

Deliv Days: 3

(09246) J H WILLIA
<Quote: 00002101>

Deliv Days: 2

(04097) WARD OIL C
<Quote: 00002102>

Deliv Days: 3

(05873) SPARTAN OI
<Quote: 00002103>

Deliv Days: 3

Bid Tab for Bid# 5994

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

Oil, motor, 10W-30,  [2BO]
<61.000>

3000.0GAL

$3.02

$9,060.00

$3.50

$10,500.00

$3.46

$10,380.00

$2.94

$8,820.00

*

Eval Codes: NI Eval Codes: NI Eval Codes: NI

Totals: Net $ Total:

$ Discount:

$ Awarded:

"Evaluation Code Descriptions:

NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All Items

No Bid Quotes:
Quote: 00002099   Vendor: AFFORDABLE FUEL OIL
Quote: 00002098   Vendor: MOTORFUELERS INC
"

$105,935.86

$0.00

$0.00

$144,427.60

$0.00

$0.00

$101,889.25

$0.00

$0.00

$102,092.21

$0.00

$0.00



(12214) TERRELL IN
<Quote: 00002104>

Deliv Days: 2

Bid Tab for Bid# 5994

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

Multi-Purpose Gear L [2BO]
<1.000>

7.0PAIL

$27.50

$192.50

Multi-Purpose Gear L [2BO]
<2.000>

7.0PAIL

$27.95

$195.65

Multi-Purpose Gear L [2BO]
<3.000>

7.0PAIL

$27.95

$195.65

Multi-Purpose Gear L [2BO]
<4.000>

7.0PAIL

$27.95

$195.65

Multi-Purpose Gear L [2BO]
<5.000>

7.0PAIL

$31.50

$220.50

Multi-Purpose Gear L [2BO]
<6.000>

7.0PAIL

$29.00

$203.00

Turbine Oil, R & 032 [2BO]
<7.000>

5.0PAIL

$25.50

$127.50

Turbine Oil, R & 068 [2BO]
<8.000>

3.0PAIL

$25.50

$76.50

Turbine Oil, R & 100 [2BO]
<9.000>

5.0PAIL

$25.75

$128.75



(12214) TERRELL IN
<Quote: 00002104>

Deliv Days: 2

Bid Tab for Bid# 5994

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

Turbine Oil, R & 022 [2BO]
<10.000>

65.0PAIL

$27.50

$1,787.50

Cylinder Oil, 460, 5 [2BO]
<11.000>

1.0DM

$265.00

$265.00

Cylinder Oil, 680, 5 [2BO]
<12.000>

1.0DM

$270.00

$270.00

Oil, gear, Spec N. I [2BO]
<13.000>

2.0PAIL

$29.00

$58.00

Oil, hydraulic, Spec [2BO]
<14.000>

4.0DM

$163.00

$652.00

Oil, hydraulic, Spec [2BO]
<15.000>

4.0PAIL

$17.75

$71.00

Oil, hydraulic, Spec [2BO]
<16.000>

4.0PAIL

$17.75

$71.00

Oil, hydraulic, Spec [2BO]
<17.000>

5.0PAIL

$17.75

$88.75

Oil, hydraulic, Spec [2BO]
<18.000>

6.0DM

$162.00

$972.00



(12214) TERRELL IN
<Quote: 00002104>

Deliv Days: 2

Bid Tab for Bid# 5994

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

Oil, hydraulic, Spec [2BO]
<19.000>

2.0DM

$230.00

$460.00

Oil, hydraulic, Spec [2BO]
<20.000>

20.0PAIL

$26.00

$520.00

Oil, hydraulic and g [2BO]
<21.000>

5.0PAIL

$17.75

$88.75

Oil, lubricant, gene [2BO]
<22.000>

4.0PAIL

$29.00

$116.00

Oil, lubricant, gene [2BO]
<23.000>

4.0PAIL

$31.50

$126.00

Oil, lubricant, gene [2BO]
<24.000>

4.0PAIL

$27.95

$111.80

Oil, lubricant, gene [2BO]
<25.000>

4.0PAIL

$31.50

$126.00

Oil, gear, Spec. N I [2BO]
<26.000>

8.0PAIL

$29.00

$232.00

Oil, gear, Spec. N,  [2BO]
<27.000>

4.0PAIL

$27.95

$111.80



(12214) TERRELL IN
<Quote: 00002104>

Deliv Days: 2

Bid Tab for Bid# 5994

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

Oil, gear, Spec N, I [2BO]
<28.000>

10.0PAIL

$27.95

$279.50

Oil, gear, Spec N, I [2BO]
<29.000>

4.0DM

$265.00

$1,060.00

Oil, gear, Spec N, I [2BO]
<30.000>

4.0PAIL

$29.50

$118.00

Oil, gear, Spec. N,  [2BO]
<31.000>

2.0PAIL

$27.95

$55.90

Oil, gear, Spec N, I [2BO]
<32.000>

2.0PAIL

$27.95

$55.90

Oil, motor, ISO V.G. [2BO]
<33.000>

1.0PAIL

$23.50

$23.50

Oil, motor, ISO V.G. [2BO]
<34.000>

150.0PAIL

$23.50

$3,525.00

Oil, hydraulic, gene [2BO]
<35.000>

2.0PAIL

$26.50

$53.00

Gear lube, ISO V.G.  [2BO]
<36.000>

7.0PAIL

$26.50

$185.50



(12214) TERRELL IN
<Quote: 00002104>

Deliv Days: 2

Bid Tab for Bid# 5994

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

Gear lube, ISO V.G.  [2BO]
<37.000>

1.0PAIL

$27.95

$27.95

Gear oil, medium, IS [2BO]
<38.000>

1.0PAIL

$28.75

$28.75

Oil, cylinder, ISO V [2BO]
<39.000>

3.0PAIL

$34.50

$103.50

Oil, hydraulic, ISO  [2BO]
<40.000>

1.0PAIL

$17.75

$17.75

Oil, hydraulic, ISO  [2BO]
<41.000>

22.0PAIL

$17.75

$390.50

Gear Lube, ISO V.G.  [2BO]
<42.000>

22.0PAIL

$27.95

$614.90

Lube, general, ISO V [2BO]
<43.000>

1.0PAIL

$28.50

$28.50

Grease, 1 Temp Lithi [2BO]
<44.000>

24.0TUBE

$1.50

$36.00

Transmission Fluid,  [2BO]
<45.000>

24.0QT

$1.61

$38.64



(12214) TERRELL IN
<Quote: 00002104>

Deliv Days: 2

Bid Tab for Bid# 5994

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

Oil, White Mineral,  [2BO]
<46.000>

22.0PAIL

$39.00

$858.00

Oil, engine, SAE 40, [2BO]
<47.000>

675.0GAL

$3.35

$2,261.25

Oil, engine, SAE 15W [2BO]
<48.000>

7500.0GAL

$3.10

$23,250.00

Transmission Fluid,  [2BO]
<49.000>

3600.0GAL

$3.35

$12,060.00

TranSynd - Allsion/C [2BO]
<50.000>

20.0DM NB

No Bid

Tractor, hydraulic f [2BO]
<51.000>

18.0DM

$238.00

$4,284.00

Oil, Tractor hydraul [2BO]
<52.000>

900.0GAL

$3.59

$3,231.00

Gear Lube, 85W-140,  [2BO]
<53.000>

26.0KG

$79.00

$2,054.00

*

Grease, multi-purpos [2BO]
<54.000>

900.0TUBE

$1.50

$1,350.00



(12214) TERRELL IN
<Quote: 00002104>

Deliv Days: 2

Bid Tab for Bid# 5994

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

Grease, multi-purpos [2BO]
<55.000>

10.0DM

$585.00

$5,850.00

Grease, multi-purpos [2BO]
<56.000>

12.0CAN

$187.00

$2,244.00

Moly Grease, tubes,  [2BO]
<57.000>

300.0TUBE

$1.71

$513.00

Gear Lube, Synthetic [2BO]
<58.000>

10.0CAN

$97.00

$970.00

Gear Lube, Synthetic [2BO]
<59.000>

15.0CAN

$105.00

$1,575.00

Oil, hydraulic, Spec [2BO]
<60.000>

9000.0GAL

$2.39

$21,510.00



(12214) TERRELL IN
<Quote: 00002104>

Deliv Days: 2

Bid Tab for Bid# 5994

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

Oil, motor, 10W-30,  [2BO]
<61.000>

3000.0GAL

$3.50

$10,500.00

Eval Codes: NI

Totals: Net $ Total:

$ Discount:

$ Awarded:

Evaluation Code Descriptions:

NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All Items

$106,816.34

$0.00

$0.00


