
(17268) JSS PROPER
<Quote: 00002000>

Deliv Days: 210

(16088) CADSTRUCT
<Quote: 00002001>

Deliv Days: 210

(01850) COX CONSTR
<Quote: 00002002>

Deliv Days: 180

(13533) HUFFMAN FI
<Quote: 00002003>

Bid Tab for Bid# 5999-1

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

Construction of addi [2BO]
<1.000>

1.0JOB

$506,751.00

$506,751.00

$539,094.00

$539,094.00

$514,000.00

$514,000.00

$553,000.00

$553,000.00

Unforseen Condition  [2BO]
<2.000>

1.0JOB

$20,000.00

$20,000.00

*,Tie

$20,000.00

$20,000.00

*,Tie

$20,000.00

$20,000.00

*,Tie

$20,000.00

$20,000.00

*,Tie

Permit Allowance [2BO]
<3.000>

1.0JOB

$5,000.00

$5,000.00

*,Tie

$5,000.00

$5,000.00

*,Tie

$5,000.00

$5,000.00

*,Tie

$5,000.00

$5,000.00

*,Tie

Alternate No. 1 Rem [2BO]
<4.000>

1.0JOB

$11,873.00

$11,873.00

$9,537.00

$9,537.00

$10,750.00

$10,750.00

$8,254.00

$8,254.00

Alternate No. 2  Ne [2BO]
<5.000>

1.0JOB

$23,987.00

$23,987.00

$28,628.00

$28,628.00

$34,100.00

$34,100.00

$14,100.00

$14,100.00

*

Alternate No. 3  Fi [2BO]
<6.000>

1.0EA NB

No Bid $35,900.00

$35,900.00

$19,650.00

$19,650.00

$11,000.00

$11,000.00

*

Alternate No.4   Fi [2BO]
<7.000>

1.0EA NB

No Bid $300.00

$300.00

$1,150.00

$1,150.00

$300.00

$300.00

Eval Codes: NI

Totals: Net $ Total:

$ Discount:

$ Awarded:

"Evaluation Code Descriptions:

NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All Items

No Bid Quotes:
Quote: 00002018   Vendor: NEW MILLENNIUM CONST., INC
Quote: 00002017   Vendor: AQUAMARINE SWIMMING POOL CO
Quote: 00002016   Vendor: LECHASE CONSTRUCTION SERVICES
Quote: 00002015   Vendor: TRIAD CONSTRUCTION SVS INC
Quote: 00002014   Vendor: PROJECT DEVELOPMENT GROUP INC
Quote: 00002013   Vendor: TFR ENTERPRISES INC
Quote: 00002012   Vendor: BAYSIDE DESIGNS INC
Quote: 00002011   Vendor: CARL HANKINS INC
"

$567,611.00

$0.00

$0.00

$638,459.00

$0.00

$0.00

$604,650.00

$0.00

$0.00

$611,654.00

$0.00

$0.00



(13851) CEM ENTERP
<Quote: 00002004>

Deliv Days: 210

(00272) EVELAND BR
<Quote: 00002005>

Deliv Days: 210

(19043) GLE CONSTRUCTIO
<Quote: 00002006>

Deliv Days: 210

(11877) DAVIS CONS
<Quote: 00002007>

Deliv Days: 210

Bid Tab for Bid# 5999-1

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

Construction of addi [2BO]
<1.000>

1.0JOB

$555,000.00

$555,000.00

$478,000.00

$478,000.00

*

$575,491.00

$575,491.00

$510,251.00

$510,251.00

Unforseen Condition  [2BO]
<2.000>

1.0JOB

$20,000.00

$20,000.00

*,Tie

$20,000.00

$20,000.00

*,Tie

$20,000.00

$20,000.00

*,Tie

$20,000.00

$20,000.00

*,Tie

Permit Allowance [2BO]
<3.000>

1.0JOB

$5,000.00

$5,000.00

*,Tie

$5,000.00

$5,000.00

*,Tie

$5,000.00

$5,000.00

*,Tie

$5,000.00

$5,000.00

*,Tie

Alternate No. 1 Rem [2BO]
<4.000>

1.0JOB

$10,800.00

$10,800.00

$10,420.00

$10,420.00

$19,738.00

$19,738.00

$13,028.00

$13,028.00

Alternate No. 2  Ne [2BO]
<5.000>

1.0JOB

$25,000.00

$25,000.00

$35,000.00

$35,000.00

$52,197.00

$52,197.00

$33,475.00

$33,475.00

Alternate No. 3  Fi [2BO]
<6.000>

1.0EA

$20,000.00

$20,000.00

$53,050.00

$53,050.00

$43,000.00

$43,000.00

$38,513.00

$38,513.00

Alternate No.4   Fi [2BO]
<7.000>

1.0EA

$1,200.00

$1,200.00

$275.00

$275.00

*

$3,000.00

$3,000.00

$307.00

$307.00

Totals: Net $ Total:

$ Discount:

$ Awarded:

Comments:

$637,000.00

$0.00

$0.00

$601,745.00

$0.00

$0.00

$718,426.00

$0.00

$0.00

$620,574.00

$0.00

$0.00



(03249) LINCOLN CO
<Quote: 00002008>

Deliv Days: 180

(19205) BUILDCON SERVIC
<Quote: 00002009>

Deliv Days: 180

(09265) ANGELL CON
<Quote: 00002010>

Deliv Days: 210

Bid Tab for Bid# 5999-1

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

Construction of addi [2BO]
<1.000>

1.0JOB

$486,900.00

$486,900.00

$558,000.00

$558,000.00

$546,540.00

$546,540.00

Unforseen Condition  [2BO]
<2.000>

1.0JOB

$20,000.00

$20,000.00

*,Tie

$20,000.00

$20,000.00

*,Tie

$20,000.00

$20,000.00

*,Tie

Permit Allowance [2BO]
<3.000>

1.0JOB

$5,000.00

$5,000.00

*,Tie

$5,000.00

$5,000.00

*,Tie

$5,000.00

$5,000.00

*,Tie

Alternate No. 1 Rem [2BO]
<4.000>

1.0JOB

$10,333.00

$10,333.00

$7,000.00

$7,000.00

*

$10,914.65

$10,914.65

Alternate No. 2  Ne [2BO]
<5.000>

1.0JOB

$27,360.00

$27,360.00

$30,000.00

$30,000.00

$32,236.83

$32,236.83

Alternate No. 3  Fi [2BO]
<6.000>

1.0EA

$21,762.00

$21,762.00

$20,000.00

$20,000.00

$56,612.20

$56,612.20

Alternate No.4   Fi [2BO]
<7.000>

1.0EA

$300.00

$300.00

$300.00

$300.00

$862.50

$862.50

Totals: Net $ Total:

$ Discount:

$ Awarded:

Comments:

$571,655.00

$0.00

$0.00

$640,300.00

$0.00

$0.00

$672,166.18

$0.00

$0.00


