
(10401) TOMS SOD S
<Quote: 00002121>

(00525) MCCOY SOD
<Quote: 00002122>

Deliv Days: 1

(19445) SUNBELT SOD AND
<Quote: 00002123>0

Bid Tab for Bid# 6017A Sod

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

Argentine Bahia  P [2BO]
<1.000>

45000.0SQFT

$0.13

$5,850.00

$0.17

$7,650.00

$0.12

$5,400.00

*

Bermuda "328" Tifgre [2BO]
<2.000>

5000.0SQFT NB

No Bid $0.42

$2,100.00

$0.36

$1,800.00

*

Bermuda "419" Tifway [2BO]
<3.000>

12000.0SQFT

$0.22

$2,640.00

$0.30

$3,600.00

$0.20

$2,400.00

*

Bitter Blue  Price [2BO]
<4.000>

500.0SQFT

$0.28

$140.00

*

$0.34

$170.00

$0.30

$150.00

Floratam, Muck Grown [2BO]
<5.000>

8000.0SQFT

$0.24

$1,920.00

$0.30

$2,400.00

$0.19

$1,520.00

*

Floratam, sand grown [2BO]
<6.000>

32000.0SQFT

$0.22

$7,040.00

$0.32

$10,240.00

$0.19

$6,080.00

*

Pursley "Seville"   [2BO]
<7.000>

6000.0SQFT

$0.38

$2,280.00

$0.38

$2,280.00

$0.26

$1,560.00

*

St Augustine "Sevill [2BO]
<8.000>

7000.0SQFT

$0.38

$2,660.00

$0.38

$2,660.00

$0.26

$1,820.00

*

St Augustine, sand g [2BO]
<9.000>

19000.0SQFT

$0.22

$4,180.00

$0.32

$6,080.00

$0.19

$3,610.00

*



(10401) TOMS SOD S
<Quote: 00002121>

(00525) MCCOY SOD
<Quote: 00002122>

Deliv Days: 1

(19445) SUNBELT SOD AND
<Quote: 00002123>0

Bid Tab for Bid# 6017A

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

Bermuda "419" Tifway [2BO]
<10.000>

10000.0SQFT

$0.22

$2,200.00

*

$0.36

$3,600.00

$0.28

$2,800.00

Argentine Bahia  P [2BO]
<11.000>

100000.0SQFT

$0.12

$12,000.00

*

$0.17

$17,000.00

NB

No Bid

Bermuda "328" Tifgre [2BO]
<12.000>

500.0SQFT NB

No Bid $0.40

$200.00

* NB

No Bid

Bermuda "419" Tifway [2BO]
<13.000>

1500.0SQFT

$0.20

$300.00

*

$0.32

$480.00

NB

No Bid

Bitter Blue  Price [2BO]
<14.000>

4000.0SQFT

$0.24

$960.00

*

$0.32

$1,280.00

NB

No Bid

Floratam, Muck Grown [2BO]
<15.000>

18000.0SQFT

$0.22

$3,960.00

*

$0.28

$5,040.00

NB

No Bid

Floratam, sand grown [2BO]
<16.000>

65000.0SQFT

$0.20

$13,000.00

*

$0.32

$20,800.00

NB

No Bid

Pursley "Seville"   [2BO]
<17.000>

6000.0SQFT

$0.37

$2,220.00

$0.34

$2,040.00

* NB

No Bid

St Augustine "Sevill [2BO]
<18.000>

7000.0SQFT

$0.37

$2,590.00

$0.34

$2,380.00

* NB

No Bid



(10401) TOMS SOD S
<Quote: 00002121>

(00525) MCCOY SOD
<Quote: 00002122>

Deliv Days: 1

(19445) SUNBELT SOD AND
<Quote: 00002123>0

Bid Tab for Bid# 6017A

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

St Augustine, sand g [2BO]
<19.000>

7000.0SQFT

$0.20

$1,400.00

*

$0.32

$2,240.00

NB

No Bid

Argentine Bahia [2BO]
<20.000>

200000.0SQFT

$0.16

$32,000.00

$0.20

$40,000.00

$0.135

$27,000.00

*

Bermuda "328" Tifgre [2BO]
<21.000>

5000.0SQFT NB

No Bid $0.50

$2,500.00

$0.41

$2,050.00

*

Burmuda "419" Tifway [2BO]
<22.000>

50000.0SQFT

$0.24

$12,000.00

*,Tie

$0.40

$20,000.00

$0.24

$12,000.00

*,Tie

Bitter Blue [2BO]
<23.000>

30000.0SQFT

$0.26

$7,800.00

*

$0.37

$11,100.00

$0.27

$8,100.00

Floratam, Muck Grown [2BO]
<24.000>

20000.0SQFT

$0.26

$5,200.00

*,Tie

$0.32

$6,400.00

$0.26

$5,200.00

*,Tie

Floratam, sand grown [2BO]
<25.000>

70000.0SQFT

$0.26

$18,200.00

$0.34

$23,800.00

$0.25

$17,500.00

*

Pursley "Seville" [2BO]
<26.000>

7000.0SQFT

$0.50

$3,500.00

$0.40

$2,800.00

$0.265

$1,855.00

*

St Augustine "Sevill [2BO]
<27.000>

10000.0SQFT

$0.50

$5,000.00

$0.40

$4,000.00

$0.265

$2,650.00

*



(10401) TOMS SOD S
<Quote: 00002121>

(00525) MCCOY SOD
<Quote: 00002122>

Deliv Days: 1

(19445) SUNBELT SOD AND
<Quote: 00002123>0

Bid Tab for Bid# 6017A

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

St Augustine, sand g [2BO]
<28.000>

60000.0SQFT

$0.26

$15,600.00

$0.34

$20,400.00

$0.25

$15,000.00

*

5,000 - 10,000 Squar [2BO]
<29.000>

30000.0SQFT

$0.125

$3,750.00

*

$0.18

$5,400.00

$0.145

$4,350.00

Over 10,000 Square F [2BO]
<30.000>

100000.0SQFT

$0.115

$11,500.00

*

$0.15

$15,000.00

$0.14

$14,000.00

5,000 - 10,000 Squar [2BO]
<31.000>

30000.0SQFT

$0.01

$300.00

*

$0.03

$900.00

$0.02

$600.00

Over 10,000 Square F [2BO]
<32.000>

100000.0SQFT

$0.01

$1,000.00

*,Tie

$0.02

$2,000.00

$0.01

$1,000.00

*,Tie



(10401) TOMS SOD S
<Quote: 00002121>

(00525) MCCOY SOD
<Quote: 00002122>

Deliv Days: 1

(19445) SUNBELT SOD AND
<Quote: 00002123>0

Bid Tab for Bid# 6017A

Item Info:

Quote
Info:

Minimum 10 Cubic Yar [2BO]
<33.000>

100.0CUYD

$35.00

$3,500.00

*

$250.00

$25,000.00

NB

No Bid

Eval Codes: NI Eval Codes: NI

Totals: Net $ Total:

$ Discount:

$ Awarded:

"Evaluation Code Descriptions:

NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All Items

No Bid Quotes:
Quote: 00002120   Vendor: SOUTH FLORIDA GRASSING INC
"

$184,690.00

$0.00

$0.00

$271,540.00

$0.00

$0.00

$138,445.00

$0.00

$0.00


