Bid Tab for Bid# 6032

Quote (00791) INTERIOR D (19529) WATSON FURNITUR (19530) XYBIX SYSTEMS (19531) ORBACOM SYSTEMS
Info: <Quote: 00002226> <Quote: 00002225> <Quote: 00002227> <Quote: 00002228>

Iltem Info: Deliv Days: 45 Deliv Days: 30 Deliv Days: 100
Emergency Calltaker, [2BO $5,300.54 $6,428.00 $8,416.83 $273,385.00
<1.000> $5,300.54 $6,428.00 $8,416.83 $273,385.00
EA 1.0 *
Emergency Calltaker, [2BO $5,300.54 $6,428.00 $8,416.83 No Bid
<2.000> $5,300.54 $6,428.00 $8,416.83
EA 1.0 * NB
Emergency Calltaker, [2BO $5,300.54 $6,428.00 $8,416.83 No Bid
<3.000> $5,300.54 $6,428.00 $8,416.83
EA 1.0 * NB
Emergency Calltaker, [2BO $5,300.54 $6,428.00 $8,416.82 No Bid
<4.000> $5,300.54 $6,428.00 $8,416.82
EA 1.0 * NB
Emergency Calltaker, [2BO $5,300.54 $6,428.00 $8,416.83 No Bid
<5.000> $5,300.54 $6,428.00 $8,416.83
EA 1.0 * NB
Emergency Calltaker, [2BO $5,300.54 $6,428.00 $8,416.83 No Bid
<6.000> $5,300.54 $6,428.00 $8,416.83
EA 1.0 * NB
Emergency Calltaker, [2BO $5,300.54 $6,428.00 $8,416.83 No Bid
<7.000> $5,300.54 $6,428.00 $8,416.83
EA 1.0 * NB
Emergency Calltaker, [2BO $5,300.54 $6,428.00 $8,416.83 No Bid
<8.000> $5,300.54 $6,428.00 $8,416.83
EA 1.0 * NB
Emergency Calltaker, [2BO $6,232.00 $6,687.00 $8,416.83 No Bid
<9.000> $6,232.00 $6,687.00 $8,416.83
EA 1.0 * NB
Emergency Calltaker, [2BO $6,072.15 $6,687.00 $8,416.83 No Bid
<10.000> $6,072.15 $6,687.00 $8,416.83
EA 1.0 * NB
Emergency Calltaker, [2BO $6,054.88 $6,687.00 $8,416.83 No Bid
<11.000> $6,054.88 $6,687.00 $8,416.83

EA 1.0

NB




Bid Tab for Bid# 6032

Quote (00791) INTERIOR D (19529) WATSON FURNITUR  (19530) XYBIX SYSTEMS  (19531) ORBACOM SYSTEMS
Info: <Quote: 00002226> <Quote: 00002225> <Quote: 00002227> <Quote: 00002228>

Iltem Info: Deliv Days: 45 Deliv Days: 30 Deliv Days: 100
Supervisor - Calltak [2BO] $7,001.03 $6,687.00 $8,416.83 No Bid
<12.000> $7,001.03 $6,687.00 $8,416.83
EA 1.0 * NB
Emergency Radio Disp [2B( $7,292.21 $6,975.00 $8,416.83 No Bid
<13.000> $7,292.21 $6,975.00 $8,416.83
EA 1.0 * NB
Emergency Radio Disp [2B¢ $7,782.13 $7,901.00 $8,416.83 No Bid
<14.000> $7,782.13 $7,901.00 $8,416.83
EA 1.0 * NB
Emergency Radio Disp [2B¢ $6,033.03 $7,448.00 $9,449.33 No Bid
<15.000> $6,033.03 $7,448.00 $9,449.33
EA 1.0 * NB
Emergency Radio Disp [2B( $7,578.65 $7,015.00 $9,449.33 No Bid
<16.000> $7,578.65 $7,015.00 $9,449.33
EA 1.0 * NB
Emergency Radio Disp [2B¢ $7,702.21 $7,326.00 $9,449.33 No Bid
<17.000> $7,702.21 $7,326.00 $9,449.33
EA 1.0 * NB
Emergency Radio Disp [2B( $7,522.49 $7,326.00 $9,449.33 No Bid
<18.000> $7,522.49 $7,326.00 $9,449.33
EA 1.0 * NB
Emergency Radio Disp [2B¢ $8,107.29 $7,870.00 $9,449.33 No Bid
<19.000> $8,107.29 $7,870.00 $9,449.33
EA 1.0 * NB
Emergency Radio Disp [2B¢ $8,818.14 $8,640.00 $9,449.33 No Bid
<20.000> $8,818.14 $8,640.00 $9,449.33
EA 1.0 * NB
Supervisor - Radio D [2BO] $7,052.00 $7,277.00 $9,449.33 No Bid
<21.000> $7,052.00 $7,277.00 $9,449.33
EA 1.0 * NB
FoxTrot, Workstation [2BO] $7,557.05 $6,977.00 $9,449.33 No Bid
<22.000> $7,557.05 $6,977.00 $9,449.33

EA 1.0

NB




Bid Tab for Bid# 6032

Quote (00791) INTERIOR D (19529) WATSON FURNITUR (19530) XYBIX SYSTEMS (19531) ORBACOM SYSTEMS
Info: <Quote: 00002226> <Quote: 00002225> <Quote: 00002227> <Quote: 00002228>

Iltem Info: Deliv Days: 45 Deliv Days: 30 Deliv Days: 100
Echo, Workstation # [2BO] $7,702.21 $7,870.00 $9,449.33 No Bid
<23.000> $7,702.21 $7,870.00 $9,449.33
EA 1.0 * NB
Spare, Workstation # [2BO’ $9,115.38 $7,870.00 $9,449.33 No Bid
<24.000> $9,115.38 $7,870.00 $9,449.33
EA 1.0 * NB
Supervisor - Shift, [2BO] $7,503.73 $7,601.00 $8,416.83 No Bid
<25.000> $7,503.73 $7,601.00 $8,416.83
EA 1.0 * NB
General Work Area, W [2B! $3,670.90 $4,814.00 $5,475.13 No Bid
<26.000> $3,670.90 $4,814.00 $5,475.13
EA 1.0 * NB
Work Area, Workstati [2BO $1,104.29 $2,289.00 $947.95 No Bid
<27.000> $1,104.29 $2,289.00 $947.95
EA 1.0 * NB
Supervisor Work Area [2B( $1,565.88 $1,699.00 $3,595.86 No Bid
<28.000> $1,565.88 $1,699.00 $3,595.86
EA 1.0 * NB
Supervisor Work Area [2B( $3,096.02 $5,585.00 $3,595.86 No Bid
<29.000> $3,096.02 $5,585.00 $3,595.86
EA 1.0 * NB
Supervisor Work Area [2B( $1,565.88 $2,031.00 $3,595.86 No Bid
<30.000> $1,565.88 $2,031.00 $3,595.86
EA 1.0 * NB
Supervisor Work Area [2B( $1,565.88 $2,222.00 $3,595.86 No Bid
<31.000> $1,565.88 $2,222.00 $3,595.86
EA 1.0 * NB
Supervisor Work Area [2B( $1,956.87 $2,222.00 $3,595.86 No Bid
<32.000> $1,956.87 $2,222.00 $3,595.86
EA 1.0 * NB
Supervisor Work Area [2B( $1,956.87 $926.00 $876.05 No Bid
<33.000> $1,956.87 $926.00 $876.05

EA 1.0

NB




Bid Tab for Bid# 6032

Quote (00791) INTERIOR D (19529) WATSON FURNITUR (19530) XYBIX SYSTEMS (19531) ORBACOM SYSTEMS
Info: <Quote: 00002226> <Quote: 00002225> <Quote: 00002227> <Quote: 00002228>
Iltem Info: Deliv Days: 45 Deliv Days: 30 Deliv Days: 100
Supervisor Work Area [2B( No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<34.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB NB NB
Supervisor Work Area [2B( $1,170.19 $926.00 $876.05 No Bid
<35.000> $1,170.19 $926.00 $876.05
EA 1.0 * NB
Supervisor Work Area [2B( No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<36.000>
EA 1.0 NB NB NB NB
(31) Fabric Wall Pan [2BO] $1,085.00 $1,520.00 $2,656.00 No Bid
<37.000> $1,085.00 $1,520.00 $2,656.00
EA 1.0 & NB
Demolition/Removal o [2BO $1,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
<38.000> $1,500.00
EA 1.0 €5 NB NB NB
Totals: Net $ Total: $187,768.68 $200,502.00 $249,556.22 $273,385.00
$ Discount: $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
$ Awarded: $182,468.14 $0.00 $0.00 $273,385.00
Eval Codes: NI Eval Codes: NI Eval Codes: NI Eval Codes: NI

Evaluation Code Descriptions:

NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All ltems




