Bid Tab for Bid# 6032A

Quote (19529) WATSON FURNITUR

(19530) XYBIX SYSTEMS

(19531) ORBACOM SYSTEMS

Info: <Quote: 00002321> <Quote: 00002324> <Quote: 00002325>
Item Info:
Emergency Calltaker, [2BO $6,221.00 $6,285.66 $6,101.00
<1.000> $6,221.00 $6,285.66 $6,101.00
EA 1.0 *
Emergency Calltaker, [2BO $6,221.00 $6,285.66 $6,101.00
<2.000> $6,221.00 $6,285.66 $6,101.00
EA 1.0 *
Emergency Calltaker, [2BO $6,221.00 $6,285.66 $6,435.00
<3.000> $6,221.00 $6,285.66 $6,435.00
EA 1.0 *
Emergency Calltaker, [2BO $6,221.00 $6,285.66 $6,435.00
<4.000> $6,221.00 $6,285.66 $6,435.00
EA 1.0 *
Emergency Calltaker, [2BO $6,221.00 $6,285.66 $6,101.00
<5.000> $6,221.00 $6,285.66 $6,101.00
EA 1.0 *
Emergency Calltaker, [2BO $6,221.00 $6,285.66 $6,101.00
<6.000> $6,221.00 $6,285.66 $6,101.00
EA 1.0 *
Emergency Calltaker, [2BO $6,221.00 $6,285.66 $6,435.00
<7.000> $6,221.00 $6,285.66 $6,435.00
EA 1.0 *
Emergency Calltaker, [2BO $6,221.00 $6,285.66 $6,435.00
<8.000> $6,221.00 $6,285.66 $6,435.00
EA 1.0 *
Emergency Calltaker, [2BO $6,480.00 $6,285.66 $6,484.00
<9.000> $6,480.00 $6,285.66 $6,484.00
EA 1.0 *
Emergency Calltaker, [2BO $6,480.00 $6,285.66 $6,484.00
<10.000> $6,480.00 $6,285.66 $6,484.00
EA 1.0 *
Emergency Calltaker, [2BO $6,480.00 $7,827.42 $6,484.00
<11.000> $6,480.00 $7,827.42 $6,484.00

EA 1.0




Bid Tab for Bid# 6032A

Quote (19529) WATSON FURNITUR

(19530) XYBIX SYSTEMS

(19531) ORBACOM SYSTEMS

Info: <Quote: 00002321> <Quote: 00002324> <Quote: 00002325>

Item Info:

Supervisor - Calltak [2BO] $6,480.00 $7,824.42 $7,890.00
<12.000> $6,480.00 $7,824.42 $7,890.00
EA 1.0 *

Emergency Radio Disp [2B( $6,768.00 $7,827.42 $15,395.00
<13.000> $6,768.00 $7,827.42 $15,395.00
EA 1.0 *

Emergency Radio Disp [2B( $7,694.00 $7,827.42 $7,716.00
<14.000> $7,694.00 $7,827.42 $7,716.00
EA 1.0 *

Emergency Radio Disp [2B( $7,241.00 $7,827.42 $7,716.00
<15.000> $7,241.00 $7,827.42 $7,716.00
EA 1.0 *

Emergency Radio Disp [2B( $6,808.00 $7,827.42 $7,716.00
<16.000> $6,808.00 $7,827.42 $7,716.00
EA 1.0 *

Emergency Radio Disp [2B( $7,119.00 $7,827.42 $7,700.00
<17.000> $7,119.00 $7,827.42 $7,700.00
EA 1.0 *

Emergency Radio Disp [2B( $7,119.00 $7,827.42 $7,700.00
<18.000> $7,119.00 $7,827.42 $7,700.00
EA 1.0 *

Emergency Radio Disp [2B( $7,662.00 $7,827.42 $6,422.00
<19.000> $7,662.00 $7,827.42 $6,422.00
EA 1.0 *
Emergency Radio Disp [2B( $8,432.00 $7,827.42 $6,422.00
<20.000> $8,432.00 $7,827.42 $6,422.00
EA 1.0 *
Supervisor - Radio D [2BO] $7,070.00 $7,827.42 $6,771.00
<21.000> $7,070.00 $7,827.42 $6,771.00
EA 1.0 *
FoxTrot, Workstation [2BO] $6,770.00 $7,827.42 $6,422.00
<22.000> $6,770.00 $7,827.42 $6,422.00

EA 1.0




Bid Tab for Bid# 6032A

Quote (19529) WATSON FURNITUR

(19530) XYBIX SYSTEMS

(19531) ORBACOM SYSTEMS

Info: <Quote: 00002321> <Quote: 00002324> <Quote: 00002325>
Item Info:
Echo, Workstation # [2BO] $7,662.00 $7,827.42 $6,422.00
<23.000> $7,662.00 $7,827.42 $6,422.00
EA 1.0 *
Spare, Workstation # [2BO’ $7,662.00 $7,827.42 $6,422.00
<24.000> $7,662.00 $7,827.42 $6,422.00
EA 1.0 *
Supervisor - Shift, [2BO] $7,394.00 $7,827.42 $7,890.00
<25.000> $7,394.00 $7,827.42 $7,890.00
EA 1.0 *
General Work Area, W [2B! $4,607.00 $2,888.00 $6,422.00
<26.000> $4,607.00 $2,888.00 $6,422.00
EA 1.0 *
Work Area, Workstati [2BO $2,082.00 $1,092.00 $6,422.00
<27.000> $2,082.00 $1,092.00 $6,422.00
EA 1.0 *
Supervisor Work Area [2B( $1,492.00 $1,221.65 $23,346.00
<28.000> $1,492.00 $1,221.65 $23,346.00
EA 1.0 *
Supervisor Work Area [2B( $5,377.00 $6,285.66 No Bid
<29.000> $5,377.00 $6,285.66
EA 1.0 * NB
Supervisor Work Area [2B( $1,824.00 $1,221.65 No Bid
<30.000> $1,824.00 $1,221.65
EA 1.0 * NB
Supervisor Work Area [2B( $2,015.00 $2,121.65 No Bid
<31.000> $2,015.00 $2,121.65
EA 1.0 * NB
Supervisor Work Area [2B( $2,015.00 $2,121.65 No Bid
<32.000> $2,015.00 $2,121.65
EA 1.0 * NB
Supervisor Work Area [2B( $719.00 $912.50 No Bid
<34.000> $719.00 $912.50

EA 1.0

NB




Bid Tab for Bid# 6032A

Quote (19529) WATSON FURNITUR

(19530) XYBIX SYSTEMS

(19531) ORBACOM SYSTEMS

Info: <Quote: 00002321> <Quote: 00002324> <Quote: 00002325>
Item Info:
Supervisor Work Area [2B( $719.00 $912.50 No Bid
<35.000> $719.00 $912.50
EA 1.0 * NB
(31) Fabric Wall Pan [2BO] $1,308.00 $1,519.03 $2,000.00
<37.000> $1,308.00 $1,519.03 $2,000.00
EA 1.0 *
Demolition/Removal o [2BO No Bid No Bid $2,200.00
<38.000> $2,200.00
EA 1.0 NB NB *
Totals: Net $ Total: $193,247.00 $200,561.19 $218,590.00
$ Discount: $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
$ Awarded: $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Eval Codes: NI Eval Codes: NI Eval Codes: NI

Evaluation Code Descriptions:

NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All Items




