Bid Tab for Bid# 6065

Quote (01890) OTIS ELEVA (05543) SUNRISE EL (18665) KONE ELEVATORS (10204) ABELL ELEVATOR
Info: <Quote: 00002566> <Quote: 00002568> <Quote: 00002569> <Quote: 00002570>

ltem Info: Deliv Days: 30 Deliv Days: 1 Deliv Days: 30 Deliv Days: 1
Passenger elevator, [2BO] $130.00 $160.00 $95.00 $93.00
<1.000> $1,560.00 $1,920.00 $1,140.00 $1,116.00
MO 12.0
Dumbwaiter/booklift, [2BO] $50.00 $160.00 $45.00 $69.75
<2.000> $600.00 $1,920.00 $540.00 $837.00
MO 12.0 * Tie
Dumbwaiter/booklift, [2BO] $50.00 $160.00 $45.00 $69.75
<3.000> $600.00 $1,920.00 $540.00 $837.00
MO 12.0 * Tie
Passenger elevator, [2BO] $130.00 $220.00 $105.00 $115.00
<4.000> $1,560.00 $2,640.00 $1,260.00 $1,380.00
MO 12.0
Manlift, Puritronics [2BO] $50.00 $90.00 $45.00 $93.00
<5.000> $600.00 $1,080.00 $540.00 $1,116.00
MO 12.0 *
Mainlift, Puritronic [2BO] $50.00 $90.00 $45.00 $93.00
<6.000> $600.00 $1,080.00 $540.00 $1,116.00
MO 12.0 *
Freight elevator, Mo [2BO] $130.00 $185.00 $210.00 $102.00
<7.000> $1,560.00 $2,220.00 $2,520.00 $1,224.00
MO 12.0 *
Passenger elevator, [2BO] $130.00 $185.00 $90.00 $93.00
<8.000> $1,560.00 $2,220.00 $1,080.00 $1,116.00
MO 12.0
Passenger elevator, [2BO] $130.00 $160.00 $95.00 $93.00
<9.000> $1,560.00 $1,920.00 $1,140.00 $1,116.00
MO 12.0
Passenger elevator, [2BO] $130.00 $160.00 $95.00 $111.00
<10.000> $1,560.00 $1,920.00 $1,140.00 $1,332.00
MO 12.0
Passenger elevator, [2BO] $130.00 $160.00 $95.00 $93.00
<11.000> $1,560.00 $1,920.00 $1,140.00 $1,116.00

MO 12.0




Bid Tab for Bid# 6065

Quote (01890) OTIS ELEVA (05543) SUNRISE EL (18665) KONE ELEVATORS (10204) ABELL ELEVATOR
Info: <Quote: 00002566> <Quote: 00002568> <Quote: 00002569> <Quote: 00002570>

ltem Info: Deliv Days: 30 Deliv Days: 1 Deliv Days: 30 Deliv Days: 1
Passenger elevator, [2BO] $130.00 $150.00 $95.00 $93.00
<12.000> $1,560.00 $1,800.00 $1,140.00 $1,116.00
MO 12.0
Dumbwaiter, Shinko, [2BO No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
<13.000>
MO 12.0 NB NB NB NB
Passenger elevator, [2BO] $250.00 $280.00 $110.00 $171.00
<14.000> $3,000.00 $3,360.00 $1,320.00 $2,052.00
MO 12.0 *
Passenger elevator, [2BO] $250.00 $280.00 $235.00 $180.00
<15.000> $3,000.00 $3,360.00 $2,820.00 $2,160.00
MO 12.0 *
Passenger elevator, [2BO] $130.00 $215.00 $235.00 $119.00
<16.000> $1,560.00 $2,580.00 $2,820.00 $1,428.00
MO 12.0
Passenger elevator, [2BO] $130.00 $185.00 $110.00 $132.00
<17.000> $1,560.00 $2,220.00 $1,320.00 $1,584.00
MO 12.0 *
Passenger elevator, [2BO] $130.00 $185.00 $110.00 $132.00
<18.000> $1,560.00 $2,220.00 $1,320.00 $1,584.00
MO 12.0 *
Freight elevator, Mo [2BO] $250.00 $125.00 $125.00 $180.00
<19.000> $3,000.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $2,160.00
MO 12.0 * Tie * Tie
Dumbwaiter, Montgome [2E $50.00 $125.00 $45.00 $69.75
<20.000> $600.00 $1,500.00 $540.00 $837.00

MO 12.0

* Tie




Bid Tab for Bid# 6065

Quote (01890) OTIS ELEVA (05543) SUNRISE EL (18665) KONE ELEVATORS (10204) ABELL ELEVATOR
Info: <Quote: 00002566> <Quote: 00002568> <Quote: 00002569> <Quote: 00002570>
Item Info: Deliv Days: 30 Deliv Days: 1 Deliv Days: 30 Deliv Days: 1
Passenger elevator, [2BO] $130.00 $135.00 $95.00 $93.00
<21.000> $1,560.00 $1,620.00 $1,140.00 $1,116.00
MO 12.0
Totals: Net $ Total: $30,720.00 $40,920.00 $25,500.00 $26,343.00
$ Discount: $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
$ Awarded: $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Eval Codes: NI Eval Codes: NI Eval Codes: NI Eval Codes: NI

"Evaluation Code Descriptions:

* = Low Item Price or Low Quote Total

NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All Items

No Bid Quotes:

Quote: 00002567 Vendor: INNOVATIVE ELEVATOR

Quote: 00002565 Vendor: WEST COAST ELEVATOR CO INC




Bid Tab for Bid# 6065

Quote (01723) GENERAL EL
Info: <Quote: 00002571>

Item Info: Deliv Days: 10
Passenger elevator, [2BO] $80.00
<1.000> $960.00
MO 12.0 *
Dumbwaiter/booklift, [2BO] $45.00
<2.000> $540.00
MO 12.0 * Tie
Dumbwaiter/booklift, [2BO] $45.00
<3.000> $540.00
MO 12.0 * Tie
Passenger elevator, [2BO] $80.00
<4.000> $960.00
MO 12.0 *
Manlift, Puritronics [2BO] $65.00
<5.000> $780.00
MO 12.0

Mainlift, Puritronic [2BO] $65.00
<6.000> $780.00
MO 12.0

Freight elevator, Mo [2BO] $150.00
<7.000> $1,800.00
MO 12.0

Passenger elevator, [2BO] $80.00
<8.000> $960.00
MO 12.0 *
Passenger elevator, [2BO] $80.00
<9.000> $960.00
MO 12.0 *
Passenger elevator, [2BO] $80.00
<10.000> $960.00
MO 12.0 *
Passenger elevator, [2BO] $80.00
<11.000> $960.00

MO 12.0




Bid Tab for Bid# 6065

Quote (01723) GENERAL EL
Info: <Quote: 00002571>

Item Info: Deliv Days: 10
Passenger elevator, [2BO] $80.00
<12.000> $960.00
MO 12.0 *
Dumbwaiter, Shinko, [2BO No Bid
<13.000>
MO 12.0 NB
Passenger elevator, [2BO] $220.00
<14.000> $2,640.00
MO 12.0
Passenger elevator, [2BO] $220.00
<15.000> $2,640.00
MO 12.0
Passenger elevator, [2BO] $110.00
<16.000> $1,320.00
MO 12.0 *
Passenger elevator, [2BO] $125.00
<17.000> $1,500.00
MO 12.0
Passenger elevator, [2BO] $125.00
<18.000> $1,500.00
MO 12.0
Freight elevator, Mo [2BO] $250.00
<19.000> $3,000.00
MO 12.0
Dumbwaiter, Montgome [2E $45.00
<20.000> $540.00

MO 12.0

* Tie




Bid Tab for Bid# 6065

Quote (01723) GENERAL EL

Info: <Quote: 00002571>
Item Info: Deliv Days: 10
Passenger elevator, [2BO] $80.00
<21.000> $960.00
MO 12.0 *
Totals: Net $ Total: $25,260.00
$ Discount: $0.00
$ Awarded: $0.00
Eval Codes: NI

Evaluation Code Descriptions:

NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All Items



