Bid Tab for Bid# 6308A

Quote  (13667) OLDSMAR FI (14909) PIPER FIRE (08752) GULFCOAST
Info: <Quote: 00004176> <Quote: 00004179>0 <Quote: 00004183>
Deliv Days: 2 Deliv Days: 1
Item Info:
INSPECTION: ABC D [2B¢ $4.00 $2.00 $1.25
<1.000> $4,800.00 $2,400.00 $1,500.00
EA 1200.0 «
ABC Dry Chemical, 2. [2BC $10.50 $7.50 $2.35
<2.000> PP, POPPRN PO
$157.50 $112.50 $35.25

EA 15.0 .
ABC Dry Chemical, 5# [2B( $13.50 $10.00 $5.60
<3.000> $4,050.00 $3,000.00 $1,680.00
EA 300.0 .
ABC Dry Chemical, 6# [2B( $14.50 $10.25 $5.60
<4.000> $725.00 $512.50 $280.00
EA 50.0 .
ABC Dry Chemical, 10 [2B¢ $19.50 $13.00 $9.30
<5.000> $1,657.50 $1,105.00 $790.50
EA 85.0 .
ABC Dry Chemical, 20 [2B( $27.00 $17.50 $12.60
<6.000> $675.00 $437.50 $315.00
EA 25.0 *
CO2 Dry Chemical, 2. [2BC $9.50 $7.00 No Charge
<7.000> $9.50 $7.00
EA 1.0 * NC,NB
CO2 Dry Chemical, 5# [2B( $11.75 $7.50 $5.60
<8.000> $352.50 $225.00 $168.00
EA 30.0 *
CO2 Dry Chemical, 6# [2B( $11.75 $9.00 No Charge
<9.000> $11.75 $9.00
EA 1.0 * NC,NB
CO2 Dry Chemical, 10 [2B( $14.50 $16.00 $9.30
<10.000> $942.50 $1,040.00 $604.50
EA 65.0 *
CO2 Dry Chemical, 15 [2B( $18.50 $23.50 $9.30
<11.000> $92.50 $117.50 $46.50

EA 5.0




Bid Tab for Bid# 6308A

Quote (13667) OLDSMAR FI (14909) PIPER FIRE (08752) GULFCOAST
Info: <Quote; 00004176> <Quote: 0000417950 <Quote: 00004183>
Deliv Days: 2 Deliv Days: 1
Item Info:
CO2 Dry Chemical, 20 [2B( $23.50 $31.00 No Charge
<12.000> $23.50 $31.00
EA 1.0 * NC,NB
Purple K, 2.5# Fire [2BO] $13.50 $8.50 No Charge
<13.000> $13.50 $8.50
EA 1.0 *,NC,NB
Purple K, 54 Fire Ex [2BO] $17.50 $11.25 $5.60
<14.000> $17.50 $11.25 $5.60
EA 1.0 .
Purple K, 6# Fire Ex [2BO] $19.50 $11.75 $5.60
<15.000> $19.50 $11.75 $5.60
EA 1.0 .
Purple K, 104 Fire E [2BO)] $23.50 $14.00 $9.30
<16.000> $23.50 $14.00 $9.30
EA 1.0 .
Purple K, 20# Fire E [2BO] $31.00 $18.50 $12.60
<17.000> $31.00 $18.50 $12.60
EA 1.0 *
Halon, 2.5# Fire Ext [2BO] $41.00 $37.50 No Bid
<18.000> $41.00 $37.50
EA 1.0 * NC,NB
Halon, 5# Fire Extin [2BO] $90.00 $75.00 No Bid
<19.000> $450.00 $375.00
EA 5.0 . NC,NB
Halon, 6# Fire Extin [2BO] $95.00 $90.00 No Bid
<20.000> $95.00 $90.00
EA 1.0 * NC,NB
Halon, 10# Fire Exti [2BO] $154.00 $150.00 No Bid
<21.000> $154.00 $150.00
EA 1.0 . NC,NB
Halon, 17# Fire Exti [2BO] $244.00 $255.00 No Bid
<22.000> $976.00 $1,020.00

EA 4.0

NC,NB




Bid Tab for Bid# 6308A

Quote (13667) OLDSMAR FI (14909) PIPER FIRE (08752) GULFCOAST
Info: <Quote: 00004176> <Quote: 00004179>0 <Quote: 00004183>
Deliv Days: 2 Deliv Days: 1
item info:
Halon, 20# Fire Exti [2BO] $287.00 $300.00 No Bid
<23.000> $287.00 $300.00
EA 1.0 » NC,NB
Halotron, 110# Fire [2BO] No Bid $198.00 No Bid
<24.000> $198.00
EA 1.0 NB . NC,NB
Halotron, 15.5# Fire [2BO] No Bid $279.00 No Bid
<25.000> $279.00
EA 1.0 NB . NC,NB
Dry Chem Fire Exting [2BO $8.00 $11.50 $5.60
<26.000> $712.00 $1,023.50 $498.40
EA 89.0 .
CO2 Fire Extinguishe [2BO $14.00 $15.00 $9.30
<27.000> $98.00 $105.00 $65.10
EA 7.0 .
Halon [2BO] $10.00 $11.50 $5.60
<28.000> $30.00 $34.50 $16.80
EA 3.0 *
Purple K [2BO] $8.00 $11.50 $5.60
<29.000> $8.00 $11.50 $5.60
EA 1.0 .
Air Pack [2BO] $14.00 $15.00 $12.60
<30.000>
$154.00 $185.00 $138.60
EA 11.0 .
Scuba [2BO] $14.00 $15.00 $12.60
<31.000> $14.00 $15.00 $12.60
EA 1.0 N
Oxygen [2BO] $14.00 $15.00 $12.60
<32.000>
$28.00 $30.00 $25.20
EA 2.0 .
O-~'ring [2BO] $1.50 $1.00 $0.50
<33.000> $1.50 $1.00 $0.50

EA 1.0




Bid Tab for Bid# 6308A

Quote (13667) OLDSMAR FI (14909) PIPER FIRE (08752) GULFCOAST
Info: <Quote: 00004176> <Quote: 0000417950 <Quote: 00004183>
Deliv Days: 1
item Info:
Band Assembly [2BO] $5.00 $4.50 No Charge
<34.000> $5.00 $4.50
EA 1.0 * NC,NB
Valve Stem Assembly [2BC $8.10 $5.00 $6.50
<35.000> $8.10 $5.00 $6.50
EA 1.0 *
Tamper Seals [2BO] $0.50 No Charge No Charge
<36.000> $0.50
EA 1.0 * Tie,NC * Tie,NC,NB
Gauge [2BO] $5.25 $4.50 $6.50
<37.000> $5.25 $4.50 $6.50
EA 1.0 *
Horn [2BO) $10.00 $9.50 No Charge
<38.000> $10.00 $9.50
EA 1.0 * NC,NB
Hose [2BO] $10.00 $11.00 $6.50
<39.000> $10.00 $11.00 $6.50
EA 1.0 *
Hose/Horn Assembly [2BO $19.00 $22.50 No Charge
<40.000> $19.00 $22.50
EA 1.0 * NC,NB
Lock Pins [2BO] $1.00 $0.35 $1.00
<41.000> $1.00 $0.35 $1.00
EA 1.0 *
Hose Band [2BO] $2.50 $4.50 No Charge
<42.000> $2.50 $4.50
EA 1.0 * NC,NB
Discharge Hose [2BO)] $8.00 $12.50 No Charge
<43.000> $8.00 $12.50
EA 1.0 * NC,NB
CO2 Burst (Safety) D [2BO $5.00 $5.00 No Charge
<44.000> $5.00 $5.00

EA 1.0

*,NC,NB




Bid Tab for Bid# 6308A

Quote  (13667) OLDSMAR Fi (14909) PIPER FIRE (08752) GULFCOAST
Info: <Quote: 00004176> <Quote:; 00004179>0 <Quote: 00004183>
Deliv Days: 2 Deliv Days: 1
tem Info:
Siphon Tube [2BO] $3.50 $8.00 $5.50
<45.000> $3.50 $8.00 $5.50
EA 1.0 *
Cabinet for 54, ABC [2BO] $15.00 $27.50 $21.00
<46.000> $15.00 $27.50 $21.00
EA 1.0 *
Cabinet Cover for 5# [2BO] $10.50 $10.00 $6.00
<47.000> $10.50 $10.00 $6.00
EA 1.0 .
Carry Handles [2BO} $4.00 $4.50 No Charge
<48.000> $4.00 $4.50
EA 1.0 * NC,NB
Vehicle mounting bra [2BO’ $10.00 $9.00 $8.00
<49.000> $10.00 $9.00 $8.00
EA 1.0 -
Fire Extinguisher, A [2BO] $22.00 $23.75 $19.90
<51.000> $22.00 $23.75 $19.90
EA 1.0 .
Fire Extinguisher, A [2BO] $30.00 $28.00 $35.50
<52.000> $30.00 $28.00 $35.50
EA 1.0 *
Fire Extinguisher, A [2BO] $40.00 $42.00 $45.50
<53.000> $40.00 $42.00 $45.50
EA 1.0 .
Fire Extinguisher, A [2BO] $75.00 $65.50 $65.50
<54.000> $75.00 $65.50 $65.50
EA 10 * Tie * Tie
Fire Extinguisher, C [2BO] $97.00 $95.00 $47.50
<55.000> $97.00 $95.00 $47.50
EA 1.0 *
Fire Extinguisher, C [2BO) $124.00 $126.00 $67.50
<56.000> $124.00 $126.00 $67.50

EA 1.0




Bid Tab for Bid# 6308A

Quote (13667) OLDSMAR Fl (14909) PIPER FIRE (08752) GULFCOAST
Info: <Quote: 00004176> <Quote: 00004179>0 <Quote: 00004183>
Deliv Days: 2 Deliv Days: 1

item info:
Fire Extinguisher, C [2BO] $150.00 $145.00 $121.50
<57.000> $150.00 $145.00 $121.50
EA 1.0 *
Fire Extinguisher, C [2BO] $180.00 $178.00 $147.50
<58.000> $180.00 $178.00 $147.50
EA 1.0 *
Fire Extinguisher, P [2BO] $55.00 $54.00 $45.50
<59.000> $55.00 $54.00 $45.50
EA 1.0 *
Fire Extinguisher, H [2BO] $235.00 $215.00 $164.50
<60.000> $235.00 $215.00 $164.50
EA 1.0 *
Fire Extinguisher, H [2BO} $390.00 $300.00 $259.50
<61.000> $390.00 $300.00 $259.50
EA 1.0 *
Totals: Net $ Total: $18,166.10 $14,306.60 $7,296.55
$ Discount: $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
$ Awarded: $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Eval Codes: NI Eval Codes: NI

"Evaluation Code Descriptions:
NB = No Bid

NI = Did Not Bid All ltems

NC = No Charge

No Bid Quotes:

Quote: 00004185 Vendor: COUNTY FIRE EQUIPMENT CO
Quote: 00004184 Vendor: TOTAL SAFETY INC C/O HAZCO

Quote: 00004182 Vendor: FIRE APPARATUS SERVICE TEAM INC
Quote: 00004181 Vendor: DELRAY FIRE EXTINGUISHER SVC

Quote: 00004180 Vendor: MUNICIPAL EQUIPMENT CO

Quote: 00004178 Vendor: EAST COAST FIRE EQUIPMENT INC
Quote: 00004177 Vendor: CARLWOOD SAFETY INC




