
Bid No. 6486A Three-Year Contract
for Custodial Services

Bid Tabulation

Item 
No. Location

Monthly 
Fee

Yearly 
Fee

Monthly 
Fee

Yearly 
Fee

Monthly 
Fee

Yearly 
Fee

1 Albert Whitted Airport $160.00 $1,920.00 $350.00 $4,200.00 NB
2 Central Records 360.00 4,320.00 NB $225.00 $2,700.00
3 Consolidated Warehouse 415.00 4,980.00 NB 245.00 2,940.00
4a Water Resources 1,400.00 16,800.00 985.00 11,820.00 1,000.00 12,000.00
4b Water Resources - Quality Assessment 575.00 6,900.00 NB 525.00 6,300.00
5 Cosme Waste Treatment NB NB 290.00 3,480.00
6 Fire Headquarters NB 945.00 11,340.00 825.00 9,900.00
7 Mangrove Bay Golf Course 975.00 11,700.00 NB NB
8 Cypress Links Golf Course 105.00 1,260.00 NB NB
9 Twin Brooks Golf Course 220.00 2,640.00 450.00 5,400.00 MB
10 ICS Radio Shop NB NB 280.00 3,360.00
11 James Weldon Johnson Library 840.00 10,080.00 NB 975.00 11,700.00
12 Main Library 2,300.00 27,600.00 NB 2,600.00 31,200.00
13 North Branch Library 735.00 8,820.00 NB 625.00 7,500.00
14 South Branch Library 840.00 10,080.00 NB 965.00 11,580.00
15 Sanitation NB NB 975.00 11,700.00

Total: $107,100.00 Total: $32,760.00 Total: $114,360.00

Statement of No Bid
All-Kleen Commercial Cleaning Service
ATS Commercial Maintenance Services, Inc.
Clear View Window Cleaning
Paradise Clenaing Service

Priority Care Services
dba United Janitorial

Solutions

Terms: Net-30 Days
St. Petersburg, FL

Vanessa Pinckney dba
Tropical Beach Cleaning

St. Petersburg, FL
Terms: Net-30 Days

Sunny Skys & Son
General Cleaning
St, Petersburg, FL

Terms: Net-30 Days
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Bid No. 6486A Three-Year Contract
for Custodial Services

Bid Tabulation

Item 
No. Location
1 Albert Whitted Airport
2 Central Records
3 Consolidated Warehouse
4a Water Resources
4b Water Resources - Quality Assessment
5 Cosme Waste Treatment
6 Fire Headquarters
7 Mangrove Bay Golf Course
8 Cypress Links Golf Course
9 Twin Brooks Golf Course
10 ICS Radio Shop
11 James Weldon Johnson Library
12 Main Library
13 North Branch Library
14 South Branch Library
15 Sanitation

Statement of No Bid
All-Kleen Commercial Cleaning Service
ATS Commercial Maintenance Services, Inc.
Clear View Window Cleaning
Paradise Clenaing Service

Monthly 
Fee

Yearly 
Fee

Monthly 
Fee

Yearly 
Fee

Monthly 
Fee

Yearly 
Fee

$1,046.00 $12,552.00 $232.00 $2,784.00 $337.00 $4,044.00
1,973.00 23,676.00 430.00 5,160.00 625.00 7,500.00

NB 363.00 4,356.00 555.00 6,660.00
NB 1,611.00 19,332.00 1,100.00 13,200.00
NB 932.00 11,184.00 585.00 7,020.00
NB 250.00 3,000.00 NB
NB 1,347.00 16,164.00 895.00 10,740.00
NB 1,375.00 16,500.00 715.00 8,580.00
NB NB 495.00 5,940.00

1,540.00 18,480.00 699.00 8,388.00 500.00 6,000.00
861.00 10,332.00 212.00 2,544.00 300.00 3,600.00

3,747.00 44,964.00 2,052.00 24,624.00 820.00 9,840.00
NB 3,330.00 39,960.00 2,300.00 27,600.00

2,160.00 25,920.00 1,095.00 13,140.00 700.00 8,400.00
3,096.00 37,152.00 1,525.00 18,300.00 800.00 9,600.00

14,423.00 173,076.00 1,334.00 16,008.00 1,005.00 12,060.00
Total: $346,152.00 Total: $201,444.00 Total: $140,784.00

A & G Environmental
Services

St. Petersburg, FL
Terms: 2%-10 Days

Trom Corp.
dba Anago of Tampa

Clearwater, FL
Terms: Net-30 Days

Brothers Keeper
St. Petersburg, FL

Terms: Net-30 Days
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Bid No. 6486A Three-Year Contract
for Custodial Services

Bid Tabulation

Item 
No. Location
1 Albert Whitted Airport
2 Central Records
3 Consolidated Warehouse
4a Water Resources
4b Water Resources - Quality Assessment
5 Cosme Waste Treatment
6 Fire Headquarters
7 Mangrove Bay Golf Course
8 Cypress Links Golf Course
9 Twin Brooks Golf Course
10 ICS Radio Shop
11 James Weldon Johnson Library
12 Main Library
13 North Branch Library
14 South Branch Library
15 Sanitation

Statement of No Bid
All-Kleen Commercial Cleaning Service
ATS Commercial Maintenance Services, Inc.
Clear View Window Cleaning
Paradise Clenaing Service

Monthly 
Fee

Yearly 
Fee

Monthly 
Fee

Yearly 
Fee

Monthly 
Fee

Yearly 
Fee

$288.60 $3,463.20 $368.86 $4,426.32 $1,970.00 $23,640.00
432.90 5,194.80 2,094.96 25,139.52 NB
360.75 4,329.00 310.25 3,723.00 NB

1,443.00 17,316.00 3,741.00 44,892.00 NB
577.20 6,926.40 1,586.18 19,034.16 NB
360.75 4,329.00 290.30 3,483.60 NB

1,298.70 15,584.40 3,117.50 37,410.00 5,890.00 70,680.00
865.80 10,389.60 1,238.77 14,865.24 4,160.00 49,920.00
216.00 2,592.00 95.52 1,146.24 1,280.00 15,360.00
432.90 5,194.80 773.14 9,277.68 2,430.00 29,160.00
360.75 4,329.00 466.13 5,593.56 NB
937.95 11,255.40 3,541.48 42,497.76 NB

3,030.30 36,363.60 9,976.00 119,712.00 NB
865.80 10,389.60 2,045.08 24,540.96 NB

1,010.10 12,121.20 3,366.90 40,402.80 NB
2,308.80 27,705.60 2,992.80 35,913.60 5,590.00 67,080.00

Total: $177,483.60 Total: $432,058.44 Total: $255,840.00

Superior Building &
Technical Services, Inc.

Orlando, FL
Terms: Net-30 Days

Priority Cleaning
St. Petersburg, FL 
Terms: 2%-10 Days

Integrated Building
Maintenance Services, Inc.

Clearwater, FL
Terms: Net-30 Days
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Bid No. 6486A Three-Year Contract
for Custodial Services

Bid Tabulation

Item 
No. Location
1 Albert Whitted Airport
2 Central Records
3 Consolidated Warehouse
4a Water Resources
4b Water Resources - Quality Assessment
5 Cosme Waste Treatment
6 Fire Headquarters
7 Mangrove Bay Golf Course
8 Cypress Links Golf Course
9 Twin Brooks Golf Course
10 ICS Radio Shop
11 James Weldon Johnson Library
12 Main Library
13 North Branch Library
14 South Branch Library
15 Sanitation

Statement of No Bid
All-Kleen Commercial Cleaning Service
ATS Commercial Maintenance Services, Inc.
Clear View Window Cleaning
Paradise Clenaing Service

Monthly 
Fee

Yearly 
Fee

Monthly 
Fee

Yearly 
Fee

Monthly 
Fee

Yearly 
Fee

$113.37 $1,360.44 $1,048.82 $12,585.84 $250.00 $3,000.00
321.51 3,858.12 257.69 3,092.28 442.00 5,304.00
263.14 3,157.68 114.69 1,376.28 450.00 5,400.00

1,398.50 16,782.00 888.43 10,661.16 1,225.00 14,700.00
433.75 5,205.00 888.43 10,661.16 610.00 7,320.00
116.48 1,397.76 645.81 7,749.72 313.00 3,756.00
982.80 11,793.60 1,199.48 14,393.76 1,465.00 17,580.00
524.30 6,291.60 894.36 10,732.32 1,434.00 17,208.00
263.14 3,157.68 894.36 10,732.32 600.00 7,200.00
373.75 4,485.00 748.95 8,987.40 889.00 10,668.00
77.00 924.00 422.65 5,071.80 200.00 2,400.00

1,487.36 17,848.32 1,792.55 21,510.60 1,941.00 23,292.00
4,136.47 49,637.64 7,637.24 91,646.88 3,874.00 46,488.00

795.35 9,544.20 1,399.87 16,798.44 1,378.00 16,536.00
1,477.20 17,726.40 1,712.71 20,552.52 1,929.00 23,148.00
1,191.14 14,293.68 2,238.82 26,865.84 1,410.00 16,920.00

Total: $167,463.12 Total: $273,418.32 Total: $220,920.00

Tri-Angle Maintenance
Service, Inc.

Clearwater, FL 
Terms: Net-30 Days

Jani-King of Tampa Bay
Clearwater, FL

Terms: Net-30 Days

Owens, Renz, &
Lee Company, Inc.

Winter Park, FL
Terms: Net-30 Days
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