
IFB No. 6715 Three-Year Contract for
Safety Clothing and Supplies

City of St. Petersburg

Bid Tabulation
Purchasing and Materials Management

Item
No. Description *EAU UOM Unit Price

Extended 
Price Unit Price

Extended 
Price Unit Price

Extended 
Price Unit Price

Extended 
Price

1 Back Support, Size SM 25-30" 12 EA NB NB $7.10 $85.20 NB NB NB NB
2 Back Support, Size MD 30-34" 42 EA NB NB $7.10 $298.20 NB NB NB NB
3 Back Support, Size LG 34-38" 47 EA NB NB $7.10 $333.70 NB NB NB NB
4 Back Support, Size XL 38-42" 30 EA NB NB $7.10 $213.00 NB NB NB NB
5 Back Support, Size 2XL 42-46" 12 EA NB NB $7.10 $85.20 NB NB NB NB
6 Bandana, Cool Wrap, Chill Its 6705 or Equal 68 EA NB NB $2.05 $139.40 NB NB NB NB
7 Boots, Hip, Rubber, Steel Shank, Size 8 60 PAIR NB NB $26.80 $1,608.00 NB NB NB NB
8 Boots, Hip, Rubber, Steel Shank, Size 9 132 PAIR NB NB $26.80 $3,537.60 NB NB NB NB
9 Boots, Hip, Rubber, Steel Shank, Size 10 206 PAIR NB NB $26.80 $5,520.80 NB NB NB NB
10 Boots, Hip, Rubber, Steel Shank, Size 11 137 PAIR NB NB $26.80 $3,671.60 NB NB NB NB
11 Boots, Hip, Rubber, Steel Shank, Size 12 103 PAIR NB NB $26.80 $2,760.40 NB NB NB NB
12 Boots, Hip, Rubber, Steel Shank, Size 13 114 PAIR NB NB $26.80 $3,055.20 NB NB NB NB
13 Boots, Knee, Size 8 38 PAIR NB NB $7.99 $303.62 NB NB NB NB
14 Boots, Knee, Size 9 78 PAIR NB NB $7.99 $623.22 NB NB NB NB
15 Boots, Knee, Size 10 108 PAIR NB NB $7.99 $862.92 NB NB NB NB
16 Boots, Knee, Size 11 138 PAIR NB NB $7.99 $1,102.62 NB NB NB NB
17 Boots, Knee, Size 12 114 PAIR NB NB $7.99 $910.86 NB NB NB NB
18 Boots, Knee, Size 13 84 PAIR NB NB $7.99 $671.16 NB NB NB NB
19 Coat, Rain, Full Length, Size SM 20 EA $8.49 $169.80 $3.35 $67.00 NB NB NB NB
20 Coat, Rain, Full Length, Size MD 40 EA $8.49 $339.60 $3.35 $134.00 NB NB NB NB
21 Coat, Rain, Full Length, Size LG 168 EA $8.49 $1,426.32 $3.35 $562.80 NB NB NB NB
22 Coat, Rain, Full Length, Size XL 251 EA $8.49 $2,130.99 $3.35 $840.85 NB NB NB NB
23 Coveralls, Size 2XL, White 6,500 EA NB NB $3.25 $21,125.00 NB NB NB NB
24 Coveralls, Size 3XL, White 3,026 EA NB NB $3.44 $10,409.44 NB NB NB NB
25 Coveralls, Size 4XL, White 2,375 EA NB NB $3.70 $8,787.50 NB NB NB NB
26 Coveralls, Size SM, White 100 EA NB NB $3.09 $309.00 NB NB NB NB
27 Coveralls, Size MD, White 125 EA NB NB $3.09 $386.25 NB NB NB NB
28 Coveralls, Size LG, White 1,975 PAIR NB NB $3.09 $6,102.75 NB NB NB NB
29 Coveralls, Size XL, White 2,742 EA NB NB $3.09 $8,472.78 NB NB NB NB
30 Ear Muff, Adjustable Position 84 EA NB NB $9.50 $798.00 NB NB NB NB
31 Ear Muff, Over the Head 162 EA NB NB $14.40 $2,332.80 NB NB NB NB
32 Ear Plugs,Uncorded Foam 82 BX NB NB $14.40 $1,180.80 NB NB NB NB
33 Glasses, Safety, Polarized 144 EA $31.46 $4,530.24 $27.80 $4,003.20 NB NB NB NB
34 Glasses, Safety, Blue Mirror Lens 220 EA NB NB $4.60 $1,012.00 NB NB NB NB

Safety Products Inc.
Lakeland, FL

Terms: 2% - 10 Days
Delivery: 3 Days

MTS Safety Products 
Inc.

Golden, MS
Terms: Net 30 Days
Delivery: 10 Days

Tronex International 
Inc.

Parsippany, NJ
Terms: Net 30 Days
Delivery: 90 Days

Stroud Safety Apparel
Stroud, OK

Terms: Net 30 Days
Delivery: 14 Days
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IFB No. 6715 Three-Year Contract for
Safety Clothing and Supplies

City of St. Petersburg

Bid Tabulation
Purchasing and Materials Management

Item
No. Description *EAU UOM Unit Price

Extended 
Price Unit Price

Extended 
Price Unit Price

Extended 
Price Unit Price

Extended 
Price

Safety Products Inc.
Lakeland, FL

Terms: 2% - 10 Days
Delivery: 3 Days

MTS Safety Products 
Inc.

Golden, MS
Terms: Net 30 Days
Delivery: 10 Days

Tronex International 
Inc.

Parsippany, NJ
Terms: Net 30 Days
Delivery: 90 Days

Stroud Safety Apparel
Stroud, OK

Terms: Net 30 Days
Delivery: 14 Days

35 Glasses, Safety, Brown Lens 516 EA NB NB $4.30 $2,218.80 NB NB NB NB
36 Glasses, Safety, Amber Lens 276 EA $4.53 $1,250.28 $4.43 $1,222.68 NB NB NB NB
37 Glasses, Safety, Platinum Color 920 EA $4.77 $4,388.40 $3.94 $3,624.80 NB NB NB NB
38 Glasses, Safety, Grey Lens 1,440 EA $4.10 $5,904.00 $4.64 $6,681.60 NB NB NB NB
39 Glasses, Safety, Scratch Resistant 1,818 EA NB NB $2.92 $5,308.56 NB NB NB NB
40 Glasses, Safety, Gold Mirror Lens 740 EA NB NB $6.14 $4,543.60 NB NB NB NB
41 Glove, Mechanic 260 EA NB NB $17.20 $4,472.00 NB NB NB NB
42 Gloves, Antivibration, Size XL 12 PAIR NB NB $24.50 $294.00 NB NB NB NB
43 Gloves, Size SM 12 PAIR NB NB $9.50 $114.00 NB NB NB NB
44 Gloves, Size MD 72 PAIR NB NB $9.50 $684.00 NB NB NB NB
45 Gloves, Size LG 150 PAIR NB NB $9.50 $1,425.00 NB NB NB NB
46 Gloves, Size XL 168 PAIR NB NB $9.50 $1,596.00 NB NB NB NB
47 Gloves, Size SM 450 BX NB NB $4.75 $2,137.50 $3.89 $1,750.50 NB NB
48 Gloves, Powderless, Size MD 1,872 BX NB NB $4.75 $8,892.00 $3.89 $7,282.08 NB NB
49 Gloves, Powderless, Size LG 2,672 BX NB NB $4.75 $12,692.00 $3.89 $10,394.08 NB NB
50 Gloves, Powderless, Size XL 2,426 BX NB NB $4.75 $11,523.50 $3.89 $9,437.14 NB NB
51 Gloves, Mens, Safety Cuff, One Size 5,100 PAIR NB NB $0.80 $4,080.00 $1.00 $5,100.00 NB NB
52 Gloves, Mens, Waterproof Cuff, One Size 21,888 PAIR NB NB $0.99 $21,669.12 $1.09 $23,857.92 NB NB
53 Gloves, Mens, 12IN Length, One Size, Black 264 PAIR NB NB $0.96 $253.44 NB NB NB NB
54 Gloves, Mens, 18IN length, Size LG 456 PAIR NB NB $1.07 $487.92 NB NB NB NB
55 Gloves, Mens, Safety Cuffs, Natural 9,984 PAIR NB NB $1.16 $11,581.44 NB NB NB NB
56 Gloves, Nitrile Coated, Size XL 22,956 PAIR NB NB $1.09 $25,022.04 NB NB NB NB
57 Gloves, Wrist Length 960 EA NB NB $6.31 $6,057.60 NB NB NB NB
58 Gloves, Womens, Safety Cuff, One Size 552 PAIR NB NB $0.78 $430.56 NB NB NB NB
59 Gloves, Work, 2IN, 16 ml, Natural, Size LG 264 PAIR NB NB $0.37 $97.68 NB NB NB NB
60 Gloves, Work, Cotton, Size SM, MD, LG, XL 5,976 PAIR NB NB $1.47 $8,784.72 $1.09 $6,513.84 NB NB
61 Gloves, Work, Cotton Seam-Free Liner, Size LG 1,680 PAIR NB NB $1.86 $3,124.80 NB NB NB NB
62 Goggles, Protective, No-Fog Lens 204 EA NB NB $1.69 $344.76 NB NB NB NB
63 Hat Rack, Safety 12 EA NB NB $7.06 $84.72 NB NB NB NB
64 Hat, Hard, Full Brim, White 44 EA NB NB $9.10 $400.40 NB NB NB NB
65 Hat, Hard, Full Brim, Yellow 143 EA NB NB $9.10 $1,301.30 NB NB NB NB
66 Hat, Hard, Suspension Replacement System 6 EA NB NB $7.24 $43.44 NB NB NB NB
67 Headgear, Adjust Head Size, Clear Acetate 10 EA NB NB $3.98 $39.80 NB NB NB NB
68 Jacket, Rain, 3 IN Block Screen, Size SM 4 EA NB NB $3.95 $15.80 NB NB NB NB
69 Jacket, Rain, 3 IN Block Screen, Size MD 6 EA NB NB $3.95 $23.70 NB NB NB NB
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IFB No. 6715 Three-Year Contract for
Safety Clothing and Supplies

City of St. Petersburg

Bid Tabulation
Purchasing and Materials Management

Item
No. Description *EAU UOM Unit Price

Extended 
Price Unit Price

Extended 
Price Unit Price

Extended 
Price Unit Price

Extended 
Price

Safety Products Inc.
Lakeland, FL

Terms: 2% - 10 Days
Delivery: 3 Days

MTS Safety Products 
Inc.

Golden, MS
Terms: Net 30 Days
Delivery: 10 Days

Tronex International 
Inc.

Parsippany, NJ
Terms: Net 30 Days
Delivery: 90 Days

Stroud Safety Apparel
Stroud, OK

Terms: Net 30 Days
Delivery: 14 Days

70 Jacket, Rain, 3 IN Block Screen, Size LG 12 EA NB NB $3.95 $47.40 NB NB NB NB
71 Jacket, Rain, 3 IN Block Screen, Size XL 17 EA NB NB $3.95 $67.15 NB NB NB NB
72 Jacket, Rain, 3 IN Block Screen, Size 2XL 25 EA NB NB $4.09 $102.25 NB NB NB NB
73 Jacket, Rain, 3 IN Block Screen, Size 3XL 16 EA NB NB $4.22 $67.52 NB NB NB NB
74 Jacket, Rain, Size SM, Safety Yellow 20 EA NB NB $2.76 $55.20 NB NB NB NB
75 Jacket, Rain, Size MD, Safety Yellow 75 EA NB NB $2.76 $207.00 NB NB NB NB
76 Jacket, Rain, Size LG, Safety Yellow 109 EA NB NB $2.76 $300.84 NB NB NB NB
77 Jacket, Rain, Size XL, Yellow 120 EA NB NB $2.76 $331.20 NB NB NB NB
78 Jacket, Rain, Size 2XL, Safety Yellow 40 EA NB NB $2.90 $116.00 NB NB NB NB
79 Jacket, Rain, Size 3XL, Safety Yellow 40 EA NB NB $3.03 $121.20 NB NB NB NB
80 Liner, Hard Hat, Single Layer 10 EA NB NB $1.57 $15.70 NB NB NB NB
81 Overalls, Rain, Bib Trousers, Size SM 20 EA NB NB $1.98 $39.60 NB NB NB NB
82 Overalls, Rain, Bib Trousers, Size MD 30 EA NB NB $1.98 $59.40 NB NB NB NB
83 Overalls, Rain, Bib Trousers, Size LG 40 EA NB NB $1.98 $79.20 NB NB NB NB
84 Overalls, Rain, Bib Trousers, Size XL 40 EA NB NB $1.98 $79.20 NB NB NB NB
85 Overalls, Rain, Bib Trousers, Size 2XL 40 EA NB NB $2.09 $83.60 NB NB NB NB
86 Respirator, Disposable 568 EA NB NB $5.46 $3,101.28 NB NB NB NB
87 Respirator, Dust and Mist 368 PKG NB NB $6.20 $2,281.60 NB NB NB NB
88 Shield, Face, Polycarbonate 10 EA NB NB $12.05 $120.50 NB NB NB NB
89 Sweatband, Disposable 6,600 EA NB NB $0.30 $1,980.00 NB NB NB NB
90 Vest, Front Velcro Closure 901 EA NB NB $3.09 $2,784.09 NB NB $6.00 $5,406.00
91 Vest, Front Zipper Closure 599 EA NB NB $14.35 $8,595.65 NB NB $11.50 $6,888.50
92 Visor, Faceshield, 8IN x 15IN x .040IN 1,500 EA NB NB $0.95 $1,425.00 NB NB NB NB
93 Visor, Wire Mesh, 6" x 11 1/2" 10 EA NB NB $7.15 $71.50 NB NB NB NB
94 Wader, Chest, Steel Toe, Size 8 4 PAIR NB NB $70.77 $283.08 NB NB NB NB
95 Wader, Chest, Steel Toe, Size 9 11 PAIR NB NB $70.77 $778.47 NB NB NB NB
96 Wader, Chest, Steel Toe, Size 10 8 PAIR NB NB $70.77 $566.16 NB NB NB NB
97 Wader, Chest, Steel Toe, Size 11 14 PAIR NB NB $70.77 $990.78 NB NB NB NB
98 Wader, Chest, Steel Toe, Size 12 28 PAIR NB NB $70.77 $1,981.56 NB NB NB NB

Total : $20,139.63 $270,312.28 $64,335.56 $12,294.50
SBDE: $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Discount 2%-10 Days: $0.00 $5,406.25 $0.00 $0.00
Total w/Discount: $20,139.63 $264,906.03 $64,335.56 $12,294.50

Statement of No Bid:
Mantek, Division of NCH Corp.
Pro-Am Safety Inc.
Aramsco
AA Casey
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IFB No. 6715 Three-Year Contract for
Safety Clothing and Supplies

City of St. Petersburg

Bid Tabulation
Purchasing and Materials Management

Item
No. Description *EAU UOM

1 Back Support, Size SM 25-30" 12 EA
2 Back Support, Size MD 30-34" 42 EA
3 Back Support, Size LG 34-38" 47 EA
4 Back Support, Size XL 38-42" 30 EA
5 Back Support, Size 2XL 42-46" 12 EA
6 Bandana, Cool Wrap, Chill Its 6705 or Equal 68 EA
7 Boots, Hip, Rubber, Steel Shank, Size 8 60 PAIR
8 Boots, Hip, Rubber, Steel Shank, Size 9 132 PAIR
9 Boots, Hip, Rubber, Steel Shank, Size 10 206 PAIR
10 Boots, Hip, Rubber, Steel Shank, Size 11 137 PAIR
11 Boots, Hip, Rubber, Steel Shank, Size 12 103 PAIR
12 Boots, Hip, Rubber, Steel Shank, Size 13 114 PAIR
13 Boots, Knee, Size 8 38 PAIR
14 Boots, Knee, Size 9 78 PAIR
15 Boots, Knee, Size 10 108 PAIR
16 Boots, Knee, Size 11 138 PAIR
17 Boots, Knee, Size 12 114 PAIR
18 Boots, Knee, Size 13 84 PAIR
19 Coat, Rain, Full Length, Size SM 20 EA
20 Coat, Rain, Full Length, Size MD 40 EA
21 Coat, Rain, Full Length, Size LG 168 EA
22 Coat, Rain, Full Length, Size XL 251 EA
23 Coveralls, Size 2XL, White 6,500 EA
24 Coveralls, Size 3XL, White 3,026 EA
25 Coveralls, Size 4XL, White 2,375 EA
26 Coveralls, Size SM, White 100 EA
27 Coveralls, Size MD, White 125 EA
28 Coveralls, Size LG, White 1,975 PAIR
29 Coveralls, Size XL, White 2,742 EA
30 Ear Muff, Adjustable Position 84 EA
31 Ear Muff, Over the Head 162 EA
32 Ear Plugs,Uncorded Foam 82 BX
33 Glasses, Safety, Polarized 144 EA
34 Glasses, Safety, Blue Mirror Lens 220 EA

Unit Price
Extended 

Price Unit Price
Extended 

Price Unit Price
Extended 

Price Unit Price
Extended 

Price

NB NB NB NB NB NB $6.16 $73.92
NB NB NB NB NB NB $6.16 $258.72
NB NB NB NB NB NB $6.16 $289.52
NB NB NB NB NB NB $6.16 $184.80
NB NB NB NB NB NB $6.16 $73.92
NB NB NB NB NB NB $3.70 $251.60
NB NB NB NB NB NB $46.54 $2,792.40
NB NB NB NB NB NB $46.54 $6,143.28
NB NB NB NB NB NB $46.54 $9,587.24
NB NB NB NB NB NB $46.54 $6,375.98
NB NB NB NB NB NB $46.54 $4,793.62
NB NB NB NB NB NB $46.54 $5,305.56
NB NB NB NB NB NB $10.79 $410.02
NB NB NB NB NB NB $10.79 $841.62
NB NB NB NB NB NB $12.02 $1,298.16
NB NB NB NB NB NB $12.02 $1,658.76
NB NB NB NB NB NB $12.02 $1,370.28
NB NB NB NB NB NB $12.02 $1,009.68
NB NB $4.82 $96.40 NB NB $3.94 $78.80
NB NB $4.82 $192.80 NB NB $3.94 $157.60
NB NB $4.82 $809.76 NB NB $3.94 $661.92
NB NB $4.82 $1,209.82 NB NB $3.94 $988.94
NB NB NB NB NB NB $3.44 $22,360.00
NB NB NB NB NB NB $3.64 $11,014.64
NB NB NB NB NB NB $3.92 $9,310.00
NB NB NB NB NB NB $3.27 $327.00
NB NB NB NB NB NB $3.27 $408.75
NB NB NB NB NB NB $3.27 $6,458.25
NB NB NB NB NB NB $3.27 $8,966.34
NB NB NB NB NB NB $9.99 $839.16
NB NB NB NB NB NB $8.78 $1,422.36

$19.99 $1,639.18 NB NB NB NB $20.94 $1,717.08
NB NB NB NB NB NB $29.41 $4,235.04
NB NB NB NB NB NB $5.29 $1,163.80

Bound Tree Medical 
LLC

Dublin, OH
Terms: Net 30 Days

Delivery: 5 Days

The Artcraft Company
University Park, FL
Terms: Net 30 Days
Delivery: 20 Days

Loveline Ind. Inc.
Passak, NJ

Terms: Net 30 Days
Delivery: 30 Days

Nestor Sales LLC
Largo, FL

Terms: Net 30 Days
Delivery: 2 Days
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IFB No. 6715 Three-Year Contract for
Safety Clothing and Supplies

City of St. Petersburg

Bid Tabulation
Purchasing and Materials Management

Item
No. Description *EAU UOM

35 Glasses, Safety, Brown Lens 516 EA
36 Glasses, Safety, Amber Lens 276 EA
37 Glasses, Safety, Platinum Color 920 EA
38 Glasses, Safety, Grey Lens 1,440 EA
39 Glasses, Safety, Scratch Resistant 1,818 EA
40 Glasses, Safety, Gold Mirror Lens 740 EA
41 Glove, Mechanic 260 EA
42 Gloves, Antivibration, Size XL 12 PAIR
43 Gloves, Size SM 12 PAIR
44 Gloves, Size MD 72 PAIR
45 Gloves, Size LG 150 PAIR
46 Gloves, Size XL 168 PAIR
47 Gloves, Size SM 450 BX
48 Gloves, Powderless, Size MD 1,872 BX
49 Gloves, Powderless, Size LG 2,672 BX
50 Gloves, Powderless, Size XL 2,426 BX
51 Gloves, Mens, Safety Cuff, One Size 5,100 PAIR
52 Gloves, Mens, Waterproof Cuff, One Size 21,888 PAIR
53 Gloves, Mens, 12IN Length, One Size, Black 264 PAIR
54 Gloves, Mens, 18IN length, Size LG 456 PAIR
55 Gloves, Mens, Safety Cuffs, Natural 9,984 PAIR
56 Gloves, Nitrile Coated, Size XL 22,956 PAIR
57 Gloves, Wrist Length 960 EA
58 Gloves, Womens, Safety Cuff, One Size 552 PAIR
59 Gloves, Work, 2IN, 16 ml, Natural, Size LG 264 PAIR
60 Gloves, Work, Cotton, Size SM, MD, LG, XL 5,976 PAIR
61 Gloves, Work, Cotton Seam-Free Liner, Size LG 1,680 PAIR
62 Goggles, Protective, No-Fog Lens 204 EA
63 Hat Rack, Safety 12 EA
64 Hat, Hard, Full Brim, White 44 EA
65 Hat, Hard, Full Brim, Yellow 143 EA
66 Hat, Hard, Suspension Replacement System 6 EA
67 Headgear, Adjust Head Size, Clear Acetate 10 EA
68 Jacket, Rain, 3 IN Block Screen, Size SM 4 EA
69 Jacket, Rain, 3 IN Block Screen, Size MD 6 EA

Unit Price
Extended 

Price Unit Price
Extended 

Price Unit Price
Extended 

Price Unit Price
Extended 

Price

Bound Tree Medical 
LLC

Dublin, OH
Terms: Net 30 Days

Delivery: 5 Days

The Artcraft Company
University Park, FL
Terms: Net 30 Days
Delivery: 20 Days

Loveline Ind. Inc.
Passak, NJ

Terms: Net 30 Days
Delivery: 30 Days

Nestor Sales LLC
Largo, FL

Terms: Net 30 Days
Delivery: 2 Days

NB NB NB NB NB NB $5.62 $2,899.92
$6.55 $1,807.80 NB NB NB NB $4.88 $1,346.88
$5.99 $5,510.80 NB NB NB NB $4.88 $4,489.60
$5.65 $8,136.00 NB NB NB NB $4.49 $6,465.60

NB NB NB NB NB NB $3.40 $6,181.20
NB NB NB NB NB NB $6.64 $4,913.60
NB NB NB NB NB NB $9.97 $2,592.20
NB NB NB NB NB NB $13.26 $159.12
NB NB NB NB NB NB $9.51 $114.12
NB NB NB NB NB NB $9.51 $684.72
NB NB NB NB NB NB $9.51 $1,426.50
NB NB NB NB NB NB $9.51 $1,597.68

$6.85 $3,082.50 NB NB NB NB $5.41 $2,434.50
$6.85 $12,823.20 NB NB NB NB $5.41 $10,127.52
$6.85 $18,303.20 NB NB NB NB $5.41 $14,455.52
$6.85 $16,618.10 NB NB NB NB $5.41 $13,124.66

NB NB NB NB NB NB $0.75 $3,825.00
NB NB NB NB NB NB $1.05 $22,982.40
NB NB NB NB NB NB $1.08 $285.12
NB NB NB NB NB NB $1.19 $542.64
NB NB NB NB NB NB $1.37 $13,678.08
NB NB NB NB NB NB $1.20 $27,547.20
NB NB NB NB NB NB $3.54 $3,398.40
NB NB NB NB NB NB $1.30 $717.60
NB NB NB NB NB NB $0.33 $87.12
NB NB NB NB NB NB $1.64 $9,800.64
NB NB NB NB NB NB $1.39 $2,335.20
NB NB NB NB NB NB $5.26 $1,073.04
NB NB NB NB NB NB $6.75 $81.00
NB NB NB NB NB NB $10.18 $447.92
NB NB NB NB NB NB $10.18 $1,455.74
NB NB NB NB NB NB $6.18 $37.08
NB NB NB NB NB NB $11.14 $111.40
NB NB $5.59 $22.36 NB NB $4.48 $17.92
NB NB $5.59 $33.54 NB NB $4.48 $26.88
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IFB No. 6715 Three-Year Contract for
Safety Clothing and Supplies

City of St. Petersburg

Bid Tabulation
Purchasing and Materials Management

Item
No. Description *EAU UOM

70 Jacket, Rain, 3 IN Block Screen, Size LG 12 EA
71 Jacket, Rain, 3 IN Block Screen, Size XL 17 EA
72 Jacket, Rain, 3 IN Block Screen, Size 2XL 25 EA
73 Jacket, Rain, 3 IN Block Screen, Size 3XL 16 EA
74 Jacket, Rain, Size SM, Safety Yellow 20 EA
75 Jacket, Rain, Size MD, Safety Yellow 75 EA
76 Jacket, Rain, Size LG, Safety Yellow 109 EA
77 Jacket, Rain, Size XL, Yellow 120 EA
78 Jacket, Rain, Size 2XL, Safety Yellow 40 EA
79 Jacket, Rain, Size 3XL, Safety Yellow 40 EA
80 Liner, Hard Hat, Single Layer 10 EA
81 Overalls, Rain, Bib Trousers, Size SM 20 EA
82 Overalls, Rain, Bib Trousers, Size MD 30 EA
83 Overalls, Rain, Bib Trousers, Size LG 40 EA
84 Overalls, Rain, Bib Trousers, Size XL 40 EA
85 Overalls, Rain, Bib Trousers, Size 2XL 40 EA
86 Respirator, Disposable 568 EA
87 Respirator, Dust and Mist 368 PKG
88 Shield, Face, Polycarbonate 10 EA
89 Sweatband, Disposable 6,600 EA
90 Vest, Front Velcro Closure 901 EA
91 Vest, Front Zipper Closure 599 EA
92 Visor, Faceshield, 8IN x 15IN x .040IN 1,500 EA
93 Visor, Wire Mesh, 6" x 11 1/2" 10 EA
94 Wader, Chest, Steel Toe, Size 8 4 PAIR
95 Wader, Chest, Steel Toe, Size 9 11 PAIR
96 Wader, Chest, Steel Toe, Size 10 8 PAIR
97 Wader, Chest, Steel Toe, Size 11 14 PAIR
98 Wader, Chest, Steel Toe, Size 12 28 PAIR

Total :
SBDE:

Discount 2%-10 Days:
Total w/Discount:

Statement of No Bid:
Mantek, Division of NCH Corp.
Pro-Am Safety Inc.
Aramsco
AA Casey

Unit Price
Extended 

Price Unit Price
Extended 

Price Unit Price
Extended 

Price Unit Price
Extended 

Price

Bound Tree Medical 
LLC

Dublin, OH
Terms: Net 30 Days

Delivery: 5 Days

The Artcraft Company
University Park, FL
Terms: Net 30 Days
Delivery: 20 Days

Loveline Ind. Inc.
Passak, NJ

Terms: Net 30 Days
Delivery: 30 Days

Nestor Sales LLC
Largo, FL

Terms: Net 30 Days
Delivery: 2 Days

NB NB $5.59 $67.08 NB NB $4.48 $53.76
NB NB $5.59 $95.03 NB NB $4.48 $76.16
NB NB $5.59 $139.75 NB NB $4.64 $116.00
NB NB $5.59 $89.44 NB NB $3.55 $56.80
NB NB $4.14 $82.80 NB NB $3.61 $72.20
NB NB $4.14 $310.50 NB NB $3.44 $258.00
NB NB $4.14 $451.26 NB NB $3.44 $374.96
NB NB $4.14 $496.80 NB NB $3.44 $412.80
NB NB $4.14 $165.60 NB NB $3.61 $144.40
NB NB $4.14 $165.60 NB NB $3.79 $151.60
NB NB NB NB NB NB $1.65 $16.50
NB NB $2.99 $59.80 NB NB $2.48 $49.60
NB NB $2.99 $89.70 NB NB $2.48 $74.40
NB NB $2.99 $119.60 NB NB $2.48 $99.20
NB NB $2.99 $119.60 NB NB $2.48 $99.20
NB NB $2.99 $119.60 NB NB $2.60 $104.00
NB NB NB NB NB NB $1.72 $976.96

$15.25 $5,612.00 NB NB NB NB $15.15 $5,575.20
$1.09 $10.90 NB NB NB NB $11.00 $110.00

NB NB NB NB $0.29 $1,914.00 $0.29 $1,914.00
NB NB $3.45 $3,108.45 $5.45 $4,910.45 $3.35 $3,018.35
NB NB $9.65 $5,780.35 $11.25 $6,738.75 $11.51 $6,894.49

$3.87 $5,805.00 NB NB NB NB $5.30 $7,950.00
NB NB NB NB NB NB $4.60 $46.00
NB NB NB NB NB NB $78.69 $314.76
NB NB NB NB NB NB $78.69 $865.59
NB NB NB NB NB NB $78.69 $629.52
NB NB NB NB NB NB $78.69 $1,101.66
NB NB NB NB NB NB $78.69 $2,203.32

$79,348.68 $13,825.64 $13,563.20 $308,051.91
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

$79,348.68 $13,825.64 $13,563.20 $308,051.91
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IFB No. 6715 Three-Year Contract for
Safety Clothing and Supplies

City of St. Petersburg

Bid Tabulation
Purchasing and Materials Management

Item
No. Description *EAU UOM

1 Back Support, Size SM 25-30" 12 EA
2 Back Support, Size MD 30-34" 42 EA
3 Back Support, Size LG 34-38" 47 EA
4 Back Support, Size XL 38-42" 30 EA
5 Back Support, Size 2XL 42-46" 12 EA
6 Bandana, Cool Wrap, Chill Its 6705 or Equal 68 EA
7 Boots, Hip, Rubber, Steel Shank, Size 8 60 PAIR
8 Boots, Hip, Rubber, Steel Shank, Size 9 132 PAIR
9 Boots, Hip, Rubber, Steel Shank, Size 10 206 PAIR
10 Boots, Hip, Rubber, Steel Shank, Size 11 137 PAIR
11 Boots, Hip, Rubber, Steel Shank, Size 12 103 PAIR
12 Boots, Hip, Rubber, Steel Shank, Size 13 114 PAIR
13 Boots, Knee, Size 8 38 PAIR
14 Boots, Knee, Size 9 78 PAIR
15 Boots, Knee, Size 10 108 PAIR
16 Boots, Knee, Size 11 138 PAIR
17 Boots, Knee, Size 12 114 PAIR
18 Boots, Knee, Size 13 84 PAIR
19 Coat, Rain, Full Length, Size SM 20 EA
20 Coat, Rain, Full Length, Size MD 40 EA
21 Coat, Rain, Full Length, Size LG 168 EA
22 Coat, Rain, Full Length, Size XL 251 EA
23 Coveralls, Size 2XL, White 6,500 EA
24 Coveralls, Size 3XL, White 3,026 EA
25 Coveralls, Size 4XL, White 2,375 EA
26 Coveralls, Size SM, White 100 EA
27 Coveralls, Size MD, White 125 EA
28 Coveralls, Size LG, White 1,975 PAIR
29 Coveralls, Size XL, White 2,742 EA
30 Ear Muff, Adjustable Position 84 EA
31 Ear Muff, Over the Head 162 EA
32 Ear Plugs,Uncorded Foam 82 BX
33 Glasses, Safety, Polarized 144 EA
34 Glasses, Safety, Blue Mirror Lens 220 EA

Unit Price
Extended 

Price Unit Price
Extended 

Price Unit Price
Extended 

Price Unit Price
Extended 

Price

NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

$40.79 $2,447.40 $44.94 $2,696.40 NB NB $32.50 $1,950.00
$40.79 $5,384.28 $44.94 $5,932.08 NB NB $32.50 $4,290.00
$40.79 $8,402.74 $44.94 $9,257.64 NB NB $32.50 $6,695.00
$40.79 $5,588.23 $44.94 $6,156.78 NB NB $32.50 $4,452.50
$40.79 $4,201.37 $44.94 $4,628.82 NB NB $32.50 $3,347.50
$40.79 $4,650.06 $44.94 $5,123.16 NB NB $32.50 $3,705.00
$9.76 $370.88 $20.60 $782.80 NB NB $9.25 $351.50
$9.76 $761.28 $20.60 $1,606.80 NB NB $9.25 $721.50
$9.76 $1,054.08 $20.60 $2,224.80 NB NB $9.25 $999.00
$9.76 $1,346.88 $20.60 $2,842.80 NB NB $9.25 $1,276.50
$9.76 $1,112.64 $20.60 $2,348.40 NB NB $9.25 $1,054.50
$9.76 $819.84 $20.60 $1,730.40 NB NB $9.25 $777.00
$5.37 $107.40 $3.84 $76.80 NB NB NB NB
$5.10 $204.00 $3.84 $153.60 NB NB NB NB
$5.10 $856.80 $3.84 $645.12 NB NB NB NB
$5.10 $1,280.10 $3.84 $963.84 NB NB NB NB
$3.08 $20,020.00 $3.77 $24,505.00 NB NB NB NB
$3.26 $9,864.76 $4.00 $12,104.00 NB NB NB NB
$3.50 $8,312.50 $4.30 $10,212.50 NB NB NB NB
$2.92 $292.00 $3.59 $359.00 NB NB NB NB
$2.92 $365.00 $3.59 $448.75 NB NB NB NB
$2.92 $5,767.00 $3.59 $7,090.25 NB NB NB NB
$2.92 $8,006.64 $3.59 $9,843.78 NB NB NB NB
$8.53 $716.52 NB NB NB NB NB NB
$8.87 $1,436.94 NB NB NB NB NB NB

$23.37 $1,916.34 NB NB NB NB NB NB
$27.78 $4,000.32 NB NB NB NB $16.95 $2,440.80
$7.56 $1,663.20 NB NB NB NB NB NB

Global Protection 
Acquisition Inc.

Terms: Net 30 Days
Delivery: 14 Days

West Berlin, NJ

Uniforms 
Manufacturing Inc.

Scottsdale, AZ
Terms: Net 30 Days
Delivery: 30 Days

NAFECO
Clearwater, FL

Terms: Net 30 Days
Delivery: 30 Days

Abel Unlimited Inc.
Riviera Beach, FL

Terms: Net 30 Days
Delivery: Not Specified
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IFB No. 6715 Three-Year Contract for
Safety Clothing and Supplies

City of St. Petersburg

Bid Tabulation
Purchasing and Materials Management

Item
No. Description *EAU UOM

35 Glasses, Safety, Brown Lens 516 EA
36 Glasses, Safety, Amber Lens 276 EA
37 Glasses, Safety, Platinum Color 920 EA
38 Glasses, Safety, Grey Lens 1,440 EA
39 Glasses, Safety, Scratch Resistant 1,818 EA
40 Glasses, Safety, Gold Mirror Lens 740 EA
41 Glove, Mechanic 260 EA
42 Gloves, Antivibration, Size XL 12 PAIR
43 Gloves, Size SM 12 PAIR
44 Gloves, Size MD 72 PAIR
45 Gloves, Size LG 150 PAIR
46 Gloves, Size XL 168 PAIR
47 Gloves, Size SM 450 BX
48 Gloves, Powderless, Size MD 1,872 BX
49 Gloves, Powderless, Size LG 2,672 BX
50 Gloves, Powderless, Size XL 2,426 BX
51 Gloves, Mens, Safety Cuff, One Size 5,100 PAIR
52 Gloves, Mens, Waterproof Cuff, One Size 21,888 PAIR
53 Gloves, Mens, 12IN Length, One Size, Black 264 PAIR
54 Gloves, Mens, 18IN length, Size LG 456 PAIR
55 Gloves, Mens, Safety Cuffs, Natural 9,984 PAIR
56 Gloves, Nitrile Coated, Size XL 22,956 PAIR
57 Gloves, Wrist Length 960 EA
58 Gloves, Womens, Safety Cuff, One Size 552 PAIR
59 Gloves, Work, 2IN, 16 ml, Natural, Size LG 264 PAIR
60 Gloves, Work, Cotton, Size SM, MD, LG, XL 5,976 PAIR
61 Gloves, Work, Cotton Seam-Free Liner, Size LG 1,680 PAIR
62 Goggles, Protective, No-Fog Lens 204 EA
63 Hat Rack, Safety 12 EA
64 Hat, Hard, Full Brim, White 44 EA
65 Hat, Hard, Full Brim, Yellow 143 EA
66 Hat, Hard, Suspension Replacement System 6 EA
67 Headgear, Adjust Head Size, Clear Acetate 10 EA
68 Jacket, Rain, 3 IN Block Screen, Size SM 4 EA
69 Jacket, Rain, 3 IN Block Screen, Size MD 6 EA

Unit Price
Extended 

Price Unit Price
Extended 

Price Unit Price
Extended 

Price Unit Price
Extended 

Price

Global Protection 
Acquisition Inc.

Terms: Net 30 Days
Delivery: 14 Days

West Berlin, NJ

Uniforms 
Manufacturing Inc.

Scottsdale, AZ
Terms: Net 30 Days
Delivery: 30 Days

NAFECO
Clearwater, FL

Terms: Net 30 Days
Delivery: 30 Days

Abel Unlimited Inc.
Riviera Beach, FL

Terms: Net 30 Days
Delivery: Not Specified

$7.28 $3,756.48 NB NB NB NB $1.70 $877.20
$4.33 $1,195.08 NB NB NB NB $1.70 $469.20
$4.33 $3,983.60 NB NB NB NB $1.70 $1,564.00
$3.98 $5,731.20 NB NB NB NB $1.65 $2,376.00
$4.75 $8,635.50 NB NB NB NB $1.80 $3,272.40
$5.88 $4,351.20 NB NB NB NB $1.80 $1,332.00
$0.71 $184.60 $8.32 $2,163.20 NB NB NB NB
$4.40 $52.80 $41.60 $499.20 NB NB NB NB

$16.78 $201.36 NB NB NB NB NB NB
$16.78 $1,208.16 NB NB NB NB NB NB
$16.78 $2,517.00 NB NB NB NB NB NB
$16.78 $2,819.04 NB NB NB NB NB NB
$14.81 $6,664.50 $4.73 $2,128.50 NB NB NB NB
$14.81 $27,724.32 $4.73 $8,854.56 NB NB NB NB
$14.81 $39,572.32 $4.73 $12,638.56 NB NB $3.67 $9,806.24
$14.81 $35,929.06 $4.73 $11,474.98 NB NB $3.67 $8,903.42
$0.83 $4,233.00 $0.87 $4,437.00 NB NB $1.05 $5,355.00
$1.10 $24,076.80 $1.22 $26,703.36 NB NB $1.10 $24,076.80
$1.13 $298.32 $1.26 $332.64 NB NB $1.00 $264.00
$1.21 $551.76 $1.35 $615.60 NB NB $1.20 $547.20
$1.39 $13,877.76 $1.55 $15,475.20 NB NB NB NB
$1.00 $22,956.00 $1.13 $25,940.28 NB NB $1.20 $27,547.20

NB NB $6.89 $6,614.40 NB NB NB NB
$1.55 $855.60 $0.98 $540.96 NB NB NB NB
$1.66 $438.24 $0.42 $110.88 NB NB $0.85 $224.40
$1.38 $8,246.88 $1.05 $6,274.80 NB NB $0.92 $5,497.92
$2.11 $3,544.80 $1.40 $2,352.00 NB NB NB NB
$4.17 $850.68 NB NB NB NB NB NB
$6.25 $75.00 NB NB NB NB NB NB

$12.38 $544.72 NB NB NB NB NB NB
$12.38 $1,770.34 NB NB NB NB NB NB

NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
NB NB $4.49 $17.96 NB NB NB NB
NB NB $4.49 $26.94 NB NB NB NB
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IFB No. 6715 Three-Year Contract for
Safety Clothing and Supplies

City of St. Petersburg

Bid Tabulation
Purchasing and Materials Management

Item
No. Description *EAU UOM

70 Jacket, Rain, 3 IN Block Screen, Size LG 12 EA
71 Jacket, Rain, 3 IN Block Screen, Size XL 17 EA
72 Jacket, Rain, 3 IN Block Screen, Size 2XL 25 EA
73 Jacket, Rain, 3 IN Block Screen, Size 3XL 16 EA
74 Jacket, Rain, Size SM, Safety Yellow 20 EA
75 Jacket, Rain, Size MD, Safety Yellow 75 EA
76 Jacket, Rain, Size LG, Safety Yellow 109 EA
77 Jacket, Rain, Size XL, Yellow 120 EA
78 Jacket, Rain, Size 2XL, Safety Yellow 40 EA
79 Jacket, Rain, Size 3XL, Safety Yellow 40 EA
80 Liner, Hard Hat, Single Layer 10 EA
81 Overalls, Rain, Bib Trousers, Size SM 20 EA
82 Overalls, Rain, Bib Trousers, Size MD 30 EA
83 Overalls, Rain, Bib Trousers, Size LG 40 EA
84 Overalls, Rain, Bib Trousers, Size XL 40 EA
85 Overalls, Rain, Bib Trousers, Size 2XL 40 EA
86 Respirator, Disposable 568 EA
87 Respirator, Dust and Mist 368 PKG
88 Shield, Face, Polycarbonate 10 EA
89 Sweatband, Disposable 6,600 EA
90 Vest, Front Velcro Closure 901 EA
91 Vest, Front Zipper Closure 599 EA
92 Visor, Faceshield, 8IN x 15IN x .040IN 1,500 EA
93 Visor, Wire Mesh, 6" x 11 1/2" 10 EA
94 Wader, Chest, Steel Toe, Size 8 4 PAIR
95 Wader, Chest, Steel Toe, Size 9 11 PAIR
96 Wader, Chest, Steel Toe, Size 10 8 PAIR
97 Wader, Chest, Steel Toe, Size 11 14 PAIR
98 Wader, Chest, Steel Toe, Size 12 28 PAIR

Total :
SBDE:

Discount 2%-10 Days:
Total w/Discount:

Statement of No Bid:
Mantek, Division of NCH Corp.
Pro-Am Safety Inc.
Aramsco
AA Casey

Unit Price
Extended 

Price Unit Price
Extended 

Price Unit Price
Extended 

Price Unit Price
Extended 

Price

Global Protection 
Acquisition Inc.

Terms: Net 30 Days
Delivery: 14 Days

West Berlin, NJ

Uniforms 
Manufacturing Inc.

Scottsdale, AZ
Terms: Net 30 Days
Delivery: 30 Days

NAFECO
Clearwater, FL

Terms: Net 30 Days
Delivery: 30 Days

Abel Unlimited Inc.
Riviera Beach, FL

Terms: Net 30 Days
Delivery: Not Specified

NB NB $4.49 $53.88 NB NB NB NB
NB NB $4.49 $76.33 NB NB NB NB
NB NB $4.64 $116.00 NB NB NB NB
NB NB $4.81 $76.96 NB NB NB NB

$3.06 $61.20 $3.19 $63.80 NB NB NB NB
$3.06 $229.50 $3.19 $239.25 NB NB NB NB
$3.06 $333.54 $3.19 $347.71 NB NB NB NB
$3.06 $367.20 $3.19 $382.80 NB NB NB NB
$3.20 $128.00 $3.34 $133.60 NB NB NB NB
$3.39 $135.60 $3.51 $140.40 NB NB NB NB

NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
$2.20 $44.00 $2.30 $46.00 NB NB NB NB
$2.20 $66.00 $2.30 $69.00 NB NB NB NB
$2.20 $88.00 $2.30 $92.00 NB NB NB NB
$2.20 $88.00 $2.30 $92.00 NB NB NB NB
$2.31 $92.40 $2.42 $96.80 NB NB NB NB
$5.16 $2,930.88 NB NB NB NB NB NB

$11.26 $4,143.68 NB NB NB NB NB NB
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

$11.08 $2,925.12 NB NB NB NB NB NB
NB NB NB NB $9.00 $8,109.00 $2.90 $2,612.90

$16.51 $9,889.49 NB NB $7.75 $4,642.25 NB NB
$1.30 $1,950.00 NB NB NB NB $0.85 $1,275.00

NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
$66.06 $264.24 $117.22 $468.88 NB NB NB NB
$66.06 $726.66 $117.22 $1,289.42 NB NB NB NB
$66.06 $528.48 $117.22 $937.76 NB NB NB NB
$66.06 $924.84 $117.22 $1,641.08 NB NB NB NB
$66.06 $1,849.68 $117.22 $3,282.16 NB NB NB NB

$355,561.83 $248,580.37 $12,751.25 $128,061.68
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

$355,561.83 $248,580.37 $12,751.25 $128,061.68
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IFB No. 6715 Three-Year Contract for
Safety Clothing and Supplies

City of St. Petersburg

Bid Tabulation
Purchasing and Materials Management

Item
No. Description *EAU UOM

1 Back Support, Size SM 25-30" 12 EA
2 Back Support, Size MD 30-34" 42 EA
3 Back Support, Size LG 34-38" 47 EA
4 Back Support, Size XL 38-42" 30 EA
5 Back Support, Size 2XL 42-46" 12 EA
6 Bandana, Cool Wrap, Chill Its 6705 or Equal 68 EA
7 Boots, Hip, Rubber, Steel Shank, Size 8 60 PAIR
8 Boots, Hip, Rubber, Steel Shank, Size 9 132 PAIR
9 Boots, Hip, Rubber, Steel Shank, Size 10 206 PAIR
10 Boots, Hip, Rubber, Steel Shank, Size 11 137 PAIR
11 Boots, Hip, Rubber, Steel Shank, Size 12 103 PAIR
12 Boots, Hip, Rubber, Steel Shank, Size 13 114 PAIR
13 Boots, Knee, Size 8 38 PAIR
14 Boots, Knee, Size 9 78 PAIR
15 Boots, Knee, Size 10 108 PAIR
16 Boots, Knee, Size 11 138 PAIR
17 Boots, Knee, Size 12 114 PAIR
18 Boots, Knee, Size 13 84 PAIR
19 Coat, Rain, Full Length, Size SM 20 EA
20 Coat, Rain, Full Length, Size MD 40 EA
21 Coat, Rain, Full Length, Size LG 168 EA
22 Coat, Rain, Full Length, Size XL 251 EA
23 Coveralls, Size 2XL, White 6,500 EA
24 Coveralls, Size 3XL, White 3,026 EA
25 Coveralls, Size 4XL, White 2,375 EA
26 Coveralls, Size SM, White 100 EA
27 Coveralls, Size MD, White 125 EA
28 Coveralls, Size LG, White 1,975 PAIR
29 Coveralls, Size XL, White 2,742 EA
30 Ear Muff, Adjustable Position 84 EA
31 Ear Muff, Over the Head 162 EA
32 Ear Plugs,Uncorded Foam 82 BX
33 Glasses, Safety, Polarized 144 EA
34 Glasses, Safety, Blue Mirror Lens 220 EA

Unit Price
Extended 

Price Unit Price
Extended 

Price Unit Price
Extended 

Price

$9.04 $108.48 $7.43 $89.16 NB NB
$6.70 $281.40 $7.43 $312.06 NB NB
$6.70 $314.90 $7.43 $349.21 NB NB
$6.70 $201.00 $7.43 $222.90 NB NB
$6.71 $80.52 $7.43 $89.16 NB NB
$2.32 $157.76 $1.06 $72.08 NB NB

$36.08 $2,164.80 $39.10 $2,346.00 NB NB
$36.09 $4,763.88 $39.10 $5,161.20 NB NB
$36.12 $7,440.72 $39.10 $8,054.60 NB NB
$36.13 $4,949.81 $39.10 $5,356.70 NB NB
$36.70 $3,780.10 $39.10 $4,027.30 NB NB
$36.65 $4,178.10 $39.10 $4,457.40 NB NB
$15.43 $586.34 $10.32 $392.16 NB NB
$15.43 $1,203.54 $10.32 $804.96 NB NB
$15.47 $1,670.76 $10.32 $1,114.56 NB NB
$15.46 $2,133.48 $10.32 $1,424.16 NB NB
$15.47 $1,763.58 $10.32 $1,176.48 NB NB
$16.00 $1,344.00 $10.32 $866.88 NB NB

NB NB $3.70 $74.00 NB NB
NB NB $3.70 $148.00 NB NB
NB NB $3.70 $621.60 NB NB
NB NB $3.70 $928.70 NB NB
NB NB $3.62 $23,530.00 $2.55 $16,575.00
NB NB $3.85 $11,650.10 $2.70 $8,170.20
NB NB $4.13 $9,808.75 $2.88 $6,840.00
NB NB $3.45 $345.00 NB NB
NB NB $3.45 $431.25 $2.55 $318.75
NB NB $3.45 $6,813.75 $2.55 $5,036.25
NB NB $3.45 $9,459.90 $2.55 $6,992.10

$4.91 $412.44 $16.28 $1,367.52 NB NB
$15.06 $2,439.72 $13.20 $2,138.40 NB NB
$14.44 $1,184.08 $14.12 $1,157.84 NB NB
$1.50 $216.00 $29.41 $4,235.04 NB NB

$19.95 $4,389.00 $4.59 $1,009.80 NB NB

E & R Industrial Sales, 
Inc.

Largo, FL
Terms: Net 30 Days

Delivery: 4 Days

American Chemical & 
Building Maintenance 

Supply, Inc.
St. Petersburg, FL

Terms: Net 30 Days
Delivery: 5 Days

W.W. Grainger
Tampa, FL

Terms: Net 30 Days
Delivery: 5 Days
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IFB No. 6715 Three-Year Contract for
Safety Clothing and Supplies

City of St. Petersburg

Bid Tabulation
Purchasing and Materials Management

Item
No. Description *EAU UOM

35 Glasses, Safety, Brown Lens 516 EA
36 Glasses, Safety, Amber Lens 276 EA
37 Glasses, Safety, Platinum Color 920 EA
38 Glasses, Safety, Grey Lens 1,440 EA
39 Glasses, Safety, Scratch Resistant 1,818 EA
40 Glasses, Safety, Gold Mirror Lens 740 EA
41 Glove, Mechanic 260 EA
42 Gloves, Antivibration, Size XL 12 PAIR
43 Gloves, Size SM 12 PAIR
44 Gloves, Size MD 72 PAIR
45 Gloves, Size LG 150 PAIR
46 Gloves, Size XL 168 PAIR
47 Gloves, Size SM 450 BX
48 Gloves, Powderless, Size MD 1,872 BX
49 Gloves, Powderless, Size LG 2,672 BX
50 Gloves, Powderless, Size XL 2,426 BX
51 Gloves, Mens, Safety Cuff, One Size 5,100 PAIR
52 Gloves, Mens, Waterproof Cuff, One Size 21,888 PAIR
53 Gloves, Mens, 12IN Length, One Size, Black 264 PAIR
54 Gloves, Mens, 18IN length, Size LG 456 PAIR
55 Gloves, Mens, Safety Cuffs, Natural 9,984 PAIR
56 Gloves, Nitrile Coated, Size XL 22,956 PAIR
57 Gloves, Wrist Length 960 EA
58 Gloves, Womens, Safety Cuff, One Size 552 PAIR
59 Gloves, Work, 2IN, 16 ml, Natural, Size LG 264 PAIR
60 Gloves, Work, Cotton, Size SM, MD, LG, XL 5,976 PAIR
61 Gloves, Work, Cotton Seam-Free Liner, Size LG 1,680 PAIR
62 Goggles, Protective, No-Fog Lens 204 EA
63 Hat Rack, Safety 12 EA
64 Hat, Hard, Full Brim, White 44 EA
65 Hat, Hard, Full Brim, Yellow 143 EA
66 Hat, Hard, Suspension Replacement System 6 EA
67 Headgear, Adjust Head Size, Clear Acetate 10 EA
68 Jacket, Rain, 3 IN Block Screen, Size SM 4 EA
69 Jacket, Rain, 3 IN Block Screen, Size MD 6 EA

Unit Price
Extended 

Price Unit Price
Extended 

Price Unit Price
Extended 

Price

E & R Industrial Sales, 
Inc.

Largo, FL
Terms: Net 30 Days

Delivery: 4 Days

American Chemical & 
Building Maintenance 

Supply, Inc.
St. Petersburg, FL

Terms: Net 30 Days
Delivery: 5 Days

W.W. Grainger
Tampa, FL

Terms: Net 30 Days
Delivery: 5 Days

$3.23 $1,666.68 $4.30 $2,218.80 $1.25 $645.00
$5.18 $1,429.68 $2.78 $767.28 $4.75 $1,311.00
$4.82 $4,434.40 $2.16 $1,987.20 NB NB
$5.31 $7,646.40 $2.24 $3,225.60 NB NB

$19.95 $36,269.10 NB NB NB NB
$6.03 $4,462.20 $5.39 $3,988.60 NB NB
$6.11 $1,588.60 $8.25 $2,145.00 NB NB

$15.13 $181.56 NB NB NB NB
$5.04 $60.48 $9.38 $112.56 NB NB
$9.39 $676.08 $9.38 $675.36 NB NB
$9.38 $1,407.00 $9.38 $1,407.00 NB NB
$9.39 $1,577.52 $9.38 $1,575.84 NB NB
$0.96 $432.00 $7.04 $3,168.00 NB NB
$0.96 $1,797.12 $7.04 $13,178.88 NB NB
$0.96 $2,565.12 $7.04 $18,810.88 NB NB
$0.97 $2,353.22 $7.04 $17,079.04 NB NB
$3.43 $17,493.00 $0.99 $5,049.00 NB NB
$5.04 $110,315.52 $1.10 $24,076.80 NB NB
$6.07 $1,602.48 $0.99 $261.36 NB NB
$1.44 $656.64 $1.18 $538.08 NB NB
$1.14 $11,381.76 $1.12 $11,182.08 NB NB
$2.07 $47,518.92 $1.00 $22,956.00 NB NB
$5.96 $5,721.60 $4.13 $3,964.80 NB NB

NB NB $0.67 $369.84 NB NB
$0.87 $229.68 $0.35 $92.40 NB NB

$11.17 $66,751.92 $0.92 $5,497.92 $2.48 $14,820.48
$14.70 $24,696.00 $1.35 $2,268.00 NB NB
$27.33 $5,575.32 $1.67 $340.68 NB NB
$5.35 $64.20 NB NB NB NB
$8.86 $389.84 $7.40 $325.60 NB NB
$8.86 $1,266.98 $7.40 $1,058.20 NB NB
$4.80 $28.80 $4.20 $25.20 NB NB
$5.93 $59.30 NB NB NB NB

NB NB $5.93 $23.72 NB NB
NB NB $5.93 $35.58 NB NB
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IFB No. 6715 Three-Year Contract for
Safety Clothing and Supplies

City of St. Petersburg

Bid Tabulation
Purchasing and Materials Management

Item
No. Description *EAU UOM

70 Jacket, Rain, 3 IN Block Screen, Size LG 12 EA
71 Jacket, Rain, 3 IN Block Screen, Size XL 17 EA
72 Jacket, Rain, 3 IN Block Screen, Size 2XL 25 EA
73 Jacket, Rain, 3 IN Block Screen, Size 3XL 16 EA
74 Jacket, Rain, Size SM, Safety Yellow 20 EA
75 Jacket, Rain, Size MD, Safety Yellow 75 EA
76 Jacket, Rain, Size LG, Safety Yellow 109 EA
77 Jacket, Rain, Size XL, Yellow 120 EA
78 Jacket, Rain, Size 2XL, Safety Yellow 40 EA
79 Jacket, Rain, Size 3XL, Safety Yellow 40 EA
80 Liner, Hard Hat, Single Layer 10 EA
81 Overalls, Rain, Bib Trousers, Size SM 20 EA
82 Overalls, Rain, Bib Trousers, Size MD 30 EA
83 Overalls, Rain, Bib Trousers, Size LG 40 EA
84 Overalls, Rain, Bib Trousers, Size XL 40 EA
85 Overalls, Rain, Bib Trousers, Size 2XL 40 EA
86 Respirator, Disposable 568 EA
87 Respirator, Dust and Mist 368 PKG
88 Shield, Face, Polycarbonate 10 EA
89 Sweatband, Disposable 6,600 EA
90 Vest, Front Velcro Closure 901 EA
91 Vest, Front Zipper Closure 599 EA
92 Visor, Faceshield, 8IN x 15IN x .040IN 1,500 EA
93 Visor, Wire Mesh, 6" x 11 1/2" 10 EA
94 Wader, Chest, Steel Toe, Size 8 4 PAIR
95 Wader, Chest, Steel Toe, Size 9 11 PAIR
96 Wader, Chest, Steel Toe, Size 10 8 PAIR
97 Wader, Chest, Steel Toe, Size 11 14 PAIR
98 Wader, Chest, Steel Toe, Size 12 28 PAIR

Total :
SBDE:

Discount 2%-10 Days:
Total w/Discount:

Statement of No Bid:
Mantek, Division of NCH Corp.
Pro-Am Safety Inc.
Aramsco
AA Casey

Unit Price
Extended 

Price Unit Price
Extended 

Price Unit Price
Extended 

Price

E & R Industrial Sales, 
Inc.

Largo, FL
Terms: Net 30 Days

Delivery: 4 Days

American Chemical & 
Building Maintenance 

Supply, Inc.
St. Petersburg, FL

Terms: Net 30 Days
Delivery: 5 Days

W.W. Grainger
Tampa, FL

Terms: Net 30 Days
Delivery: 5 Days

NB NB $5.93 $71.16 NB NB
NB NB $5.93 $100.81 NB NB
NB NB $6.09 $152.25 NB NB
NB NB $6.26 $100.16 NB NB
NB NB $3.10 $62.00 NB NB
NB NB $3.10 $232.50 NB NB
NB NB $3.10 $337.90 NB NB
NB NB $3.10 $372.00 NB NB
NB NB $3.22 $128.80 NB NB
NB NB $3.38 $135.20 NB NB

$1.20 $12.00 $1.65 $16.50 NB NB
NB NB $2.22 $44.40 NB NB
NB NB $2.22 $66.60 NB NB
NB NB $2.22 $88.80 NB NB
NB NB $2.22 $88.80 NB NB
NB NB $2.34 $93.60 NB NB

$5.69 $3,231.92 $5.80 $3,294.40 NB NB
$10.66 $3,922.88 $7.82 $2,877.76 NB NB
$4.83 $48.30 $1.93 $19.30 NB NB

$23.25 $153,450.00 $0.20 $1,320.00 NB NB
$3.01 $2,712.01 $3.93 $3,540.93 NB NB

$12.65 $7,577.35 $9.63 $5,768.37 NB NB
$3.60 $5,400.00 NB NB NB NB

NB NB NB NB NB NB
NB NB $101.44 $405.76 NB NB
NB NB $101.44 $1,115.84 NB NB
NB NB $101.44 $811.52 NB NB
NB NB $101.44 $1,420.16 NB NB
NB NB $101.44 $2,840.32 NB NB

$584,417.99 $283,947.76 $60,708.78
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00

$584,417.99 $283,947.76 $60,708.78
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IFB No. 6715 Three-Year Contract for
Safety Clothing and Supplies

City of St. Petersburg

Bid Tabulation
Purchasing and Materials Management

Item
No. Description *EAU UOM

1 Back Support, Size SM 25-30" 12 EA
2 Back Support, Size MD 30-34" 42 EA
3 Back Support, Size LG 34-38" 47 EA
4 Back Support, Size XL 38-42" 30 EA
5 Back Support, Size 2XL 42-46" 12 EA
6 Bandana, Cool Wrap, Chill Its 6705 or Equal 68 EA
7 Boots, Hip, Rubber, Steel Shank, Size 8 60 PAIR
8 Boots, Hip, Rubber, Steel Shank, Size 9 132 PAIR
9 Boots, Hip, Rubber, Steel Shank, Size 10 206 PAIR
10 Boots, Hip, Rubber, Steel Shank, Size 11 137 PAIR
11 Boots, Hip, Rubber, Steel Shank, Size 12 103 PAIR
12 Boots, Hip, Rubber, Steel Shank, Size 13 114 PAIR
13 Boots, Knee, Size 8 38 PAIR
14 Boots, Knee, Size 9 78 PAIR
15 Boots, Knee, Size 10 108 PAIR
16 Boots, Knee, Size 11 138 PAIR
17 Boots, Knee, Size 12 114 PAIR
18 Boots, Knee, Size 13 84 PAIR
19 Coat, Rain, Full Length, Size SM 20 EA
20 Coat, Rain, Full Length, Size MD 40 EA
21 Coat, Rain, Full Length, Size LG 168 EA
22 Coat, Rain, Full Length, Size XL 251 EA
23 Coveralls, Size 2XL, White 6,500 EA
24 Coveralls, Size 3XL, White 3,026 EA
25 Coveralls, Size 4XL, White 2,375 EA
26 Coveralls, Size SM, White 100 EA
27 Coveralls, Size MD, White 125 EA
28 Coveralls, Size LG, White 1,975 PAIR
29 Coveralls, Size XL, White 2,742 EA
30 Ear Muff, Adjustable Position 84 EA
31 Ear Muff, Over the Head 162 EA
32 Ear Plugs,Uncorded Foam 82 BX
33 Glasses, Safety, Polarized 144 EA
34 Glasses, Safety, Blue Mirror Lens 220 EA

Unit Price
Extended 

Price Unit Price
Extended 

Price

$8.28 $99.36 NB NB
$8.28 $347.76 NB NB
$8.28 $389.16 NB NB
$8.28 $248.40 NB NB
$8.28 $99.36 NB NB
$1.42 $96.56 NB NB

$28.99 $1,739.40 NB NB
$28.99 $3,826.68 NB NB
$28.99 $5,971.94 NB NB
$28.99 $3,971.63 NB NB
$28.99 $2,985.97 NB NB
$28.99 $3,304.86 NB NB
$10.49 $398.62 NB NB
$10.49 $818.22 NB NB
$10.49 $1,132.92 NB NB
$10.49 $1,447.62 NB NB
$10.49 $1,195.86 NB NB
$10.49 $881.16 NB NB
$3.49 $69.80 $4.14 $82.80
$3.49 $139.60 $4.15 $166.00
$3.49 $586.32 $4.15 $697.20
$3.49 $875.99 $4.15 $1,041.65
$3.58 $23,270.00 $4.27 $27,755.00
$3.79 $11,468.54 $4.52 $13,677.52
$4.10 $9,737.50 $4.88 $11,590.00
$3.58 $358.00 NB NB
$3.58 $447.50 $4.03 $503.75
$3.58 $7,070.50 $4.03 $7,959.25
$3.58 $9,816.36 $4.03 $11,050.26

$11.49 $965.16 NB NB
$15.25 $2,470.50 NB NB
$15.49 $1,270.18 $19.26 $1,579.32
$6.99 $1,006.56 $35.33 $5,087.52
$4.49 $987.80 $5.52 $1,214.40

Ritz Safety, LLC
Tampa, FL

Terms: Net 30 Days
Delivery: 4 Days

Motion Industries, Inc.
Tampa, FL

Terms: Net 30 Days
Delivery: Not Specified
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IFB No. 6715 Three-Year Contract for
Safety Clothing and Supplies

City of St. Petersburg

Bid Tabulation
Purchasing and Materials Management

Item
No. Description *EAU UOM

35 Glasses, Safety, Brown Lens 516 EA
36 Glasses, Safety, Amber Lens 276 EA
37 Glasses, Safety, Platinum Color 920 EA
38 Glasses, Safety, Grey Lens 1,440 EA
39 Glasses, Safety, Scratch Resistant 1,818 EA
40 Glasses, Safety, Gold Mirror Lens 740 EA
41 Glove, Mechanic 260 EA
42 Gloves, Antivibration, Size XL 12 PAIR
43 Gloves, Size SM 12 PAIR
44 Gloves, Size MD 72 PAIR
45 Gloves, Size LG 150 PAIR
46 Gloves, Size XL 168 PAIR
47 Gloves, Size SM 450 BX
48 Gloves, Powderless, Size MD 1,872 BX
49 Gloves, Powderless, Size LG 2,672 BX
50 Gloves, Powderless, Size XL 2,426 BX
51 Gloves, Mens, Safety Cuff, One Size 5,100 PAIR
52 Gloves, Mens, Waterproof Cuff, One Size 21,888 PAIR
53 Gloves, Mens, 12IN Length, One Size, Black 264 PAIR
54 Gloves, Mens, 18IN length, Size LG 456 PAIR
55 Gloves, Mens, Safety Cuffs, Natural 9,984 PAIR
56 Gloves, Nitrile Coated, Size XL 22,956 PAIR
57 Gloves, Wrist Length 960 EA
58 Gloves, Womens, Safety Cuff, One Size 552 PAIR
59 Gloves, Work, 2IN, 16 ml, Natural, Size LG 264 PAIR
60 Gloves, Work, Cotton, Size SM, MD, LG, XL 5,976 PAIR
61 Gloves, Work, Cotton Seam-Free Liner, Size LG 1,680 PAIR
62 Goggles, Protective, No-Fog Lens 204 EA
63 Hat Rack, Safety 12 EA
64 Hat, Hard, Full Brim, White 44 EA
65 Hat, Hard, Full Brim, Yellow 143 EA
66 Hat, Hard, Suspension Replacement System 6 EA
67 Headgear, Adjust Head Size, Clear Acetate 10 EA
68 Jacket, Rain, 3 IN Block Screen, Size SM 4 EA
69 Jacket, Rain, 3 IN Block Screen, Size MD 6 EA

Unit Price
Extended 

Price Unit Price
Extended 

Price

Ritz Safety, LLC
Tampa, FL

Terms: Net 30 Days
Delivery: 4 Days

Motion Industries, Inc.
Tampa, FL

Terms: Net 30 Days
Delivery: Not Specified

$4.25 $2,193.00 $2.05 $1,057.80
$4.49 $1,239.24 $2.05 $565.80
$4.49 $4,130.80 $2.60 $2,392.00
$1.45 $2,088.00 NB NB
$0.87 $1,581.66 NB NB
$6.45 $4,773.00 NB NB
$8.25 $2,145.00 $9.35 $2,431.00
$9.09 $109.08 NB NB

NB NB NB NB
$9.15 $658.80 $11.24 $809.28
$9.15 $1,372.50 $11.24 $1,686.00
$9.15 $1,537.20 $11.24 $1,888.32
$7.15 $3,217.50 $7.97 $3,586.50
$7.15 $13,384.80 $7.97 $14,919.84
$7.15 $19,104.80 $7.97 $21,295.84
$7.15 $17,345.90 $7.97 $19,335.22
$0.87 $4,437.00 $1.12 $5,712.00
$0.89 $19,480.32 $1.36 $29,767.68
$0.73 $192.72 $1.16 $306.24
$7.86 $3,584.16 $0.99 $451.44
$0.52 $5,191.68 $1.25 $12,480.00
$1.12 $25,710.72 $2.07 $47,518.92
$3.49 $3,350.40 NB NB
$1.08 $596.16 $1.44 $794.88
$3.89 $1,026.96 $0.42 $110.88
$0.99 $5,916.24 $4.04 $24,143.04
$0.83 $1,394.40 $1.53 $2,570.40
$7.65 $1,560.60 $2.01 $410.04
$6.88 $82.56 NB NB
$6.69 $294.36 NB NB
$6.69 $956.67 NB NB
$2.29 $13.74 NB NB
$5.05 $50.50 $6.88 $68.80
$3.99 $15.96 $7.25 $29.00
$3.99 $23.94 $7.25 $43.50

14 of 15



IFB No. 6715 Three-Year Contract for
Safety Clothing and Supplies

City of St. Petersburg

Bid Tabulation
Purchasing and Materials Management

Item
No. Description *EAU UOM

70 Jacket, Rain, 3 IN Block Screen, Size LG 12 EA
71 Jacket, Rain, 3 IN Block Screen, Size XL 17 EA
72 Jacket, Rain, 3 IN Block Screen, Size 2XL 25 EA
73 Jacket, Rain, 3 IN Block Screen, Size 3XL 16 EA
74 Jacket, Rain, Size SM, Safety Yellow 20 EA
75 Jacket, Rain, Size MD, Safety Yellow 75 EA
76 Jacket, Rain, Size LG, Safety Yellow 109 EA
77 Jacket, Rain, Size XL, Yellow 120 EA
78 Jacket, Rain, Size 2XL, Safety Yellow 40 EA
79 Jacket, Rain, Size 3XL, Safety Yellow 40 EA
80 Liner, Hard Hat, Single Layer 10 EA
81 Overalls, Rain, Bib Trousers, Size SM 20 EA
82 Overalls, Rain, Bib Trousers, Size MD 30 EA
83 Overalls, Rain, Bib Trousers, Size LG 40 EA
84 Overalls, Rain, Bib Trousers, Size XL 40 EA
85 Overalls, Rain, Bib Trousers, Size 2XL 40 EA
86 Respirator, Disposable 568 EA
87 Respirator, Dust and Mist 368 PKG
88 Shield, Face, Polycarbonate 10 EA
89 Sweatband, Disposable 6,600 EA
90 Vest, Front Velcro Closure 901 EA
91 Vest, Front Zipper Closure 599 EA
92 Visor, Faceshield, 8IN x 15IN x .040IN 1,500 EA
93 Visor, Wire Mesh, 6" x 11 1/2" 10 EA
94 Wader, Chest, Steel Toe, Size 8 4 PAIR
95 Wader, Chest, Steel Toe, Size 9 11 PAIR
96 Wader, Chest, Steel Toe, Size 10 8 PAIR
97 Wader, Chest, Steel Toe, Size 11 14 PAIR
98 Wader, Chest, Steel Toe, Size 12 28 PAIR

Total :
SBDE:

Discount 2%-10 Days:
Total w/Discount:

Statement of No Bid:
Mantek, Division of NCH Corp.
Pro-Am Safety Inc.
Aramsco
AA Casey

Unit Price
Extended 

Price Unit Price
Extended 

Price

Ritz Safety, LLC
Tampa, FL

Terms: Net 30 Days
Delivery: 4 Days

Motion Industries, Inc.
Tampa, FL

Terms: Net 30 Days
Delivery: Not Specified

$3.99 $47.88 $7.25 $87.00
$3.99 $67.83 $7.25 $123.25
$4.24 $106.00 $7.25 $181.25
$4.35 $69.60 $7.25 $116.00
$2.99 $59.80 $7.25 $145.00
$2.99 $224.25 $3.44 $258.00
$2.99 $325.91 $3.44 $374.96
$2.99 $358.80 $3.44 $412.80
$3.24 $129.60 $3.61 $144.40
$3.35 $134.00 $3.79 $151.60
$1.69 $16.90 NB NB
$2.15 $43.00 $2.48 $49.60
$2.15 $64.50 $2.48 $74.40
$2.15 $86.00 $2.48 $99.20
$2.15 $86.00 $2.48 $99.20
$2.26 $90.40 $2.60 $104.00
$5.80 $3,294.40 NB NB

$11.59 $4,265.12 $112.36 $41,348.48
$2.23 $22.30 NB NB
$0.18 $1,188.00 NB NB
$3.86 $3,477.86 $4.39 $3,955.39
$7.25 $4,342.75 $13.37 $8,008.63
$0.85 $1,275.00 NB NB
$7.64 $76.40 NB NB

$72.59 $290.36 NB NB
$72.59 $798.49 NB NB
$72.59 $580.72 NB NB
$72.59 $1,016.26 NB NB
$72.59 $2,032.52 NB NB

$272,826.81 $332,512.25
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00

$272,826.81 $332,512.25
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