Bid Tab for Bid# Q-03-176

Quote (01711) Dixie Printing (19132) Nick's Nacks (20130) 60 Second Print  (20792) Data Solutions
Info Quote:00003603 Quote: 00003604 Quote: 00003605 Quote: 00003606
Del Days: 5 Delv Days: 10 Delv Days:” Delv Days: 2
Item Info:
(1) Business Cards $21.00 $168.30 $23.00 $21.97
$10,080.00 $80,784.00 $11,040.00 $10,545.60
Box 480.0
No Bid No Bid
(2) "No Parking" signs $0.35 $0.61
$698.00 $1,212.20
EA 2000.0 NB NB
Totals: Net $ Total: $10,778.00 $81,996.20 $11,040.00 $10,545.60
$ Discount: $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
$ Awarded: $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Eval Codes: NI Eval Codes: NI

Evaluation Code Descriptions

NB = No Bid
NI = Did Not Bid All ltems

No Bid Quotes:

Quote: 00003611
Quote: 00003610
Quote: 00003609
Quote: 00003608
Quote: 00003607

Vendor: C&D Printing
Vendor: Your Logo
Vendor: Pride Enterprises

Vendor: Professional Systems of Pinellas

Vendor: Central Printers




