

City of St. Petersburg
Bid Tabulation
 Purchasing and Materials Mngament

Item No.	Description	EAU*	UOM	The Dumont Company, Inc. Apopka, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 2 Days		Allied Universal Corporation Miami, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 3 Days		American Chemical & Building Maint. Supply, Inc. dba Amchem St. Petersburg, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 2 Days	
				Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
1	Calcium Chloride, 50 LB/BG	416	BAG	\$19.75	\$8,216.00	\$15.20	\$6,323.20	\$17.00	\$7,072.00
2	Calcium Hypochlorite, 100 LB/DR	20	DRUM	132.00	2,640.00	139.00	2,780.00	149.50	2,990.00
3	Sodium Bicarbonate, 50 LB/BG	880	BAG	19.50	17,160.00	13.050	11,484.00	15.50	13,640.00
4	Sodium Hypochlorite, 15 GA/DR	5	DRUM	25.00	125.00	33.95	169.75	24.50	122.50
5	Sodium Hypochlorite, 55 GA/DR	454	DRUM	74.25	33,709.50	74.20	33,686.80	59.95	27,217.30
6	Sulfur Dioxide, 1 TN cylinder	15	EACH		No Bid	950.00	14,250.00		No Bid
7	Diatomaceous Earth, 25 LB/BG	300	BAG	14.50	4,350.00		No Bid	12.95	3,885.00
8	Muriatic Acid, 30%/20% HCl, 15 GA/DR	407	DRUM	59.00	24,013.00		No Bid	49.50	20,146.50
9	Muriatic Acid, 30%/20% HCl, 1 GA BOTTLE	5,775	GA	3.50	20,212.50		No Bid	2.75	15,881.25
10	Pool Filter Media, Aqua Perl only, 12 LB BAG	175	BAG	13.00	2,275.00		No Bid	12.00	2,100.00
Total:					\$112,701.00		\$68,693.75		\$93,054.55
SBE Discount:					\$0.00		\$0.00		\$5,583.27
Total:					\$112,701.00		\$68,693.75		\$87,471.28