

City of St. Petersburg
Bid Tabulation
Procurement and Supply Management

Line	Description	EAU UOM	Bert Lowe Supply Co. Lakeland, FL Terms: Net 30 Delivery: 5 Days		Dyco Paints, Inc. Clearwater, FL Terms: 2%/10, Net 30 Delivery: 1 Day		PPG Architectural Finishes, Inc. St. Petersburg, FL Terms: Net 30 Delivery: 3 Days	
			Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
1	Brush, 1", for all paint, nylon/sable polyester	315 EACH	\$0.98	\$308.70	\$3.29	\$1,036.35	\$4.59	\$1,445.85
2	Brush, 2" for all paint, nylon/sable polyester	370 EACH	1.40	518.00	2.75	1,017.50	1.26	466.20
3	Brush, 3" for all paint, nylon/sable polyester	670 EACH	2.10	1,407.00	3.78	2,532.60	10.26	6,874.20
4	Brush, 4", for all paint, nylon/sable polyester	35 EACH	3.20	112.00	6.49	227.15	17.17	600.95
5	Brush, scratch, wire, 3X16 row, plastic handle	40 EACH	NO BID	NO BID	1.29	51.60	2.65	106.00
6	Cover, paint roller, 9" X 1-1/2", 1-1/4" nap	30 EACH	1.90	57.00	1.80	54.00	4.89	146.70
7	Cover, paint roller, 9" X 1-1/2", 3/4" nap	740 EACH	1.70	1,258.00	1.45	1,073.00	3.05	2,257.00
8	Cover, paint roller, mini, 4"X 1/2" nap	165 PACKAGE	3.01	496.65	1.65	272.25	2.02	333.30
9	Frame, paint roller, mini, 16"	30 EACH	4.50	135.00	1.84	55.20	1.74	52.29
10	Handle, telescoping, fiber glass, 4' to 8'	15 EACH	21.50	322.50	15.95	239.25	22.03	330.45
11	Paint, alkyd, gloss, black, 1 GA.	15 GALLON	22.00	330.00	16.75	251.25	32.19	482.85
12	Paint, alkyd, gloss, harbor gray, solvent based, 1 GAL.	40 GALLON	27.95	1,118.00	16.75	670.00	30.42	1,216.80
13	Paint, alkyd, gloss, OSHA blue, 1 GA	10 GALLON	35.70	357.00	16.95	169.50	30.42	304.20
14	Paint, alkyd, gloss, OSHA orange, 1 GA	5 GALLON	37.90	189.50	22.95	114.75	38.35	191.75
15	Paint, alkyd, gloss, Red, 1 GA.	5 GALLON	44.20	221.00	23.95	119.75	32.63	163.15
16	Paint, latex, flat black, interior, 1 GA,	5 GALLON	NO BID	NO BID	15.95	79.75	14.33	71.65
17	Paint, latex, flat city beige, exterior, 1 GA, (custom color)	5 GALLON	NO BID	NO BID	15.95	79.75	17.43	87.15
18	Paint, latex, flat, white, 2210-0100 white exterior, 1 GA	20 GALLON	NO BID	NO BID	15.95	319.00	3.15	63.00
19	Paint, latex, gloss, Calumet, interior/exterior, 1 GA.	5 GALLON	NO BID	NO BID	17.95	89.75	13.87	69.35
20	Paint, latex, semi-gloss, Calumet, exterior, 1 GA.	5 GALLON	NO BID	NO BID	16.95	84.75	17.43	87.15
21	Paint, latex, semi-gloss, city beige, exterior, 1 GA. (custom color)	20 GALLON	NO BID	NO BID	16.95	339.00	17.43	348.60
22	Paint, spray, wood/metal, gloss black, 11 OZ, 358, Weekend, 6/case, minimum 1 case	10 EACH	6.30	63.00	3.88	38.80	2.92	29.20
23	Paint, spray, wood/metal, gloss yellow, 12 OZ, Rustoleum, 6/case, minimum 1 case	90 EACH	6.30	567.00	3.75	337.50	6.92	622.80
24	Paint, spray, wood/metal, gloss, chocolate brown, 353, Weekend, 11 OZ, 6/case, minimum 1 case	35 EACH	6.30	220.50	3.88	135.80	1.92	67.20
25	Paint, spray, wood/metal, gloss, white, 357, Weekend, 12 OZ, 6/case, minimum 1 case	30 EACH	6.30	189.00	3.20	96.00	2.86	85.80
26	Primer, Sherwin Williams, W B51W00020 , or Kliz brand water based, 1 GA	35 GALLON	NO BID	NO BID	15.75	551.25	26.11	913.85
27	Primer, paint, rust penetrating, light gray, Kemkromik, 1 GA	5 GALLON	NO BID	NO BID	28.00	140.00	69.18	345.90
28	Primer, paint, spray metal gray, 11 Oz., 6/case, minimum 1 case	5 EACH	6.30	31.50	4.05	20.25	2.89	14.45
29	Primer, Sherwin Williams W B51W00020, or Kilz brand water based, 1 GA	165 GALLON	NO BID	NO BID	16.90	2,788.50	18.60	3,069.00
30	Sealer, varnish, quick dry, clear, semigloss, wood, quick dry, Fast Dry Varnish, Sherwin Williams, B26V43 1 GA	5 GALLON	NO BID	NO BID	32.00	160.00	23.07	115.35
31	Thinner, Naptha	5 GALLON	12.70	63.50	12.40	62.00	9.91	49.55
32	Thinners, Mineral Spirits, Odorless, meets TT-T-291F Type 1 USA-117, Crown 114-2736	35 GALLON	10.40	364.00	9.70	339.50	6.69	234.15
33	Cover, paint roller, mini, 6-1/2"X 1/4" nap, 6PK	35 PACKAGE	3.30	115.50	10.25	358.75	9.22	322.70
34	Brush, Chip, 2", 1 Use, Rubberset	205 EACH	0.35	71.75	0.30	61.50	0.29	59.45

City of St. Petersburg
Bid Tabulation
Procurement and Supply Management

Line	Description	EAU UOM	Bert Lowe Supply Co. Lakeland, FL Terms: Net 30 Delivery: 5 Days		Dyco Paints, Inc. Clearwater, FL Terms: 2%/10, Net 30 Delivery: 1 Day		PPG Architectural Finishes, Inc. St. Petersburg, FL Terms: Net 30 Delivery: 3 Days	
			Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
35	Brush, Chip, 3", 1 Use, Rubberset	115 EACH	0.55	63.25	0.55	63.25	0.42	48.30
36	Tape, Painters, Blue, 1.5" x 60 YD, 3M 2090 Tape 1.5"	75 ROLL	6.36	477.00	4.50	337.50	6.17	462.75
37	Tape, Painters, Blue, 2" x 60 YD, 3M 2090 Tape 2"	260 ROLL	7.75	2,015.00	5.75	1,495.00	7.19	1,869.40
38	Paint, Metalatex, Semi-Gloss, Acrylic Coating, White, Exterior, 1 GA, B42W00111	5 GALLON	NO BID	NO BID	25.00	125.00	27.34	136.70
39	Knife, Putty, 1-1/2" Blade, High Carbon Steel, Hyde 06108	20 EACH	4.32	86.40	2.30	46.00	7.07	141.40
40	Knife, Putty, 3" Blade, High Carbon Steel	20 EACH	5.90	118.00	2.85	57.00	10.33	206.60
41	Knife, Putty, 6" Blade, High Carbon Steel, Hyde 02750	10 EACH	7.52	75.20	4.45	44.50	14.35	143.50
42	Frame, Paint Roller, Heavy Duty, 9"X 1-1/2" core	65 EACH	1.30	84.50	1.18	76.70	1.53	99.45
43	Frame, Paint Roller, 4" Wire Cage 1/4 " Rod 4	25 EACH	1.20	30.00	0.92	23.00	0.86	21.50
44	Cover, Paint Roller, 4", 1/2" Nap	100 PACKAGE	1.92	192.00	1.30	130.00	2.74	274.00
45	Paint, alkyd, traffic yellow, zone marking paint, lead free, Sherwin Williams, TM5713, 5 GA	5 GALLON	76.95	384.75	15.00	75.00	74.44	372.20
46	Tape, Painters, Blue, 1" x 60 YD, 3M 2090 Tape 1"	130 ROLL	4.15	539.50	3.30	429.00	3.83	497.90
47	Paint, Alkyd, Enamel, Safety Yellow, Sherwin Williams B54Y00037 1 GA	45 GALLON	30.90	1,390.50	16.25	731.25	32.63	1,468.35
48	Paint, Spray, Exterior, Flat Black, 12 OZ, PN C19392, Krylon Super Maxx 6/case	85 EACH	6.30	535.50	4.50	382.50	3.95	335.75
49	Brush, Chip, 4", 1 Use, Rubberset, 174-6775	35 EACH	1.20	42.00	1.30	45.50	1.40	49.00
50	Pan, paint roller, 9", Sherwin Williams, 170-9385	95 EACH	1.75	166.25	0.85	\$80.75	2.76	262.20
SubTotal:				\$14,715.95		\$18,107.95		\$28,016.99
2%/10, Net 30 Discount:				0		362.16		0
Total:				\$14,715.95		\$17,745.79		\$28,016.99