
 
 

DEVELOPMENT REVIEW COMMISSION 
 

Prepared by the Planning & Economic Development Department, 
Development Review Services Division 

 
For Public Hearing on Wednesday, June 7, 2017 

at 2:00 p.m. in the City Council Chambers, City Hall, 
175 Fifth Street North, St. Petersburg, Florida. 

 

 
APPLICATION: LDR 2017-06 
 Site Plan Modifications 
 
APPLICANT: City of St. Petersburg 

 175 Fifth Street North 
 St. Petersburg, Florida 33701 
 
REQUEST: The City of St. Petersburg requests that the Development Review Commission 

(“DRC”) review and recommend approval of the attached proposed amendments to 
the City Code of Ordinances, Chapter 16, Land Development Regulations (LDRs), 
confirming consistency with the City of St. Petersburg’s Comprehensive Plan 
(“Comprehensive Plan”). 

 
AUTHORITY: Pursuant to Section 16.80.020.1. of the City Code of Ordinances, the DRC, acting 

as the Land Development Regulation Commission (“LDRC”), is responsible for 
reviewing and making a recommendation to the City Council on all proposed 
amendments to the LDRs. 

   
EVALUATION: 
 
Recommendation 
 

The Planning & Economic Development Department finds that the proposed request is consistent 
with the Comprehensive Plan and recommends APPROVAL. 

 
Background 
 

Over the course of several applications for site plan review in the past two years, planning and 
legal staff observed a need for procedural clarity for property owners of portions of multi-owner or 
large-tract parcels in seeking modifications to previously approved special exceptions and site 
plans. Many site plans that were approved in the development boom immediately preceding the 
Great Recession were only partially realized. Oftentimes, in larger mixed use projects, one 
building would be seen through to issuance of the certificate of occupancy, with the other building 
never even received building permits. As financing became more difficult to procure during and 
after the Great Recession, many owners of these undeveloped portions simply sold their interest. 
Their successors in interest, not surprisingly, frequently seek different plans for their property. 
Being subject to a unified site plan that is also, in some instances, functionally expired for these 

 
 

PUBLIC HEARING 
 



LDR 2017-06 
Site Plan Modifications 

Page 2 of 3 

 

undeveloped parcels has created a unique procedural hardship for these owners. As they seek 
modifications to the original site plan approval, obtaining the required authorizations from the 
other property owners subject to the approval has proven difficult, whether due to a change in 
ownership structure to multiple condominium owners, or simply because out-of-town owners have 
not responded to requests for cooperation. In an effort to help property owners overcome this 
procedural burden, staff has drafted a limited exemption from the LDRs procedural requirements 
that eliminates the need for specific authorizations from other owners and instead allows an owner 
seeking a site plan modification to provide heightened notice instead. 
 

Proposal 
 

The Planning & Economic Development Department, working with the City Attorney’s office, has 
prepared the attached proposal to amend the Land Development Regulations (LDRs).  The 
proposal provides for a limited exemption from the standard procedural requirement to obtain 
authorizations from all property owners subject to a unified site plan when one property owner 
seeks to modify a previously approved site plan, when certain conditions are met. If the conditions 
set forth in the Ordinance are met, a property owner seeking modification of a previously approved 
site plan may be able to provide heightened notice to other owners subject to the approval in lieu 
of obtaining their express authorization. 

Compliance with the Comprehensive Plan 
 

The following objectives and policies from the City's Comprehensive Plan are applicable to the 
attached proposed amendments: 
 
Objective V1:  When considering the probable use of land in a development application, the 
principles and recommendations noted in the Vision Element should be considered where 
applicable. 

 
Policy V1.1:  Development decisions and strategies shall integrate the guiding principles found in 
the Vision Element with sound planning principles followed in the formal planning process. 

 
Objective LU7: The City will continue to revise and amend the land development regulations, as 
necessary, to ensure compliance with the requirements of Chapter 163.3202, Florida Statutes 
and Chapter 9J-24 F.A.C. The City will amend its land development regulations consistent with 
the requirements of Chapter 163.3202, Florida Statutes and Chapter 9J-24 F.A.C. so that future 
growth and development will continue to be managed through the preparation, adoption, 
implementation and enforcement of land development regulations that are consistent with the 
Comprehensive Plan.   
 
Policy LU7.1:  Pursuant to the requirements of Chapter 163.3202 F.S. and Chapter 9J-24 F.A.C. 
the land development regulations will be amended, as necessary, to ensure consistency with the 
goals, objectives and policies of the Comprehensive Plan.   
 
Objective LU20: The City shall, on an ongoing basis, review and consider for adoption, 
amendments to existing and/or new innovative land development regulations that can provide 
additional incentives for the achievement of Comprehensive Plan Objectives. 
 
Policy LU20.1:  The City shall continue to utilize its innovative development regulations and staff 
shall continue to examine new innovative techniques by working with the private sector, 
neighborhood groups, and special interest groups and by monitoring regulatory innovations to 
identify potential solutions to development issues that provide incentives for the achievement of 
the goals, objectives and policies of the Comprehensive Plan. 



LDR 2017-06 
Site Plan Modifications 

Page 3 of 3 

 

 
Housing Affordability Impact Statement 
 

The proposed amendment will have little to no impact on housing affordability, availability or 
accessibility.  This application includes an amendment to the procedural requirements of the land 
development regulations which may facilitate new infill development on large-tract parcels, 
including but not limited to residential uses. 

 
Adoption Schedule 

 
The proposed amendment requires one (1) public hearing, conducted by the City of St. 
Petersburg City Council. The City Council shall consider the recommendation of the DRC and 
vote to approve, approve with modification or deny the proposed amendments: 

 

 July 13, 2017: First Reading  

 July 20, 2017: Second Reading and Adoption Public Hearing 
 
Exhibits and Attachments 

 
1. Proposed Ordinance 

 



1 

 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF ST. 

PETERSBURG, FLORIDA AMENDING 

SECTION 16.70.040.1.H. OF THE CITY CODE 

REGULATING MODIFICATION OF 

PREVIOUSLY APPROVED SPECIAL 

EXCEPTIONS AND SITE PLANS WITH 

MULTIPLE PROPERTY OWNERS AND 

ESTABLISHING THE PROCESS FOR 

MODIFYING APPLICATIONS; AND 

PROVIDING AN EFFECTIVE DATE. 

 

WHEREAS, the City of St. Petersburg, Florida (“City”) has observed a need for 

procedural clarity for certain property owners of portions of large-tract parcels seeking to develop 

their property that is governed by a previously approved special exception or site plan (“Previous 

Approval”); and 

 

WHEREAS, the City recognizes that complex real estate developments that 

comprise multiple parcels and multiple, separate ownership interests may only be partially realized 

before a Previous Approval expires or significant time lapses; and 

 

WHEREAS, the City further recognizes that ownership interests under a Previous 

Approval may have changed and that plans for the property may require modifications to a 

Previous Approval; and 

 

WHEREAS, the City acknowledges the difficulty in obtaining authorizations from 

other property owners for modifications when new ownership interests acquire property subject to 

a Previous Approval.  

 

THE CITY OF ST. PETERSBURG DOES ORDAIN: 

 

SECTION 1. Section 16.70.040.1.H. of the St. Petersburg City Code is hereby amended to read as 

follows: 

 

H.  Modifications. Any request for modification to a special exception or a site plan review 

previously approved by the POD or the commission designated in the Decisions and Appeals 

Table, shall be subject to review and approval in the same manner as a new application, 

except that the POD may approve minor modifications, provided that the basic purpose and 

intent of the Commission's action and the ordinances of the City are met and effectuated.  

 

A. Minor modifications. "Minor modification" shall mean the following:  

 

1.  Any modifications that reduce density, building square footage or degree of variance, 

or modifications not involving an increase of more than ten percent of the gross floor 

area and in no event more than 6,000 square feet in the case of buildings or five 



2 

 

percent of the lot area in the case of parking or landscaping modifications. Public 

notice of these minor modifications is not required.  

 

2. Any modifications involving an increase of more than ten percent, but not more than 

20 percent, of the gross floor area and in no event more than 15,000 square feet in the 

case of buildings or 20 percent of the lot area in the case of parking or landscaping 

modifications. Mailed notice should be provided as set forth in the notices section.  

 

3.  Minor modifications shall not cause a variance from any provisions of the City Code, 

shall not involve a change in use or an increase in residential density, shall not waive 

any condition or conditions expressly specified by the Commission, and shall not 

change the basic intent of the approved site plan.  

 

B. Procedures. 

 

1. An applicant that seeks a modification to a special exception or site plan previously 

approved by the POD or the commission designated in the Decisions and Appeals Table 

shall be required to obtain the required authorizations from all owners of property 

subject to the previous approval for which modification is sought, except as set forth in 

subsection 2 below. 

 

2. An applicant that seeks a modification to a previously approved special exception or 

site plan may be exempt from obtaining the required authorizations from the other 

property owners subject to the previous approval for which modification is sought, if 

all of the following conditions are met: 

 

a. The previously approved special exception or site plan, which may or may not be 

expired, applies to a subject property that is currently owned by multiple owners 

who are separate entities; 

 

b. The previously approved special exception or site plan has only been partially 

developed, and for which substantial construction of the developed portion has 

occurred; and 

 

c. The applicant is seeking to modify the special exception or site plan approval for 

only those portions of the subject property that the applicant owns. 

 

In lieu of obtaining the required authorizations from the other property owners, upon 

meeting the conditions set forth in this subsection, the applicant shall demonstrate proof 

of notice describing the modification supplied to the other property owners 30 days 

prior to a final decision made by the POD, or, if required, 30 days prior to a public 

hearing by the commission designated in the Decisions and Appeals Table. 

Modifications to site plans with multiple owners shall be reviewed to address overall 



3 

 

impacts on the entire site plan in accordance with the applicable development standards 

in the Land Development Regulations. 

 

SECTION 2. Coding: As used in this ordinance, language appearing in struck-through type is 

language to be deleted from the City Code, and underlined language is language to be added to the 

City Code, in the section, subsection, or other location where indicated. Language in the City Code 

not appearing in this ordinance continues in full force and effect unless the context clearly indicates 

otherwise. 

 

SECTION 3. The provisions of this ordinance shall be deemed to be severable. If any provision of 

this ordinance is determined unconstitutional or otherwise invalid, such determination shall not 

affect the validity of any other provisions of this ordinance. 

 

SECTION 4. Effective Date. In the event this ordinance is not vetoed by the Mayor in accordance 

with the City Charter, it shall become effective after the fifth business day after adoption unless 

the Mayor notifies the City Council through written notice filed with the City Clerk that the Mayor 

will not veto the ordinance, in which case the ordinance shall take effect immediately upon filing 

such written notice with the City Clerk. In the event this ordinance is vetoed by the Mayor in 

accordance with the City Charter, it shall not become effective unless and until the City Council 

overrides the veto in accordance with the City Charter, in which case it shall become effective 

immediately upon a successful vote to override the veto. 

 

 

Approved as to form and content: 

 

 

____________________________ 

City Attorney (designee) 
 

 

 

 



/  
 

DEVELOPMENT REVIEW COMMISSION 
 

Prepared by the Planning & Economic Development Department, 
Development Review Services Division 

 
For Public Hearing on Wednesday, June 7, 2017 

at 1:30 p.m. in the City Council Chambers, City Hall, 
175 Fifth Street North, St. Petersburg, Florida. 

 

 
APPLICATION: LDR 2017-01 
 Residential LDR Update 
 
APPLICANT: City of St. Petersburg 
 275 5th Street North 
 St. Petersburg, Florida 33701 
 
REQUEST: The City of St. Petersburg requests that the Development Review Commission 

(“DRC”) review and recommend approval of the attached proposed amendments to 
the City Code of Ordinances, Chapter 16, Land Development Regulations (LDRs), 
confirming consistency with the City of St. Petersburg’s Comprehensive Plan 
(“Comprehensive Plan”). 

 
AUTHORITY: Pursuant to Section 16.80.020.1 of the City Code of Ordinances, the DRC, acting as 

the Land Development Regulation Commission (“LDRC”), is responsible for 
reviewing and making a recommendation to the City Council on all proposed 
amendments to the LDRs. 

   
EVALUATION: 
 
Recommendation 
 

The Planning & Economic Development Department finds that the proposed request is consistent 
with the Comprehensive Plan and recommends APPROVAL. 

 
Background 
 

In October 2006 and August 2007, the City Council adopted several significant ordinances related 
directly to the implementation of the St. Petersburg Vision 2020 Plan and the new Land 
Development Regulations (LDRs). The adopted ordinances included text amendments to the 
City’s Comprehensive Plan, including a new Vision Element, amendments to the Future Land Use 
Map (FLUM), the rezoning of the entire City and establishment of new land development 
regulations.   
 
By 2015, the City started experiencing an accelerated rate of redevelopment in our residential 
neighborhoods. From 2007 through 2016, a total of 932 permits were issued for new single-family 
homes. In the fall of 2015, staff recognized that with this increase in new homes, there was a need 

 
 

PUBLIC HEARING 
 



LDR 2017-01 
Residential LDR Update 

Page 2 of 3 

 

to review the neighborhood residential land development regulations and evaluate the 2007 code 
changes to determine if the resulting built environment reflected the goals and visions established 
by our plans and recommend modifications to the code to improve clarity and consistency.  The 
effort included a review for amendments that support and further our current design priorities.    
 

 
Public Participation 
 

A Public Participation Report published in January along with a Public Participation Report 
Addendum are attached which outline the public outreach, community workshops, presentations 
and meetings that were held regarding the proposed changes.  Summaries of the community 
workshops are included, along with all documents submitted to staff throughout the process. 

 
Proposal 
 

The Planning and Economic Development Department, working with the City Attorney’s office, 
has prepared the attached proposal to amend the Land Development Regulations (LDRs).  The 
proposal includes approximately 85 items for consideration, generally classified into one (1) of 
three (3) categories: 

 Substantive (Regulatory) Changes means amendments resulting from new issues that 
were not originally contemplated or whose need has emerged from staff’s experience in 
administering the city code.  This amendment package includes forty (40) substantive 
(regulatory) changes; 
 

 Clarifications means the ongoing effort to provide the clearest language in the city code 
for benefit of staff and customers using the regulations.  This amendment package 
includes thirty-six (37) clarification changes; 

 

 Consistency Improvements means to maintain consistency with changes in federal, 
state and local law or to remove internal inconsistencies within the City Code.  This 
amendment package includes eight (8) consistency reviews; 

 

 
For the benefit of City staff, residents, and customers interpreting and using the City’s land 
development regulations, the proposed amendments are part of the department’s ongoing effort 
to provide the clearest language possible.  Most of these amendments involve aspects of the 
LDRs that are applied in the Neighborhood Suburban or Neighborhood Traditional zoning 
districts.  The attachments to this report includes the full list of items proposed for amendment. 

 
Compliance with the Comprehensive Plan 

 
The following objectives and policies from the City's Comprehensive Plan are applicable to the 
attached proposed amendments: 
 
Objective V1:  When considering the probable use of land in a development application, the 
principles and recommendations noted in the Vision Element should be considered where 
applicable. 

 
Policy V1.1:  Development decisions and strategies shall integrate the guiding principles found in 
the Vision Element with sound planning principles followed in the formal planning process. 

 



LDR 2017-01 
Residential LDR Update 

Page 3 of 3 

 

Objective LU7: The City will continue to revise and amend the land development regulations, as 
necessary, to ensure compliance with the requirements of Chapter 163.3202, Florida Statutes 
and Chapter 9J-24 F.A.C. The City will amend its land development regulations consistent with 
the requirements of Chapter 163.3202, Florida Statutes and Chapter 9J-24 F.A.C. so that future 
growth and development will continue to be managed through the preparation, adoption, 
implementation and enforcement of land development regulations that are consistent with the 
Comprehensive Plan.   
 
Policy LU7.1:  Pursuant to the requirements of Chapter 163.3202 F.S. and Chapter 9J-24 F.A.C. 
the land development regulations will be amended, as necessary, to ensure consistency with the 
goals, objectives and policies of the Comprehensive Plan.   
 
Objective LU20: The City shall, on an ongoing basis, review and consider for adoption, 
amendments to existing and/or new innovative land development regulations that can provide 
additional incentives for the achievement of Comprehensive Plan Objectives. 
 
Policy LU20.1:  The City shall continue to utilize its innovative development regulations and staff 
shall continue to examine new innovative techniques by working with the private sector, 
neighborhood groups, and special interest groups and by monitoring regulatory innovations to 
identify potential solutions to development issues that provide incentives for the achievement of 
the goals, objectives and policies of the Comprehensive Plan. 
 

Housing Affordability Impact Statement 
 

The proposed amendments will have positive impact on housing affordability, availability or 
accessibility.  This application includes numerous modifications to the residential land 
development regulations which will support new infill development including the reduction of the 
lot area minimum size in the NT-1 zoning district, provision to allow administrative approval for 
development of non-conforming lots, and the changes to the fenestration and transparency 
requirements in the NT districts. Additional details are included in the following attachments. 

 
Adoption Schedule 

 
The proposed amendment requires one (1) public hearing, conducted by the City of St. 
Petersburg City Council. The City Council shall consider the recommendation of the DRC and 
vote to approve, approve with modification or deny the proposed amendments: 

 

 July 13, 2017: First Reading  

 July 20, 2017: Second Reading and Adoption Public Hearing 
 
Exhibits and Attachments 

 
1. Table of Proposed Amendments (dated June 1, 2017) 
2. Proposed Ordinance 
3. Public Participation Report (January 2017) and Addendum (May 30, 2017) 

 



 

1 

 

6/1 DRAFT NO. 2 
 

ORDINANCE NO. ______ 

 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF ST. PETERSBURG PROVIDING FOR THE AMENDMENT 

OF THE ST. PETERSBURG CITY CODE LAND DEVELOPMENT REGULATIONS; AMENDING THE 

MAXIMUM DEVELOPMENT POTENTIAL BY ESTABLISHING FAR LIMITATIONS AND BONUSES 

IN NT AND NS DISTRICTS; AMENDING SETBACK REQUIREMENTS, BUILDING AND SITE 

DESIGN REQUIREMENTS AND ACCESSORY STRUCTURE REQUIRMENTS IN NT AND NS 

DISTRICTS; PROVIDING ADDITIONAL REQUIREMENTS FOR WATERFRONT YARDS, PARKING, 

AND DRIVEWAYS; AMENDING REGULATIONS RELATING TO ACCESSORY DWELLING UNITS 

AND LIVING SPACES; AMENDING REGULATIONS RELATING TO ACCESSORY STORAGE 

STRUCTURES ON THROUGH LOTS, ANCILLARY EQUIPMENT, AND ROOF OR CANOPY 

STRUCTURES ON DOCKS; AMENDING THE METHOD THAT BUILDING HEIGHT IS MEASURED 

IN SPECIAL FLOOD HAZARD AREAS; REVISING NONCONFORMING LOTS REQUIREMENTS; 

AMENDING THE ALLOWBLE ENCROACHMENT INTO SETBACKS REQUIREMENTS FOR 

ARBORS, PATIOS, SCREEN ENCLOSURES, GARAGES, AND SHEDS; AMENDING REQUIREMENTS 

FOR THE REINSTATEMENT OF ABANDONED USES AND REDEVELOPMENT OF 

GRANDFATHERED USES; PROVIDING FOR DRIVEWAY MAINTENANCE; PROVIDING FOR NEW 

AND REVISED DEFINITIONS; REVISING EXISTING GRAPHICS AND ADDING NEW GRAPHICS; 

MAKING INTERNAL LANGUAGE, TABLES AND CHARTS CONSISTENT; CODIFYING 

INTERPRETATIVE LANGUAGE AND CLARIFICATIONS; CORRECTING TYPOGRAPHICAL, 

GRAMMATICAL AND SCRIVENERS ERRORS; REMOVING OBSOLETE LANGUAGE; AND 

PROVIDING FOR AN EFFECTIVE DATE. 

 

THE CITY OF ST. PETERSBURG DOES ORDAIN:  

 

SECTION 1. Section 16.20.010.5 of the St. Petersburg City Code is hereby amended to read as 

follows: 

16.20.010.5. - Maximum development potential. 

Development potential is different within each district in order to respect the character of the 

neighborhoods. Previous regulations required larger lots and did not permit accessory dwelling units. 

Achieving maximum development potential will depend upon market forces, such as minimum desirable 

unit size, and development standards, such as minimum lot size, parking requirements, height restrictions, 

floor area ratios, maximum building and impervious surface ratios, and building setbacks.  

To maintain community character and provide for desirable redevelopment and infill housing, homes 

shall be built using FARs as set forth herein. Various design standards may be used to increase the FAR and 

maintain the compatibility of new and modified homes with the existing neighborhood character. Therefore 

a maximum FAR is established and FAR bonuses may be permitted if the home incorporates design 

elements as set forth herein which are intended to be beneficial to the character of the neighborhood and 

reduce the appearance of mass and bulk from the public view. 

Minimum Lot Size, Maximum Density and Maximum Intensity  

 

NT-1  NT-2  NT-3  NT-4  

Minimum  
Residential  45 ft.  50 ft.  60 ft.  45 ft.  



 

2 

 

Lot Width  Nonresidential  180 ft.  200 ft.  240 ft.  180 ft.  

Minimum  

Lot Area  

(square feet)  

Residential  5,800  4,500 5,800  7,620  5,800  

Nonresidential  22,860  25,400  30,480  22,860  

Maximum Residential 

Density  

(units per acre)  

15  

(1 principal unit 

and 1  

accessory unit  

per lot) (1)  

15  

(1 principal unit 

and 1  

accessory unit  

per lot) (1)  

7  

(1 principal unit; 

accessory unit  

not permitted)  

15  

(1 principal unit 

and 1  

accessory unit  

per lot) (1)  

Maximum Residential 

Intensity (floor area ratio) (2) 
(3)  

0.50 0.50 0.50 0.50 

Maximum Nonresidential  

Intensity  

(floor area ratio)  

0.50  0.50  0.40  0.85  

Maximum Residential 

Building Coverage (includes 

all structures) except where 

the primary structure is one 

story then a 0.55 building 

coverage is allowed 

0.50 0.50 0.50 0.50 

Maximum  

Impervious  

Surface  

(site area 

ratio)  

Residential  0.65  0.65  0.65  0.65  

Nonresidential  0.55  0.55  0.55  0.55  

(1) Refer to use specific development standards for regulations regarding development of accessory 

dwelling and accessory living space.  

(2)  Residential Floor Area Ratio Exemption. The FAR includes any enclosed space above the required 

design flood elevation line, including enclosed garage space, but excludes all enclosed space below the design 

flood elevation. 

(3) Residential Floor Area Ratio Bonus. An FAR bonus of up to 0.20 shall be granted when structures 

incorporate design elements set forth herein. The following options may be utilized in any combination, 

however, the maximum FAR bonus is 0.20. 

a. One story covered front porch with a separate roof structure with a minimum width of 75% of the front 

façade: 0.08 bonus. No bonus is allowed if there is a second story deck, porch or roof structure. 

b. Additional second story front setbacks: .01 bonus for every 1 foot of additional front setback of the entire 



 

3 

 

facade, no bonus is allowed unless the setback is at least six feet, maximum 0.08 bonus. No bonus is allowed 

if there is a second story deck, porch or roof structure. 

c. Additional second story side setbacks: .01 bonus for every 1 foot of additional side setback of the entire 

façade, maximum 0.05 bonus per side. 

d. Total residential floor area of the second story does not exceed 75% of the first story (excludes garage sf): 

0.05 bonus. 

e. Reduction of the height of both the peak and roofline of a two story building from the maximum allowed 

height: 0.02 bonus per foot, maximum 0.06. 

f. The entire peak of the primary roof structure of the front façade is parallel to the front property line: bonus 

0.02, or if the entire peak of the primary roof structure of the front façade is parallel to the front property line 

and the roof has dormer(s) which are equal to at least 20% of the width of the front façade: 0.04 bonus. 

g. Side façade articulation: side facades which feature offsets of at least two feet in depth that are at least 

twelve feet in length that divide the building design and are in the front half of the side facade: 0.02 bonus per 

side, maximum 0.04.  

h. All windows have real or simulated divided light muntins on interior or exterior surfaces: 0.03 bonus. 

Refer to technical standards regarding measurement of lot dimensions, calculation of maximum residential 

density, nonresidential floor area and impervious surface. For mixed use developments, refer to additional 

regulations within the use specific development standards section for mixed uses (currently section 

16.50.200). 

  



 

4 

 

SECTION 2. Section 16.20.010.6 of the St. Petersburg City Code is hereby amended to read as 

follows: 

16.20.010.6. - Building envelope: Maximum height and minimum setbacks. 

Building Height  Beginning of Roofline  Top of Roof Peak  

Primary building  24 ft.  36 ft.  

Accessory building  20 ft.  30 ft.  

Refer to technical standards regarding measurement of building height and height encroachments.  

  

 

 

 

 

 

Minimum Building Setbacks  

Building 

Setbacks  

NT-1 and 2  NT-3  NT-4  

If building 

height is up 

to 18 ft.  

If building 

height is +18 

ft. to 24 ft.  

If building 

height is 

over 24 ft.  

If building 

height is up 

to 24 ft.  

If building 

height is 

over 24 ft.  

If building 

height is up 

to 24 ft.  

If building 

height is 

over 24 ft.  

Front yard  Stoop  15 ft. or M  15 ft. or M  35 20 ft. or M  40 9 ft. or M  28 



 

5 

 

ft.  ft.  ft.  

Open Porch (1) 18 ft. or M  18 ft. or M  
35 

ft.  
23 ft. or M  

40 

ft.  
12 ft. or M  

28 

ft.  

Building  25 ft. or M  25 ft. or M  
35 

ft.  
30 ft. or M  

40 

ft.  
18 ft. or M  

28 

ft.  

Interior side 

yard  

For lots greater than 

60 ft. in width  
6 ft. or M  6 ft. or M  

12 

ft.  
7.5 ft. or M  

16 

ft.  
5 ft. or M  

10 

ft.  

For lots equal to or 

less than 60 ft. in 

width  

10 percent of lot 

width (2) 
6 ft. or M  

12 

ft.  
7.5 ft. or M  

16 

ft.  
5 ft. or M  

10 

ft.  

Street side yard  12 ft. or M  12 ft. or M  
16 

ft.  
15 ft. or M  

22 

ft.  
8 ft. or M  

15 

ft.  

Rear yard, 

with alley  

For alleys equal to or 

greater than 16 ft. in 

width  

6 ft. or M  6 ft. or M  
20 

ft.  
7.5 ft. or M  

20 

ft.  
5 ft. or M  

20 

ft.  

For alleys less than 16 

ft. in width  

10 ft., or 22 ft. 

including 

 the  width  

of the alley, 

whichever 

is less, or M  

10 ft., or 22 ft. 

including 

 the  width  

of the alley, 

whichever  

is less,  or M  

20 

ft.  

10 ft., or 22 ft.  

including  

the  width  

of the alley, 

whichever  

is less,  or M  

20 

ft.  

8 ft.., or 

22ft. 

 including 

 the  width 

 of the alley,  

whichever 

 is less, or M  

20 

ft.  

Rear yard, no alley  10 ft. or M  10 ft. or M  
30 

ft.  
10 ft. or M  

30 

ft.  
10 ft. or M  

30 

ft.  

Waterfront yard  20 ft.  20 ft.  
20 

ft.  
20 ft.  

20 

ft.  
20 ft. ft.  

20 

ft.  

Notes:  

(1) Open porches are limited to a one story covered porch with or without a second story uncovered porch; two 

story covered porches shall meet the principal structure setback. 

(2) For properties that are 50 feet or less in width, the minimum side yard building setback shall be 5 feet. 

 

M (minor encroachment): Minor encroachments into normally prescribed setbacks may be allowed in order to 

accommodate an addition to align with the side of the existing structure, provided:  

 (a) The total floor area of the encroaching portion of an addition shall not exceed 50 square feet;  

 (b) No portion of the encroachment shall exceed 24 feet in height;  

 (c) In no case shall any encroaching structure be closer to a property line than four feet.  

Refer to technical standards for yard types and setback encroachments.  

Enclosing porches in the front yard setback is regulated by the general development standards.  

The larger of the minimum building separation distances required by the Florida Building Code or the fire 

prevention code or the minimum building setback established for the interior side yard setback shall apply; 

Building setbacks are based on the overall height of the various sections of a proposed building. As the 

building height increases, so does the minimum required setback.  

  



 

6 

 

 

Minimum Building Setbacks for SE Uses  

Building Setbacks SE Uses  NT-1 and 2  NT-3  NT-4  

All yards (including waterfront)  35 ft.  35 ft.  35 ft.  

Refer to technical standards for yard types.  

  

SECTION 3. Section 16.20.010.7 of the St. Petersburg City Code is hereby amended to read as 

follows: 

16.20.010.7. - Roof lines and slopes. 

Required building setbacks increase above 24 feet in height except for towers, turrets, and dormers as 

provided herein. At 24 feet or below, a cornice line shall be provided and the roofline shall begin. The roof 

slope shall not exceed 45 degrees (12:12 pitch). The roof peak shall not exceed the maximum height of 36 

feet. If a sloped roof is not characteristic of the design style, the wall shall be accentuated with a cornice line 

at or below 24 feet in height. Any portion of a wall exceeding 24 feet in height shall be set back at least 

twice the normally required side yard setback from the side property line.  

SECTION 4. Section 16.20.010.10 of the St. Petersburg City Code is hereby amended to read as follows:  

https://www.municode.com/Library/api/CD/staticCodeContent?productId=14674&fileName=16.20.010.6B.png


 

7 

 

16.20.010.10. - Setbacks consistent with established neighborhood patterns. 

There are building setback characteristics of existing neighborhoods related to the rhythm of spacing 

between buildings (side yard setbacks), front yard setbacks, and alignment of buildings along the block face. 

Minimum yard setback characteristics of neighborhoods may differ from the requirements of this district. 

The POD may approve, without a variance, residential development that meets setback characteristics and 

standards of a neighborhood having boundaries defined by an accepted neighborhood plan. Approval shall 

be based on the following:  

1. Front and side yard setbacks will be based on predominant building setbacks established in the block 

in which the development is proposed.  

2. Evaluation of building setbacks will also consider the pattern of building setbacks on the blocks 

adjacent to the block in which the development is proposed.  

3. This approval shall follow the procedures for streamline approvals of variances.  

SECTION 5. Section 16.20.010.11 of the St. Petersburg City Code is hereby amended to read as follows: 

16.20.010.11. - Building and site design. 

The following design criteria allow the property owner and design professional to choose their 

preferred architectural style, building form, scale and massing, while creating a framework for good urban 

design practices which create a positive experience for the pedestrian. For a more complete introduction, see 
section 16.10.010.  

Building and architectural design standards. All buildings should present an inviting, human scale 

facade to the streets, internal drives, parking areas and surrounding neighborhoods. The architectural 

elements of a building should give it character, richness and visual interest.  

Site layout and orientation. The City is committed to creating and preserving a network of linkages for 

pedestrians. Consequently, pedestrian and vehicle connections between public rights-of-way and private 

property are subject to a hierarchy of transportation, which begins with the pedestrian.  

Building and parking layout and orientation.  

1. For nonresidential uses, all service areas and loading docks shall be located behind the front facade 

line of the principal structure.  

2. All mechanical equipment and utility functions (e.g. electrical conduits, meters and HVAC 

equipment) shall be located behind the front façade line of the principal structure. Mechanical 

equipment that is visible from the primary street shall be screened with a material that is compatible 

with the architecture of the principal structure.  

3.  Accessory structures (including sheds) shall be located behind the front façade of the principal 

structure. 

 

Vehicle connections and parking.  

1. The following vehicle connection regulations are required for properties located within NT-2, NT-3 

or NT-4 and are recommended for properties located within NT-1. Access for new garages and 

driveways shall be designed to take advantage of the first available alternative in the following 

prioritized list:  

a. Driveways and garage doors shall face the alley;  



 

8 

 

b. Where no alley exists, driveways and garage doors shall face the side street and shall be 

restricted to the rear one-third of the lot;  

c. Where access via the rear third of the lot is not possible and/or the alley is unable to be 

traversed with a vehicle due to physical obstructions or barriers,  driveways and garage doors 

shall be permitted within the front two-thirds of the lot facing the side street;  

d. In the absence of an alley and a side street, a single lane width curb cut and driveway shall be 

allowed which shall be located to the side of the principal structure. Parking shall be allowed 

only behind the front façade line of the principal structure.  

2. When a driveway is allowed in the front yard, nNot more than one curb cut shall be allowed for each 

property except as follows:  

a. Where the property is abutting a major street identified on the Future Major Streets Map within 

the Comprehensive Plan; and  

b. Where in accordance with the access requirements of this section, the only available access 

point is from the major street; and  

c. Where a circular driveway and second curb cut is necessary to permit vehicles to enter and exit 

the major street in a forward motion. Pursuant to this section, a second curb cut shall only be 

approved for the purpose of improved traffic safety and shall not be approved for other 

ancillary uses, such as access to accessory parking spaces or the maneuvering of domestic 

equipment.  

 

Porches and Pedestrian connections.  

1. Principal entries to a structure shall be connected to the public sidewalk and the curb of the primary 

street with a sidewalk except when the structure faces a major street which does not allow on-street 

parking in front of the property.  

2. Where a driveway exists in the legal front yard, the required sidewalk from the principal entry may be 

connected to the driveway in lieu of the connection to the street. 

3.  Principal entries shall include a porch, portico or stoop, with a minimum usable depth of six feet 

(measured from the front façade of the structure to the interior side of the railing or, if there is no railing, 

the furthest edge of the floor) and 48 square feet of total floor area, excluding a 3-foot wide walkway to 

the primary entrance and the floor area of any column. Where a railing exists, only the floor area within 

the interior side of the railing shall count towards the minimum floor area.  

 



 

9 

 

 

 
 

Building and architectural design standards. All buildings should present an inviting, human scale facade to the 

streets, internal drives, parking areas and surrounding neighborhoods. The architectural elements of a 

building should give it character, richness and visual interest.  

Building style.  



 

10 

 

1. New construction shall utilize an identifiable architectural style which is recognized by design 

professionals as having a basis in academic architectural design philosophies.  

2. Design of homes located within on the same block face on either side of the street or within on an 

adjacent block face on either side of the street shall be varied, such that a substantially similar design will 

not be replicated. There shall be a minimum separation of three parcels in every direction before a 

substantially similar design can be repeated. Variation shall include at least three of the following 

elements: architectural style, roof form (principal or porch), materials, architectural details (doors, 

windows, columns, porches). 

 

 

3. Renovations, additions and accessory structures shall utilize the architectural style of the existing 

structure, or the entire existing structure shall be modified to utilize an identifiable architectural 

style which is recognized by design professionals as having a basis in academic architectural design 

philosophies.  

 

Building form.  

1. The front and street side of a building shall be designed to give the appearance of an elevated floor at 

least 16 inches above grade level. Where slab-on-grade construction is proposed, this requirement 

can be satisfied by utilizing a raised front entry porch, elevated windows, doors and wall heights.  

2. Buildings should The front façade of a building shall create a width-to-height ratio of no more than 

1:1. Buildings that exceed the width-to-height ratio of 1:1 shall feature architectural fenestration 

creating a bay system that divides the building design into a maximum ratio of 1:1. This may be 

done through pilasters, arcades, building line and roof line off-sets, materials and other appropriate 

architectural features.  

Wall composition and transparency. Wall composition standards ensure that ground-level storefronts and 

multifamily and single-family residential buildings offer attractive features to the pedestrian. Wall 

composition standards also mitigate blank walls and ensure that all sides of a building have visual interest.  

Transparency enhances visual connections between activities inside and outside buildings, thereby 

improving pedestrian safety. The following criteria shall not apply to accessory structures.   

1. Doors, windows and other appropriate fenestration, architectural details, and features shall be 

incorporated into all sides of a building. There shall be no blank facades, except that garages 

located at the rear one-third of the lot and not on the street side may have blank facades. For multi-

story buildings, no No portion of a facade corresponding to the height between two floors shall 

contain a blank area greater than 16 feet in width.  

2. At least 30 percent of primary and secondary street facades shall consist of fenestration or 

architectural details and features. At least 20 percent of the front two-thirds of interior side facades 

and rear facades shall consist of have fenestration or architectural details and features. At least 10 

percent of the rear façade on corner lots and through lots shall consist of fenestration or 

architectural details and features. At least two-thirds 50 percent of the fenestration shall be 

transparent (i.e., window glass). One-third may consist of trim work, shutters, brackets and other 



 

11 

 

architectural features. Entry doors shall be counted toward fenestration if side panel or decorative 

windows are provided. Garage doors are not fenestration on street-facing facades.  

  

   For yards on through-lots see the Dimensional Regulations and Lot Characteristics Section.  

 

3. Structures which are situated on corner lots, through lots, or, by the nature of the site layout have a 

facade which is clearly visible from rights-of-way, shall be designed with full architectural 

treatment on all sides visible from rights-of-way. Full architectural treatment shall include roof 

design, wall materials, architectural trim, and door and window openings. While it is recognized 

that buildings have primary and secondary facades, the construction materials and detailing should 

be similar throughout. Windows on the street side facades shall be evenly distributed in a consistent 

pattern, unless a different proportion is permitted or required by an identifiable architectural . 

4. Window sashes and glass shall be square or vertical, unless a different proportion is permitted or 

required by an identifiable architectural style. 

5. Windows shall not be flush mounted. Windows recessed less than three inches shall feature 

architectural trim including a header, sill and side trim or decorative shutters. Windows recessed 

three inches or more shall feature a window sill.  Trim is not required if not consistent with the 

architectural style, i.e. Modern or Mediterranean Revival. 

6. Where the required design elevation is equal to or greater than 48” above finished grade, an 

articulated base is required to delineate the first floor level. The base may consist of a different 

material or decorative band, depending on the architectural style. 

Transparency. The provision of transparency enhances visual connections between activities inside and outside 

buildings, thereby improving pedestrian safety.  

1. Windows on the street side facades shall be evenly distributed in a consistent pattern.  

2. Window sashes and glass shall be square or vertical, unless a different proportion is permitted or 

required by an identifiable architectural style.  

3. Windows shall not be flush mounted. Windows recessed less than three inches shall feature 

architectural trim including a header, sill and side trim or decorative shutters. Windows recessed 

three inches or more shall feature a window sill.  

Roofs. Rooflines add visual interest to the streetscape and establish a sense of continuity between adjacent 

buildings. When used properly, rooflines can help distinguish between residential and commercial land uses, 

reduce the mass of large structures, emphasize entrances, and provide shade and shelter for pedestrians.  

1. Buildings shall provide a pitched roof or a flat roof with a decorative parapet wall compatible with 

the architectural style of the building.  

Garages. Garage standards maintain and enhance the attractiveness of the streetscape and are influenced by a 

hierarchy of transportation, which begins with the pedestrian. The requirements relating to garage doors do 

not apply to garage doors facing alleys. 

1. Garage doors facing the primary street:  

a. Shall be located at least ten feet behind the front facade line of the principal structure. In the 

NT-1, NT-2 and NT-4 districts, this distance shall be measured from the front of the front 

porch, if any. 

b. Shall not exceed 40 percent of the linear frontage of the facade of the principal structure and 

shall have decorative garage doors.  

2. Garage doors facing a non-primary side street, where adjoining side yard abuts another property's 

front yard:  

a. Shall be one or two single bay garage doors. Double garage bay doors are prohibited.  

b. Shall not exceed 40 percent of the linear frontage of the facade of he principal structure.  



 

12 

 

c. Shall be decorative garage doors or feature at least one of the following enhancements: an arbor 

system surrounding the garage doors, or a projecting balcony, cupola, or other decorative 

element above the garage to lessen the impact of the vehicular orientation of the house.  The 

decorative feature proposed by the applicant shall be compatible with the principal structure 

and must be approved by the POD.  This decision may only be appealed by the property 

owner.  

 

Building materials. Building material standards protect neighboring properties by holding the building's value 

longer, thereby creating a greater resale value and stabilizing the value of neighboring properties.  

1. Building materials shall be appropriate to the selected architectural style and shall be consistent 

throughout the structure. If multiple materials are used in a building façade, the visually heavier 

materials shall be located below the lighter materials, e.g. brick or stone shall be located below 

stucco or siding materials, unless they are used as architectural features. 

Accessory structures and equipment and carports. Accessory structures shall reinforce the pedestrian character 

of the City. Above-ground utility and service features, accessory storage structures, and carports shall be 

located and designed to reduce their visual impact upon the streetscape. See Use Specific Standards for 

Accessory Structures. 

1. Detached accessory structures, such as garages, and garage apartments and sheds over 100 square 

feet, shall be consistent with the architectural style, materials, and color of the principal structure. 

For multi-story accessory buildings, no portion of an exterior wall on any floor may contain a blank 

area greater than 16-feet in width. 

SECTION 6. Section 16.20.020.6 of the St. Petersburg City Code is hereby amended to read as follows: 

16.20.020.6. - Maximum development potential. 

Development potential is slightly different within each district to respect the character of the 

neighborhoods. Achieving maximum development potential will depend upon market forces, such as 

minimum desirable unit size, and development standards, such as minimum lot size, parking requirements, 

height restrictions, floor area ratios, maximum building and impervious surface ratios, and building 

setbacks.  

To maintain community character and provide for desirable redevelopment and infill housing, homes 

shall be built using FARs as set forth herein. Various design standards may be used to increase the FAR and 

maintain the compatibility of new and modified homes with the existing neighborhood character. Therefore 

a maximum FAR is established and FAR bonuses may be permitted if the home incorporates design 

elements as set forth herein which are intended to be beneficial to the character of the neighborhood and 

reduce the appearance of mass and bulk from the public view. 

 

Minimum Lot Size, Maximum Density and Maximum Intensity  

 

NS-1  NS-2  NS-E  

Minimum lot 
Residential  75 ft.  100 ft.  200 ft.  



 

13 

 

width  Nonresidential  150 ft.  200 ft.  200 ft.  

Minimum lot area  

Residential  5,800 sq. ft.  8,700 sq. ft.  1.0 acre  

Nonresidential  1.0 acre  1.0 acre  2.0 acres  

Maximum residential density  

(units per acre)  

7.5 1 principal unit 

(accessory unit not 

permitted)  

5 1 principal unit 

(accessory unit not 

permitted)  

2 1 principal unit and 1 

accessory unit per lot 

(see note 1)  

Maximum Residential Intensity (floor 

area ratio)(2)(3) 
0.50 0.50 0.50 

Maximum nonresidential intensity  

(floor area ratio)  
0.35  0.30  0.20  

Maximum Residential Building 

Coverage (includes all structures) 
0.50 0.50 0.50 

Maximum impervious surface  

(site area ratio)  
0.60  0.60  0.40  

(1) Refer to use specific development standards for regulations regarding development of accessory dwelling 

and accessory living space. 

(2)  Residential Floor Area Ratio Exemption. The FAR includes any enclosed space above the required design 

flood elevation line, including enclosed garage space, but excludes all enclosed space below the design flood 

elevation. 

(3) Residential Floor Area Ratio Bonus. An FAR bonus of up to 0.20 shall be granted when structures 

incorporate design elements set forth herein. The following options may be utilized in any combination, 

however, the maximum FAR bonus is 0.20. 

a. One story covered front porch with a separate roof structure with a minimum width of 75% of the front 

façade: 0.08 bonus. No bonus is allowed if there is a second story deck, porch or roof structure. 

b. Additional second story front setbacks: .01 bonus for every 1 foot of additional front setback of the entire 

facade, no bonus is allowed unless the setback is at least six feet, maximum 0.08 bonus. No bonus is allowed if 

there is a second story deck, porch or roof structure. 

c. Additional second story side setbacks: .01 bonus for every 1 foot of additional side setback of the entire 

façade, maximum 0.05 bonus per side. 



 

14 

 

d. Total residential floor area of the second story does not exceed 75% of the first story (excludes garage sf): 

0.05 bonus. 

e. Reduction of the height of both the peak and roofline of a two story building from the maximum allowed 

height: 0.02 bonus per foot, maximum 0.06. 

f. The entire peak of the primary roof structure of the front façade is parallel to the front property line: bonus 

0.02, or if the entire peak of the primary roof structure of the front façade is parallel to the front property line 

and the roof has dormer(s) which are equal to at least 20% of the width of the front façade: 0.04 bonus. 

g. Side façade articulation: side facades which feature offsets of at least two feet in depth that are at least 

twelve feet in length that divide the building design and are in the front half of the side facade: 0.02 bonus per 

side, maximum 0.04.  

h. All windows have real or simulated divided light muntins on interior or exterior surfaces: 0.03 bonus. 

Refer to technical standards regarding measurement of lot dimensions, calculation of maximum residential 

density, nonresidential floor area and impervious surface.  

For mixed use developments, refer to additional regulations within the use specific development standards 

section for mixed uses (currently section 16.50.200).  

  

SECTION 7. Section 16.20.020.7 of the St. Petersburg City Code is hereby amended to read as follows: 

16.20.020.7. - Building envelope: Maximum height and minimum setbacks. 

Maximum Building Height (All NS Districts)  

Building Height  Beginning of Roofline  Top of Roof Peak  

Primary building  24 ft.  36 ft.  

Accessory building  20 ft.  30 ft.  

Refer to technical standards regarding measurement of building height.  

 Maximum Building Height, Minimum Building Setbacks  

Building Setbacks  

NS-1  NS-2  NS-E  

If building 

height is up 

to 24 ft.  

If building 

height is 

over 24 ft.  

If building 

height is up 

to 24 ft.  

If building 

height is 

over24 ft.  

If building 

height is up 

to 24 ft.  

If building 

height is 

over 24 ft.  

https://www.municode.com/library/fl/st._petersburg/codes/code_of_ordinances?nodeId=PTIISTPECO_CH16LADERE_S16.50.200MIUS


 

15 

 

Front 

Yard 

Stoop 17 ft. or M 35 ft. 22 ft. or M 40 ft. 27 ft. or M 45 ft. 

Open 

Porch(1) 
20 ft. or M 35 ft. 25 ft. or M 40 ft. 30 ft. or M 45 ft. 

Building 25 ft. or M 35 ft. 30 ft. or M 40 ft. 35 ft. or M 45 ft. 

Interior Side Yard 7.5 ft. or M 15 ft. 7.5 ft. or M 15 ft. 15 ft. or M 25 ft. 

Street Side Yard 12 ft. or M 20 ft. 15 ft. or M 25 ft. 20 ft. or M 30 ft. 

Rear 

Yard 

Principal 20 ft. or M 30 ft. 20 ft. or M 30 ft. 30 ft. or M 40 ft. 

Accessory 10 ft. or M 30 ft. 10 ft. or M 30 ft. 20 ft. or M 40 ft. 

Waterfront Yard 15 ft. 20 ft. 15 ft. 20 ft. 20 ft. 20 ft. 

Notes: 

(1) Open porch shall be limited to a one story covered porch with or without a second story uncovered 

porch; a two story covered porch shall meet the principal structure setback. 

 

M (minor encroachment). Minor encroachments into the normally prescribed setbacks may be allowed so 

that an addition may align with the side of the existing structure, provided: 

 (a) The total floor area of the encroaching portion of an addition shall not exceed 50 square feet;  

 (b) No portion of the encroachment shall exceed 24 feet in height; 

 (c) In no case shall any setback be less than four feet. 

Refer to technical standards for yard types and stoop and setback encroachments. 

Enclosing porches in the front yard setback is regulated by the general development standards.  

Building setbacks are based on the overall height of the various sections of a proposed building.  

As the building height increases, so does the minimum required setback.  

 

  



 

16 

 

 

Minimum Building Setbacks for SE Uses  

Building Setbacks SE Uses  NS-1  NS-2  NS-E  

All yards, including waterfront 35 ft. 35 ft. 35 ft. 

Refer to technical standards for yard types. 

 

SECTION 8. Section 16.20.020.11 of the St. Petersburg City Code is hereby amended to read as follows: 

16.20.020.11. - Setbacks consistent with established neighborhood patterns. 

There are building setback characteristics of existing neighborhoods related to the rhythm of spacing 

between buildings (side yard setbacks), front yard setbacks, and alignment of buildings along the block face. 

Minimum yard setback characteristics of neighborhoods may differ from the requirements of this district.  

The POD may approve, without a variance, residential development that meets setback characteristics 

and standards of a neighborhood having boundaries defined by an accepted neighborhood plan approval 

shall be based on the following:  

1. Front and side yard setbacks will be based on predominant building setbacks established in the block 

in which the development is proposed.  

2. Evaluation of building setbacks will also consider the pattern of building setbacks on the blocks 

adjacent to the block in which the development is proposed.  

This approval shall follow the procedures for streamline approvals of variances.  



 

17 

 

SECTION 9. Section 16.20.020.12 of the St. Petersburg City Code is hereby amended to read as follows: 

16.20.020.12. – Building and site design. 

The following design criteria allow the property owner and design professional to choose their 

preferred architectural style, building form, scale and massing, while creating a framework for good urban 

design practices which create a positive experience for the pedestrian. For a more complete introduction, see 

section 16.10.010.  

Site layout and orientation. The City is committed to creating and preserving a network of linkages for 

pedestrians. Consequently, pedestrian and vehicle connections between public rights-of-way and private 

property are subject to a hierarchy of transportation, which begins with the pedestrian.  

Building and architectural design standards. All buildings should present an inviting, human scale 

facade to the streets, internal drives, parking areas and surrounding neighborhoods. The architectural 

elements of a building should give it character, richness and visual interest.  

Building and parking layout and orientation.  

1. For nonresidential uses, all service areas and loading docks shall be located behind the front facade 

line of the principal structure.  

2. All mechanical equipment and utility functions (for e.g. electrical conduits, meters, HVAC 

equipment) shall be located behind the front façade line of the principal structure. Mechanical 

equipment that is visible from the primary street shall be screened with a material that is compatible 

with the architecture of the principal structure.  

3. Accessory structures shall be located behind the front facade line of the principal structure.  

Building and architectural design standards. All buildings should present an inviting, human scale facade to the 

streets, internal drives, parking areas and surrounding neighborhoods. The architectural elements of a 

building should give it character, richness and visual interest.  

Building style.  

1. New construction shall utilize an identifiable architectural style, which is recognized by design 

professionals as having a basis in academic architectural design philosophies.  

2. Design of homes located within on the same block face on either side of the street or within on an 

adjacent block face on either side of the street shall be varied, such that a substantially similar design 

will not be replicated. There shall be a minimum separation of three parcels in every direction before a 

substantially similar design can be repeated. Variation shall include at least three of the following 

elements: architectural style, roof form (principal or porch), materials, architectural details (doors, 

windows, columns, porches). 

 

 

https://www.municode.com/library/fl/st._petersburg/codes/code_of_ordinances?nodeId=PTIISTPECO_CH16LADERE_S16.10.010ESZODIMAMA
https://www.municode.com/library/fl/st._petersburg/codes/code_of_ordinances?nodeId=PTIISTPECO_CH16LADERE_S16.10.010ESZODIMAMA


 

18 

 

3. Renovations, additions and accessory structures shall utilize the architectural style of the existing 

structure, or the entire existing structure shall be modified to utilize an identifiable architectural 

style, which is recognized by design professionals as having a basis in academic architectural 

design philosophies.  

Wall composition. Wall composition standards ensure that ground-level storefronts and multifamily and single-

family residential buildings offer attractive features to the pedestrian. Wall composition standards also 

mitigate blank walls and ensure that all sides of a building have visual interest. Providing for transparency 

enhances visual connections between activities inside and outside buildings thereby improving pedestrian 

safety.  The following criteria shall not apply to accessory structures.   

1. Doors, windows and other appropriate fenestration, architectural details and features shall be 

incorporated into all sides of a building. With the exception of garages up to 15-feet in height 

located at the rear one-third of the lot there There shall be no blank facades. For multi-story 

buildings, no No portion of a façade on any story corresponding to the height between two floors 

shall contain a blank area greater than 16 feet in width.  

2. Structures which are situated on corner lots, through lots, or by the nature of the site layout have a 

facade which is clearly visible from rights-of-way shall be designed with full architectural treatment 

on all sides visible from rights-of-way. Full architectural treatment shall include roof design, wall 

materials, architectural trim, and door and window openings. While it is recognized that buildings 

have primary and secondary facades, the construction materials and detailing should be similar 

throughout.  

3. Where the required design elevation is equal to or greater than 48” above finished grade, an 

articulated base is required to delineate the first floor level. The base may consist of a different material 

or decorative band, depending on the architectural style. 

Transparency. The provision of transparency enhances visual connections between activities inside and outside 

buildings thereby improving pedestrian safety.  

14. Windows on the street side facades shall be evenly distributed in a consistent pattern.  

 

Roofs. Rooflines add visual interest to the streetscape and establish a sense of continuity between adjacent 

buildings. When used properly, rooflines can help distinguish between residential and commercial land uses, 

reduce the mass of large structures, emphasize entrances, and provide shade and shelter for pedestrians.  

1. Buildings shall provide a pitched roof or a flat roof with a decorative parapet wall compatible with 

the architectural style of the building.  

Garages. Garage standards maintain and enhance the attractiveness of the streetscape and are influenced by a 

hierarchy of transportation, which begins with the pedestrian.  

1. Where alley access exists, alley access is highly encouraged.  

2. Garage doors shall comprise no more than 60 percent of the linear frontage of the facade of the 

principal structure. When garage doors comprise more than 40 percent of the linear frontage of the 

facade, the principal structure shall feature a projecting entryway that shall have a minimum 

projected depth of five feet.  

3. Where garages which project past the front facade of the principal structure and have garage doors 

that face the primary street, the garage entry shall feature at least one of the following 

enhancements: decorative garage doors, an arbor system surrounding the garage doors, a projecting 

balcony, cupola or other decorative element above the garage to lessen the impact of the vehicular 

orientation of the house. The decorative feature proposed by the applicant shall be compatible with 

the principal structure and must be approved by the POD. This decision may only be appealed by 

the property owner.  

Building materials. Building material standards protect neighboring properties by holding the building's value 

longer, thereby creating a greater resale value and stabilizing the value of neighboring properties.  



 

19 

 

1. Building materials shall be appropriate to the selected architectural style and shall be consistent 

throughout the structure.  

Accessory structures and equipment and carports. Accessory structures shall reinforce the pedestrian character 

of the City. Above-ground utility and service features, accessory storage structures, and carports shall be 

located and designed to reduce their visual impact upon the streetscape. See Use Specific Standards for 

Accessory Structures. 

1. Detached accessory structures, such as garages, and garage apartments and sheds over 100 square 

feet, shall be consistent with the architectural style, materials, and color of the principal structure. 

For multi-story accessory buildings, no portion of an exterior wall on any floor may contain a blank 

area greater than 16-feet in width. 

 

SECTION 10. Section 16.40.020 of the St. Petersburg City Code is hereby amended by deleting the entire 

existing Section and amending Section 16.40.020 to read as follows: 

 16.40.020. - ARCHITECTURE AND BUILDING DESIGN 

16.40.020.1. - Architecture and building design. 

St. Petersburg has a rich architectural history dating to its founding. The City’s architecture includes a range of 

styles that showcase the diversity of its residents, shifts in tastes, advances in building materials and 

techniques, and development patterns. St. Petersburg’s earliest buildings, both residential and commercial, 

were primarily Folk Vernacular and generally frame or masonry construction. As the City of St. Petersburg 

became more popular, fine examples of other architectural styles such as Craftsman, Prairie and Foursquare, 

Art Deco and Art Moderne, Minimal Traditional, Mid-Century, and various revival styles including 

Mediterranean, Mission, Colonial, and Tudor became prevalent. 

The publication titled, St. Petersburg’s Design Guidelines for Historic Properties (“Guidelines”), adopted by 

the City Council by resolution on July 13, 2017, as amended by City Council resolution, was created to assist 

property owners in identifying the architectural style of their property and serve as a reference guide for 

property owners, architects, builders, contractors, and city officials in executing the various design 

requirements for both the City’s historic preservation program and building design requirements contained 

within the individual zoning categories. 

It is important to understand the style of a building when making decisions affecting the exterior appearances, 

including additions and replacement of damaged or missing elements. When considering new construction, it 

is also important to consider the overall character of that neighborhood and understand the range of styles 

represented within it. The Guidelines give a brief description and history of some of the most common 

architectural styles seen throughout St. Petersburg. Illustrations show a range of elements and features that are 

common to each style. 

Due to the diversity of architectural styles observed throughout St. Petersburg, several styles are not included 

within the Guidelines and certain elements are not comprehensively covered. In each of these instances, City 

staff may refer to other academic architectural resources for additional information, including but not limited 

to: 

Virginia Savage and Lee McAlester. A Field Guide to American Houses. New York, NY: Alfred A. 

Knopf, Inc., 1984. 

 



 

20 

 

Virginia Savage and Lee McAlester. A Field Guide to American Houses (Revised): The Definitive 

Guide to Identifying and Understanding America’s Domestic Architecture. New York, NY: Alfred A. 

Knopf, Inc., 2015. 

In addition to the styles illustrated in the publications listed above, there are other styles recognized by design 

professionals as having a basis in academic architectural design philosophies that may be utilized.  

16.40.020.2 – Compliance. 

When any provision of this Chapter requires construction, which includes new construction, additions, 

redevelopment, rehabilitation, or any other activity, to comply with or meet design requirements or an 

architectural style, the publications described herein provide those design and architectural requirements and 

are hereby adopted by reference and incorporated herein as a part of this Chapter.  

SECTION 11. Section 16.400.04.3.2 of the St. Petersburg City Code is hereby amended to read as follows: 

 
16.40.040.3.2 Waterfront yards (all uses). Maximum Height. 

Waterfront yards (all uses).  

2. WATERFRONT YARDS (All uses)  

Maximum Height  

a.  -  3 feet for a solid fence or wall of 

any style, or a hedge and any 

landscape materials except protected 

trees  

    -  4 feet for an open fence 

    -   5 feet for a decorative open fence 

for a dock on a non-contiguous water 

lot, with a maximum gate height of 6 

feet, and maximum arch structure 

height over the gate of 7.5 feet  

    -  6 feet for a vinyl-coated chain-

link fence  

b.  In part of the waterfront yard there 

shall be no limit on the height of 

landscape materials or number of trees 

hedges (see E.2, below)  

For IC/CRD-

zoned 

properties  

-  10 feet for 

an open 

fence  

For 

commercial 

marinas  

-  6 feet for 

an open fence  



 

21 

 

The diagram at right is intended to 

provide an illustrative view of the 

foregoing regulations as applied to 

rectangular lots platted in the traditional 

block pattern of the City. For non-

rectangular lots or for lots with irregular 

lot lines, property owners are advised to 

contact the City to verify interpretation 

of the ordinance as applied to a specific 

property. The crosshatched area shown 

in the key is intended to illustrate 

subsection a. above. The dotted area 

shown in the key is intended to illustrate 

subsection b. above. ‘X’ is the setback 

set forth in the zoning district. 

    

 

  

SECTION 12. Section 16.40.040.3.5.C. of the St. Petersburg City Code is hereby amended by adding a new 

subsection 12 to read as follows: 

 

Section 16.40.040.3.5.C.12. Gates and fencing for docks on non-contiguous water lots shall be open and 

consist of decorative materials such as wrought iron, aluminum or other decorative metals suitable for the 

construction of fences, masonry, concrete, stone, and vinyl or composite manufactured specifically as fencing 

materials.  Any fencing projecting beyond the width of the dock as measured at the seawall (the walkway) 

shall be limited 5 feet in height and 3 feet in width on each side of the walkway. Replacement of a dock or the 

existing gate or fencing, the replacement of a majority of the pilings, any expansion of the deck area or the 

addition of a boat lift(s) shall require gates and fences to be brought into compliance. This shall not apply to 

commercial marinas or properties in the IC/CRD land use category. 

 

 

SECTION 13. Section 16.40.060.2.1.2 of the St. Petersburg City Code is hereby amended to read as follows: 

 
16.40.060.2.1.2. - Additional requirements for new and existing one- and two-unit residential properties.  

 

https://api.municode.com/CD/staticCodeContent?productId=14674&fileName=16-40-040-3-2.png


 

22 

 

A. Required permeable green space for yards abutting streets. Required front yards and required side yards 

abutting streets shall be maintained as permeable landscaped vegetative green space with the exception of 

driveways, walks, patios and similar paved areas and non-organic mulch areas, which areas combined 

shall not exceed 25 percent of the required yard area for corner lots and 45 percent of the required yard 

area for inside lots. Facilities constructed to achieve compliance with ADA requirements shall be exempt 

from this surface calculation. Yards abutting streets which do not conform to the provisions herein and 

which existed as of August 25, 1977, are grandfathered and exempt from this subsection.  

B. Ground cover, private property. Permeable portions of private property including required yards shall be 

maintained with an herbaceous layer of sod or ground cover plant material. Installation of St. Augustine 

sod turf at a property with a new structure which receives construction permits is limited to a maximum 

of 50 percent of the permeable area of the lot.  

C. Ground cover, rights-of-way. Permeable portions within the adjoining rights-of-way shall be maintained 

in accordance with an approved streetscape plan or, where an approved streetscape plan does not exist, 

with an herbaceous layer of sod or ground cover plant material. Where landscaping material is used in the 

right-of-way within four feet of the curb or road edge and there is no approved landscape plan, the 

landscaping materials, excluding sod, shall not exceed 24 inches in height above the top of the adjacent 

curb, or if there is no curb, the road bed, provided that the landscaping material does not result in a hazard 

or impairment to public vehicular or pedestrian traffic or violate the visibility at intersection section.  

D. Mulch. Organic mulch is a beneficial addition to landscaping in many situations including providing a 

surface covering under shrubs, or where ground cover material is maturing. The intention of these 

regulations is to allow mulch within a landscape design while not allowing an entire yard to only be 

covered with mulch. The use of cypress mulch is discouraged.  

1. Installation standards. Where used in lieu of sod or ground cover plant material, mulch shall be 

placed to a minimum depth of three inches. The top level of the mulch shall not exceed the height of 

the immediately adjacent ground surface. Mulch shall not be placed directly against a plant stem or 

tree trunk. Non-organic mulch including rubber, decorative gravel or crushed stone shall be allowed 

only in planting areas (e.g., in gardens or hedge areas).  

2. Limits on installation on one- and two-unit residential properties.  

a. Organic mulch may be used without limit underneath shrubs and trees, provided the shrubs and 

trees or a combination thereof are planted and maintained at a cumulative ratio of at least one 

shrub or tree, planted within the mulch per each ten square feet of organic mulched area;  

b. No more than 50 percent of the required front and street side yard may be covered with mulch;  

c. Where a mulch parking surface has been permitted pursuant to the parking and loading design 

section, a separation consisting of an herbaceous layer of sod or ground cover of not less than 

eight feet in width shall be provided between the parking area and any adjacent mulch area 

allowed pursuant to this section.  

3. Limits on installation in rights-of-way. Organic mulch may be used in permeable areas of the right-

of-way to keep moisture in the soil while other forms of approved ground cover plant material are 

maturing. Mulch is prohibited within four feet of the curb or road edge if there is no curb. Mulch in 

the right-of-way must be contained within borders sufficient to prevent flotation of mulch into the 

roadway. With the exception of permitted driveway or sidewalk materials, the use of shell, rock or 

other similar hardened non-organic mulch in the right-of-way is prohibited.  

E. Irrigation, existing one- and two-unit residential properties. A permanent irrigation system is not 

required for existing one- and two-unit residential properties; however, where one is installed, it shall be 

designed to avoid runoff, overspray or other similar conditions where water flows onto or over adjacent 

property, non-irrigated areas, walkways, roadways or structures. Irrigation systems shall be maintained so 
there are no broken irrigation heads or leaks. Automatic sprinkler systems shall install a rain sensor 



 

23 

 

device or switch which will override the irrigation cycle of the sprinkler system when adequate rainfall 

has occurred.  

F. Vegetation, existing one- and two-unit residential properties. Any one- or two-unit residential property 

that meets or exceeds the tree and/or shrub standards set forth in the previous section for new one or two 

unit residential properties, shall maintain the minimum standards for the property. This does not mean 

that existing one- or two-unit residential properties that do not meet the requirements set forth in the 

previous section for new one- or two-unit residential properties are required to install vegetation to meet 

those requirements.  

G. Landscaping adjacent to mechanical equipment on site. Mechanical equipment, (e.g. backflow 

preventers, utility cabinets, air conditioners, etc.) visible from streets, excluding alleys, shall be 

landscaped with a continuous hedge comprised of shrubs planted no more than 30 inches on center or a 

decorative fence or architectural feature if the location is inadequate for landscape (e.g. too small, 

insufficient light). Landscaping shall be installed no less than three feet from the equipment to allow for 

access, maintenance and required air flow.  

H. Landscaping adjacent to fences, walls, or dumpster enclosures. The exterior of any opaque fence or wall 

which exceeds 150 linear feet in length, visible from any street (not alley) shall be landscaped with a 

minimum of one shrub for every three linear feet and one under-story tree for every 25 linear feet. 

I. Decorative objects, including, but not limited to, rocks and planter beds, shall not be located within four 

feet of the curb of the street or where there is no curb, the road edge.  

 

SECTION 14. Section 16.40.090.3.3 of the St. Petersburg City Code is hereby amended to read as follows: 

 

16.40.090.3.3. - Development standards for private one- and two-family properties.  

Parking.  

1. Location. Required parking spaces shall be located on the same lot as the use.  

2. Driveways. Driveways shall be designed in a manner that minimizes disruption of pedestrian 

corridors and the streetscape. Driveway locations shall be provided as required in the zoning district, 

except that no such driveways shall be allowed when a one- or two-family residential property abuts 

an alley and is located in a DC district.  

3. Variances. Where unique conditions related to existing buildings, dimensional aspects of platted 

lots, or a lack of available space preclude strict compliance with these requirements, the POD may 

adjust the minimum requirements in accordance with the standards of review for the granting of a 

variance.  

4. Visibility triangle. The visibility triangle is an area which has certain restrictions to allow for safe 

visibility when operating a motor vehicle or bicycle or for pedestrian movement. Driveways may 

encroach into the visibility triangle within the public right-of-way; however, driveways shall not 

encroach into the visibility triangle within the boundary of the private property.  

5. Setbacks. Portions of a driveway located in the right-of-way shall meet a minimum setback of three 

feet from the extended interior and streetside property line.  



 

24 

 

 

6. Dimensions. Parking spaces shall be located completely on private property to prevent vehicles from 

overhanging into and obstructing the public right-of-way. Parking spaces shall be a minimum of 9 

feet in width and 18 feet in length and completely on private property. 

a. Standard driveway. Driveways shall measure no less than ten feet in width and no more than 20 

feet in width, no more than 20 feet as the driveway crosses the property line and no more than 

26 feet at the curb, which includes a three-foot by seven-foot triangular flare. The required 

minimum length for the portion of the driveway on the private property is 19 feet, measured 

from the property line.  

 

b. Circular driveway. The circular portion of a driveway shall measure no less than ten feet in 

width and no more than 14 feet in width, no more than 14 feet as the driveway crosses the 

property line and no more than 20 feet at the curb, which includes a three-foot by seven-foot 

triangular flare. Circular driveways are not allowed on lots less than 60 feet wide. 

 

   Circular Driveway 



 

25 

 

 

c. Ribbon driveway. Ribbon driveways are an acceptable alternative to standard driveways, 

reducing the overall impervious surface coverage. Ribbon driveways are subject to the same 

maximum dimensional standards as dimensions for standard driveways. Individual "ribbons" 

are only permitted within the property (not the right-of-way) and shall measure between 1½ 

and 2½ feet in width.  

   Ribbon Driveway 

 

Ribbon Driveway 

d. Accessory parking pad. An accessory parking pad no wider than ten feet and not exceeding 400 

square feet in area may be installed contiguous to a legally recognized driveway, subject to the 

condition that the parking surface area is located wholly within the property and no closer than 

three feet to the interior or street side property lines. See zoning district criteria for specific 

dimensions for parking pads. 

 



 

26 

 

   Accessory Parking Pad 

 

Accessory Parking Pad 

e. Zoning specific criteria .  

1. When a property is located within a Neighborhood Traditional (NT) zoning district, any 

new, reconstructed or reconfigured driveway shall be no wider than 20 feet within the 

property boundaries, 12 feet as the driveway crosses the property line and 16 feet at the 

curb, which includes a two feet by seven feet triangular flare. Circular driveways within 

the front or street side yards are prohibited, except as otherwise allowed by the building 

design standards of the zoning district. Where a circular driveway is permitted, the 

circular portion of the driveway shall measure no less than ten feet in width and no more 

than 12 feet in width, no more than 12 feet as the driveway crosses the property line and 

no more than 16 feet at the curb, which includes a two-foot by seven-foot triangular flare. 

2. When property is located within a Neighborhood Suburban (NS) zoning district, one 

driveway (inclusive of one portion of a circular driveway that extends to the curb) shall be 

no wider than 20 feet within the property boundaries, 20 feet as the driveway crosses the 

property line and 26 feet at the curb. All additional driveways (inclusive of one portion of 

a circular driveway that extends to the curb) shall be no wider than 14 feet within the 

property boundaries, 14 feet as the driveway crosses the property line and 20 feet at the 

curb. See also dimension requirements for circular driveways.  



 

27 

 

7. Sidewalks located within adjoining right-of-way. In traditional districts, where a driveway intersects 

a sidewalk located within the right-of-way, the portion of the sidewalk that crosses the driveway 

shall have a consistent finish and color as the abutting sidewalk and be visually delineated with 

expansion joints. In suburban districts, where a driveway intersects a sidewalk located within the 

right-of-way, the portion of the sidewalk that crosses the driveway shall be visually delineated with a 

change in color or material or with expansion joints. The abutting property owner shall be 

responsible for maintaining the sidewalk in good condition and repair with no cracks or voids larger 

than one inch. 

.8. Impervious surface coverage. The maximum impervious surface ratio is limited to those areas within 

the boundary of the private property and does not include the public right-of-way. For interior lots, 

no more than 45 percent of the land area between the front property line and front building setback 

line may be paved or covered with impervious surface materials. For corner lots, no more than 25 

percent of the land area between the front and street side property lines and front and street side 

building setback lines may be paved or covered with impervious surface materials. Impervious 

surface materials include the surface materials identified in subsection 9 of this section.  

9. Surface materials. The portion of the driveway located within the right-of-way shall be constructed 

of asphalt or concrete material, brick or decorative pavers. The portion of the driveway and all 

required parking spaces located within the property boundaries shall be constructed of asphalt or 

concrete material, brick or decorative pavers, grid pavers, crushed stone, rock, gravel or other 

materials approved by the POD. Crushed shell is prohibited. The abutting property owner shall be 

responsible for maintaining the surface in good condition and repair with no cracks or voids larger 

than one inch. 

For accessory parking pads, only organic mulch is also an approved surface material and is subject 

to the following minimum technical standards. Mulch shall be at least four inches deep. The parking 

pad shall be bordered with a solid border at least four inches below the surface and extending at least 

two inches above the surface of the mulch on all sides except the driveway side, where it shall 

extend at least one inch above the mulch surface.  

  Mulch Parking Pad 

 

Mulch Parking Pad 

SECTION 15. Sections 16.40.030.6.1.c and .3.aof the St. Petersburg City Code are hereby amended to read as 

follows:  

1.c. A proposed residential development of up to four dwelling units individual single-family 

home, duplex, triplex or quadruplex which is not part of a larger unified common plan of 

development shall be exempt from water quality requirements.  



 

28 

 

* * * * * * * * * 

3.a. A proposed residential development of up to four dwelling units individual single-family 

home, duplex, triplex or quadruplex which is not part of a larger unified common plan of 

development is exempt.  

SECTION 16. Section 16.40.140.3 of the St. Petersburg City Code is hereby amended to read as follows:  

 

16.40.140.3. - Plats, preliminary and final.  

 

A. Generally.  

1. No permit shall be issued by the POD for the construction of any building or other improvement 

requiring a permit on property within a subdivision of land for which a plat is required, unless a 

preliminary plat thereof has been approved by the POD.  

2. No street shall be accepted and maintained by the City, nor shall water, reclaimed water, or sewer 

service be extended by the City, nor shall a certificate of occupancy be approved for any permit be 

issued by the POD for the construction of any building or other improvement requiring a permit on 

property within a subdivision of land for which a plat is required by this section or was required 

prior to the adoption of this section, unless a final plat thereof has been approved and has been 

recorded in the office of the clerk of the circuit court of the county.  

2.3. All unplatted, undeveloped land shall be platted prior to the issuance of a certificate of occupancy of 

any structure thereon; however, where a legal principal use already exists on unplatted land, permits 

for maintenance purposes and additions thereto may be issued.  

4. Division of more than one platted lot under common ownership, or which are part of a unified plan 

of development, shall require that all lots be replatted or platted. 

B. Procedures. For procedures, see applications and procedures section.  

SECTION 17. Sections 16.40.140.2.4.C.3 and D of the St. Petersburg City Code are hereby amended to read 

as follows: 

 

C.3. Consistency with the established neighborhood pattern shall be maintained, including lot dimensions, 

utility and parking functions, alley access, and sanitation services. New lot lines shall comply with the 

subdivision requirements when practical and shall be formed of one straight line. 

 

D. Replatting. Replatting is required if the lot line adjustment or lot split results in the property that is the 

subject of the application being divided, and including any abutting property and lots in common 

ownership, or which are part of a unified plan of development,  into a total of three or more lots. 

 

SECTION 18. Section 16.40.140.4.7 of the St. Petersburg City Code is hereby amended to read as follows: 

 

16.40.140.4.7. - Excavation, fill, and tree removal.  

Prior to any land excavation, fill operation, or tree removal in a proposed subdivision development, a 

final preliminary plat prepared in accordance with the provisions of this chapter shall be approved by the 

POD City Council.  

1. Excavation. The owner requesting any excavation shall obtain a permit from the POD and shall 

comply with all other applicable local, county, state and federal requirements.  



 

29 

 

2. Landfill. Prior to commencing any landfill, plans and specifications for the clearing, filling and 

grading operation shall be submitted by a registered engineer who will supervise the actual clearing 

and filling operations and a permit shall be obtained from the POD. All conditions of the approved 

specifications shall be met and certified by a registered engineer in charge of the project.  

3. Tree removal. Plans for tree preservation and removal shall be submitted for any plat in excess of 

three acres.  

4. Guarantee of improvements. A guarantee of improvements shall be provided to ensure that all 

conditions of the permit shall be completed.  

 

SECTION 19.   Section 16.50.010 of the St. Petersburg City Code is hereby amended to read as follows: 

 

SECTION 16.50.010. - ACCESSORY DWELLING AND ACCESSORY LIVING SPACE 

 

16.50.010.1. - Applicability.  

This section applies to accessory dwelling units and accessory living space as defined in the Matrix: 

Use Premises and Parking Requirements and to the construction of a single-family dwelling unit as a 

principal use on a lot where an accessory dwelling unit already exists.  

16.50.010.2. - Generally.  

Common names for accessory dwelling units and accessory living space include garage apartment, 

ancillary apartment, mother-in-law unit, guest house, carriage house or granny flat. For the purposes of these 

regulations, all of these building forms shall be referred to as an "accessory dwelling use" unless otherwise 

specified in this section. See the definition of Accessory Dwelling Unit in the Use Matrix for definition, 

16.50.010.3. - Purpose and intent.  

Traditional neighborhoods in the City are under increasing development pressure. Redevelopment has 

occurred in a manner that is not consistent with the development pattern that makes these areas attractive 

and desirable. Appropriately channeling the form of redevelopment is critical to maintaining the character 

and viability of our traditional neighborhoods. Reintroducing the accessory dwelling use as a permitted use 

in these areas is intended to guide reinvestment and redevelopment in a manner that reinforces and protects 

the traditional pattern. This section is also intended to address the establishment of accessory living space 

which can be used in a manner that creates impacts similar to an accessory dwelling use. Protecting that 

pattern requires strict and complete compliance with all of the applicable development standards.  

1. Strict compliance with standards for a new accessory dwelling use. The development standards in 

this section have been crafted within the context of an urban environment. The accessory dwelling 

use will be constructed either at the same time as a new house is built or as an addition where a 

principal dwelling unit already exists. In either case, strict compliance with the standards of this 

section shall be required. Where the accessory dwelling use is proposed in addition to an existing 

principal single-family use, compliance may require significant modification to the current 

configuration of the site. This section is not intended to prioritize one standard over another; all are 

equally important and necessary. Strict compliance with the criteria is critical to adequately and 

effectively mitigate the impacts and achieve the desired outcome. A variance from any of the 

standards in this section to establish an accessory dwelling use would be inconsistent with the 

purpose and intent of this section; therefore, no variance to any provision of this section may be 

granted.  

2. Reinstatement of an abandoned accessory dwelling use. The development standards of this section 

shall also be used to evaluate the merits of an application to reinstate the grandfathered status of an 

abandoned accessory dwelling unit. Reinstatement, if approved, shall remove the grandfathered 

status and make the accessory dwelling unit lawful pursuant to the current zoning regulations. 



 

30 

 

Although no variances are allowed for new accessory dwelling uses, some relief from the standards 

of this section may be necessary in the context of a reinstatement because the principal and 

accessory structures already exist.  

16.50.010.4. - Establishment.  

Establishment or expansion of a lawful accessory dwelling unit use shall be subject to the following 

requirements:  

1. Not more than one accessory dwelling unit use shall be permitted for each single-family dwelling in 

the districts where allowed by the Matrix: Use Permissions and Parking Requirements, subject to all 

requirements of this section.  

2. An accessory dwelling unit use shall not be permitted before construction of the principal building 

has commenced or a lawful principal use is established.  

3. An accessory dwelling unit use shall be subordinate to the principal use as to location, height, square 

footage, and building coverage.  

4. An accessory dwelling unit use shall not be utilized as a transient accommodation use as defined and 

regulated by this chapter.  

16.50.010.5. - Development standards.  

 

16.50.010.5.1. - Lot requirements.  

 

A. Establishment of a new accessory dwelling unit use shall only be allowed if:  

1. The lot area shall be at least 5,800 square feet. There is no minimum lot area requirement for 

accessory living space;  

2. If the lot is below the current minimum lot area requirements for the zoning district, the original 

platted lot or lawfully established lot of record has not been subdivided and remains under common 

ownership;  

3. The If the accessory dwelling unit is detached and the legal front and rear of the lot are consistent 

with the front and rear yards of lots on the same block face. An attached accessory dwelling unit 

shall not be permitted where lots have been refaced such that the legal front yards face a different 

direction than the rest of the lots in the block or where refacing has eliminated alley access for a lot.  

B. A lot containing an accessory dwelling unit use shall not be subdivided to separate the accessory dwelling 

unit use from the principal use, unless such division can meet all applicable standards of the zoning 

district and land development regulations.  

16.50.010.5.2. - Building and site requirements.  

Site plans for the establishment of any new accessory Accessory dwelling units use shall be subject to 

the following design standards for buildings:  

1. The floor area of any accessory dwelling unit use shall be no less than 375 square feet and shall not 

exceed 750 square feet.  

2. For a multi-story, accessory building, the floor area of the portion of the building used for an 

accessory dwelling unit shall not exceed 50 percent of the gross floor area of the multi-story, 

accessory building. If the entire area used for the accessory dwelling unit is on the second floor of 

the building (not including the stairs) then the accessory dwelling unit may exceed 50 percent of the 

gross floor area of the building. The remaining floor area shall be used only as garage, utility 

(washer, dryer, work room) or storage space. For a one-story, accessory building, the accessory 

dwelling unit use may use 100 percent of the gross floor area of the one-story, accessory building.  



 

31 

 

3. The portion of the building containing an accessory dwelling unit living space may be attached to 

the side or rear of the principal structure and shall comply with the setbacks of the zoning district.  

4. Sides of buildings containing second floor porches, or unenclosed staircases which face the interior 

side yard of an adjacent property shall comply with the minimum setback of the zoning district or 

ten feet, whichever is greater. This requirement shall not apply to completely enclosed staircases.  

5. A paved walkway at least two feet in width shall connect the main entrance of the accessory 

dwelling unit use with the off-street parking spaces and the public sidewalk.  

6. The building containing an accessory dwelling unit use shall comply with the architectural standards 

for the zoning district and be compatible with the style of the building containing the principal use, 

including paint scheme.  

16.50.010.5.3. - Visual buffering.  

Given the compact urban form of traditional neighborhoods, it is necessary to establish minimum 

standards for visual buffering between uses to afford residents a reasonable level of privacy in rear yards. 

Each lot is different. Certain design solutions may be more effective or appropriate in some circumstances 

than others. The intent is to prioritize privacy for adjacent properties over the privacy between the principal 

and accessory use on the lot. Buildings for a new accessory dwelling unit shall comply with the following 

requirements:  

1. Where an accessory dwelling unit use is proposed at a second story level, all exterior doorways and 

outdoor living areas such as porches, or balconies, and unenclosed staircases shall be oriented 

toward the interior of the property or meet at least a ten foot side yard setback.  

2. Sill heights for second story windows facing interior side yards shall be at least 48 inches above the 

finished floor elevation for the second story level.  

16.50.010.5.4. - Parking and accessibility.  

New or redeveloped accessory Accessory dwelling units use shall be subject to the following parking  

design standards:  

1. Paved off-street parking spaces shall be provided for all uses on the site as required in the Matrix: 

Use Permissions and Parking Requirements.  

2. No variances shall be granted to the number of required parking spaces for a new accessory dwelling 

use permitted after September 10, 2007.  

3. The addition or reinstatement of an accessory dwelling unit shall require compliance with all of the 

parking requirements for the entire property.  

4.2. All required off-street parking spaces shall be provided in the rear yard where the rear yard is 

adjacent to an alley. If no alley access exists, parking shall be contained within the rear portion of 

the site accessed by a driveway from the side street. Driveway access from the primary street shall 

only be permitted where there is no alley or side street and shall be no larger than a single lane wide.  

5. The parking of vehicles in front of the principal structure is prohibited. Parking a vehicle on the 

street in front of the principal structure is not prohibited at a location where street parking is 

otherwise lawful.  

6.3. Driveways for off-street parking areas shall comply with the design and location restrictions for the 

zoning district. Nonconforming driveways shall be modified to comply or shall be eliminated. The 

requirement to eliminate a nonconforming driveway or parking area in order to make a property 

eligible for an accessory dwelling use shall not be deemed to constitute a hardship justifying a 

variance.  

7.4. At least one of the required parking spaces shall be an unobstructed, unenclosed surface space for 

exclusive use by occupants of the accessory dwelling unit use.  



 

32 

 

8. Surface parking areas capable of accommodating more than three vehicles shall incorporate 

decorative pavement treatments throughout at least ten percent of the paved area, including the 

driveway. Plain asphalt or concrete shall not be permitted.  

9.5. A storage area shall be reserved along the property line adjacent to the alley to provide storage of 

solid waste collection containers, where possible.  

10. Storage areas shall be at least five feet wide and may be divided between two adjacent properties.  

11. Storage areas shall be required along both sides of an alley, regardless of which side is currently 

used for solid waste collection service.  

16.50.010.5.5. - Accessory living spaces; additional restrictions. 

In addition to the restrictions applicable to accessory dwelling units, new accessory living spaces shall be 

subject to the following restrictions: 

1. An accessory living space shall operate as an extension of and be dependent upon the principal use 

and shall not be a separately functioning dwelling unit. 

2. Cooking facilities are prohibited within an accessory living space. 

3. Separate mailing addresses are prohibited for an accessory living space. 

4. Separate utility meters for electricity, gas, water, and other utility services are prohibited. 

 

 SECTION 20. The St. Petersburg City Code is hereby amended by adding a new Section 16.50.011, 

to read as follows: 

 

SECTION 16.50.011. – Accessory living space.  
 

16.50.011.1. - Applicability.  

This section applies to accessory living space as defined in the Matrix: Use Premises and Parking 

Requirements.  

16.50.011.2. - Generally.  

These requirements apply to both attached and detached accessory living spaces. 

 

16.50.011.3. - Accessory living spaces; restrictions.  

Accessory living spaces shall be subject to the following restrictions:  

1. An accessory living space shall operate as an extension of and be dependent upon the principal use 

and shall not be a separately functioning dwelling unit.  

2. Cooking facilities are prohibited within an accessory living space.  

3. Separate mailing addresses are prohibited for an accessory living space.  

4. Separate utility meters for electricity, gas, water, and other utility services are prohibited. 

16.50.011.4. Building and site requirements.  

1. Where an accessory living space is proposed at a second story level, all outdoor living areas such as 

porches, balconies, and unenclosed staircases shall be oriented toward the interior of the property or meet at 

least a ten foot side yard setback.  

16.50.011.5. Parking and accessibility.  

1. Paved off-street parking spaces shall be provided for all uses on the site as required in the Matrix: Use 

Permissions and Parking Requirements.  



 

33 

 

2. All required off-street parking spaces shall be provided in the rear yard where the rear yard is adjacent 

to an alley. If no alley access exists, parking shall be contained within the rear portion of the site accessed by a 

driveway from the side street. Driveway access from the primary street shall only be permitted where there is 

no alley or side street and shall be no larger than a single lane wide. 

 

SECTION 21. Section 16.50.020.4.1 of the St. Petersburg City Code is hereby amended to read as follows: 

 

16.50.020.4.1. - Accessory storage structure and carports.  

Within At any use in Neighborhood districts and at single family dwelling units in any district, one 

accessory storage structure (typically a pre-constructed shed) and one carport shall be allowed which are 

exempt from design requirements as set forth herein. , as provided in the setbacks section, so long as it 

complies with all of the following criteria. Structures Any other such structures are allowed in the buildable 

area provided that they do not comply with all of the following criteria shall comply with the design 

requirements and setbacks for the zoning district.  

1. General Requirements. Size and height. The structure shall not exceed 100 square feet in area and 

ten feet in height.  

2 a. Anchoring. The structure shall be properly anchored to resist wind and other forces.  

3b. Utility easements. If a structure is secured to the ground by a foundation and not capable of being 

moved intact, no portion of the structure shall encroach into a utility easement.  

4c. Right-of-way and access easements. No structure shall encroach into a right-of-way or private access 

easement.  

5d. Use restrictions. The structure shall only be utilized for storage and shall not be used for operation 

of mechanical equipment.  

6. Additional structures. Any additional accessory storage structures, regardless of size or type, shall 

comply with the setbacks for the zoning district.  

7. Street side and waterfront yards. The structure shall not be located in street side or waterfront yards. 

Where such yards exist, the structure shall comply with the setbacks for these yards for the zoning 

district.  

82. Through lots Special circumstances for storage structure from front property line. On a through lot 

which meets the width, depth and area requirements for a lot in that zoning district, if one front yard 

is determined to be a rear yard pursuant to the dimensional regulations, and lot characteristics 

section (currently Sec. 16.60.010) and has a solid, not less than five-foot high, decorative wall or 

fence, which allows no vehicular access through that front yard, one the exempt accessory storage 

structure is allowed no more than shall be setback at least ten feet from that the front property line.  

93. Design standards for accessory storage structures.  

a. One accessory storage structure 100 s.f. or less and less than 10 ft. in height is exempt from 

the requirement to utilize the architectural style and construction materials of the existing principal 

structure . See allowable encroachment and setback section. 

b. Where an Any accessory storage structure is located within the rear one-third of a property, 

200 square feet or less in gross floor area, ten feet or less in overall height to the top of roof peak, 

and screened by a solid masonry wall or decorative wood or vinyl fence measuring six feet or more 

in height, the accessory storage structure is exempt from the requirement to utilize the architectural 

style and construction materials of the existing principal structure.  

c. All other accessory storage structures shall comply with the design and setback requirements 

of the zoning district. 



 

34 

 

104. Code compliance. All accessory storage structures shall comply with the Florida Building Code and 

St. Petersburg Fire Code (e.g. building separation and egress).  

5. a.  A carport for a single family residential use is exempt from the requirement to utilize the 

architectural style and construction materials of the existing principal structure if it is: open on 

three sides, located within the rear one-third of the property, located behind the principal 

structure, meets the side yard setbacks for the principal structure (if on the streetside it must be 

hidden by another structure from view from the street), not greater than 440 square feet in area, 

not greater than 12 feet in height at the beginning of the roofline, and not greater than 15 feet in 

height at the peak of the roof.  

b. All other carports shall utilize the architectural style and construction materials of the existing 

principal structure. 

 

SECTION 22. Section 16.50.130.9.4 of the St. Petersburg City Code is hereby amended to read as follows: 

 

16.50.130.9.4. - Roof or canopy structures.  

The maximum pitch of any roof or canopy constructed as part of a dock structure shall not exceed one 

foot of elevation per every 20 feet of horizontal coverage. Roof or canopy structures are prohibited on lots 

with less than 50 feet of waterfront frontage and on any non-contiguous water lots which have a public 

sidewalk abutting the seawall. Roof or canopy structures may not be placed within a side setback unless a 

variance is granted specifically for the roof or canopy structure. Boathouses are prohibited.  

SECTION 23. Section 16.60.010.5.E of the St. Petersburg City Code is hereby amended to read as follows: 

 

16.60.010.5.E. A variance to the maximum floor area ratio is not allowed, except in Neighborhood 

Traditional Single-family or Neighborhood Suburban Single-family zoning districts. Any other request to 

exceed the maximum floor area ratio requires a rezoning and future land use map amendment, where 

applicable.  

 
SECTION 24. Section 16.60.010.6.B of the St. Petersburg City Code is hereby amended to read as follows: 

 

16.60.010.6.B. Within special flood hazard areas, building height shall be measured from the required design 

flood elevation line as measured to the finished floor to the beginning of the roofline or roof peak, as 

determined within the individual zoning districts.  

 
SECTION 25. Section 16.60.010.8.3.C of the St. Petersburg City Code is hereby amended to read as follows:  

 

16.60.010.8.3.C. On through lots, one frontage may be considered the rear yard when 50 percent or more of the 

developed through lots in the block have established that frontage as a rear yard by both building design and 

usage. Where that percentage doesn’t exist, the yard which shall be considered a rear yard shall be determined 

based upon the following order of factors: a) the location of the rear yards of abutting through lots, (b) the 

predominant location of the rear yards of other developed lots on the block, c) the location of the front entry 

into the house on the subject lot, and d) the relationship of the yard to other yards on abutting properties. 

 

 
SECTION 26. The existing graphic depiction in Section 16.60.010.9.B of the St. Petersburg City Code is 

hereby deleted and replaced with the following graphic to read as follows: 

  

16.60.010.9. B. Nonrectangular lots; yard nomenclature, location. The following diagram is intended to 

illustrate the terminology used in reference to front, side, and rear yards on interior, corner, reversed frontage 

and through lots of nonrectangular shape.  

 



 

35 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

SECTION 27. The Section 16.60.010.9.C of the St. Petersburg City Code is hereby amended to add the 

following graphic to read as follows: 

 

C. Measurements. In the measurement of required waterfront yards, depth shall be measured perpendicular 

to the centerline of the seawall, or waterside lot line or the mean high water line, whichever is closer to 

the principal structure, for non-seawalled lots.  

 

SECTION 28. The St. Petersburg City Code is hereby amended by adding a new section, Section 

16.60.030.2.B.3, to read as follows: 

 

16.60.030.2.B.3. The POD may administratively approve an application for development which otherwise 

complies with the land development regulations on a platted lot when: 

a.  80% or more of the lots on the subject block and any lots on the surrounding block faces which block 

faces are wholly or partially within 500 feet of the subject lot, are also substandard for width and/or area, 

(this calculation shall not consider or include any lots which are across a major street or are in a different 

zoning district), or 

b. the nonconformity is equal to or less than 5% of the required width and/or area. 

 



 

36 

 

SECTION 29. The Arbor; Patios, covered; Screen enclosure, patio (solid roof); Garages, residential 

sideloading or facing an alley; and Shed structure/improvements in the ‘allowable encroachments and 

setbacks’ chart in Section 16.60.050.2 of the St. Petersburg City Code are hereby amended to read as follows:  

 
16.60.050.2. - Allowable encroachments and setbacks.  

 

Structure/  

Improvement  

F=Front  
S=Side  

SS=Street side  

R=Rear  

W=Waterfront  

Traditional  

Zoning Districts  

Suburban  

Zoning Districts  

Arbor (with a minimum of 

50% open roof structure, up 

to 80 SF in area and no 

more than 12 ft. in height)  

F, S, SS, R  To property line  To property line  

•  Patios, covered (no more 

than 12 inches above 

existing grade or the top of 

an existing seawall) 

S, SS, R  
No closer to property line 

than 7.5 8 ft.  

No closer to 

property line than 

7.5 8 ft.  

W  
No closer to property line 

or seawall than 10 ft.  

No closer to 

property line or 

seawall than 10 ft.  

•  Porch, open (less than 30 

inches above existing grade 

or the top of an existing 

seawall)   

F, SS  

No Leading edge no more 

than 5 ft. from setback line 

 

No Leading edge no 

more than 5 ft. from 

setback line  

  

R No encroachment permitted 

Leading edge no 

more than 10 ft. 

from setback line 

W 

  

  

Leading edge no more than 

5 ft. from setback line 

No encroachment 

permitted 

•  Screen enclosure, patio 

(solid roof)  

S, SS, R  
No closer to property line 

than 7.5 8 ft.  

No closer to 

property line than 

7.5 8 ft.  

W  
No closer to property line 

or seawall than 10 ft.  

No closer to 

property line or 

seawall than 10 ft.  



 

37 

 

Garages, residential side-

loading or facing an alley 

F  No encroachment permitted  
No more than 8 ft. 

from setback line  

S  

No more than 2 ft. from 

setback line, if garage door 

faces alley  

No more than 2 ft. 

from setback line  

SS  

No more than 5 ft. from 

setback line, if garage door 

faces alley  

No more than 5 ft. 

from setback line  

Shed (only one shed may 

encroach into the setback. 

The maximum size is 

limited to 100 s.f. in area 

and 10 ft. in height 

horizontal dimension for 

each side shall be 10 ft. and 

the maximum height shall 

be 10 ft.)  

F  

No encroachment allowed, 

except as noted in the use-

specific development 

standards for accessory 

structures and no part of 

the shed shall be located in 

front of the front façade 

line of the principal 

structure 

No encroachment 

allowed, except as 

noted in the use-

specific 

development 

standards for 

accessory structures  

R  
Anywhere within rear 20 ft. 

of lot  

Anywhere within 

rear 20 ft. of lot  

SS  

No more than 5 ft. from 

setback line, within the rear 

20 ft. of lot not allowed  

No more than 5 ft. 

from setback line, 

within the rear 20 ft. 

of lot NS-1 only - 

see district 

regulations  

S  

No closer to property line 

than 3 ft., except in the rear 

yard 

No closer to 

property line than 3 

ft., except in the rear 

yard 

W  No encroachment allowed  
No encroachment 

allowed  

  

SECTION 30. Sections 16.70.040.1.14.D and E of the St. Petersburg City Code are hereby amended to read as 

follows: 

 
16.70.040.1.14.D. Procedure.  

 

1. Staff review and recommendation. Upon receipt of a reinstatement application, the POD shall 

determine whether the application complies with all submittal requirements and all standards for 

review. As a condition of processing the application, the applicant shall allow fire, Florida Building 

Code, certificate of inspection and property maintenance inspections of the property prior to and 

upon completion of the work:  



 

38 

 

a. Administrative approval. If the request is for reinstatement of one abandoned residential units 

and the POD determines that the application complies with all submittal requirements and 

standards for review, the POD may administratively approve the application with or without 

conditions and without notice. The POD's final decision shall be in writing and shall state the 

reasons for such approval.  

b. Streamline approval. If the request is for reinstatement of two or three abandoned residential 

units with one variance and the POD determines that the application complies with all submittal 

requirements and standards for review, the POD may streamline approve such application with 

or without conditions. The POD shall provide written and posted notice prior to making a final 

decision. The POD's final decision shall be in writing and shall state the reasons for such 

approval.  

c. Appeals. A decision of the POD to approve, approve with conditions or deny a reinstatement 

may be appealed to the commission designated in the Decisions and Appeals Table, whose 

decision shall be deemed the final decision of the City.  

2. Commission review and decision.  

a. Public hearing. If the request is for reinstatement of four or more abandoned residential units 

with more than one variance, or for reinstatement of an abandoned commercial use, or if the 

POD determines that the application requires review by the commission designated in the 

Decisions and Appeals Table because of new or unusual circumstances or that the application 

does not comply with all submittal requirements and standards for review, the POD shall send a 

report and recommendation to the commission designated in the Decisions and Appeals Table, 

with a copy to the applicant, if any, recommending whether the application should be approved, 

approved with conditions or denied and the grounds for such recommendation.  

b. Commission decision. Upon receipt of the recommendation from the POD, the Commission 

shall conduct a public hearing on the application and shall approve, approve with conditions or 

deny the requested reinstatement. After considering the application and evidence, the 

Commission may defer action for no more than 60 days in order to obtain additional 

information.  

E. Standards for review. In addition to the standards of review for a zoning and planning decision generally, 

a decision rendered under this section shall be guided by the following factors:  

1. The degree to which the property's proposed use and density is consistent with the City's 

Comprehensive Plan and the character of the density, lot sizes and building types within the 

surrounding blocks;  

2. The degree to which the property is currently or was at the time of construction in compliance with 

the use and density and intensity regulations of this chapter or then applicable zoning codes and 

Land Development Regulations;  

3. The degree to which the property is and has been in compliance with other City codes;  

4. The degree to which the property currently has or can provide adequate provisions for parking for 

the proposed number of units in accordance with the City's current codes and ordinances;  

5. The degree to which the property has an adverse impact on the neighborhood as a result of the use or 

number of residential units on the site in excess of that allowed under the current zoning designation, 

lack of needed on-site parking, substandard maintenance, or other similar factors related to the 

property;  

6. A structure containing previously grandfathered boarding or rooming units in a zoning district where 

such units are prohibited shall be converted to dwelling units. The conversion to dwelling units shall 

be based on the minimum gross floor area size requirements for one or more bedroom dwelling units 

as set forth in the Florida Building Code in these standards of review;  



 

39 

 

7. The number of residential units reinstated shall be reasonably related to and accommodated by the 

size and design of the building so that floor plans are appropriate based on the required size for 

multiple-family dwellings as defined in this chapter. No unit with a floor area of less than 375 square 

feet may be reinstated, and no variance from this minimum requirement shall be granted except as 

provided for efficiency/studio units below. Except for efficiency/studio units, each residential unit 

shall have at least one bathroom, one bedroom, a kitchen and living room. Every room in an 

apartment shall have at least one window to ensure light and ventilation; however, bathrooms, 

kitchens and dining rooms need not have windows. At least one entrance from the exterior should be 

through the living room. Entrances from the exterior shall not be through bathrooms or bedrooms. 

Bathrooms shall not be the only entryway to any room;  

8. The minimum size per unit shall be as follows:  

a. Efficiency/studio unit: 375 square feet;  

b. One bedroom unit: 500 square feet;  

c. Two bedroom unit: 750 square feet;  

d. For a dwelling unit having more than two bedrooms, an additional 200 square feet of dwelling 

area is required for each additional bedroom;  

9. A dwelling unit having not less than 220 square feet and not more than 375 square feet may be 

reinstated if the site provides at least the minimum number of off-street parking spaces for the 

number of units to be reinstated. No variance from this minimum size requirement or this minimum 

parking requirement may be granted;  

10. Reinstatement of units or a use shall not exceed the previously existing legally grandfathered 

number of units or intensity of use;  

11. For a property with up to two dwelling units, three parking spaces shall be provided for up to five 

bedrooms plus 0.5 parking spaces for each additional bedroom. For a property with more than two 

dwelling units, the property shall meet the parking requirements for multifamily dwellings of the 

zoning district.  

 
SECTION 31. Section 16.70.040.1.15 of the St. Petersburg City Code is hereby amended to read as follows: 

  
16.70.040.1.15. - Redevelopment of grandfathered uses.  

A. Applicability. The commission designated in the Decisions and Appeals Table is authorized to approve 

redevelopment plans for the reconstruction of grandfathered uses which are destroyed or demolished and 

on property which was occupied by a grandfathered use.  

B. Application. An application for redevelopment of a grandfathered use shall include the following 

information in addition to the information that the POD may generally require for a planning and zoning 

decision application:  

1. A site plan of the subject property.  

2. The number of copies required shall be established by the POD.  

a. All site plans shall include information required by the POD.  

(1) Floor plans shall include the dimensions and floor area in square feet of all rooms and 

units.  

(2) In case of doubt, the POD may require a surveyor's certificate on location of the proposed 

structure relative to the lot lines involved.  

b. If the proposed redevelopment requests modification of the minimum number of parking or 

parking layout, the site plan shall include required parking information.  



 

40 

 

c. If the proposed redevelopment requests modification of the existing landscaping or installation 

of new landscaping, the site plan shall include required landscaping information.  

3. Elevations depicting architectural details and materials for all sides of each structure.  

4. A financing plan which shall include cost estimates for renovations or construction, proposed 

methods or evidence of financing and a timetable for start and completion of the work.  

C. Conditions and requirements.  

1. Requirements. The POD shall not accept an application which does not meet the following 

requirements:  

a. If the grandfathered use has been abandoned, an application to reinstate the use shall be 

submitted with the application to approve the redevelopment plan;  

b. A redevelopment plan for a structure which had been destroyed (excluding voluntary 

demolition) shall be filed not more than one year from the event that caused the destruction of 

the structure (e.g., the date of the fire, hurricane, etc.);  

c. In cases involving voluntary demolition of a grandfathered use, a redevelopment plan shall be 

approved prior to the demolition. If a redevelopment plan is not approved prior to demolition, 

new development shall conform to the regulations for the district in which the property is 

located, except when the demolition involves a mobile home park and conversion to another 

residential use; in that situation, the redevelopment plan shall be submitted within one year of 

the effective date of the zoning allowing the new residential use. The term "voluntary 

demolition" means any demolition which is not necessary because of damage to a structure as 

the result of an unforeseen event (fire, hurricane, etc.) and shall include structures subject to 

City-initiated demolition cases;  

d. Only property that has a grandfathered use shall be the subject of an application for a 

redevelopment plan. No property which does not have a grandfathered use may be included in 

an application for a redevelopment plan;  

e. Applications for redevelopment plans shall not propose to place structures on vacated public 

right-of-way;  

f. Application for a redevelopment plan for residential use on more than one lot shall be accepted 

only if:  

(1) The lots are contiguous;  

(2) Each lot contained grandfathered residential units;  

(3) The number of residential units proposed for each lot will not exceed the number of 

grandfathered residential units for each lot.  

2. Residential uses. Applications for residential uses shall include proposed redevelopment plans which 

shall comply with the following requirements:  

a. All new structures shall meet the minimum gross floor area size requirements in the standards 

of review for reinstatement of abandoned uses for each dwelling unit;  

b. Landscaping shall comply with the requirements of the landscaping section;  

c.b. New structures shall comply with all codes relating to fire building construction standards and 

property maintenance;  

d.c. New structures and additions shall comply with the design and dimensional requirements of the 

zoning district in which the property is located.  

3. Nonresidential uses. Applications for nonresidential uses shall include proposed redevelopment 

plans which shall comply with the following requirements:  



 

41 

 

a. The number of on-site parking spaces required shall be based on the grandfathered use and 

shall be increased to meet the requirement for the additional square footage of any expansion or 

new construction;  

b. Landscaping shall comply with the landscaping requirements of the landscaping section;  

c. New structures shall comply with all City codes relating to fire building construction standards 

and property maintenance;  

d. New structures and additions shall comply with the design and dimensional requirements of the 

zoning district in which the property is located.  

D. Procedure.  

1. Administrative approval. If the request is for redevelopment of one accessory residential unit 

without variances and the POD determines that the application complies with all submittal 

requirements and standards for review, the POD may administratively approve such application with 

or without conditions. The POD's final decision shall be in writing and shall state the reasons for 

such approval. 

2. Staff review and recommendation. If the request is for redevelopment of more than one accessory 

residential unit or the request includes variances, after  After the POD has reviewed the application, 

the POD shall send a report to the commission designated in the Decisions and Appeals Table, with 

a copy to the applicant, if any, recommending whether the application should be approved, approved 

with conditions or denied and the ground for such recommendation.  

2. Commission review. Upon receipt of the recommendation from the POD, the Commission shall 

conduct a public hearing on the application and shall approve, approve with conditions or deny the 

requested redevelopment plan. After considering the application and evidence, the Commission may 

defer action for no more than 60 days in order to obtain additional information.  

E. Standards for review. In addition to the standards of review for a zoning and planning decision generally, 

a decision rendered under this section shall be guided by the following factors:  

1. Criteria. Redevelopment plans shall be reviewed for compliance with the criteria set forth in the 

following chart:  

Redevelopment Plan  

Criterion  Project less than a City block  
Project equal to or greater than a City 

block  

Building type (e.g., single-

family homes with garage 

apartments, duplexes, 

multifamily uses, etc.)  Structures shall be required to 

match the predominant building 

type, setbacks and scale in the 

block face across the street or 

abutting residential uses.  

Structures on the perimeter of the project 

shall be required to match the predominant 

building type, setbacks and scale in the 

block face across the street or abutting 

residential uses. Structures on the interior 

of the project shall comply with the 

requirements of the zoning district.  

Building setbacks (including 

both perimeter and interior 

setbacks)  

Building scale (e.g., one-story 

or two-story principal 

structures)  

Site development and 

orientation (e.g., location of 

buildings, front entries, 

driveways, parking and utility 

functions)  

Structures shall be required to 

match the predominant 

development pattern in the 

block face across the street or 

abutting residential uses. If alley 

Structures on the perimeter of the project 

shall be required to match the predominant 

development pattern in the block face 

across the street or abutting residential 

uses. If alley access exists on the proposed 



 

42 

 

access exists on the proposed 

site, garages and parking areas 

shall be designed for alley use.  

site, garages and parking areas shall be 

designed for alley use. Structures on the 

interior of the project shall comply with 

requirements of the zoning district.  

Additional criterion for all projects  

Building mass  

Building mass shall be regulated by building setbacks and floor area ratio 

(FAR). The maximum FAR shall be the existing FAR of the property prior to 

redevelopment or 0.50 FAR, whichever is greater or the FAR plus bonuses 

allowed in the zoning district. Bonuses to this FAR are listed below. FAR 

shall include all enclosed space, including garage and storage space, except 

that open porches (not screened) and the first 300 sq. ft. of garage space shall 

be excluded from the existing FAR for each unit.  

Building height  

Residential structures for:  

(1) A project less than a platted block, or  

(2) On the perimeter of a project equal to or greater than a platted block 

shall comply with the following building height and roof design 

requirements:  

  1. The maximum height shall not exceed 24 ft. to the eave line and 36 

ft. to the peak of the roof for principal structures;  

  2. The maximum height shall not exceed 20 ft. to the eave line and 32 

ft. to the peak of the roof for secondary or accessory structures;  

  3. The maximum slope of any roof angle shall not exceed 12/12;  

  4. Dormers shall not occupy more than 50 percent of any roof surface; 

structures on the interior of a residential project equal to or greater than a 

platted block, and commercial structures shall comply with requirements of 

the zoning district.  

Development across multiple 

lots (for redevelopment 

containing more than two lots 

and having structures 

constructed across platted lot 

lines, the original lot lines shall 

be respected through building 

articulation)  

1. Structures should be separated by zoning district setbacks; however, if 

the structures are not separated by zoning district setbacks, there shall be a 

break in the building and roof planes at each original lot line, equal to or 

greater than the combined side yard setbacks that would be required for each 

lot;  

2. Both the width and depth of the break shall be equal to or greater than 

the dimension of the combined side yard setbacks.  

Single corner lots  
Structures on single corner lots shall be oriented so that the front entrance of 

the structure faces the legal front yard.  

Traditional grid roadway 

network  

For projects equal to or greater than a platted block, extensions of the 

traditional grid roadway network which:  

 (1) Abut the perimeter of the project area; or  

 (2) Would logically be extended through the project are required. 

Compliance with applicable subdivision and public improvement regulations 

is required.  

Non-traditional roadway 

network  

For projects equal to or greater than a platted block, roadway and pedestrian 

networks shall meet the following requirements:  

 1. There shall be at least two points of entry into the project;  



 

43 

 

 2. Sidewalk connections shall be made to surrounding streets, homes and 

businesses;  

 3. Streets shall be stubbed to property lines to allow for roadway 

extensions into abutting properties which may be developed or anticipated to 

be redeveloped in the future.  

Density and intensity  

Redevelopment projects shall not exceed the legally grandfathered number of 

units or intensity of use (e.g., if the use is office it cannot change to a more 

intensive grandfathered use such as retail).  

For mobile home park redevelopment, the maximum number of dwelling 

units shall be equal to the number of legal mobile home unit spaces (lots) 

within the park prior to redevelopment, or 140 percent of the maximum 

density of the future land use designation assigned to the property, whichever 

is less. No variance from this requirement shall be approved.  

  

2. Perimeter. Perimeter requirements shall not apply on portions of the property that abut or across the 

street from a nonresidential use or a water body greater than 150 feet wide.  

3. Floor area ratio bonus. FAR bonuses shall only be allowed for originally platted lots which have 

not been joined together. Structures on joined or combined lots (two or more originally platted lots) 

shall not be allowed FAR bonus and shall be developed following the development across multiple 

lots criteria indicated in the chart above.  

a. An FAR bonus of 0.10 0.20 shall be granted when structures are located in a traditional 

neighborhood context and designed in a traditional building style as defined by the City's 

neighborhood design review manual or the Land Development Regulations. To qualify for this 

FAR bonus, the structure shall use the correct proportions, fenestration patterns, details, and 

materials. Structures that use finishes common to an identified style without proper design, 

detailing, and fenestration shall not qualify for this FAR bonus.  

b. An FAR bonus of 0.05 shall be granted when structures are finished with decorative wall 

finishes typical of traditional development. This includes clapboard or single products of real 

wood, "Hardi-Plank" or the equivalent, rough textured or exposed aggregate stucco, tile, brick 

or stone. Vinyl or aluminum siding and smooth or knock-down stucco shall not qualify for this 

bonus.  

c. An FAR bonus of 0.10 shall be granted when structures contain a front porch for each unit. 

Each porch shall measure a minimum area of 60 square feet and have a minimum functional 

depth of six feet.  

SECTION 32. The definitions of ‘Impervious surface’ and ‘Domestic equipment’ in Section 16.90.020.3 

of the St. Petersburg City Code are hereby amended to read as follows: 

Impervious surface means a surface that has been compacted or covered with a layer of material so 

that it is resistent to or prevents infiltration by stormwater. It includes, but is not limited to, roofed areas, 

pools, and surfaces such as compacted sand, limerock, or clay, as well as conventionally surfaced streets, 

sidewalks, parking lots, pavers, and other similar surfaces. For purposes of calculating the ISR, 50 percent 

of the surface area of decks shall be included as impervious surface. 

Domestic equipment means, in connection with allowable parking on a residential lot or on a street in 

a residential district, accessory equipment not designed, used or intended to be used for commercial 

purposes. "Domestic equipment" is limited to the following types of equipment: all portable structures built 
or designed to be carried on a chassis and operated or transported whether or not self-propelled, including, 

but not limited to motor homes, mobile homes, campers, travel trailers, recreational vehicles, tent trailers, 

pop-out campers, pick-up campers, houseboats, boats, boat trailers, barbeque grills (or any other kind of 



 

44 

 

grill) on trailers, and utility trailers. The term "domestic equipment" does not include self-propelled vehicles 

designed and licensed for use on the public roadways of 20 feet or less in overall length and seven feet or 

less in overall height. 

SECTION 33. The definition of ‘Stoop’ in Section 16.90.020.3of the St. Petersburg City Code is hereby 

amended by adding a graphic, to read as follows: 

Stoop means the elevated landing and stairs, leading to the main entrance of a house. The stoop shall 

correspond directly to the building entry.  

 

SECTION 34. Section 16.90.020.3of the St. Petersburg City Code is hereby amended by adding a new 

definition for ‘Cooking facilities,’ ‘Roof line’ and ‘Unified plan of development,’ in the appropriate 

alphabetical order, to read as follows: 

Cooking facility means a kitchen or other designed food preparation area in a structure that is 

equipped with a range/oven. An area may be presumed to be intended for use as a cooking facility 

if it includes a refrigerator or sink and has a 220 volt electrical outlet or natural gas hookup which 

is not being actively used for water heaters or clothes dryers. 

Roof line means, for the purpose of height measurement, on a sloped roof the lowest point or edge of the 

roof at its farthest point from a side wall measured perpendicular to the wall, or on a flat roof, the 

highest point of the roofing materials.  

Unified plan of development shall have the same meaning as set forth in F.S. 380.0651(4). 

 

SECTION 35. The Site layout and orientation subsection of Section 16.20.120.8 of the St. Petersburg City 

Code is hereby amended to read as follows: 

 

Site layout and orientation. The City is committed to creating and preserving a network of linkages for 

pedestrians. Consequently, pedestrian and vehicle connections between public rights-of-way and private 

property are subject to a hierarchy of transportation, which begins with the pedestrian. 

 

1. Buildings shall be constructed to the right-of-way line or create outdoor areas that integrate into the 

public sidewalk utilizing sound urban design. 



 

45 

 

2. Surface parking, ancillary equipment, loading and service operations shall be placed to the rear or 

internal to the property and shall not be visible from streets (not alleys). 

3. No curb cuts shall be allowed on Central Avenue, Beach Drive or 2nd Avenue North east of Fifth 

Street. 

4. Detention and retention ponds and drainage ditches shall be located behind the principal building to 

the rear of the property. Detention and retention ponds and drainage ditches shall comply with the 

design standards set forth in the drainage and surface water management section. 

5. For any lot, public improvements (e.g. sidewalks, right of way, etc.) shall be provided to service the 

lot in accordance with the subdivision section. 

 

SECTION 36. Section 16.40.100.5 of the St. Petersburg City Code is hereby amended to read as follows: 

 

16.40.100.5. - Domestic equipment parked, placed, or stored on neighborhood zoned property. 

A. No person shall park, allow to be parked, place, allow to be placed, store, or allow to be stored more 

than two pieces of domestic equipment on neighborhood zoned property outside a legally constructed 

fully enclosed structure. Any domestic equipment parked, placed, or stored on neighborhood zoned 

property outside a fully enclosed structure shall not exceed 35 feet in overall length, shall not exceed 

eight feet in width and shall not exceed 12 feet in overall height. Whenever a piece of domestic 

equipment is parked, placed or stored on a trailer specifically designed to transport or carry the 

domestic equipment, this condition shall be counted as one piece of domestic equipment for purposes 

of this subsection. 

B. Domestic equipment may be parked, placed or stored inside any legally constructed fully enclosed 

structure which meets the regulatory requirements of the zoning district. 

C. A person may park, place or store up to two pieces of domestic equipment outside a fully enclosed 

structure provided all of the following conditions are met: 

1. The equipment is parked, placed or stored in the rear yard, in the interior side yard, or in the allowable 

buildable area for a principal or accessory structure; however, it shall not be parked, placed or stored 

in the front yard, in the street side yard, or in the buildable area to the front of the principal structure. 

2. When parked, placed or stored within any buildable area between the street side yard and the side of 

the principal structure, or within 50 feet of any street right-of-way, measured from the edge of the 

traveled road bed, equipment must be shielded from view from the street right-of-way by a solid six-

foot high fence. Any portion of the required six-foot high shielding may also be accomplished with 

maintained vegetation forming a solid hedge. Any gate used to comply with this shielding 

requirement must also be solid, six feet high, and be kept closed whenever the equipment is not being 

moved through the gate. When any shielding is required, it must be located on the property where the 

equipment is stored, and the location, height and construction of the shielding must comply with all 

applicable ordinances and laws. 

3. When parked, placed or stored adjacent to an alley, the equipment must not impede the visibility for 

vehicles entering the alley from adjacent driveways. 

4. No equipment shall be in a waterfront yard except one boat is allowed to be placed or stored within 

any waterfront yard only when provisions exist to place the boat directly in the water from its 

location or storage place. 

5. Equipment cannot obstruct any door, window or other opening of a dwelling which provides light, air, 

entrance to or exit from a dwelling. 

6. Equipment must be in sound condition, good repair and free of deterioration or damage. 

D. Limited exceptions: On the following days and times, domestic equipment may be temporarily parked 

or placed to the front of the principal structure or outside of any required shielding on private 



 

46 

 

property, provided the equipment does not impede visibility for motorists and does not block any 

portion of the public sidewalk or roadway: 

1. From Monday 8:00 a.m. through Thursday 4:00 p.m. for no more than four consecutive hours, and 

2. From Thursday, 4:00 p.m. until Monday 8:00 a.m. 

E. Each item of domestic equipment observed in violation of this section is a separate violation subject to 

a separate fine and each day that the observed violation continues to exist is a separate violation 

subject to a separate fine. 

F. If any piece of domestic equipment is fitted with liquefied liquified petroleum gas or other volatile 

liquid containers, such containers shall meet all local, state, and federal standards. In the event that 

leakage is detected from such container, immediate corrective action must be taken by the property 

owner or equipment owner to make proper and safe repairs. 

 

SECTION 37.  Section 16.40.090.3.4.B.7.a of the St. Petersburg City Code is hereby amended to read as 

follows: 

a. Permanent surface. Except as otherwise permitted in this section, all parking spaces, drive 

lanes and driveways shall be paved with asphalt or concrete material, brick or decorative 

pavers. The surface must be maintained in good condition and repair with no cracks or voids 

larger than one inch. 

 

SECTION 38.  The St. Petersburg City Code is hereby amended by adding a new Section 16.40.090.3.4.B.15 

to read as follows: 

15. Failure to construct and continuously maintain aprons, driveways and approved parking areas in 

compliance with all location, dimensional and materials requirements of the code is a violation of the 

Code. Regardless of whether the surface materials were installed before or after the effective date of 

this section, failure to comply with any of the design or maintenance requirements regarding aprons, 

driveways and parking areas is a violation of the Code.  

 

SECTION 39. The first graphic in Section 2 amending Section 16.20.010.6 relating to roof and roofline 

measurements is replaced, the two new graphics in Section 5 amending Section 16.20.010.11 relating to 

Porches and Pedestrian Connections are added, the graphic in Section 14 amending Section 16.40.090.3.3.6.d 

relating to parking pads is replaced, and the graphic in Section 26 amending Section 16.60.010.9.B is replaced 

to read as shown in those sections. 

 

SECTION 40. Coding:  As used in this ordinance, language appearing in struck-through type is language to 

be deleted from the City Code, and underlined language is language to be added to the City Code, in the 

section, subsection, or other location where indicated. Language in the City Code not appearing in this 

ordinance continues in full force and effect unless the context clearly indicates otherwise. Sections of this 

ordinance that amend the City Code to add new sections or subsections are generally not underlined. 

 

SECTION 41. The provisions of this ordinance shall be deemed to be severable.  If any provision of this 

ordinance is determined unconstitutional or otherwise invalid, such determination shall not affect the validity 

of any other provisions of this ordinance. 

 



 

47 

 

SECTION 42. In the event this Ordinance is not vetoed by the Mayor in accordance with the City Charter, it 

shall become effective upon the expiration of the fifth business day after adoption unless the Mayor notifies the 

City Council through written notice filed with the City Clerk that the Mayor will not veto this Ordinance, in 

which case this Ordinance shall become effective immediately upon filing such written notice with the City 

Clerk.  In the event this Ordinance is vetoed by the Mayor in accordance with the City Charter, it shall not 

become effective unless and until the City Council overrides the veto in accordance with the City Charter, in 

which case it shall become effective immediately upon a successful vote to override the veto.   

 

APPROVED AS TO FORM AND CONTENT: 

 

 

________________________________ 

City Attorney (designee) 

 

 

 

  

 

 

 



LDR 2017-01: Residential LDR Amendment Package 
Revised 06/01/17 

    Page 1 

 

 

LDR 2017-01 – RESIDENTIAL LAND DEVELOPMENT REGULATIONS (LDRs) CODE UPDATE 
D.R.C. June 7, 2017 

 SECTION NO. SECTION TITLE COMPLEXITY DESCRIPTION 

1. 16.20.010.5. 
Neighborhood Traditional Single-Family 
Districts 
Maximum development potential 

Regulatory 
Change 

Problem Statement:  Concerns have been expressed regarding the size and bulk of new homes being built, particularly in the traditional neighborhoods, and their consistency with 

the surrounding neighborhood and development pattern. Many new homes have 2nd stories built close to or at the minimum required setbacks, creating a box-like, bulky 

appearance.  Research on the average home size and FAR indicates significant increases for new construction 

Requested Action:  Create standards to limit the size and bulk of new homes to be proportionate with the lot size by establishing a maximum building coverage standard and a 

maximum Floor Area Ratio.  Establish standards for bonuses if the development incorporates design elements beneficial to the character of the neighborhood including providing 

greater second floor setbacks in the front or side and providing an extended front porch  

2. 16.20.010.5. 

Neighborhood Traditional Single-Family 
Districts 
Maximum development potential 
Minimum Lot Size 

Regulatory 
Change 

Problem Statement:  Minimum Lot Area in NT-1 is not reflective of the existing development pattern, rendering many lots unbuildable without a variance, which puts an undue 

burden on the property owners and discourages redevelopment efforts  

Requested Action:  Reduce the minimum lot size in the NT-1 zoning districts to 4,500 s.f. 

3. 16.20.010.5. 

Neighborhood Traditional Single-Family 
Districts 
Maximum development potential 
Maximum Intensity 

Regulatory 
Change 

Problem Statement:  Code currently addresses Impervious Surface Ratio, but does not limit building coverage, which creates issues with allowing enough area for pools, decks and 

patios 

Requested Action:  Establish a maximum building coverage limit of 0.50 

4. 16.20.010.6 

Neighborhood Traditional Single-Family 
Districts 
Building envelope: Maximum height 
and minimum setbacks.  

Regulatory 
Change 

Problem Statement:  Interior side yard setback of 10% for lots less than 60-feet allows structures too close to the property line and is not consistent with the building code. 

Requested Action:  Provide a minimum 5-foot setback for lots equal to or less than 50-feet 

5. 16.20.010.6 

Neighborhood Traditional Single-Family 
Districts 
Building envelope: Maximum height 
and minimum setbacks.  

Regulatory 
Change 

Problem Statement:  Rear yard setback of 10-feet from alleys with less than 16-feet is too restrictive, and has resulted in numerous variance requests 

Requested Action:  Provide a minimum rear yard setback of 10-feet or 22-feet including the alley, whichever is less.  This provides the minimum turning radius needed for the garage 

6. 16.20.010.6 

Neighborhood Traditional Single-Family 
Districts 
Building envelope: Maximum height 
and minimum setbacks.  

Regulatory 
Change 

Problem Statement:  Language is not clear that open porch setback applies to a one-story porch; a two-story covered porch is too great of a mass at the reduced porch setback 

Requested Action:  Modify the footnote to clarify that a covered two-story porch is required to meet the principal structure setbacks 

7. 16.20.010.7 
Neighborhood Traditional Single-Family 
Districts 
Roof Lines & Slopes 

Regulatory 
Change 

Problem Statement:  Application is limited to certain architectural styles and is in conflict with the goals to reduce height and bulk from the street 

Requested Action:  Delete language 

8. 16.20.010.10 

 
Neighborhood Traditional Single-Family 
Districts 
Setbacks consistent with established 
neighborhood patterns. 

Regulatory 
Change 

Problem Statement: This section allows reduced front and side yard setbacks based on the neighborhood pattern.  There is no practical way to get accurate measurements of 

existing side yard setbacks on the subject and adjacent blocks, and it is not appropriate to allow a reduction of side yards without such data.  

Requested Action:  Eliminate the allowance for a side yard reduction based on neighborhood pattern 

9. 16.20.010.11 

 
Neighborhood Traditional Single-Family 
Districts 
Building Design 

Clarification 

Problem Statement:  This section addresses both building and site design, but section title only references building design 

Requested Action:  Add “Site” to description 

10. 16.20.010.11 

Neighborhood Traditional Single-Family 
Districts 
Building Design 
Building and parking layout and 
orientation 

Clarification 

Problem Statement:  NS includes language stating that accessory structures shall be located behind the front façade of the principal structure, but no such language exists for NT. 

Requested Action:  Add same language to NT for consistency 

11. 16.20.010.11 

 
Neighborhood Traditional Single-Family 
Districts 
Building Design 
Vehicle connections. (1.c. & 1.d.) 
 
 

Clarification 

Problem Statement:  Not clear that driveways are only allowed if the alley access is obstructed  

Requested Action:  Add clarifying language 



LDR 2017-01: Residential LDR Amendment Package 
Revised 06/01/17 

    Page 2 

12. 16.20.010.11 

 
Neighborhood Traditional Single-Family 
Districts 
Building Design 
Vehicle connections. (2.) 

Clarification 

Problem Statement:  Not clear that an additional driveway apron is allowed only if a driveway on the front is allowed 

Requested Action:  Add clarifying language 

13. 16.20.010.11 

 
Neighborhood Traditional Single-Family 
Districts 
Building Design 
Pedestrian connections.  

Clarification 

Problem Statement:  This section also speaks to porches, in addition to pedestrian connections 

Requested Action:  Add “Porches” to description 

14. 16.20.010.11 

 
Neighborhood Traditional Single-Family 
Districts 
Building Design 
Pedestrian connections.  

Regulatory 
Change 

Problem Statement:  Requiring pedestrian connection from the sidewalk to the curb on a major street with no on-street parking is a safety hazard and requiring a separate walkway 

for homes with front driveways is not necessary as pedestrians can access the public sidewalk and street via the drive.  This adds to both cost and additional impervious surface in 

the front yard 

Requested Action:  Add an exemption for such major streets and add a new subsection exempting separate walkway when there is a driveway in the front 

15. 16.20.010.11 

 
Neighborhood Traditional Single-Family 
Districts 
Building Design 
Pedestrian connections.  

Clarification 

Problem Statement:  It is not clear that the walkway through the front entry does not count towards the required 48-square feet of usable porch area, and that columns and railings 

are not to be included in this calculation 

Requested Action:  Add clarifying language and graphics 

16. 16.20.010.11 

Neighborhood Traditional Single-Family 
Districts 
Building Design 
Building Style 

Clarification/ 
Regulatory 

Change 

Problem Statement:  Description of the district notes that the intent is to support the appearance and character of neighborhoods developed over time, but code does not provide a 

clear, measurable standard to regulate repetitive design 

Requested Action:  Create new Repetitive Design Standard: Design of homes located on the same block face or within three lots on an adjacent block face with similar design shall 

be varied, such that a substantially similar design cannot be replicated. Variation shall include at least three of the following elements: architectural style, roof form, materials, and 

details (doors, windows, columns);  Add graphic 

17. 16.20.010.11 

Neighborhood Traditional Single-Family 
Districts 
Building Design 
Building Form 

Clarification/ 
Regulatory 

Change 

Problem Statement:  Requirement for height to width ratio needs clarification 

Requested Action:  Add clarifying language stating that height to width ratio is for front façade only  

18. 16.20.010.11 

Neighborhood Traditional Single-Family 
Districts 
Building Design 
Wall Composition (1.) 

Clarification 

Problem Statement:   Language regarding blank façade on multi-story buildings is confusing 

Requested Action:  Modify to state that there shall not be blank areas greater than 16-feet in width for both first and second stories, except for one-story garage in the rear third of 

the building, in the interior side yards 

19. 16.20.010.11 

Neighborhood Traditional Single-Family 
Districts 
Building Design 
Wall Composition (2.) 

Regulatory 
Change 

Problem Statement:  The percentage of fenestration and glazing is excessive for all architectural styles and has caused the need for frequent design variances 

Requested Action:  Reduce minimum percentages to be reflective of typical architectural styles; limit side requirement to front 2/3, eliminate rear requirement unless on corner lot; 

clarify through lots 

20. 16.20.010.11 

Neighborhood Traditional Single-Family 
Districts 
Building Design 
Wall Composition  

Regulatory 
Change 

Problem Statement:  Requires windows on street-side façade to be evenly distributed, however this is not appropriate for certain architectural styles; and need clarification on 

window design standards 

Requested Action:  Modify subsection, to allow a variation based on architectural style and clarify window design requirements 

21. 16.20.010.11 

Neighborhood Traditional Single-Family 
Districts 
Building Design 
Wall Composition  

Regulatory 
Change 

Problem Statement:  New homes in the flood plain can be required to be significantly higher than existing grade, which results in a greater expanse of wall area below the first floor  

Requested Action:  Add new standard: Where design elevation is equal to or greater than 48” above existing grade, an articulated base is required to delineate the first floor level.  

The base may consist of a different material or decorative band, depending on the architectural style 

22. 16.20.010.11 

Neighborhood Traditional Single-Family 
Districts 
Building Design 
Garage Doors  

Clarification 

Problem Statement:  Not clear what constitutes a decorative garage door and not clear that garage doors be 10-feet behind the main structure, includes the front porch. Concerns 

have been raised in certain neighborhoods regarding the location of the garage 

Requested Action:  Add additional language to clarify. Change NT-3 to require 10-feet behind the main structure, not including the front porch. 

23. 16.20.010.11 

Neighborhood Traditional Single-Family 
Districts 
Building Design 
Building Materials 

Regulatory 
Change/ 

Clarification 

Problem Statement:  Standards do not articulate the architectural design practice which dictates that heavier materials such as brick or stone should be place below lighter 

materials such as stucco or siding on a wall face 

Requested Action:  Add additional language to clarify 

24. 16.20.010.11 
Neighborhood Traditional Single-Family 
Districts 
Accessory Structures 

Consistency 
Problem Statement:  Accessory structure design requirements are located in multiple sections of the code and need to be consolidated for clarity 

Requested Action:  Reformat for clarity 



LDR 2017-01: Residential LDR Amendment Package 
Revised 06/01/17 

    Page 3 

25. 16.20.010.11 
Neighborhood Traditional Single-Family 
Districts 
Accessory Structures 

Regulatory 
Change 

Problem Statement:  Not clear that design standards apply to garage apartments 

Requested Action:  Add garage apartments 

26. 16.20.020.6 
Neighborhood Suburban Single-Family 
Districts 
Maximum development potential 

Regulatory 
Change 

Problem Statement:  Concerns have been expressed regarding the size and bulk of new homes being built, particularly in the traditional neighborhoods, and their consistency with 

the surrounding neighborhood and development pattern. Many new homes have 2nd stories built close to or at the minimum required setbacks, creating a box-like, bulky 

appearance.  Research on the average home size and FAR indicates significant increases for new construction  

Requested Action:  Create standards to limit the size and bulk of new homes to be proportionate with the lot size by establishing a maximum building coverage standard and a 

maximum Floor Area Ratio.  Establish standards for bonuses if the development incorporates design elements beneficial to the character of the neighborhood including providing 

greater second floor setbacks in the front or side and providing an extended front porch 

27. 16.20.020.6 

Neighborhood Traditional Single-Family 
Districts 
Maximum development potential 
Maximum Intensity 

Regulatory 
Change 

Problem Statement:  Code currently addresses Impervious Surface Ratio, but does not limit building coverage, which creates issues with allowing enough area for pools, decks and 

patios 

Requested Action:  Establish a maximum building coverage limit of 0.50 

28. 16.20.020.7 

Neighborhood Suburban Single-Family 
Districts 
Building envelope: Maximum height 
and minimum setbacks. 

Regulatory 
Change and 
Clarification 

Problem Statement:  Language is not clear that open porch setback applies to a one-story porch 

Requested Action:  Modify the footnote to clarify that a covered two-story porch is required to meet the principal structure setbacks 

29. 16.20.020.11 

Neighborhood Suburban Single-Family 
Districts 
Setbacks consistent with established 
neighborhood patterns. 

Clarification 

Problem Statement:  This section allows reduced front and side yard setbacks based on the neighborhood pattern.  There is no practical way to get accurate measurements of 

existing side yard setbacks on the subject and adjacent blocks, and it is not appropriate to allow a reduction of side yards without such data. In addition, this section has a 

procedure for approval that is inconsistent with language in NT and also references the incorrect commission 

Requested Action:   Eliminate the allowance for a side yard reduction based on neighborhood pattern and revise language to be consistent with NT section 

30. 16.20.020.12 
Neighborhood Suburban Single-Family 
Districts 
Building Design 

Clarification 

Problem Statement:  This section addresses both building and site design, but section title only references building design; Accessory structure placement not clear 

Requested Action:  Add “Site” to description and add language clarifying that accessory structures/sheds shall be located behind the front facade 

31. 16.20.020.12 
Neighborhood Suburban Single-Family 
Districts 
Building Design 

Clarification/ 
Regulatory 

Change 

Problem Statement:  Description of the district notes that the intent is to support the appearance and character of neighborhoods developed over time, but code does not provide a 

clear, measurable standard to regulate repetitive design 

Requested Action:  Create new Repetitive Design Standard: Design of homes located on the same block face or within three lots on an adjacent block face with similar design shall 

be varied, such that a substantially similar design cannot be replicated. Variation shall include at least three of the following elements: architectural style, roof form, materials, and 

details (doors, windows, columns);  Add graphic 

32. 16.20.020.12 

Neighborhood Suburban Single-Family 
Districts 
Building Design 
Wall Composition (1.) 

Regulatory 
Change 

Problem Statement:  Limits blank walls to no more than 16 linear feet; difficult and impractical to design to this standard for garages, which typically are at least 20-feet   

Requested Action:  Add language to exempt garages up to 15-feet in height from this requirement, if the garage is located in the rear third of the building. Clarify that 16-feet blank 

façade limit applies to each story 

33. 16.20.020.12 
Districts 
Building Design 
Wall Composition (3.) 

Regulatory 
Change 

Problem Statement:  New homes in the flood plain can be required to be significantly higher than existing grade, which results in a greater expanse of wall area below the first floor  

Requested Action:  Add new standard: “Where design elevation is equal to or greater than 48” above existing grade, an articulated base is required.”  The base may consist of a 

different material or decorative band, depending upon on the architectural style 

34. 16.20.020.12 

Neighborhood Suburban Single-Family 
Districts 
Building Design 
Accessory structures 

Consistency 

Problem Statement:  Accessory structure design requirements are located in multiple sections of the code and need to be consolidated for clarity 

Requested Action:  Reformat for consistency 

35. 16.20.120.8 
Downtown Center Districts 
Building Design 

Consistency 

Problem Statement:  DC section does not clearly state that sidewalks need to be improved to current subdivision standards, current language is in the non-conforming lot section of 

code 

Requested Action:  Add language to this section 

36. 16.40.020.1. 
Architecture and Building Design 
Architectural Styles 

Regulatory 
Change 

Problem Statement:  Photos and descriptions of architectural styles need updating. Descriptions are very limited and most photos are not from the City 

Requested Action:  Eliminate detail in this section and refer to design guidelines for historic properties; anticipated adoption 06-01-17 

37. 16.40.030.4 

Drainage and Surface Water 
management 
Applicability  

 

Clarification  

Problem Statement:  No definition of “common place of development” 

Requested Action:  Replace with “unified plan of development” and add definition in definition section of code 



LDR 2017-01: Residential LDR Amendment Package 
Revised 06/01/17 

    Page 4 

38. 16.40.030.6 

Drainage and Surface Water 
management 
Rules and Regulations (C.1.c. and 
C.2.c.) 

Clarification  

Problem Statement:  Exemption language needs to be revised per practice and interpretation 

Requested Action:  Replace “single-family home, duplex, triplex or quadraplex”  with “development of up to four dwelling units” and change “common plan of development” to 

“unified plan of development” 

39. 16.40.040.3.2 
Fence, Wall and Hedge Regulations 
Waterfront yards (all uses). Maximum 
Height 

Clarification/ 
Regulatory 

Change 

Problem Statement:  Height of solid fences, walls and hedges are limited to 3-feet in height in the waterfront yard.  There are many types of plant material other than hedges that can 

block waterfront views 

Requested Action:  Change “hedge” to “landscape materials, other than trees” 

40. 
16.40.040.3.2 
16.40.040.5.C.12. 

Fence, Wall and Hedge Regulations 
Waterfront Yards 

 

Regulatory 
Change 

Problem Statement: Gates and fencing for docks on non-contiguous water lots (Coffee Pot Boulevard, Sunrise Dr. S., Sunset Drive N. and S.) are not separately regulated, and 

specific standards for materials, height and width, are needed to protect the public view of these water lots from the adjacent streets  

Requested Action:  Add regulations to limit the height to 5-feet, with a maximum gate height of 6-feet and a maximum arch structure of 7.5-feet.  Any fencing projecting beyond the 

limits of the dock shall be limited to 5-feet in height and 3 feet in width. Add language requiring materials to be decorative wrought iron, aluminum, masonry, concrete, stone, vinyl, 

or composite.  Wood fences and gates may be repaired but not replaced;  Update graphic for clarity 

41. 16.40.060.2.1.2. 

Landscaping/Fencing 
Additional requirements for new and 
existing one- and two-unit residential 
properties 

Consistency 

Problem Statement: Fence code references landscaping required for 6-foot high fences over 150 linear feet in length, but landscape section of the code does not include a standard 

for residential  

Requested Action:  Add standard, same as commercial 

42. 16.40.090.3.3  
Development standards for private one- 
and two-family properties. 
Parking 

Clarification 

Problem Statement: Driveway standards and size of parking space need updating & surface materials for required parking spaces need clarification 

Requested Action:  Update standards, add language to Surface materials (9.) clarifying that all required parking spaces must be on an improved surface 

43. 
16.40.090.3.4 
 

Development standards for all other 
uses. 
 

Clarification 

Problem Statement: Code is not clear as to maintenance responsibilities for aprons, driveways and parking areas 

Requested Action:  Add clarifying language (section 7. And new subsection 13) 

44. 16.40.100.5 
Parking, Enforcement 
Domestic equipment parked, place, or 
stored on neighborhood zoned property. 

Clarification 

Problem Statement: Need to revise to be enforceable based on court case 

Requested Action: Add clarification regarding number (2) and location (on private property) 

45. 16.40.140.2.4.D. 
Subdivisions 
Lot line adjustments and lot splits 

Clarification 

Problem Statement: Need clarifying language to reference when platting is required for lot splits under common ownership or part of unified plan of development 

Requested Action:  Add new section with clarifying language 

46. 16.40.140.3 
Subdivisions 
Plats, preliminary and final 

Clarification 

Problem Statement: Need clarification language regarding timing of permits during the platting process, and actions that trigger platting 

Requested Action:  Allow permits to be issued after preliminary plat approval and clarify when platting is required for lots under common ownership or part of a unified plan of 

development 

47. 16.40.140.4.7 
Subdivisions 
Excavation, fill, and tree removal 

Clarification 

Problem Statement: Restricts permit issuance for land clearing to approval of final plat which is unduly restrictive 

Requested Action:  Amend language to allow issuance of permits after preliminary plat is approved 

48. 16.50.010.2 
Accessory Dwelling and Accessory 
Living Space 
Generally 

Clarification 

Problem Statement:  Accessory dwelling units and accessory living space are treated the same, and there should be more flexibility for accessory living space 

Requested Action:  Provide separate code sections for accessory dwelling units and accessory living space 

49. 16.50.010.2 
Accessory Dwelling and Accessory 
Living Space 
Purpose and Intent (1.) 

Regulatory 
Change 

Problem Statement:  Prohibits variance to any standards related to accessory dwelling units and accessory living space.  Given the very limited number of accessory dwelling units 

constructed in the last ten years, this provision seems unduly restrictive 

Requested Action:  Delete subsection in its entirety 

50. 16.50.010.3 
Accessory Dwelling and Accessory 
Living Space 
Purpose and Intent (2.) 

Consistency 

Problem Statement:  Language references reinstatement process for grandfathered accessory dwelling units, which is not consistent with those sections of code related to 

grandfathered use and reinstatements 

Requested Action:  Delete subsection in its entirety 

51. 16.50.010.4 

 
Accessory Dwelling and Accessory 
Living Space 
Establishment 

Clarification 

Problem Statement:  Reference to accessory dwelling use vs. unit is confusing 

Requested Action:  Change “use” to “unit” throughout subsection 



LDR 2017-01: Residential LDR Amendment Package 
Revised 06/01/17 

    Page 5 

 
 

52. 16.50.010.4. 
Accessory Dwelling and Accessory 
Living Space 
Establishment (3.) 

Regulatory 
Change 

Problem Statement:  Accessory dwelling use is required to be subordinate in height to the principal structure.  This does not allow a 2-story garage structure when there is a one 

story home on a property.  It is very typical in traditional neighborhoods for there to be a 2-story garage structure with a one story house 

Requested Action:  Delete “height” 

53. 16.50.010.5.1 
Accessory Dwelling and Accessory 
Living Space 
Lot requirements 

Clarification 

Problem Statement:  Prohibits ADU for lots that have been refaced, which is unnecessarily restrictive 

Requested Action:  Change “use” to “unit” throughout subsection; eliminate limitation for lots that have been refaced; allow division if all LDRs are met 

54. 16.50.010.5.2 
Accessory Dwelling and Accessory 
Living Space 
Building Requirements  

Clarification 

Problem Statement:  Intro language is confusing. Should reference building and site requirements for accessory dwelling units (new and redeveloped) 

Requested Action:  Amend language 

55. 16.50.010.5.2 
Accessory Dwelling and Accessory 
Living Space 
Building Requirements (1.) 

Regulatory 
Change 

Problem Statement:  Minimum size of units specified as 375-square feet.  Building code allows smaller units, and there is a desire for “Tiny” units 

Requested Action:  Delete required minimum; allow building code to regulate 

56. 16.50.010.5.2 
Accessory Dwelling and Accessory 
Living Space 
Building Requirements (3.) 

Clarification 

Problem Statement:  Incorrect reference to living space rather than unit 

Requested Action:  Change “space” to “unit” 

57. 16.50.010.5.2 
Accessory Dwelling and Accessory 
Living Space 
Building Requirements (5.) 

Regulatory 
Change 

Problem Statement:  Requires a pedestrian connection to parking and to public sidewalk.  Units are often on an alley, rendering connection to public sidewalk impractical. 

Requested Action:  Delete required connection to public sidewalk, if there is direct access to the alley 

58. 16.50.010.5.3 
Accessory Dwelling and Accessory 
Living Space 
Visual Buffering (1.) 

Clarification 

Problem Statement:  Requirement to orient outdoor living areas to the interior of the property is confusing 

Requested Action:  Add language to clarify that all areas in the rear yard with a minimum of 10-foot setback are considered to be interior 

59. 16.50.010.5.3 
Accessory Dwelling and Accessory 
Living Space 
Visual Buffering (2.) 

Clarification 

Problem Statement:  Requires minimum 48” sill height, which conflicts with the building code  

Requested Action:  Eliminate sill height requirement 

60. 16.50.010.5.4 
Accessory Dwelling and Accessory 
Living Space 
Parking and accessibility 

Regulatory 
Change/ 

Clarification 

Problem Statement: Prohibits variances, which is unduly restrictive; requires parking in rear, which is not always possible; requires decorative parking pads, requires storage area 

for solid waste container in alley 

Requested Action:  Modify subsection 

61. 16.50.010.5.5 
Accessory Dwelling and Accessory 
Living Space 
Accessory Living Spaces 

Regulatory 
Change/ 

Clarification 

Problem Statement: Requires accessory living space to meet all requirements for accessory dwelling unit, which is unduly restrictive 

Requested Action:  Re-write this section of code to separate accessory dwelling unit and accessory living space  

62. 16.50.020.4.1 Accessory Storage structure Clarification 

Problem Statement: Accessory structures 200 square feet and over are required to be consistent with style, materials and color of the principal structure.  Restrictions on open 

carports in the rear yard not visible from a City street do not support the purpose of this section of code related to the pedestrian experience, and create an undue financial burden 

on residents desiring to construct two-car carport structures. In addition, metal carports along alleys are very typical to the districts; Clarification on location on through lots 

Requested Action:  Allow exemption for open carports up to 440 s.f. feet up to 15 feet in height in the rear 1/3 of the yard, behind the principal structure, meeting principal structure 

side setbacks, not visible from the street and add clarification on through lots 

63. 16.50.130.9.4 
Docks 
Roof or canopy structures 

Regulatory 
Change 

Problem Statement: Concerns expressed about roof structures over docks along Coffee Pot Boulevard 

Requested Action:  Prohibit roof or canopy structures over docks on non-contiguous water lots on any street with a public sidewalk abutting the seawall 

64. 16.60.010.5. 

 
Dimensional Regulations and Lot 
Characteristics  
Floor Area Ratio (E) 
 

Clarification  

Problem Statement: This section of the Code refers to existing regulations for non-residential F.A.R.  

Requested Action:  Add a statement clarifying that this section does not apply to Neighborhood Traditional or Neighborhood Suburban Single-Family zoning districts. 

65. 16.60.10.6 

 
 
Dimensional Regulations and Lot 
Characteristics  
Height Measurement 

Clarification  

Problem Statement: Language related to measurement of height in a special flood hazard area (flood zone) is not clear 

Requested Action:  Add clarifying language to delete as measured to the finished floor 



LDR 2017-01: Residential LDR Amendment Package 
Revised 06/01/17 

    Page 6 

 

66. 16.60.010.8.3 
Dimensional Regulations and Lot 
Characteristics  
Yards, rear (c) 

Clarification  

Problem Statement: Language for through lots needs clarification to allow one side to be considered the rear for setbacks where such pattern is predominant 

Requested Action:  Add clarifying language  

67. 16.60.10.9 

Dimensional Regulations and Lot 
Characteristics  
Nonrectangular lots (B.) & 
Measurements in the waterfront yard 
(C) 

Clarification  

Problem Statement: Nonrectangular lot graphic needs updating; Where there is no seawall or where property lines extend into the water (above submerged lands), it is not clear 

where the setback is measured from 

Requested Action:  Replace nonrectangular lot graphic; Add clarifying language to specify the mean high water line 

68. 16.60.030.2.B.3 
Non-conforming Lots 
Nonconforming lots in common 
ownership. 

Regulatory 
Change 

Problem Statement:  Minimum Lot Dimensions are often not consistent with underlying subdivision plat and the existing development pattern, rendering many lots unbuildable 

without a variance, which puts an undue burden on the property owners and discourages redevelopment efforts  

Requested Action:  Amend non-conforming lot section of code to allow administrative approval for non-conforming platted lots of record if lots 80% or more of parcels in the subject 

block face and within 500-feet on the surrounding block faces are also substandard or if the non-conformity is equal to or less than 5% of the required width and area 

69. 
 

16.60.050 
Setbacks, allowable encroachments 
Arbor 

Clarification 

Problem Statement:  Need to clarify that arbors have open roof structure 

Requested Action:  Amend language to clarify that at least 50% of the roof structure be open 

70. 16.60.050 
Setbacks, allowable encroachments 
Garages, residential side-loading 

Clarification 

Problem Statement:  Garages facing an alley in Neighborhood Suburban zoning should have the same allowable encroachment as garages facing alleys in Neighborhood Traditional 

zoning.   

Requested Action:  Amend language to clarify 

71. 16.60.050 
Setbacks, allowable encroachments 
Sheds 

Clarification 

Problem Statement:  Current size limit is 10 feet by 10 feet, which doesn’t allow for other small sheds of equal square footage, such as 8 feet by 12 feet; additionally, a recent code 

change to allow sheds in the side yard inadvertently changed the allowance for a shed anywhere in the rear third; needs to be behind principal structure 

Requested Action:  Change to 100 square feet and located behind the principal structure 

72. 16.60.050 
Setbacks, allowable encroachments 
Patios & Screen enclosures 

Clarification 

Problem Statement:  Current setbacks are 8-feet, but side yard for house is 7.5-feet, and needs clarification on leading edge and height of patio from grade 

Requested Action:  Change to 7.5 feet, add “leading edge”; encroachment for patios are limited to patios that are no more than 12 inches from existing grade 

73. 16.60.050 
Setbacks, allowable encroachments 
Porches, open 

Clarification 

Problem Statement:  Need to clarify that if the height of the porch exceeds 30”, principal structure setbacks apply, clarify that eaves cannot project beyond these encroachments 

and add allowable encroachments for additional situations 

Requested Action:  Add language specifying that encroachment is only for an open porch less than 30” above existing grade or the seawall; Allow 10-foot encroachment into the 

rear yard on suburban districts and 5-foot water yard encroachment in traditional districts; add “leading edge” to preclude eave overhang 

74. 16.70.040.1.14.D. 
Reinstatement of abandoned uses.  
Procedure 

Regulatory 
Change 

Problem Statement: Administrative approvals are limited to one residential unit, requiring streamline and/or commission review, regardless if a variance is needed for reinstatement 

of additional residential units.  This adds to cost and time for the applicant and creates additional work for staff.  In review of cases over last ten years, all reinstatements without 

variances have been approved.   

Requested Action:  Change language to allow staff to process residential reinstatements administratively, provided no variances are requested. 

 
75. 

16.70.040.1.14.E.6. 
Reinstatement of abandoned uses.  
Standards for review 

Consistency 

Problem Statement:  Conversion of dwelling units references one or more bedroom sizes 

Requested Action:  Change reference to building code 

76. 
16.70.040.1.14.E.7 
& 8. 

Reinstatement of abandoned uses.  
Standards for review 

Regulatory 
Change 

Problem Statement:  Minimum size of units are specified, and a minimum of 375 square feet is required.  Requirements for windows and egress are specified in the building code. 

This unduly restricts reinstatements of smaller units that may meet building code.   

Requested Action:  Modify to remove minimum sizes of units and refer to compliance with the building code. 

77. 16.70.040.1.14.E.9. 
Reinstatement of abandoned uses.  
Standards for review 

Regulatory 
Change 

Problem Statement:  Specifies that units 220 square feet or less may not request a parking variance.  Unduly restrictive to not allow an applicant with a small unit to apply for a 

variance 

 

Requested Action:  Delete subsection 

 



LDR 2017-01: Residential LDR Amendment Package 
Revised 06/01/17 

    Page 7 

 
78. 

16.70.040.15.B.4. 
Redevelopment of Grandfathered uses.  
Application 

Regulatory 
Change 

Problem Statement: Requires submittal of a financing plan with cost estimates, evidence of financing, and timetable for work. This type of requirement is not found in any other part 

of the code and seems unnecessary to the review and approval process for a redevelopment plan 

Requested Action:  Delete subsection in its entirety 

79. 16.70.040.15.C.1.e. 
Redevelopment of Grandfathered uses.  
Conditions and requirements 

Regulatory 
Change 

Problem Statement: Specifies that redevelopment plans not propose to place structures on vacated public right-of-way.  If a project was not subject to redevelopment, this 

restriction would not be in place.  No public purpose related to such prohibition solely for a redevelopment project, which should be subject to the same setback parameters of any 

structure 

Requested Action:  Delete subsection in its entirety 

80. 16.70.040.15.C.2.a. 
Redevelopment of Grandfathered uses.  
Conditions and requirements 

Consistency 

Problem Statement: References minimum unit size of reinstatement section of the code, which is proposed to be eliminated 

Requested Action:  Delete subsection in its entirety 

81. 16.70.040.15.D.1. 
Redevelopment of Grandfathered uses.  
Procedure 

Regulatory 
Change 

Problem Statement: All redevelopment projects currently require a public hearing before DRC.  This seems unduly burdensome for an applicant wanting to demolish a garage 

apartment and rebuild. Redevelopment of an existing accessory dwelling unit should be allowed to be processed as an administrative application, if no variances are requested.  

Requested Action:  Add new subsection allowing one accessory dwelling unit to be reviewed as administrative application, at the discretion of the POD, provided no variances are 

requested 

82. 16.70.040.15.E.1. 
Redevelopment of Grandfathered uses.  
Standards for review. Building Height 
(3.) 

Consistency 

Problem Statement:  Requirement is based on zoning district 

Requested Action:  Delete subsection in its entirety 

83. 16.70.040.15.E.1 
Redevelopment of Grandfathered uses.  
Standards for review. Non-traditional 
roadway network (2.) 

Clarification 

Problem Statement:  Requires sidewalk connections to surrounding streets, “homes and businesses”.  Unclear what is meant by surrounding homes and businesses, difficult to 

regulate, and seems unnecessary to the purpose and intent of the redevelopment provisions 

Requested Action:  Delete “homes and businesses” 

 
84. 

16.70.040.15.E.3. 
Redevelopment of Grandfathered uses.  
Standards for review. Floor area ratio 
bonus. 

Regulatory 
Change 

Problem Statement:  Allows FAR bonuses up to .85, which is out of scale in any neighborhood   

Requested Action:  Reduce bonus for traditional style from 0.20 to 0.10 and eliminate 0.10 bonus for front porch, which is already required by the design standards in the 

Neighborhood Traditional zoning district. Reduces total bonus allowed from 0.35 to 0.15 or allow development consistent with FAR as specified in the zoning district 

Requested Action:  Revise language to clarify 

85. 16.90.020.3 Definitions Clarification 

Problem Statement:   Many definitions need updating and there is a need for some additional definitions 

Requested Action: Add definitions for Roof Line, Cooking Facilities and Unified Plan of Development; Revise definition of impervious surface to specifically include pavers and pools and 50% decks; 

update graphic for Stoop; revise Domestic Equipment to include barbeque grills 

 













































































































































































































































































































































































































































1



2



3



4



5



6



7



8



9



10



11



12



13



14



15



16



17



18



19



20



21



22



23



24



25



26



27



28



29



30



31



32



33



34



35



36



37



38



39



40



41



42



43



44



45



46



47



48



49



50



51



52



53



54



55



56



57



58



59



60



61



62



63



64



65



66



67



68



69



70



71



72



73



74



75



76



77



78



79



80



81



82



83



84



85



86



87



88



89



90



91



92



93



94



95



96



97



98



99



100



101



102



103



104



105



106



107



108



109



110



111



112



113



114



115



116



117



118



119



120



121



122



123



124



125



126



127



128



129



130



131



132



133



134



135



136



137



138



139



140



141



142



143



144



145



146



147



148



149



150



151



152



153



154



155



156



157



158



159



160



161



162



163



164



165



166



167



168



169



170



171



172



173



174



175



176



177



178



179



180



181



182



183



184



185



186



187



188

























































1



2



3



4



5



6



7



8



9



10



11



12



13



14



15



16



17



18



19



20



21



22



23



24



25



26



27



28



29



30



31



32



33



34



35



36



37



38



39



40



1



2



3



4



5



6



7



8



9



10



11



12



13



14



15



16



17



18



19



20



21



22



23



24



25



26



27



28



29



30



31



32



33



34



35



36



37



38



39



40



41



42



43



44



45



46



47



1



2



3



4



5



6



7



8



9



10



11



12



13



14



15



16



17



18



19



20



21



22



1



2



3



4



5



6



7



8



9



10



11



12



13



14



15



16



17



18



19



20



21



22















7



8



9



10



11



12



13



14



15



16



17



18



19



20



21



22



23



24



25



1



2



3



4



5



6



7



8



9



10



11



12



13



14



15



16



17



18



19



20



21



22



23



24



25



26



27



28



29



30



31



32



33



34



35



36



37



38



39



40



41



42



43



44



45



46



47



48



49



50



51



52



53



54



55



56



57



58



59



60



61



62



63



64



65



66



67



68



69



70



71



72



73



74



75



76



77



78



79



80



81



82



83



84



85



86



87



88



89



90



1



2



3



4



5



6



7



8



9



10



11



12



13



14



15



16



17



18



19



20



21



22



23



24



25



26



27



28



29



30



31



32



33



34



35



36



37



38



39



40



41



42



43



44



45



46



47



48



49



50



51



52



53



54



55



56



57



58



59



60



61



62



63



64



65



66



67



68



69



70



71



72



1



2



3



4



5



6



7



8



9



10



11



12



13



14



15



16



17



18



19



20



21



22



1



2



3



4



5



 

6



 

7



 

8



 

9



 

10



 

11



 

12



 

13



 

14



 

15



 

16



 

17



 

18



 

19



 

20



 

21



 

22



 

23



24




