

City of St. Petersburg
Bid Tabulation
 Purchasing Materials Management

Item No.	Description	Qty.	UOM	Resource Efficiency Solutions, Inc. Thonotosassa, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 45 Days		Graybar Electric Co. Clearwater, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 4-6 Weeks		Rexel Orlando, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 60 Days		Wesco Distribution Tampa, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 50 Days	
				Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
1a	Induction Light Fixture with lamp, clear prismatic polycarbonate lens, 1-85W induction light, dark bronze finish, Concept Fluorescent Systems, Inc. Part Number CFS-1X1-85W, or approved equal	320	Each	\$328.00	\$104,960.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$498.94	\$159,660.80	No Bid	No Bid
b	Induction Light, lamp only , 23W, American Green Power Inc. Part Number E1101-23W, or approved equal	190	Each	\$47.50	\$9,025.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$35.70	\$6,783.00	No Bid	No Bid
c	Base Adapter, Mogul to Medium, Leviton Part Number 8681, or approved equal	175	Each	\$2.20	\$385.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.75	\$481.25	No Bid	No Bid
	Price Includes inside delivery				\$114,370.00		No Bid		\$166,925.05		No Bid
	SBDE:				\$3,431.10				\$0.00		
	Discount 2%-10 Days:				\$0.00				\$0.00		
	Total w/Discount:				\$110,938.90				\$166,925.05		
OR											
2a	Induction Light Fixture with lamp, clear prismatic polycarbonate lens, 1-85W induction light, dark bronze finish, McGraw Edison Part Number EPL-85-QL-277-SBQZ, or approved equal	320	Each	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$326.56	\$104,499.20
b	Induction Light, lamp only , 23W, American Green Power Inc. Part Number E1101-23W, or approved equal	190	Each	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
c	Base Adapter, Mogul to Medium, Leviton Part Number 8681, or approved equal	175	Each	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price Includes inside delivery				No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$104,499.20
	SBDE:										\$0.00
	Discount 2%-10 Days:										\$0.00
	Total w/Discount:										\$104,499.20

Bid No. 6722
 Induction Light Fixtures Replacement
 for South Core Garage
 Addendum 3

City of St. Petersburg
Bid Tabulation
 Purchasing Materials Management

Item No.	Description	Qty.	UOM	Resource Efficiency Solutions, Inc. Thonotosassa, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 45 Days		Graybar Electric Co. Clearwater, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 4-6 Weeks		Rexel Orlando, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 60 Days		Wesco Distribution Tampa, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 50 Days	
				Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
OR											
3a	Induction Light Fixture with lamp, clear prismatic polycarbonate lens, 1-85W induction light, dark bronze finish, Kim Lighting Part Number PGL51-851F-277V, or approved equal	320	Each	No Bid	No Bid	\$331.50	\$106,080.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$328.13	\$105,001.60
b	Induction Light, lamp only , 23W, American Green Power Inc. Part Number E1101-23W, or approved equal	190	Each	No Bid	No Bid	\$104.00	\$19,760.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
c	Base Adapter, Mogul to Medium, Leviton Part Number 8681, or approved equal	175	Each	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.79	\$313.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price Includes inside delivery				No Bid		\$126,153.25		No Bid		\$105,001.60
	Total:				No Bid		\$0.00		No Bid		\$0.00
	SBDE:						\$0.00				\$0.00
	Discount 2%-10 Days:						\$0.00				\$0.00
	Total w/Discount:						\$126,153.25				\$105,001.60
Add Alternate:											
1	Induction Light Fixture with lamp, clear prismatic polycarbonate lens, 1-85W induction light, dark bronze finish, Concept Fluorescent Systems, Inc. Part Number CFS-1X1-85W, or approved equal	160	Each	\$328.00	\$52,480.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$498.94	\$79,830.40	No Bid	No Bid
2	Induction Light Fixture with lamp, clear prismatic polycarbonate lens, 1-85W induction light, dark bronze finish, McGraw Edison Part Number EPL-85-QL-277-SBQZ, or approved equal	160	Each	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$326.56	\$52,249.60
3	Induction Light Fixture with lamp, clear prismatic polycarbonate lens, 1-85W induction light, dark bronze finish, Kim Lighting Part Number PGL51-851F-277V, or approved equal	160	Each	No Bid	No Bid	\$331.50	\$53,040.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$328.13	\$52,500.80
Non-Responsive:											
Frontier Lighting Inc. The Arras Group C.E.D / Raybro											