

City of St. Petersburg
Bid Tabulation
 Purchasing and Materials Management

Item No.	Description	Est. Annual Qty, One Way	UOM	Bulk Express Transport Miami, FL Terms: 2%-10 Days Delivery: 1 Day		J Grez Transport Inc. Tampa, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 1 Day		Zimmer Equipment Inc. Tampa, FL Terms: 2%-10 Days Delivery: 5 Days		Consolidated Resource Recovery, Inc. Sarasota, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 5 Days		Estrada Trucking Inc. Wimauma, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 3 Days	
				Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
1	Zone 1 - One Way, 1-10 miles	1	mile	\$ 16.48	\$ 16.48	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 11.34	\$ 11.34	\$ 13.00	\$ 13.00	\$ 11.05	\$ 11.05
2	Zone 2 - One Way, 11-20 miles	1	mile	\$ 8.28	\$ 8.28	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 8.84	\$ 8.84	\$ 9.50	\$ 9.50	\$ 9.00	\$ 9.00
3	Zone 3 - One Way, 21-30 miles	1	mile	\$ 6.02	\$ 6.02	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 6.60	\$ 6.60	\$ 7.50	\$ 7.50	\$ 6.55	\$ 6.55
4	Zone 4 - One Way, 31-40 miles	53,700	mile	\$ 4.97	\$ 266,889.00	\$ 5.10	\$ 273,870.00	\$ 5.54	\$ 297,498.00	\$ 6.00	\$ 322,200.00	\$ 5.25	\$ 281,925.00
5	Zone 5 - One Way, 41-50 miles	1	mile	\$ 4.49	\$ 4.49	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 5.49	\$ 5.49	\$ 6.00	\$ 6.00	\$ 4.95	\$ 4.95
6	Zone 6 - One Way, 51-60 miles	1	mile	\$ 4.23	\$ 4.23	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 5.24	\$ 5.24	\$ 6.00	\$ 6.00	\$ 4.60	\$ 4.60
7	Zone 7 - One Way, 61-70 miles	1	mile	\$ 4.00	\$ 4.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 5.09	\$ 5.09	\$ 5.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 4.50	\$ 4.50
8	Zone 8 - One Way, 71-80 miles	1	mile	\$ 3.80	\$ 3.80	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 4.99	\$ 4.99	\$ 4.80	\$ 4.80	\$ 4.25	\$ 4.25
9	Zone 9 - One Way, 81-90 miles	1	mile	\$ 3.69	\$ 3.69	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 4.99	\$ 4.99	\$ 4.60	\$ 4.60	\$ 4.20	\$ 4.20
10	Zone 10 - One Way, 91-100 mile	1	mile	\$ 3.60	\$ 3.60	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 4.99	\$ 4.99	\$ 4.40	\$ 4.40	\$ 4.20	\$ 4.20
11	Zone 11 - One Way, 101-150 mil	1	mile	\$ 3.54	\$ 3.54	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 4.99	\$ 4.99	\$ 4.00	\$ 4.00	\$ 4.15	\$ 4.15
12	Zone 12 - One Way, 151-200 mil	1	mile	\$ 3.51	\$ 3.51	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 4.81	\$ 4.81	\$ 3.50	\$ 3.50	\$ 4.10	\$ 4.10
Total:				\$ 266,950.64		\$273,870.00		\$297,565.37		\$322,268.30		\$281,986.55	
SBDE:				\$0.00		\$5,477.40		\$5,951.31		\$0.00		\$0.00	
Discount 2%-10 Days:				\$5,339.01		\$0.00		\$5,951.31		\$0.00		\$0.00	
Total w/Discount:				\$ 261,611.63		\$ 268,392.60		\$ 285,662.76		\$ 322,268.30		\$ 281,986.55	

Statement of No Bid:
 E.L. Trevena, Inc.