

City of St. Petersburg
Bid Tabulation
Purchasing and Materials Management

Item No.	Description	EAU*	UOM	K & R Pumping Inc. Wesley Chapel, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: Not Specified		Cemex Construction Materials Florida, LLC Tampa, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 1 Day		All American Concrete, Inc. Largo, FL Terms: 2%-10 Days Delivery: 1 Day	
				Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
1	Concrete, Ready Mix (delivered to site) 3000 PSI	2000	Cubic Yard	No Bid	No Bid	\$95.00	\$190,000.00	\$98.00	\$196,000.00
2	Bag, Fiber Mesh	20	LB	No Bid	No Bid	\$5.00	\$100.00	\$7.00	\$140.00
3	Pumper Rental (Weekdays 6:30 am - 5:00 pm) 0-200 feet of hose	135	Hour	\$75.00	\$10,125.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$80.00	\$10,800.00
4	Pumper Rental (Premium Hours) Weekdays after 5:00 p.m.	5	Hour	\$80.00	\$400.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$85.00	\$425.00
	Saturday	7	Hour	\$80.00	\$560.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$85.00	\$595.00
5	Pumper Rental additional charges 201 or more feet of hose	10	Foot	\$10.00	\$100.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.00	\$20.00
Total:					\$11,185.00		\$190,100.00		\$207,980.00
2%-10 Days Discount:					\$0.00		\$0.00		\$4,159.60
Total w/Discount:					\$11,185.00		\$190,100.00		\$203,820.40