

City of St. Petersburg  
**Bid Tabulation**  
Purchasing and Materials Management

Item No.	Description	Qty.	UOM	Robbins Sport Floors Florida, LLC Coral Springs, FL Terms: 2%-10 Days Delivery: 25 Days		SSE + Associates, Inc. New Smyrna Beach, FL Terms: 2%-10 Days Delivery: Not Specified		Trident Surfacing, Inc. Miami, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 30 Days		J.M.D Developers Inc. Altamonte Springs, FL Terms: 2%-10 Days Delivery: 10 Days	
				Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
1	Refinish Main Floor Area	1	JOB		\$36,070.00		\$18,630.00	\$18,750.00	\$18,750.00	\$70,150.00	\$70,150.00
2	Refinish Flooring in 10 Alcoves	1	JOB		2,225.00		2,730.00		No Bid		No Bid
3	Refinish Balcony and Stairs	1	JOB		3,225.00		2,940.00		No Bid		No Bid
4	Unforeseen Conditions	1	JOB	2,000.00	2,000.00	2,000.00	2,000.00	2,000.00	2,000.00	2,000.00	2,000.00
5	<b>Total Base Bid</b>				43,520.00		26,300.00		20,750.00		72,150.00
6	Less 2% 10 days discount	1	EA		870.40		526.00		0.00		1,443.00
7	<b>Total Base Bid less Discount, if applicable</b>				42,649.60		25,774.00		20,750.00		70,707.00
8	Remove and Replace 200 S.F. of 3/4" plywood substrate in Storage Room. No finished floor over plywood.	1	JOB		600.00		700.07		No Bid		No Bid
9	Replace damaged or deteriorated wood per square foot including all labor and materials	1	SQ FT	25.00		5.00		20.00	20.00	2.50	2.50