

## Bid Tabulation for Evaluations

Purchasing Materials Management

6816

				Office Furniture Center Inc. Terms: Not Specified Delivery: 45 Days		Holmes & Brakel International, Inc. Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 56 Days		Commercial Design Services, Inc. Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 90 Days	
Item	Lead-time	Description	Qty UOM	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
				<b>Seating:</b>					
1	S1	Three Module Armless Bench Unit	2 EA	\$2,058.15	\$4,116.30	\$1,230.00	\$2,460.00	\$2,352.21	\$4,704.42
3	S3	Thesis Bistro Height Bar	8 EA	\$787.87	\$6,302.96	\$594.00	\$4,752.00	\$915.06	\$7,320.48
5	S2	Bola Bench	9 EA	\$279.09	\$2,511.81	\$234.00	\$2,106.00	\$361.77	\$3,255.93
7	S4	Bola Armless Chair	39 EA	\$90.80	\$3,541.20	\$92.50	\$3,607.50	\$99.26	\$3,871.14
8	S5	Work Chair	33 EA	\$351.19	\$11,589.27	\$350.00	\$11,550.00	\$224.96	\$7,423.68
9	S13	Wood Bench	1 EA	\$1,792.56	\$1,792.56	\$1,765.00	\$1,765.00	\$2,084.24	\$2,084.24
14	S15	Guest chair with arms	2 EA	\$133.92	\$267.84	\$134.00	\$268.00	\$185.38	\$370.76
				<b>Tables:</b>					
16	T3	Bistro Table	4 EA	\$385.96	\$1,543.84	\$390.00	\$1,560.00	\$450.02	\$1,800.08
17	T6	Rectangular 30"x48"	2 EA	\$417.50	\$835.00	\$425.00	\$850.00	\$456.50	\$913.00
18	T7	With light & countertop	2 EA	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,165.00	\$2,330.00	\$4,038.14	\$8,076.28
19	T9	Conference Table	1 EA	\$1,222.63	\$1,222.63	\$2,495.00	\$2,495.00	\$2,741.70	\$2,741.70
				<b>Misc:</b>					
37	M3	Clock, Wall	4 EA	\$148.50	\$594.00	\$140.00	\$560.00	\$153.68	\$614.72
38	M4	Lectern	1 EA	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,875.00	\$1,875.00	\$1,569.98	\$1,569.98
39	S14	Ottoman	5 EA	No Bid	No Bid	\$565.00	\$2,825.00	\$720.06	\$3,600.30
<b>ROA Total:</b>									

**Non-Responsive:**

American Office Systems, Inc.  
DTS Commercial Interiors, Inc. dba Unisource Group

## Bid Tabulation for Evaluations

Purchasing Materials Management

6816

				Florida Business Interiors		The Beaux-Arts Group		
				Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 56 Days		Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 80 Days		
Item	Lead-time	Description	Qty UOM	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	
<b>Seating:</b>								
1	S1	6 wks	Three Module Armless Bench Unit	2 EA	\$850.51	\$1,701.02	\$2,408.04	\$4,816.08
3	S3	6 wks	Thesis Bistro Height Bar	8 EA	\$860.50	\$6,884.00	\$911.32	\$7,290.56
5	S2	6 wks	Bola Bench	9 EA	\$239.64	\$2,156.76		\$2,831.98
7	S4	6 wks	Bola Armless Chair	39 EA	\$94.97	\$3,703.83	\$97.26	\$3,793.14
8	S5	3-4 wks	Work Chair	33 EA	\$367.34	\$12,122.22	\$378.78	\$12,499.74
9	S13	6 wks	Wood Bench	1 EA	\$3,864.54	\$3,864.54	\$1,893.79	\$1,893.79
14	S15	2 wks	Guest chair with arms	2 EA	\$140.08	\$280.16	\$389.23	\$778.46
<b>Tables:</b>								
16	T3	6 wks	Bistro Table	4 EA	\$436.01	\$1,744.04	\$451.57	\$1,806.28
17	T6	6 wks	Rectangular 30"x48"	2 EA	\$436.71	\$873.42	\$447.32	\$894.64
18	T7	6 wks	With light & countertop	2 EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
19	T9	6-8 wks	Conference Table	1 EA	\$1,050.99	\$1,050.99	\$2,325.92	\$2,325.92
<b>Misc:</b>								
37	M3	6-8 wks	Clock, Wall	4 EA	\$131.80	\$527.20	\$150.00	\$600.00
38	M4	6-8 wks	Lectern	1 EA	\$1,941.51	\$1,941.51	\$1,737.67	\$1,737.67
39	S14	6 wks	Ottoman	5 EA	\$572.23	\$2,861.15	\$613.97	\$3,069.85
<b>ROA Total:</b>						<b>\$1,578.19</b>		

**Non-Responsive:**

American Office Systems, Inc.  
DTS Commercial Interiors, Inc. dba Unisource Grc

### Bid Tabulation for Evaluations

Purchasing Materials Management

6816A

**Office Furniture Center, Inc.**  
Tampa, FL  
Terms: Net 30 Days  
Delivery: 45 Days

**Holmes & Brakel International, Inc.**  
Not Specified  
Terms: Not Specified  
Delivery: Not Specified

**Commercial Design Services, Inc.**  
Tampa, FL  
Terms: Net 30 Days  
Delivery: 90 Days

Item	Description	Qty	UOM	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price		
<b>Systems Furniture:</b>											
1	T2	5	wks	Table, 60" x 30"	1 LOT	No Bid	\$2,250.00	\$2,250.00	\$3,804.38	\$3,804.38	
2	T5	5	wks	Table, 72" x 30"	1 LOT	No Bid	15,465.00	15,465.00	24,718.38	24,718.38	
3	WS1	5	wks	Workstation, Children's area	1 LOT	No Bid	6,920.00	6,920.00	18,770.45	18,770.45	
4	WS2	5	wks	Workstation, Teen area	1 LOT	No Bid	5,135.00	5,135.00	7,026.39	7,026.39	
5	WS3	5	wks	Workstation, Reference area	1 LOT	No Bid	9,730.00	9,730.00	14,856.35	14,856.35	
6	WS4	5	wks	Workstation, Tech service area	1 LOT	No Bid	9,135.00	9,135.00	16,107.86	16,107.86	
7	WS5	5	wks	Workstation, Information desk	1 LOT	No Bid	3,460.00	3,460.00	7,844.89	7,844.89	
8	WT1a, WT1b	5	wks	Workstation, Office 112	1 LOT	No Bid	2,300.00	2,300.00	2,932.61	2,932.61	
9	WT2	5	wks	Workstation, Offices 157/158	1 LOT	No Bid	4,565.00	4,565.00	4,351.02	4,351.02	
10	WT3	5	wks	Workstation, Workroom 159, north	1 LOT	No Bid	3,830.00	3,830.00	4,668.16	4,668.16	
11	WT4	5	wks	Workstation, Workroom 159, south	1 LOT	No Bid	1,850.00	1,850.00	1,629.93	1,629.93	
12	WT5	5	wks	Workstation, Security system room	1 LOT	No Bid	2,515.00	2,515.00	2,639.32	2,639.32	
				Workstation, additional files	1 LOT						
<b>Systems Furniture Total</b>							<b>67,155.00</b>		<b>109,349.74</b>		
<b>Seating:</b>											
13	S8	44	EA	Chair, task, plastic		No Bid	151.00	6,644.00	182.14	8,014.16	
14	S7	37	EA	Square arm lounge, powered		1,755.22	64,943.14	1,815.00	67,155.00	2,164.85	80,099.45
15	S11	1	LOT	Chair, stack, qty 96 + 3 dollies		No Bid	136.50	13,104.00	16,398.72	16,398.72	
16	S12	5	EA	Stool, task, upholstered		438.12	2,190.60	472.00	2,360.00	583.75	2,918.75
17	S10	61	EA	Chair, task, upholstered		265.73	16,209.53	242.50	14,792.50	300.27	18,316.47
18	S9	1	EA	Lounge, modular		4,473.04	4,473.04	5,400.00	5,400.00		No Bid
19	T4	13	SET	Footrest/Ottoman		582.45	7,571.85	564.00	7,332.00	656.31	8,532.03
<b>Miscellaneous:</b>											
20	T1	1	EA	Table, Pivoting		1,103.75	1,103.75	550.00	550.00	1,287.45	1,287.45
21	D1	1	LOT	Desk, Manager's office		2,539.96	2,539.96		No Bid		No Bid
22	MD	24	LOT	Storage, Media		No Bid	515.00	12,360.00		638.82	15,331.68
23	M2	15	EA	Rack, Magazine		No Bid	308.00	4,620.00		299.33	4,489.95
<b>ROA Total:</b>						<b>\$104,605.49</b>		<b>\$32,782.00</b>		<b>\$13,483.61</b>	

**Non-Responsive:**

The Beaux-Arts Group  
Corporate Interiors, Inc.  
Florida Business Interiors

### Bid Tabulation for Evaluations

Purchasing Materials Management

6816A

**Office Pavilion South Florida  
dba Workplace Resource**  
Tampa, FL  
Terms: Net 30 Days  
Delivery: 60 Days

**Corporate Express US Inc.**  
Tampa, FL  
Terms: Net 30 Days  
Delivery: Not Specified

**Kimball Office , a division of  
Kimball International  
Marketing, Inc.**  
Jasper, IN  
Terms: Net 30 Days  
Delivery: Not Specified

Item	Description	Qty	UOM	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price		
<b>Systems Furniture:</b>											
1	T2	5	wks	Table, 60" x 30"	1 LOT	\$3,125.65	\$3,125.65	No Bid	\$4,926.34	\$4,926.34	
2	T5	5	wks	Table, 72" x 30"	1 LOT	17,105.50	17,105.50	No Bid	25,546.91	25,546.91	
3	WS1	5	wks	Workstation, Children's area	1 LOT	7,198.90	7,198.90	No Bid	11,380.61	11,380.61	
4	WS2	5	wks	Workstation, Teen area	1 LOT	6,112.60	6,112.60	No Bid	8,294.06	8,294.06	
5	WS3	5	wks	Workstation, Reference area	1 LOT	11,232.75	11,232.75	No Bid	16,011.24	16,011.24	
6	WS4	5	wks	Workstation, Tech service area	1 LOT	10,415.25	10,415.25	No Bid	15,199.66	15,199.66	
7	WS5	5	wks	Workstation, Information desk	1 LOT	5,306.00	5,306.00	No Bid	7,995.85	7,995.85	
8	WT1a, WT1b	5	wks	Workstation, Office 112	1 LOT	2,281.80	2,281.80	No Bid	4,845.02	4,845.02	
9	WT2	5	wks	Workstation, Offices 157/158	1 LOT	4,532.00	4,532.00	No Bid	6,206.30	6,206.30	
10	WT3	5	wks	Workstation, Workroom 159, north	1 LOT	3,701.00	3,701.00	No Bid	7,137.03	7,137.03	
11	WT4	5	wks	Workstation, Workroom 159, south	1 LOT	1,672.50	1,672.50	No Bid	3,205.83	3,205.83	
12	WT5	5	wks	Workstation, Security system room	1 LOT	1,950.00	1,950.00	No Bid	2,969.64	2,969.64	
				Workstation, additional files	1 LOT	7,000.00	7,000.00				
<b>Systems Furniture Total</b>							<b>81,633.95</b>			<b>113,718.49</b>	
<b>Seating:</b>											
13	S8	44	EA	Chair, task, plastic		171.90	7,563.60	152.21	6,697.24	222.25	9,779.00
14	S7	37	EA	Square arm lounge, powered		1,888.00	69,856.00	1,826.99	67,598.63		No Bid
15	S11	1	LOT	Chair, stack, qty 96 + 3 dollies		14,486.00	14,486.00	14,571.30	14,571.30		No Bid
16	S12	5	EA	Stool, task, upholstered		399.00	1,995.00	499.00	2,495.00		No Bid
17	S10	61	EA	Chair, task, upholstered		295.00	17,995.00		No Bid		No Bid
18	S9	1	EA	Lounge, modular		4,800.00	4,800.00		No Bid		No Bid
19	T4	13	SET	Footrest/Ottoman		653.00	8,489.00	725.99	9,437.87		No Bid
<b>Miscellaneous:</b>											
20	T1	1	EA	Table, Pivoting		1,268.00	1,268.00	1,175.52	1,175.52		No Bid
21	D1	1	LOT	Desk, Manager's office		2,512.00	2,512.00		No Bid	4,180.05	4,180.05
22	MD	24	LOT	Storage, Media			12,527.00		No Bid		No Bid
23	M2	15	EA	Rack, Magazine		340.50	5,107.50		No Bid		No Bid
<b>ROA Total:</b>						<b>\$86,140.95</b>		<b>\$14,571.30</b>			

**Non-Responsive:**

The Beaux-Arts Group  
Corporate Interiors, Inc.  
Florida Business Interiors