

City of St. Petersburg  
**Bid Tabulation**  
Purchasing and Materials Management

Item No.	Title	Days	Hours	Riley Electric Co Inc Largo, FL Terms: 2%-10 Days Delivery: 10 Days	Himes Electric Company, Inc. Lutz, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 3 Days	S. Douglas Erwin Tampa, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 1 Day	Professional Highway Maintenance, Inc. Pinellas Park, FL Terms: Not Specified Delivery: 30 Days
				Rate per Hour	Rate per Hour	Rate per Hour	Rate per Hour
1	Licensed Journeyman Electrician	Monday - Friday	8:00 am - 5:00 pm	\$48.19	\$61.50	\$55.50	\$75.00
		Monday - Friday	5:01 pm - 7:59 am	\$72.29	\$75.00	\$75.00	\$95.00
		Weekends & Holidays	8:00 am - 5:00 pm	\$72.29	\$75.00	\$75.00	\$95.00
		Weekends & Holidays	5:01 pm - 7:59 am	\$96.39	\$75.00	\$80.00	\$95.00
2	Electrician's Helper/Apprentice	Monday - Friday	8:00 am - 5:00 pm	\$34.42	\$47.50	\$45.50	\$35.00
		Monday - Friday	5:01 pm - 7:59 am	\$51.64	\$54.00	\$62.50	\$55.00
		Weekends & Holidays	8:00 am - 5:00 pm	\$51.64	\$54.00	\$62.50	\$55.00
		Weekends & Holidays	5:01 pm - 7:59 am	\$68.85	\$54.00	\$70.00	\$55.00
<b>Airfield and Port Lighting for the Albert Whitted Airport and Cruise Port</b>							
3	Licensed Journeyman Electrician	Monday - Friday	8:00 am - 5:00 pm	\$48.19	\$61.50	\$105.00	\$85.00
		Monday - Friday	5:01 pm - 7:59 am	\$72.29	\$75.00	\$132.00	\$105.00
		Weekends & Holidays	8:00 am - 5:00 pm	\$72.29	\$75.00	\$132.00	\$105.00
		Weekends & Holidays	5:01 pm - 7:59 am	\$96.39	\$75.00	\$140.00	\$105.00
4	Electrician's Helper/Apprentice	Monday - Friday	8:00 am - 5:00 pm	\$34.42	\$47.00	\$60.00	\$40.00
		Monday - Friday	5:01 pm - 7:59 am	\$51.64	\$55.00	\$80.00	\$60.00
		Weekends & Holidays	8:00 am - 5:00 pm	\$51.64	\$55.00	\$80.00	\$60.00
		Weekends & Holidays	5:01 pm - 7:59 am	\$68.85	\$55.00	\$100.00	\$60.00
<b>Electrical Maintenance and Repair Services performed at Cosme Water Treatment Plant</b>							
5	Licensed Journeyman Electrician	Monday - Friday	8:00 am - 5:00 pm	\$68.85	\$75.00	\$68.00	\$75.00
		Monday - Friday	5:01 pm - 7:59 am	\$103.27	\$92.00	\$88.00	\$95.00
		Weekends & Holidays	8:00 am - 5:00 pm	\$103.27	\$92.00	\$88.00	\$95.00
		Weekends & Holidays	5:01 pm - 7:59 am	\$137.70	\$112.00	\$93.00	\$95.00
6	Electrician's Helper/Apprentice	Monday - Friday	8:00 am - 5:00 pm	\$48.19	\$57.00	\$55.00	\$35.00
		Monday - Friday	5:01 pm - 7:59 am	\$72.29	\$69.00	\$75.00	\$55.00
		Weekends & Holidays	8:00 am - 5:00 pm	\$72.29	\$95.00	\$75.00	\$55.00
		Weekends & Holidays	5:01 pm - 7:59 am	\$96.39	\$95.00	\$80.00	\$55.00

City of St. Petersburg  
**Bid Tabulation**  
Purchasing and Materials Management

Item No.	Title	Days	Hours	Riley Electric Co Inc Largo, FL Terms: 2%-10 Days Delivery: 10 Days Rate per Hour	Himes Electric Company, Inc. Lutz, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 3 Days Rate per Hour	S. Douglas Erwin Tampa, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 1 Day Rate per Hour	Professional Highway Maintenance, Inc. Pinellas Park, FL Terms: Not Specified Delivery: 30 Days Rate per Hour
<b>High Voltage Electrical Repairs and Maintenance</b>							
7	Licensed Journeyman Electrician	Monday - Friday	8:00 am - 5:00 pm	\$202.50	No Bid	\$99.00	\$90.00
		Monday - Friday	5:01 pm - 7:59 am	\$303.75	No Bid	\$120.00	\$110.00
		Weekends & Holidays	8:00 am - 5:00 pm	\$303.75	No Bid	\$120.00	\$110.00
		Weekends & Holidays	5:01 pm - 7:59 am	\$405.00	No Bid	\$135.00	\$110.00
8	Electrician's Helper/Apprentice	Monday - Friday	8:00 am - 5:00 pm	\$101.25	No Bid	\$60.00	\$45.00
		Monday - Friday	5:01 pm - 7:59 am	\$151.88	No Bid	\$80.00	\$60.00
		Weekends & Holidays	8:00 am - 5:00 pm	\$151.88	No Bid	\$80.00	\$60.00
		Weekends & Holidays	5:01 pm - 7:59 am	\$202.50	No Bid	\$100.00	\$60.00
<b>Equipment Rate Schedule</b>							
9	Aerial (Bucket) Truck, 35' with Operator	Monday - Friday	8:00 am - 5:00 pm	\$125.00	\$109.00	\$90.00	\$95.00
		Monday - Friday	5:01 pm - 7:59 am	\$187.50	\$129.00	\$115.00	\$115.00
		Weekends & Holidays	8:00 am - 5:00 pm	\$187.50	\$157.00	\$115.00	\$115.00
		Weekends & Holidays	5:01 pm - 7:59 am	\$250.00	\$157.00	\$115.00	\$115.00
10	Line (Pole-Setting) Boom Truck with Operat	Monday - Friday	8:00 am - 5:00 pm	\$150.00	\$125.00	\$115.00	\$40.00
		Monday - Friday	5:01 pm - 7:59 am	\$225.00	\$145.00	\$138.00	\$60.00
		Weekends & Holidays	8:00 am - 5:00 pm	\$225.00	\$165.00	\$138.00	\$60.00
		Weekends & Holidays	5:01 pm - 7:59 am	\$300.00	\$165.00	\$158.00	\$60.00
<b>Total:</b>				<b>\$5,166.18</b>	<b>\$2,833.50</b>	<b>\$3,755.00</b>	<b>\$3,045.00</b>
<b>2%-10 Days Discount:</b>				<b>\$103.32</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>
<b>Total w/Discount:</b>				<b>\$5,062.86</b>	<b>\$2,833.50</b>	<b>\$3,755.00</b>	<b>\$3,045.00</b>

**Non-Responsive:**  
Gancedo Technologies, Inc.

City of St. Petersburg  
**Bid Tabulation**  
Purchasing and Materials Management

Item No.	Title	Days	Hours	Kohler Construction Services Inc. dba Kohler Constructions Co. Pinellas Park, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: Not Specified Rate per Hour	Tri-City Electrical Contractors, Inc. Tampa, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 30 Days Rate per Hour	Electrical Engineering Enterprises Inc. Tampa, FL Terms: 2%-10 Days Delivery: 1 Day Rate per Hour	M.C. Dean, Inc. dba ANECO Tampa, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 1 Day Rate per Hour
1	Licensed Journeyman Electrician	Monday - Friday	8:00 am - 5:00 pm	\$60.00	\$45.00	\$55.00	\$46.66
		Monday - Friday	5:01 pm - 7:59 am	\$90.00	\$57.00	\$65.00	\$70.00
		Weekends & Holidays	8:00 am - 5:00 pm	\$90.00	\$57.00	\$82.50	\$70.00
		Weekends & Holidays	5:01 pm - 7:59 am	\$90.00	\$63.75	\$97.50	\$93.25
2	Electrician's Helper/Apprentice	Monday - Friday	8:00 am - 5:00 pm	\$50.00	\$30.00	\$45.00	\$34.00
		Monday - Friday	5:01 pm - 7:59 am	\$75.00	\$35.00	\$55.00	\$51.00
		Weekends & Holidays	8:00 am - 5:00 pm	\$75.00	\$35.00	\$67.50	\$51.00
		Weekends & Holidays	5:01 pm - 7:59 am	\$75.00	\$42.00	\$82.50	\$67.83
<b>Airfield and Port Lighting for the Albert Whitted Airport and Cruise Port</b>							
3	Licensed Journeyman Electrician	Monday - Friday	8:00 am - 5:00 pm	\$60.00	\$45.00	\$55.00	\$46.66
		Monday - Friday	5:01 pm - 7:59 am	\$90.00	\$57.00	\$65.00	\$70.00
		Weekends & Holidays	8:00 am - 5:00 pm	\$90.00	\$57.00	\$82.50	\$70.00
		Weekends & Holidays	5:01 pm - 7:59 am	\$90.00	\$63.75	\$97.50	\$93.25
4	Electrician's Helper/Apprentice	Monday - Friday	8:00 am - 5:00 pm	\$50.00	\$30.00	\$45.00	\$34.00
		Monday - Friday	5:01 pm - 7:59 am	\$75.00	\$35.00	\$55.00	\$51.00
		Weekends & Holidays	8:00 am - 5:00 pm	\$75.00	\$35.00	\$67.50	\$51.00
		Weekends & Holidays	5:01 pm - 7:59 am	\$75.00	\$42.00	\$82.50	\$67.83
<b>Electrical Maintenance and Repair Services performed at Cosme Water Treatment Plant</b>							
5	Licensed Journeyman Electrician	Monday - Friday	8:00 am - 5:00 pm	\$60.00	\$45.00	\$55.00	\$67.00
		Monday - Friday	5:01 pm - 7:59 am	\$90.00	\$57.00	\$65.00	\$100.25
		Weekends & Holidays	8:00 am - 5:00 pm	\$90.00	\$57.00	\$82.50	\$100.25
		Weekends & Holidays	5:01 pm - 7:59 am	\$90.00	\$63.75	\$97.50	\$134.00
6	Electrician's Helper/Apprentice	Monday - Friday	8:00 am - 5:00 pm	\$50.00	\$30.00	\$45.00	\$47.00
		Monday - Friday	5:01 pm - 7:59 am	\$75.00	\$35.00	\$55.00	\$70.00
		Weekends & Holidays	8:00 am - 5:00 pm	\$75.00	\$35.00	\$67.50	\$70.00
		Weekends & Holidays	5:01 pm - 7:59 am	\$75.00	\$42.00	\$82.50	\$93.25

City of St. Petersburg  
**Bid Tabulation**  
 Purchasing and Materials Management

Item No.	Title	Days	Hours	Kohler Construction Services Inc. dba Kohler Constructions Co. Pinellas Park, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: Not Specified	Tri-City Electrical Contractors, Inc. Tampa, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 30 Days	Electrical Engineering Enterprises Inc. Tampa, FL Terms: 2%-10 Days Delivery: 1 Day	M.C. Dean, Inc. dba ANECO Tampa, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 1 Day
				Rate per Hour	Rate per Hour	Rate per Hour	Rate per Hour
<b>High Voltage Electrical Repairs and Maintenance</b>							
7	Licensed Journeyman Electrician	Monday - Friday	8:00 am - 5:00 pm	\$76.00	\$55.00	\$55.00	\$200.00
		Monday - Friday	5:01 pm - 7:59 am	\$114.00	\$72.50	\$65.00	\$300.00
		Weekends & Holidays	8:00 am - 5:00 pm	\$114.00	\$85.00	\$82.50	\$300.00
		Weekends & Holidays	5:01 pm - 7:59 am	\$114.00	\$102.00	\$97.50	\$404.00
8	Electrician's Helper/Apprentice	Monday - Friday	8:00 am - 5:00 pm	\$70.00	\$25.00	\$45.00	\$98.00
		Monday - Friday	5:01 pm - 7:59 am	\$105.00	\$32.50	\$55.00	\$147.00
		Weekends & Holidays	8:00 am - 5:00 pm	\$105.00	\$42.00	\$67.50	\$147.00
		Weekends & Holidays	5:01 pm - 7:59 am	\$105.00	\$52.00	\$82.50	\$195.51
<b>Equipment Rate Schedule</b>							
9	Aerial (Bucket) Truck, 35' with Operator	Monday - Friday	8:00 am - 5:00 pm	\$116.00	\$80.00	\$65.00	\$123.00
		Monday - Friday	5:01 pm - 7:59 am	\$154.00	\$87.50	\$75.00	\$184.00
		Weekends & Holidays	8:00 am - 5:00 pm	\$154.00	\$87.50	\$97.50	\$184.00
		Weekends & Holidays	5:01 pm - 7:59 am	\$154.00	\$90.00	\$112.50	\$245.39
10	Line (Pole-Setting) Boom Truck with Operat	Monday - Friday	8:00 am - 5:00 pm	\$131.00	\$150.00	\$65.00	\$150.00
		Monday - Friday	5:01 pm - 7:59 am	\$169.00	\$165.00	\$75.00	\$225.00
		Weekends & Holidays	8:00 am - 5:00 pm	\$169.00	\$190.00	\$97.50	\$225.00
		Weekends & Holidays	5:01 pm - 7:59 am	\$169.00	\$190.00	\$112.50	\$300.00
<b>Total:</b>				<b>\$3,834.00</b>	<b>\$2,600.25</b>	<b>\$2,900.00</b>	<b>\$5,077.13</b>
<b>2%-10 Days Discount:</b>				<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>\$58.00</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>
<b>Total w/Discount:</b>				<b>\$3,834.00</b>	<b>\$2,600.25</b>	<b>\$2,842.00</b>	<b>\$5,077.13</b>

**Non-Responsive:**  
 Gancedo Technologies, Inc.