

City of St. Petersburg
Bid Tabulation
Purchasing Materials Management

| Item No. | Description | Est. Qty. | UOM | Rexel, Inc. dba Rexel Mader Sarasota, FL Terms: Not Specified Delivery: 1 Day | | John Mader Enterprises Inc. dba Mader Electric Motors N. Fort Myers, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 1 Day | | Tenvarva Machinery Co. dba Hudson Pump & Equipment Lakeland, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: Not Specified | | Carl Eric Johnson, Inc Lawrenceville, GA Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 20 Days | |
|--|--|-----------|-----|--|---------------------|---|---------------------|---|---------------------|--|---------------------|
| | | | | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price |
| Labor Rate for Work Performed at Contractor's Facility: | | | | | | | | | | | |
| 1 | Mechanic, 7:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m. Monday - Friday | 640 | HR | \$30.00 | \$19,200.00 | \$75.00 | \$48,000.00 | \$85.00 | \$54,400.00 | \$70.00 | \$44,800.00 |
| 2 | Mechanic, 5:01 p.m. - 7:59 a.m. Monday - Friday | 200 | HR | 30.00 | 6,000.00 | 110.00 | 22,000.00 | 127.50 | 25,500.00 | 105.00 | 21,000.00 |
| 3 | Mechanic, City Holiday, Saturday, Sunday | 100 | HR | 30.00 | 3,000.00 | 110.00 | 11,000.00 | 170.00 | 17,000.00 | 140.00 | 14,000.00 |
| 4 | Machinist, 7:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m. Monday - Friday | 350 | HR | 35.00 | 12,250.00 | 75.00 | 26,250.00 | 85.00 | 29,750.00 | | No Bid |
| 5 | Machinist, 5:01 p.m. - 7:59 a.m. Monday - Friday | 100 | HR | 35.00 | 3,500.00 | 110.00 | 11,000.00 | 127.50 | 12,750.00 | | No Bid |
| 6 | Machinist, City Holiday, Saturday, Sunday | 500 | HR | 35.00 | 17,500.00 | 110.00 | 55,000.00 | 170.00 | 85,000.00 | | No Bid |
| 7 | Welder, 7:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m. Monday - Friday | 250 | HR | 18.00 | 4,500.00 | 50.00 | 12,500.00 | 85.00 | 21,250.00 | | No Bid |
| 8 | Welder, 5:01 p.m. - 7:59 a.m. Monday - Friday | 100 | HR | 18.00 | 1,800.00 | 75.00 | 7,500.00 | 127.50 | 12,750.00 | | No Bid |
| 9 | Welder, City Holiday, Saturday, Sunday | 50 | HR | 18.00 | 900.00 | 75.00 | 3,750.00 | 170.00 | 8,500.00 | | No Bid |
| 10 | Laborer, 7:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m. Monday - Friday | 100 | HR | 10.00 | 1,000.00 | 20.00 | 2,000.00 | 85.00 | 8,500.00 | | No Bid |
| 11 | Laborer, 5:01 p.m. - 7:59 a.m. Monday - Friday | 100 | HR | 10.00 | 1,000.00 | 20.00 | 2,000.00 | 127.50 | 12,750.00 | | No Bid |
| 12 | Laborer, City Holiday, Saturday, Sunday | 50 | HR | 10.00 | 500.00 | 20.00 | 1,000.00 | 170.00 | 8,500.00 | | No Bid |
| | Subtotal: | | | | 71,150.00 | | 202,000.00 | | 296,650.00 | | 79,800.00 |
| Labor Rate for Work Performed at City's Facility: | | | | | | | | | | | |
| 13 | Mechanic, 7:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m. Monday - Friday | 320 | HR | 75 | 24000 | 90.00 | 28,800.00 | 100.00 | 32,000.00 | 80.00 | 25,600.00 |
| 14 | Mechanic, 5:01 p.m. - 7:59 a.m. Monday - Friday | 100 | HR | 75 | 7500 | 135.00 | 13,500.00 | 150.00 | 15,000.00 | 120.00 | 12,000.00 |
| 15 | Mechanic, City Holiday, Saturday, Sunday | 50 | HR | 75 | 3750 | 135.00 | 6,750.00 | 200.00 | 10,000.00 | 160.00 | 8,000.00 |
| 16 | Machinist, 7:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m. Monday - Friday | 150 | HR | 20 | 3000 | 90.00 | 13,500.00 | 100.00 | 15,000.00 | | No Bid |
| 17 | Machinist, 5:01 p.m. - 7:59 a.m. Monday - Friday | 100 | HR | 20 | 2000 | 135.00 | 13,500.00 | 150.00 | 15,000.00 | | No Bid |
| 18 | Machinist, City Holiday, Saturday, Sunday | 250 | HR | 20 | 5000 | 135.00 | 33,750.00 | 200.00 | 50,000.00 | | No Bid |
| 19 | Welder, 7:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m. Monday - Friday | 125 | HR | 20 | 2500 | 90.00 | 11,250.00 | 100.00 | 12,500.00 | | No Bid |
| 20 | Welder, 5:01 p.m. - 7:59 a.m. Monday - Friday | 50 | HR | 20 | 1000 | 135.00 | 6,750.00 | 150.00 | 7,500.00 | | No Bid |
| 21 | Welder, City Holiday, Saturday, Sunday | 100 | HR | 20 | 2000 | 135.00 | 13,500.00 | 200.00 | 20,000.00 | | No Bid |
| 22 | Laborer, 7:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m. Monday - Friday | 100 | HR | 15 | 1500 | 30.00 | 3,000.00 | 100.00 | 10,000.00 | | No Bid |
| 23 | Laborer, 5:01 p.m. - 7:59 a.m. Monday - Friday | 100 | HR | 15 | 1500 | 45.00 | 4,500.00 | 150.00 | 15,000.00 | | No Bid |
| 24 | Laborer, City Holiday, Saturday, Sunday | 50 | HR | 15 | 750 | 45.00 | 2,250.00 | 200.00 | 10,000.00 | | No Bid |
| | Subtotal: | | | | 54,500.00 | | 151,050.00 | | 212,000.00 | | 45,600.00 |
| Total (Line 19 plus 33) | | | | | \$125,650.00 | | \$353,050.00 | | \$508,650.00 | | \$125,400.00 |
| SBE Discount: | | | | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| 2%-10 Days Discount: | | | | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| Total: | | | | | \$125,650.00 | | \$353,050.00 | | \$508,650.00 | | \$125,400.00 |

City of St. Petersburg
Bid Tabulation
Purchasing Materials Management

| Item No. | Description | Est. Qty. | UOM | Rexel, Inc. dba Rexel Mader Sarasota, FL Terms: Not Specified Delivery: 1 Day | | John Mader Enterprises Inc. dba Mader Electric Motors N. Fort Myers, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 1 Day | | Tenvarva Machinery Co. dba Hudson Pump & Equipment Lakeland, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: Not Specified | | Carl Eric Johnson, Inc Lawrenceville, GA Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 20 Days | |
|----------|-------------------|-----------|-----|--|----------------|---|----------------|---|----------------|--|----------------|
| | | | | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price |
| | Discount Schedule | | | | 0% | | 2-30% | | - | | 19% |

Statement of No Bid:

Godwin Pumps of America, Inc.
Motion Industries
Hydraulic Professionals
Flanders Electric Motor Service
Diversified Drilling Corp.
Piper Fire Protection
Carter & VerPlanck, Inc.

City of St. Petersburg
Bid Tabulation
Purchasing Materials Management

| Item No. | Description | Est. Qty. | UOM | DJ/PJ Inc. dba JW Appley & Son Clearwater, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: Not Specified | | Gemini Enterprises of South FL Inc. dba Electro Mechanical South Sarasota, FL Terms: 2%-10 Days Delivery: 4 Weeks | | Tampa Armature Works, Inc. Riverview, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: Not Specified | | Southeastern Wastewater Equipment Corp. dba Southeastern Pump Ft. Lauderdale, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 7-28 Days | | Process Equipment Repair Services Tampa, FL Terms: 2%-10 Days Delivery: 10 Days | |
|--|--|-----------|-----|--|---------------------|---|---------------------|---|---------------------|---|----------------|---|---------------------|
| | | | | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price |
| Labor Rate for Work Performed at Contractor's Facility: | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| 1 | Mechanic, 7:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m. Monday - Friday | 640 | HR | \$47.00 | \$30,080.00 | \$75.00 | \$48,000.00 | \$45.00 | \$28,800.00 | | No Bid | \$42.00 | \$26,880.00 |
| 2 | Mechanic, 5:01 p.m. - 7:59 a.m. Monday - Friday | 200 | HR | 47.00 | 9,400.00 | 112.50 | 22,500.00 | 56.50 | 11,300.00 | | No Bid | 63.00 | 12,600.00 |
| 3 | Mechanic, City Holiday, Saturday, Sunday | 100 | HR | 52.00 | 5,200.00 | 112.50 | 11,250.00 | 79.00 | 7,900.00 | | No Bid | 84.00 | 8,400.00 |
| 4 | Machinist, 7:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m. Monday - Friday | 350 | HR | 47.00 | 16,450.00 | 75.00 | 26,250.00 | 45.00 | 15,750.00 | | No Bid | 62.50 | 21,875.00 |
| 5 | Machinist, 5:01 p.m. - 7:59 a.m. Monday - Friday | 100 | HR | 47.00 | 4,700.00 | 112.50 | 11,250.00 | 56.50 | 5,650.00 | | No Bid | 93.75 | 9,375.00 |
| 6 | Machinist, City Holiday, Saturday, Sunday | 500 | HR | 52.00 | 26,000.00 | 112.50 | 56,250.00 | 79.00 | 39,500.00 | | No Bid | 125.00 | 62,500.00 |
| 7 | Welder, 7:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m. Monday - Friday | 250 | HR | 47.00 | 11,750.00 | 75.00 | 18,750.00 | 45.00 | 11,250.00 | | No Bid | 42.00 | 10,500.00 |
| 8 | Welder, 5:01 p.m. - 7:59 a.m. Monday - Friday | 100 | HR | 47.00 | 4,700.00 | 112.50 | 11,250.00 | 56.50 | 5,650.00 | | No Bid | 63.00 | 6,300.00 |
| 9 | Welder, City Holiday, Saturday, Sunday | 50 | HR | 52.00 | 2,600.00 | 112.50 | 5,625.00 | 79.00 | 3,950.00 | | No Bid | 84.00 | 4,200.00 |
| 10 | Laborer, 7:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m. Monday - Friday | 100 | HR | 47.00 | 4,700.00 | 70.00 | 7,000.00 | 40.00 | 4,000.00 | | No Bid | 38.00 | 3,800.00 |
| 11 | Laborer, 5:01 p.m. - 7:59 a.m. Monday - Friday | 100 | HR | 47.00 | 4,700.00 | 105.00 | 10,500.00 | 50.00 | 5,000.00 | | No Bid | 57.00 | 5,700.00 |
| 12 | Laborer, City Holiday, Saturday, Sunday | 50 | HR | 52.00 | 2,600.00 | 105.00 | 5,250.00 | 70.00 | 3,500.00 | | No Bid | 76.00 | 3,800.00 |
| | Subtotal: | | | | 122,880.00 | | 233,875.00 | | 142,250.00 | | No Bid | | 175,930.00 |
| Labor Rate for Work Performed at City's Facility: | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| 13 | Mechanic, 7:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m. Monday - Friday | 320 | HR | 75.00 | 24,000.00 | 85.00 | 27,200.00 | 55.00 | 17,600.00 | | No Bid | 42.00 | 13,440.00 |
| 14 | Mechanic, 5:01 p.m. - 7:59 a.m. Monday - Friday | 100 | HR | 100.00 | 10,000.00 | 127.50 | 12,750.00 | 69.00 | 6,900.00 | | No Bid | 63.00 | 6,300.00 |
| 15 | Mechanic, City Holiday, Saturday, Sunday | 50 | HR | 100.00 | 5,000.00 | 127.50 | 6,375.00 | 97.00 | 4,850.00 | | No Bid | 84.00 | 4,200.00 |
| 16 | Machinist, 7:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m. Monday - Friday | 150 | HR | 75.00 | 11,250.00 | 85.00 | 12,750.00 | 60.00 | 9,000.00 | | No Bid | 62.50 | 9,375.00 |
| 17 | Machinist, 5:01 p.m. - 7:59 a.m. Monday - Friday | 100 | HR | 100.00 | 10,000.00 | 127.50 | 12,750.00 | 75.00 | 7,500.00 | | No Bid | 93.75 | 9,375.00 |
| 18 | Machinist, City Holiday, Saturday, Sunday | 250 | HR | 100.00 | 25,000.00 | 127.50 | 31,875.00 | 105.00 | 26,250.00 | | No Bid | 125.00 | 31,250.00 |
| 19 | Welder, 7:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m. Monday - Friday | 125 | HR | 75.00 | 9,375.00 | 85.00 | 10,625.00 | 55.00 | 6,875.00 | | No Bid | 42.00 | 5,250.00 |
| 20 | Welder, 5:01 p.m. - 7:59 a.m. Monday - Friday | 50 | HR | 100.00 | 5,000.00 | 127.50 | 6,375.00 | 69.00 | 3,450.00 | | No Bid | 63.00 | 3,150.00 |
| 21 | Welder, City Holiday, Saturday, Sunday | 100 | HR | 100.00 | 10,000.00 | 127.50 | 12,750.00 | 97.00 | 9,700.00 | | No Bid | 84.00 | 8,400.00 |
| 22 | Laborer, 7:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m. Monday - Friday | 100 | HR | 75.00 | 7,500.00 | 75.00 | 7,500.00 | 50.00 | 5,000.00 | | No Bid | 38.00 | 3,800.00 |
| 23 | Laborer, 5:01 p.m. - 7:59 a.m. Monday - Friday | 100 | HR | 100.00 | 10,000.00 | 112.50 | 11,250.00 | 63.00 | 6,300.00 | | No Bid | 57.00 | 5,700.00 |
| 24 | Laborer, City Holiday, Saturday, Sunday | 50 | HR | 100.00 | 5,000.00 | 112.50 | 5,625.00 | 88.00 | 4,400.00 | | No Bid | 76.00 | 3,800.00 |
| | Subtotal: | | | | 132,125.00 | | 157,825.00 | | 107,825.00 | | No Bid | | 104,040.00 |
| | Total (Line 19 plus 33) | | | | \$255,005.00 | | \$391,700.00 | | \$250,075.00 | | No Bid | | \$279,970.00 |
| | SBE Discount: | | | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | | | \$0.00 |
| | 2%-10 Days Discount: | | | | \$0.00 | | \$7,834.00 | | \$0.00 | | | | \$5,599.40 |
| | Total: | | | | \$255,005.00 | | \$383,866.00 | | \$250,075.00 | | | | \$274,370.60 |

City of St. Petersburg
Bid Tabulation
Purchasing Materials Management

| Item No. | Description | Est. Qty. | UOM | DJ/PJ Inc. dba JW Appley & Son Clearwater, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: Not Specified | | Gemini Enterprises of South FL Inc. dba Electro Mechanical South Sarasota, FL Terms: 2%-10 Days Delivery: 4 Weeks | | Tampa Armature Works, Inc. Riverview, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: Not Specified | | Southeastern Wastewater Equipment Corp. dba Southeastern Pump Ft. Lauderdale, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 7-28 Days | | Process Equipment Repair Services Tampa, FL Terms: 2%-10 Days Delivery: 10 Days | |
|----------|-------------------|-----------|-----|---|----------------|--|----------------|--|----------------|--|----------------|--|----------------|
| | | | | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price |
| | Discount Schedule | | | | 0% | | Cost+15% | | Cost+20% | | 2-5% | | 15-30% |

Statement of No Bid:

Godwin Pumps of America, Inc.
Motion Industries
Hydraulic Professionals
Flanders Electric Motor Service
Diversified Drilling Corp.
Piper Fire Protection
Carter & VerPlanck, Inc.