

City of St. Petersburg
Bid Tabulation
Purchasing and Materials Management

Item No.	Description	EAU*	UOM**	Cemex, Inc. dba Cemex Construction Materials FL Tampa, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 1 Day		Davis Concrete, Inc. Clearwater, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 2 Days		Florida Rock Industries, Inc. Tampa, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 2 Days		Frontier Ready Mix, Inc. Pinellas Park, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 2 Days	
				Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
Pricing includes delivery to site location for Item No.'s 1,3,4,5).											
1	Concrete, Ready Mix (Minimum 5 Cubic Yards)										
	3000 PSI (Minimum 2 - 5 cy)	50	CU YD	\$95.00	\$4,750.00		No Bid	\$101.00	\$5,050.00	\$98.00	\$4,900.00
	3000 PSI (Minimum 6 - 10 cy)	3,150	CU YD	95.00	299,250.00	\$91.75	\$289,012.50	101.00	318,150.00	95.00	299,250.00
	3000 PSI (Minimum 10+ cy)	100	CU YD	95.00	9,500.00	\$1.75	9,175.00	101.00	10,100.00	93.00	9,300.00
2	Concrete, Ready Mix (U-Cart Pick Up Only)										
	3000 PSI - 1/4 cy	30	HR		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
	3000 PSI - 1/2 cy	30	HR		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
	3000 PSI - 3/4 cy	30	HR		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
	3000 PSI - 1 cy	50	HR		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
3	Fiber Mesh Reinforcement										
	(.75 Residential)	20	CU YD	4.00	80.00	5.00	100.00	5.00	100.00	4.00	80.00
	(1 1/2 Commercial)	20	CU YD	8.00	160.00	5.00	100.00	7.00	140.00	5.00	100.00
4	Pumper Rental										
	0-200 feet of hose (Monday - Friday, 6:30am - 5pm)	155	HR		No Bid	150.00	23,250.00		No Bid	80.00	12,400.00
	201+ feet of hose (Monday - Friday, 6:30am - 5pm)	10	HR		No Bid	175.00	1,750.00		No Bid	110.00	1,100.00
	0-200 feet of hose (Monday - Friday, after 5pm)	10	HR		No Bid	175.00	1,750.00		No Bid	90.00	900.00
	201+ feet of hose (Monday - Friday, after 5pm)	10	HR		No Bid	175.00	1,750.00		No Bid	120.00	1,200.00
	0-200 feet of hose (Saturday, 8am - 5pm)	10	HR		No Bid	175.00	1,750.00		No Bid	90.00	900.00
	201+ feet of hose (Saturday, 8am - 5pm)	10	HR		No Bid	175.00	1,750.00		No Bid	120.00	1,200.00
5	Pump Application										
	150 PSI Max (Minimum 0 - 5 cy)	50	HR		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	80.00	4,000.00
	150 PSI Max (Minimum 5+ cy)	50	HR		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	80.00	4,000.00
	Total:				\$313,740.00		\$330,387.50		\$333,540.00		\$339,330.00

* Estimated Annual Usage

**Unit of Measure

Non Responsive: Preferred Materials, Inc.