

City of St. Petersburg
Bid Tabulation
 Purchasing and Materials Management

| Item No. | Description* | Est. Qty. | UOM | NCH Corporation dba Mantek Division Dallas, TX Terms: Not Specified Delivery: 5-7 Days | | Ward Oil Company Inc. Tampa, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 1-3 Days | | J.H. Williams Oil Company, Inc. Tampa, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 2 Days | | G2 Fuel Technologies, LLC Tampa, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 10 Days | |
|----------|--|-----------|------|---|----------------|--|----------------|--|----------------|---|----------------|
| | | | | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price |
| 1 | Oil, Motor, synthetic blend, bulk, 5W20; Citgo Supergard or approved equal | 4,000 | GAL | \$14.90 | \$59,600.00 | \$5.54 | \$22,160.00 | \$5.40 | \$21,600.00 | | No Bid |
| 2 | Oil, Motor, synthetic blend, bulk, 5W30; Citgo Supergard or approved equal | 4,000 | GAL | 14.90 | 59,600.00 | 5.54 | 22,160.00 | 5.35 | 21,400.00 | | No Bid |
| 3 | Oil, Motor, SAE 10W, high detergent, 5 gallon pail, Fina Universal Plus/Total Rubia 11810 or approved Equal | 20 | PAIL | 89.80 | 1,796.00 | 41.30 | 826.00 | 45.00 | 900.00 | | No Bid |
| 4 | Oil, Motor, bulk, 15W-40, CJ-4; 76 Fleet Supreme or approved equal | 8,000 | GAL | 16.80 | 134,400.00 | 6.38 | 51,040.00 | 5.79 | 46,320.00 | | No Bid |
| 5a. | Oil, Engine, SAE 15W 40; 55 gallon drum, 76 T5X or approved equal | 4 | DRUM | 982.30 | 3,929.20 | 416.35 | 1,665.40 | 319.00 | 1,276.00 | | No Bid |
| b. | Oil, Engine, SAE 15W 40; 5 gallon pail, Kappa Premium 15W-40 CJ-4 or approved equal | 44 | PAIL | 122.76 | 5,401.44 | 44.65 | 1,964.60 | 36.50 | 1,606.00 | | No Bid |
| 6a. | Oil, Motor, SAE 30W, ISO 100, 55 gallon drum, Fina Universal Plus/Total Rubia 11830 or approved equal | 4 | DRUM | 875.05 | 3,500.20 | 395.45 | 1,581.80 | 494.45 | 1,977.80 | | No Bid |
| b. | Oil, Motor, SAE 30W, ISO 100, 5 gallon pail, Fina Universal Plus/Total Rubia 11830 or approved equal | 46 | PAIL | 89.80 | 4,130.80 | 41.60 | 1,913.60 | 48.30 | 2,221.80 | | No Bid |
| 7a. | Oil, Motor, heavy duty, SAE 40W; ISO 150; 76 TX5 or approved equal | 560 | GAL | 15.91 | 8,909.60 | 6.42 | 3,595.20 | 6.47 | 3,623.20 | | No Bid |
| b. | Oil, Motor, heavy duty, SAE 40W; ISO 150; 55 gallon drum, Fina Universal Plus/Total Rubia 11840 or approved equal | 7 | DRUM | 875.05 | 6,125.35 | 435.60 | 3,049.20 | 355.95 | 2,491.65 | | No Bid |
| c. | Oil, Motor, heavy duty, SAE 40W; ISO 150; 5 gallon pail, Fina Universal Plus/Total Rubia 11840 or approved equal | 24 | PAIL | 89.80 | 2,155.20 | 41.95 | 1,006.80 | 49.10 | 1,178.40 | | No Bid |
| 8a. | Oil, Tractor hydraulic fluid, Amalie Tractor Hyd or approved equal | 450 | GAL | 17.46 | 7,857.00 | 5.859 | 2,636.55 | 5.10 | 2,295.00 | | No Bid |
| b. | Oil, Tractor hydraulic fluid, 55 gallon drum, Fina Universal Transdraulic Fluid/Total Dynatran SMP 14100 or approved equal | 25 | DRUM | 960.30 | 24,007.50 | 392.15 | 9,803.75 | 330.00 | 8,250.00 | \$1,001.79 | \$25,044.75 |
| c. | Oil, Tractor hydraulic fluid, 5 gallon pail, Fina Universal Transdraulic Fluid/Total Dynatran SMP 14100 or approved equal | 22 | PAIL | 98.80 | 2,173.60 | 36.40 | 800.80 | 39.45 | 867.90 | 100.90 | 2,219.80 |
| 9 | Oil, Hydraulic, heavy duty AW32; ISO 32; 5 gallon pail, Fina Hydran/Total Azollazs 15060 or approved equal | 10 | PAIL | 75.80 | 758.00 | 33.05 | 330.50 | 47.75 | 477.50 | 77.54 | 775.40 |

City of St. Petersburg
Bid Tabulation
 Purchasing and Materials Management

| Item No. | Description* | Est. Qty. | UOM | NCH Corporation dba Mantek Division Dallas, TX Terms: Not Specified Delivery: 5-7 Days | | Ward Oil Company Inc. Tampa, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 1-3 Days | | J.H. Williams Oil Company, Inc. Tampa, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 2 Days | | G2 Fuel Technologies, LLC Tampa, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 10 Days | |
|----------|--|-----------|------|---|----------------|--|----------------|--|----------------|---|----------------|
| | | | | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price |
| 10 | Oil, Hydraulic, heavy duty AW46; ISO 46; 5 gallon pail, Fina Hydran/Total Azollazs 15061 or approved equal | 12 | PAIL | 84.80 | 1,017.60 | 33.10 | 397.20 | 34.00 | 408.00 | 78.81 | 945.72 |
| 11a. | Oil, Hydraulic, bulk, T SAE AW 68; ISO 68; Citgo Milemaster or approved equal | 8,000 | GAL | 11.40 | 91,200.00 | 4.89 | 39,120.00 | 4.77 | 38,160.00 | | No Bid |
| b. | Oil, Hydraulic, bulk, T SAE AW 68; ISO 68; 55 gallon drum, Fina Hydran/Total Azollazs premium AW 68 15062 or approved equal | 2 | DRUM | 795.30 | 1,590.60 | 358.05 | 716.10 | 303.60 | 607.20 | 799.88 | 1,599.76 |
| c. | Oil, Hydraulic, bulk, T SAE AW 68; ISO 68; 5 gallon pail, Fina Hydran/Total Azollazs premium AW 68 15062 or approved equal | 83 | PAIL | 75.55 | 6,270.65 | 33.10 | 2,747.30 | 30.00 | 2,490.00 | 82.54 | 6,850.82 |
| 12 | Oil, Hydraulic, heavy duty AW 150; ISO 150; 5 gallon pail, Fina Hydran/Total Azollazs Premium AW 150 15064 or approved equal | 20 | PAIL | 92.55 | 1,851.00 | 38.80 | 776.00 | 38.00 | 760.00 | | No Bid |
| 13 | Fluid, Transmission, Automatic; Dexron II (No Substitute) | 6 | QT | | No Bid | 2.24 | 13.44 | 3.50 | 21.00 | | No Bid |
| 14 | Fluid, Transmission, automatic, bulk; Dexron III (No Substitute) | 3,000 | GAL | | No Bid | 5.53 | 16,590.00 | 4.75 | 14,250.00 | | No Bid |
| 15 | Fluid, Transmission, automatic, bulk; Dexron IV (No Substitute) | 500 | GAL | | No Bid | 10.16 | 5,080.00 | 11.50 | 5,750.00 | | No Bid |
| 16 | Fluid, Transmission, automatic, bulk; Mercon V (No Substitute) | 2,000 | GAL | | No Bid | 8.98 | 17,960.00 | 8.10 | 16,200.00 | | No Bid |
| 17 | Oil, Transmission, synthetic; 5 gallon pail, Allison TES 295, Allison TranSynd (No Substitute) | 4 | PAIL | | No Bid | 14.81 | 59.24 | 175.00 | 700.00 | | No Bid |
| 18 | Oil, Gear, EP 68; AGMA #2, ISO 68; 5 gallon pail Fina Pontonic N Gear/Total Carter-ST-NA 68 28162 or approved equal | 5 | PAIL | 84.70 | 423.50 | 41.70 | 208.50 | 30.00 | 150.00 | 83.25 | 416.25 |
| 19 | Oil, Gear, EP 100; AGMA #3, ISO 100; 5 gallon pail Fina Pontonic N Gear/Total Carter-ST-NA 100 28163 or approved equal | 12 | PAIL | | No Bid | 41.85 | 502.20 | 45.00 | 540.00 | 83.25 | 999.00 |
| 20 | Oil, Gear, EP 150; AGMA #4, ISO 150; 5 gallon pail 76 Extra Duty EP-4 or approved equal | 42 | PAIL | 79.45 | 3,336.90 | 42.40 | 1,780.80 | 40.00 | 1,680.00 | | No Bid |
| 21 | Oil, Gear, extra heavy, 150; ISO 150; 5 gallon pail | 8 | PAIL | 79.45 | 635.60 | 40.25 | 322.00 | 40.00 | 320.00 | | No Bid |
| | Fina Eolan/Total Cirkanro R & O 150 15164 or approved equal | | | | | | | | | | |

City of St. Petersburg
Bid Tabulation
 Purchasing and Materials Management

| Item No. | Description* | Est. Qty. | UOM | NCH Corporation dba Mantek Division Dallas, TX Terms: Not Specified Delivery: 5-7 Days | | Ward Oil Company Inc. Tampa, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 1-3 Days | | J.H. Williams Oil Company, Inc. Tampa, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 2 Days | | G2 Fuel Technologies, LLC Tampa, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 10 Days | |
|----------|---|-----------|------|---|----------------|--|----------------|--|----------------|---|----------------|
| | | | | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price |
| 22 | Oil, Gear, EP 220; AGMA #5, ISO 220; 5 gallon pail Fina Pontonic N Gear/Total Carter-ST-NA 220 28165 or approved equal | 26 | PAIL | 184.45 | 4,795.70 | 43.00 | 1,118.00 | 40.00 | 1,040.00 | | No Bid |
| 23 | Oil, Gear, EP 320; AGMA #6, ISO 320; 5 gallon pail 76 Extra Duty EP-6 or approved equal | 50 | PAIL | 84.70 | 4,235.00 | 43.10 | 2,155.00 | 45.00 | 2,250.00 | | No Bid |
| 24 | Lubricant, Gear, Multi-Purpose; AGMA #7 ISO 460; 5 gallon pail 76 Extra Duty EP-7 or approved equal | 21 | PAIL | 84.70 | 1,778.70 | 43.20 | 907.20 | 45.00 | 945.00 | | No Bid |
| 25 | Lubricant, Gear, Multi-Purpose; AGMA #8 ISO 680; 5 gallon pail, Fina Pontonic N Gear/Total Carter-ST-NA 680 28168 or approved equal | 30 | PAIL | 84.70 | 2,541.00 | 43.90 | 1,317.00 | 45.00 | 1,350.00 | | No Bid |
| 26 | Oil, Gear, 680-7; ISO 680-7; 5 gallon pail, Chevron Cylinder Oil 680 or approved equal | 2 | PAIL | 84.70 | 169.40 | 45.10 | 90.20 | 45.00 | 90.00 | | No Bid |
| 27 | Gear Lube, 120 lb., 85W-140, 5 gallon pail, Fina Pontonic MPX Gear/Total Transmission-MDL-NA 28159 or approved equal | 5 | PAIL | 103.95 | 519.75 | 39.85 | 199.25 | 43.35 | 216.75 | | No Bid |
| 28 | Gear Lube, 80W-90; 5 gallon pail, 76 MP Gear 80W90 or | 3 | PAIL | 103.95 | 311.85 | 39.25 | 117.75 | 43.68 | 131.04 | 140.35 | 421.05 |
| 29 | Grease, multi-purpose, EP-2, Citgo Premium Lithium EP -2 or | 220 | TUBE | 2.38 | 523.60 | 1.54 | 338.80 | 1.25 | 275.00 | 9.30 | 2,046.00 |
| 30 | Grease, multi-purpose; JT-6; 55 gallon drum, Mystik JT-6 MP Hi Temp Grease (No Substitute) | 20 | DRUM | | No Bid | 791.00 | 15,820.00 | 914.11 | 18,282.20 | | No Bid |
| | Grease, multi-purpose; JT-6; 16 gallon keg, Mystik JT-6 MP Hi Temp Grease (No Substitute) | 40 | KEG | | No Bid | 256.60 | 10,264.00 | 258.01 | 10,320.40 | | No Bid |
| | Grease, multi-purpose; JT-6; tube, Mystik JT-6 MP Hi Temp Grease (No Substitute) | 300 | TUBE | | No Bid | 2.09 | 627.00 | 2.34 | 702.00 | | No Bid |
| 31 | Oil, Turbine, R & O 32; 5 gallon pail, Fina Eolan/Total Cirkanro R & O 32 15160 or approved equal | 10 | PAIL | 114.80 | 1,148.00 | 39.20 | 392.00 | 40.00 | 400.00 | 77.54 | 775.40 |
| 32 | Oil, Turbine, R & O 68; 5 gallon pail, Fina Eolan/Total Cirkanro R & O 68 15162 or approved equal | 10 | PAIL | 109.80 | 1,098.00 | 39.40 | 394.00 | 40.00 | 400.00 | 82.54 | 825.40 |
| 33 | Oil, Turbine, R & O 100; 5 gallon pail, Fina Eolan/Total Cirkanro R & O 100 15163 or approved equal | 11 | PAIL | 109.80 | 1,207.80 | 39.95 | 439.45 | 45.00 | 495.00 | 85.83 | 944.13 |
| 34 | Oil, Turbine, R & O 220; 5 gallon pail, Fina Eolan/Total Cirkanro R & O 220 15165 or approved equal Mobil DTE BB or equal | 252 | PAIL | | No Bid | 40.65 | 10,243.80 | 45.00 | 11,340.00 | | No Bid |

City of St. Petersburg
Bid Tabulation
 Purchasing and Materials Management

| Item No. | Description* | Est. Qty. | UOM | NCH Corporation dba Mantek Division Dallas, TX Terms: Not Specified Delivery: 5-7 Days | | Ward Oil Company Inc. Tampa, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 1-3 Days | | J.H. Williams Oil Company, Inc. Tampa, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 2 Days | | G2 Fuel Technologies, LLC Tampa, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 10 Days | |
|-----------------------------|---|-----------|------|---|---------------------|--|---------------------|--|---------------------|---|--------------------|
| | | | | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price |
| 35 | Oil, Food Grade ISO 200; 5 gallon pail, Citgo Clarion White or | 55 | PAIL | | No Bid | 49.96 | 2,747.80 | 60.00 | 3,300.00 | | No Bid |
| 36 | Oil, Gear, R & O 150; 5 gallon pail, Fina Eolan/Total Cirkanro R & Fina Eolan or equal | 8 | PAIL | | No Bid | 40.65 | 325.20 | 45.00 | 360.00 | | No Bid |
| 37 | Oil, Gear, N 320; 5 gallon pail, 76 Heavy Duty EP-6 or approved | 24 | PAIL | 84.70 | 2,032.80 | 42.85 | 1,028.40 | 45.00 | 1,080.00 | | No Bid |
| 38 | Grease, 1 Temp Lithium base; ISO EP-2; Citgo Lithoplex RT or | 12 | TUBE | | No Bid | 1.83 | 21.96 | 1.80 | 21.60 | | No Bid |
| 39 | Gear Lube, Synthetic, 75-140, 30 LB; 16 gallon keg, 76 Citgo Syn | 20 | KEG | | No Bid | 319.36 | 6,387.20 | 342.00 | 6,840.00 | | No Bid |
| 40a. | Gear Lube, Synthetic, 80-140, 120 LB; 55 gallon drum, Citgo Syn | 20 | DRUM | | No Bid | 1,294.70 | 25,894.00 | 1,100.00 | 22,000.00 | | No Bid |
| b. | Gear Lube, Synthetic, 80-140, 120 LB; 16 gallon keg, Citgo Syn 80W140 or approved equal | 50 | KEG | | No Bid | 385.28 | 19,264.00 | 342.00 | 17,100.00 | | No Bid |
| Total: | | | | | \$451,031.34 | | \$310,898.99 | | \$297,460.44 | | \$43,863.48 |
| 2%-10 Days Discount: | | | | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| SBE Discount: | | | | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| Total: | | | | | \$451,031.34 | | \$310,898.99 | | \$297,460.44 | | \$43,863.48 |

City of St. Petersburg
Bid Tabulation
 Purchasing and Materials Management

| Item No. | Description* | Est. Qty. | UOM | SSI Lubricants LLC dba SSI Petroleum Winter Haven, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 5 Days | | Terrell Industries St. Petersburg, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 1-2 Days | |
|----------|--|-----------|------|---|----------------|--|----------------|
| | | | | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price |
| 1 | Oil, Motor, synthetic blend, bulk, 5W20; Citgo Supergard or approved equal | 4,000 | GAL | \$5.36 | \$21,440.00 | \$6.7394 | \$26,957.60 |
| 2 | Oil, Motor, synthetic blend, bulk, 5W30; Citgo Supergard or approved equal | 4,000 | GAL | 5.31 | 21,240.00 | 6.7394 | 26,957.60 |
| 3 | Oil, Motor, SAE 10W, high detergent, 5 gallon pail, Fina Universal Plus/Total Rubia 11810 or approved Equal | 20 | PAIL | | No Bid | 69.00 | 1,380.00 |
| 4 | Oil, Motor, bulk, 15W-40, CJ-4; 76 Fleet Supreme or approved equal | 8,000 | GAL | 5.80 | 46,400.00 | 7.46 | 59,680.00 |
| 5a. | Oil, Engine, SAE 15W 40; 55 gallon drum, 76 T5X or approved equal | 4 | DRUM | 361.56 | 1,446.24 | 663.00 | 2,652.00 |
| b. | Oil, Engine, SAE 15W 40; 5 gallon pail, Kappa Premium 15W-40 CJ-4 or approved equal | 44 | PAIL | 40.00 | 1,760.00 | 69.00 | 3,036.00 |
| 6a. | Oil, Motor, SAE 30W, ISO 100, 55 gallon drum, Fina Universal Plus/Total Rubia 11830 or approved equal | 4 | DRUM | | No Bid | 575.00 | 2,300.00 |
| b. | Oil, Motor, SAE 30W, ISO 100, 5 gallon pail, Fina Universal Plus/Total Rubia 11830 or approved equal | 46 | PAIL | | No Bid | 69.00 | 3,174.00 |
| 7a. | Oil, Motor, heavy duty, SAE 40W; ISO 150; 76 TX5 or approved equal | 560 | GAL | | No Bid | 7.00 | 3,920.00 |
| b. | Oil, Motor, heavy duty, SAE 40W; ISO 150; 55 gallon drum, Fina Universal Plus/Total Rubia 11840 or approved equal | 7 | DRUM | | No Bid | 663.00 | 4,641.00 |
| c. | Oil, Motor, heavy duty, SAE 40W; ISO 150; 5 gallon pail, Fina Universal Plus/Total Rubia 11840 or approved equal | 24 | PAIL | | No Bid | 69.00 | 1,656.00 |
| 8a. | Oil, Tractor hydraulic fluid, Amalie Tractor Hyd or approved equal | 450 | GAL | | No Bid | 10.00 | 4,500.00 |
| b. | Oil, Tractor hydraulic fluid, 55 gallon drum, Fina Universal Transdraulic Fluid/Total Dynatran SMP 14100 or approved equal | 25 | DRUM | | No Bid | 620.00 | 15,500.00 |
| c. | Oil, Tractor hydraulic fluid, 5 gallon pail, Fina Universal Transdraulic Fluid/Total Dynatran SMP 14100 or approved equal | 22 | PAIL | | No Bid | 75.00 | 1,650.00 |
| 9 | Oil, Hydraulic, heavy duty AW32; ISO 32; 5 gallon pail, Fina Hydran/Total Azollazs 15060 or approved equal | 10 | PAIL | | No Bid | 58.00 | 580.00 |

City of St. Petersburg
Bid Tabulation
 Purchasing and Materials Management

| Item No. | Description* | Est. Qty. | UOM | SSI Lubricants LLC dba SSI Petroleum Winter Haven, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 5 Days | | Terrell Industries St. Petersburg, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 1-2 Days | |
|----------|--|-----------|------|---|----------------|--|----------------|
| | | | | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price |
| 10 | Oil, Hydraulic, heavy duty AW46; ISO 46; 5 gallon pail, Fina Hydran/Total Azollazs 15061 or approved equal | 12 | PAIL | | No Bid | 58.00 | 696.00 |
| 11a. | Oil, Hydraulic, bulk, T SAE AW 68; ISO 68; Citgo Milemaster or approved equal | 8,000 | GAL | 4.35 | 34,800.00 | 6.75 | 54,000.00 |
| b. | Oil, Hydraulic, bulk, T SAE AW 68; ISO 68; 55 gallon drum, Fina Hydran/Total Azollazs premium AW 68 15062 or approved equal | 2 | DRUM | 265.00 | 530.00 | 475.00 | 950.00 |
| c. | Oil, Hydraulic, bulk, T SAE AW 68; ISO 68; 5 gallon pail, Fina Hydran/Total Azollazs premium AW 68 15062 or approved equal | 83 | PAIL | 31.00 | 2,573.00 | 50.00 | 4,150.00 |
| 12 | Oil, Hydraulic, heavy duty AW 150; ISO 150; 5 gallon pail, Fina Hydran/Total Azollazs Premium AW 150 15064 or approved equal | 20 | PAIL | | No Bid | 50.00 | 1,000.00 |
| 13 | Fluid, Transmission, Automatic; Dexron II (No Substitute) | 6 | QT | | No Bid | | No Bid |
| 14 | Fluid, Transmission, automatic, bulk; Dexron III (No Substitute) | 3,000 | GAL | 5.33 | 15,990.00 | 5.39 | 16,170.00 |
| 15 | Fluid, Transmission, automatic, bulk; Dexron IV (No Substitute) | 500 | GAL | | No Bid | | No Bid |
| 16 | Fluid, Transmission, automatic, bulk; Mercon V (No Substitute) | 2,000 | GAL | | No Bid | | No Bid |
| 17 | Oil, Transmission, synthetic; 5 gallon pail, Allison TES 295, Allison TranSynd (No Substitute) | 4 | PAIL | | No Bid | | No Bid |
| 18 | Oil, Gear, EP 68; AGMA #2, ISO 68; 5 gallon pail Fina Pontonic N Gear/Total Carter-ST-NA 68 28162 or approved equal | 5 | PAIL | | No Bid | 65.00 | 325.00 |
| 19 | Oil, Gear, EP 100; AGMA #3, ISO 100; 5 gallon pail Fina Pontonic N Gear/Total Carter-ST-NA 100 28163 or approved equal | 12 | PAIL | | No Bid | 65.00 | 780.00 |
| 20 | Oil, Gear, EP 150; AGMA #4, ISO 150; 5 gallon pail 76 Extra Duty EP-4 or approved equal | 42 | PAIL | | No Bid | 65.00 | 2,730.00 |
| 21 | Oil, Gear, extra heavy, 150; ISO 150; 5 gallon pail | 8 | PAIL | | No Bid | 65.00 | 520.00 |
| | Fina Eolan/Total Cirkanro R & O 150 15164 or approved equal | | | | | | |

City of St. Petersburg
Bid Tabulation
 Purchasing and Materials Management

| Item No. | Description* | Est. Qty. | UOM | SSI Lubricants LLC dba SSI Petroleum Winter Haven, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 5 Days | | Terrell Industries St. Petersburg, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 1-2 Days | |
|----------|--|-----------|------|---|----------------|--|----------------|
| | | | | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price |
| 22 | Oil, Gear, EP 220; AGMA #5, ISO 220; 5 gallon pail Fina Pontonic N Gear/Total Carter-ST-NA 220 28165 or approved equal | 26 | PAIL | | No Bid | 65.00 | 1,690.00 |
| 23 | Oil, Gear, EP 320; AGMA #6, ISO 320; 5 gallon pail 76 Extra Duty EP-6 or approved equal | 50 | PAIL | | No Bid | 65.00 | 3,250.00 |
| 24 | Lubricant, Gear, Multi-Purpose; AGMA #7 ISO 460; 5 gallon pail 76 Extra Duty EP-7 or approved equal | 21 | PAIL | | No Bid | 65.00 | 1,365.00 |
| 25 | Lubricant, Gear, Multi-Purpose; AGMA #8 ISO 680; 5 gallon pail, Fina Pontonic N Gear/Total Carter-ST-NA 680 28168 or approved equal | 30 | PAIL | | No Bid | 65.00 | 1,950.00 |
| 26 | Oil, Gear, 680-7; ISO 680-7; 5 gallon pail, Chevron Cylinder Oil 680 or approved equal | 2 | PAIL | | No Bid | 65.00 | 130.00 |
| 27 | Gear Lube, 120 lb., 85W-140, 5 gallon pail, Fina Pontonic MPX Gear/Total Transmission-MDL-NA 28159 or approved equal | 5 | PAIL | | No Bid | | No Bid |
| 28 | Gear Lube, 80W-90; 5 gallon pail, 76 MP Gear 80W90 or | 3 | PAIL | | No Bid | | No Bid |
| 29 | Grease, multi-purpose, EP-2, Citgo Premium Lithium EP -2 or | 220 | TUBE | | No Bid | | No Bid |
| 30 | Grease, multi-purpose; JT-6; 55 gallon drum, Mystik JT-6 MP Hi Temp Grease (No Substitute) | 20 | DRUM | | No Bid | 770.00 | 15,400.00 |
| | Grease, multi-purpose; JT-6; 16 gallon keg, Mystik JT-6 MP Hi Temp Grease (No Substitute) | 40 | KEG | | No Bid | 311.25 | 12,450.00 |
| | Grease, multi-purpose; JT-6; tube, Mystik JT-6 MP Hi Temp Grease (No Substitute) | 300 | TUBE | | No Bid | 2.40 | 720.00 |
| 31 | Oil, Turbine, R & O 32; 5 gallon pail, Fina Eolan/Total Cirkanro R & O 32 15160 or approved equal | 10 | PAIL | | No Bid | 70.00 | 700.00 |
| 32 | Oil, Turbine, R & O 68; 5 gallon pail, Fina Eolan/Total Cirkanro R & O 68 15162 or approved equal | 10 | PAIL | | No Bid | 70.00 | 700.00 |
| 33 | Oil, Turbine, R & O 100; ISO 100; 5 gallon pail, Fina Eolan/Total Cirkanro R & O 100 15163 or approved equal | 11 | PAIL | | No Bid | 70.00 | 770.00 |
| 34 | Oil, Turbine, R & O 220; 5 gallon pail, Fina Eolan/Total Cirkanro R & O 220 15165 or approved equal Mobil DTE BB or equal | 252 | PAIL | | No Bid | 65.00 | 16,380.00 |

City of St. Petersburg
Bid Tabulation
 Purchasing and Materials Management

| Item No. | Description* | Est. Qty. | UOM | SSI Lubricants LLC dba SSI Petroleum Winter Haven, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 5 Days | | Terrell Industries St. Petersburg, FL Terms: Net 30 Days Delivery: 1-2 Days | |
|-----------------------------|--|-----------|------|---|---------------------|--|---------------------|
| | | | | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price |
| 35 | Oil, Food Grade ISO 200; 5 gallon pail, Citgo Clarion White or | 55 | PAIL | | No Bid | | No Bid |
| 36 | Oil, Gear, R & O 150; 5 gallon pail, Fina Eolan/Total Cirkanro R & Fina Eolan or equal | 8 | PAIL | | No Bid | 65.00 | 520.00 |
| 37 | Oil, Gear, N 320; 5 gallon pail, 76 Heavy Duty EP-6 or approved | 24 | PAIL | | No Bid | 65.00 | 1,560.00 |
| 38 | Grease, 1 Temp Lithium base; ISO EP-2; Citgo Lithoplex RT or | 12 | TUBE | | No Bid | | No Bid |
| 39 | Gear Lube, Synthetic, 75-140, 30 LB; 16 gallon keg, 76 Citgo Syn | 20 | KEG | | No Bid | | No Bid |
| 40a. | Gear Lube, Synthetic, 80-140, 120 LB; 55 gallon drum, Citgo Syn | 20 | DRUM | | No Bid | | No Bid |
| b. | 80W140 or approved equal | 50 | KEG | | No Bid | | No Bid |
| Total: | | | | | \$146,179.24 | | \$297,490.20 |
| 2%-10 Days Discount: | | | | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| SBE Discount: | | | | | \$0.00 | | \$11,899.61 |
| Total: | | | | | \$146,179.24 | | \$285,590.59 |