

City of St. Petersburg
Bid Tabulation
 Purchasing and Materials Management

				Sanders Construction, Inc.	KML Enterprises, Inc. dba R.B.C.	AGT Construction Services, Inc. dba AGT Builders
				St. Petersburg, FL Delivery: 60 Days Terms: 2%-10 Days	St. Pete Beach, FL Delivery: 30 Days Terms: Net 30 Days	Bokeelia, FL Delivery: 60 Days Terms: Net 30 Days
Item No.	Description	Qty.	UOM	Extended Price	Extended Price	Extended Price
1	2581 - 36th Ave North In accordance with IFBC #7004	1	JOB	\$35,685.00	\$37,795.00	\$37,548.64
2	RH-2581 Allowances Permits	1	JOB	500.00	500.00	500.00
Sub Total:				\$36,185.00	\$38,295.00	\$38,048.64
Discount 2%-10 Days:				723.70		
Total:				\$35,461.30	\$38,295.00	\$38,048.64

Item No.	Description	Qty.	UOM	Extended Price	Extended Price	Extended Price
1	3701 Queen Street North In accordance with IFBC #7004	1	JOB	\$48,980.00	\$61,571.00	No Bid
2	RH-3701 Allowances Permits	1	JOB	500.00	500.00	
Sub Total:				\$49,480.00	\$62,071.00	
Discount 2%-10 Days:				989.60		
Total:				\$48,490.40	\$62,071.00	No Bid

Contractor's discount if awarded both homes. Note:
 contractor must bid both homes to receive any discount in
 bid calculation.

4%

Not Specified

Not Applicable

Statement of No Bid:

Richard Eaton Builders, Inc.
 Ageless Construction, Inc.
 Seven Oaks
 Sports Turf One, Inc.
 DeBolt Construction

Non-Responsive:

Aron Electric, Inc.

City of St. Petersburg
Bid Tabulation
 Purchasing and Materials Management

				Home Accessibility Solutions, Inc. St. Petersburg, FL Delivery: 30 Days Terms: Not Specified	Above All Caulking & Waterproofing, Inc. Clearwater, FL Delivery: 40 Days Terms: Net 30 Days	Leisure Construction, Inc. Largo, FL Delivery: 96 Days Terms: Net 30 Days
Item No.	Description	Qty.	UOM	Extended Price	Extended Price	Extended Price
1	2581 - 36th Ave North In accordance with IFBC #7004	1	JOB	\$64,088.00	\$51,807.34	\$32,491.00
2	RH-2581 Allowances Permits	1	JOB	500.00	500.00	500.00
		Sub Total:		\$64,588.00	\$52,307.34	\$32,991.00
		Discount 2%-10 Days:				
		Total:		\$64,588.00	\$52,307.34	\$32,991.00

Item No.	Description	Qty.	UOM	Extended Price	Extended Price	Extended Price
1	3701 Queen Street North In accordance with IFBC #7004	1	JOB	\$88,310.00	\$62,666.38	\$44,815.00
2	RH-3701 Allowances Permits	1	JOB	500.00	500.00	500.00
		Sub Total:		\$88,810.00	\$63,166.38	\$45,315.00
		Discount 2%-10 Days:				
		Total:		\$88,810.00	\$63,166.38	\$45,315.00

Contractor's discount if awarded both homes. Note:
 contractor must bid both homes to receive any discount in
 bid calculation.

3.5%

Not Specified

0%

Statement of No Bid:
 Richard Eaton Builders, Inc.
 Ageless Construction, Inc.
 Seven Oaks
 Sports Turf One, Inc.
 DeBolt Construction

Non-Responsive:
 Aron Electric, Inc.

City of St. Petersburg
Bid Tabulation
 Purchasing and Materials Management

				L&D Development, LLC dba Restoration Construction Team Tampa, FL Delivery: 120 Days Terms: Net 30 Days	Michael G. Knettel & Co., Inc. Gulfport, FL Delivery: 10 Days Terms: 2%-Net 10 Days	CW Contracting, LLC St. Petersburg, FL Delivery: 30 Days Terms: Net 30 Days
Item No.	Description	Qty.	UOM	Extended Price	Extended Price	Extended Price
	2581 - 36th Ave North					
1	In accordance with IFBC #7004	1	JOB	\$76,276.87	\$23,881.00	\$44,738.00
	RH-2581 Allowances					
2	Permits	1	JOB	500.00	500.00	500.00
	Sub Total:			\$76,776.87	\$24,381.00	\$45,238.00
	Discount 2%-10 Days:				487.62	
	Total:			\$76,776.87	\$23,893.38	\$45,238.00

Item No.	Description	Qty.	UOM	Extended Price	Extended Price	Extended Price
	3701 Queen Street North					
1	In accordance with IFBC #7004	1	JOB	\$60,441.50	\$33,793.00	\$72,707.00
	RH-3701 Allowances					
2	Permits	1	JOB	500.00	500.00	500.00
	Sub Total:			\$60,941.50	\$34,293.00	\$73,207.00
	Discount 2%-10 Days:				685.86	
	Total:			\$60,941.50	\$33,607.14	\$73,207.00

Contractor's discount if awarded both homes. Note:
 contractor must bid both homes to receive any discount in
 bid calculation.

2.5%

5%

2%

Statement of No Bid:

Richard Eaton Builders, Inc.
 Ageless Construction, Inc.
 Seven Oaks
 Sports Turf One, Inc.
 DeBolt Construction

Non-Responsive:

Aron Electric, Inc.

City of St. Petersburg
Bid Tabulation
 Purchasing and Materials Management

		Taborelli Construction, Inc.		World Class Custom Builders, Inc.	
		Tampa, FL Delivery: 50 Days Terms: Net 30 Days		dba World Class Remodeling & Roofing, Inc. Palm Harbor, FL Delivery: 30 Days Terms: 2%-Net 10 Days	
Item No.	Description	Qty.	UOM	Extended Price	Extended Price
1	2581 - 36th Ave North In accordance with IFBC #7004	1	JOB	\$71,927.00	\$38,074.00
2	RH-2581 Allowances Permits	1	JOB	500.00	500.00
Sub Total:				\$72,427.00	\$38,574.00
Discount 2%-10 Days:					771.48
Total:				\$72,427.00	\$37,802.52

Item No.	Description	Qty.	UOM	Extended Price	Extended Price
1	3701 Queen Street North In accordance with IFBC #7004	1	JOB	\$94,897.00	\$60,047.24
2	RH-3701 Allowances Permits	1	JOB	500.00	500.00
Sub Total:				\$95,397.00	\$60,547.24
Discount 2%-10 Days:					1,210.94
Total:				\$95,397.00	\$59,336.30

Contractor's discount if awarded both homes. Note:
 contractor must bid both homes to receive any discount in
 bid calculation.

Not Specified

3%

Statement of No Bid:

Richard Eaton Builders, Inc.
 Ageless Construction, Inc.
 Seven Oaks
 Sports Turf One, Inc.
 DeBolt Construction

Non-Responsive:

Aron Electric, Inc.