

City of St. Petersburg
Bid Tabulation
 Purchasing and Materials Management

Item No.	Description	Qty.	UOM	Pro-Fit Development, Inc. Tampa, FL Terms: 2%/10, Net 30 Delivery: 100 Days Extended Price	Fuller Construction Group, LLC Tampa, FL Terms: 2%/10, Net 30 Delivery: 100 Days Extended Price
Primary, Large - 1,667 sq. ft. 3482 16th Avenue South					
1	In accordance with IFB No. 7029	1	JOB	\$112,450.00	No Bid
New - 3482 Allowances					
2	Permits	1	JOB	\$1,550.00	
Sub Total:				\$114,000.00	
SBE Discount:				\$5,700.00	
2%/10 Discount:				\$2,280.00	
Total:				\$106,020.00	No bid
Alternate, Small - 1,471 sq. ft. 3482 16th Avenue South					
1	In accordance with IFB No. 7029	1	JOB	\$98,450.00	\$130,000.00
New - 3482 Allowances					
2	Permits	1	JOB	\$1,550.00	\$1,550.00
Sub Total:				\$100,000.00	\$131,550.00
SBE Discount:				\$5,000.00	\$6,577.50
2%/10 Discount:				\$2,000.00	\$2,631.00
Total:				\$93,000.00	\$122,341.50

Statement of No Bid:
 Above All Caulking & Waterproofing, Inc.
 Bettencourt Construction, LLC
 KML Enterprises, Inc. dba R.B.C.
 McMullen Construction

Non Responsive:
 Griffin Contracting, Inc.

City of St. Petersburg
Bid Tabulation
 Purchasing and Materials Management

Item No.	Description	Qty.	UOM	Phoenix Systems Engineering, Inc. Orlando, FL Terms: Net 30 Delivery: 100 Days Extended Price	James E. Decker Construction Co. Lakeland, FL Terms: Net 30 Delivery: 100 Days Extended Price
Primary, Large - 1,667 sq. ft. 3482 16th Avenue South					
1	In accordance with IFB No. 7029	1	JOB	\$128,629.00	\$158,900.00
New - 3482 Allowances					
2	Permits	1	JOB	\$1,550.00	\$1,550.00
Sub Total:				\$130,179.00	\$160,450.00
SBE Discount:				0	0
2%/10 Discount:				0	0
Total:				\$130,179.00	\$160,450.00
Alternate, Small - 1,471 sq. ft. 3482 16th Avenue South					
1	In accordance with IFB No. 7029	1	JOB	\$112,884.54	\$156,900.00
New - 3482 Allowances					
2	Permits	1	JOB	\$1,550.00	\$1,550.00
Sub Total:				\$114,434.54	\$158,450.00
SBE Discount:				0	0
2%/10 Discount:				0	0
Total:				\$114,434.54	\$158,450.00

Statement of No Bid:

Above All Caulking & Waterproofing, Inc.
 Bettencourt Construction, LLC
 KML Enterprises, Inc. dba R.B.C.
 McMullen Construction

Non Responsive:

Griffin Contracting, Inc.