

City of St. Petersburg
Bid Tabulation
 Procurement and Supply Management

Item No.	Description*	Est. Qty.	UOM**	Florida Chemical Supply, Inc.		Lancaster Oil Company, Inc.		Ward Oil Company, Inc.	
				Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
1	Oil, Motor, synthetic blend, bulk, 5W20; Citgo Supergard, 76 Super or approved equal	4,000	GAL	\$7.02000	\$28,080.00	\$9.30000	\$37,200.00	\$7.63000	\$30,520.00
2	Oil, Motor, synthetic blend, bulk, 5W30; Citgo Supergard, 76 Super or approved equal	4,000	GAL	7.12000	28,480.00	8.90000	35,600.00	7.48000	29,920.00
3	Oil, Motor, SAE 10W, high detergent, 5 gallon pail, Fina Universal Plus/Total Rubia S10 1-11810 or approved equal	100	GAL	9.51000	951.00		No Bid	10.64000	1,064.00
4	Oil, Motor, bulk, 15W-40, CJ-4, TBN 8 minimum, 1% or less sulfated ash; 76 Fleet Supreme or approved equal	8,000	GAL	8.25000	66,000.00	8.49000	67,920.00	7.98000	63,840.00
5a.	Oil, Engine, SAE 15W 40, CJ-4, TBN 8 minimum, 1% or less sulfated ash; 55 gallon drum, 76 T5X or approved equal	220	GAL	8.98000	1,975.60	8.96000	1,971.20	9.77000	2,149.40
5b.	Oil, Engine, SAE 15W 40; 5 gallon pail, TBN 8 minimum, 1% or less sulfated ash, Kappa Premium 15W-40 CJ-4, 76 Fleet Supreme or approved equal	220	GAL	9.75000	2,145.00	9.72000	2,138.40	11.27000	2,479.40
6a.	Oil, Motor, SAE 30W, ISO 100, 55 gallon drum, Fina Universal Plus/Total Rubia 1-11830 or approved equal	220	GAL	8.75000	1,925.00	7.00000	1,540.00	9.09000	1,999.80
6b.	Oil, Motor, SAE 30W, ISO 100, 5 gallon pail, Fina Universal Plus/Total Rubia S30 1-11830 or approved equal	230	GAL	9.35000	2,150.50	8.30000	1,909.00	10.71000	2,463.30
7a.	Oil, Motor, heavy duty, bulk, SAE 40W; ISO 150; 76 TX5, Total Rubio 1-11840 or approved equal	560	GAL	8.02000	4,491.20	9.04000	5,062.40	8.09000	4,530.40
7b.	Oil, Motor, heavy duty, SAE 40W; ISO 150; 55 gallon drum, Fina Universal Plus/Total Rubia 11840, 76 T5X or approved equal	385	GAL	8.75000	3,368.75	9.05000	3,484.25	10.18000	3,919.30
7c.	Oil, Motor, heavy duty, SAE 40W; ISO 150; 5 gallon pail, Fina Universal Plus/Total Rubia S40 1-11840 or approved equal	120	GAL	9.35000	1,122.00	10.30000	1,236.00	10.58000	1,269.60
8a.	Oil, Tractor hydraulic fluid, bulk, Amalie Tractor Hyd or approved equal	450	GAL	7.28000	3,276.00	6.40000	2,880.00	7.32000	3,294.00
8b.	Oil, Tractor hydraulic fluid, 55 gallon drum, Fina Universal Transdraulic Fluid/Total Dynatran SMP 14100, Amalie Tractor Hyd or approved equal	1,375	GAL	8.03000	11,041.25	7.60000	10,450.00	9.13000	12,553.75
8c.	Oil, Tractor hydraulic fluid, 5 gallon pail, Fina Universal Transdraulic Fluid/TotalDynatran SMP 14100, Amalie Tractor Hyd, Xcel Super Universal Plus 845-0345-25 or approved equal	110	GAL	8.78000	965.80	8.50000	935.00	9.28000	1,020.80
9	Oil, Hydraulic, heavy duty AW32; ISO 32; 5 gallon pail, Fina Hydran/Total Azollazs 15060, Xcel Premium Hydraulic AW32-845-04124-25 or approved equal	50	GAL	7.79000	389.50	8.00000	400.00	8.61000	430.50
10	Oil, Hydraulic, heavy duty AW46; ISO 46; 5 gallon pail, Fina Hydran/Total Azollazs 15061, Xcel Premium Hyd AW46 845-0413-25 or approved equal	60	GAL	7.79000	467.40	8.60000	516.00	8.61000	516.60
11a.	Oil, Hydraulic, bulk, T SAE AW 68; ISO 68; Citgo Milemaster, 76 Megaflow or approved equal	8,000	GAL	6.29000	50,320.00	6.75000	54,000.00	6.42000	51,360.00
11b.	Oil, Hydraulic, T SAE AW 68; ISO 68; 55 gallon drum, Fina Hydran/Total Azollazs premium AW 68 15062, 76 Megaflow or approved equal	110	GAL	7.04000	774.40	7.20000	792.00	8.34000	917.40
11c.	Oil, Hydraulic, T SAE AW 68; ISO 68; 5 gallon pail, Fina Hydran/Total Azollazs premium AW 68 15062, 76 Megaflow or approved equal	415	GAL	7.79000	3,232.85	8.60000	3,569.00	8.49000	3,523.35
12	Oil, Hydraulic, heavy duty AW 150; ISO 150; 5 gallon pail, Fina Hydran/Total Azollazs Premium AW 150 15064, 76 Unax, Citgo AW or approved equal	100	GAL	9.41000	941.00		No Bid	8.59000	859.00
13	Fluid, Transmission, automatic, bulk, multi-purpose, H III; (Old Dexron III, Mercon) (No Substitute)	3,000	GAL	7.09000	21,270.00	7.10000	21,300.00	7.24000	21,720.00
14	Fluid, Transmission, automatic, bulk; Mercon V (No Substitute)	2,000	GAL	10.65000	21,300.00	14.25000	28,500.00	12.32000	24,640.00

City of St. Petersburg
Bid Tabulation
 Procurement and Supply Management

Item No.	Description*	Est. Qty.	UOM**	Florida Chemical Supply, Inc.		Lancaster Oil Company, Inc.		Ward Oil Company, Inc.	
				Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
15	Oil, Transmission, synthetic; 5 gallon pail, Allison TES 295 approved products only; Castrol TranSynd AN-011001, BP Autran Syn 295 AN-031002, Cognis Emgard 2805 AN-031003, International Fleetrite Synthetic ATF AN-031004, Mobil Delvac Synthetic ATF AN-051005	20	GAL	19.98000	399.60	30.00000	600.00	29.28000	585.60
15a	Oil, Transmission, synthetic; 55 gallon drum, Allison TES 295 approved products only; Castrol TranSynd AN-011001, BP Autran Syn 295 AN-031002, Cognis Emgard 2805 AN-031003, International Fleetrite Synthetic ATF AN-031004, Mobil Delvac Synthetic ATF AN-051005	330	GAL	17.73000	5,850.90	26.50000	8,745.00	27.43000	9,051.90
16	Oil, Gear, EP 68; AGMA #2, ISO 68; 5 gallon pail (35 lb.) Fina Pontonic N Gear/Total Carter-ST-NA 68 28162, Citgo EP Compound or approved equal	175	LB	1.25000	218.75	1.55000	271.25	1.54000	269.50
17	Oil, Gear, EP 100; AGMA #3, ISO 100; 5 gallon pail (35 lb.) Fina Pontonic N Gear/Total Carter-ST-NA 100 28163 or approved equal	420	LB	1.25000	525.00	1.57000	659.40	1.52800	641.76
18	Oil, Gear, EP 150; AGMA #4, ISO 150; 5 gallon pail (35 lb.) 76 Extra Duty EP-4 or approved equal	1,470	LB	1.25000	1,837.50	1.60000	2,352.00	1.55800	2,290.26
19	Oil, Gear, extra heavy, 150; ISO 150; 5 gallon pail (35 lb.) Fina Eolan/Total Cirkan R & O 150 15164, 76 Extra Duty or approved equal	280	LB	1.35000	378.00	1.63000	456.40	1.47300	412.44
20	Oil, Gear, EP 220; AGMA #5, ISO 220; 5 gallon pail (35 lb.) Fina Pontonic N Gear/Total Carter-ST-NA 220 28165, Citgo EP Compound, 76 Extra Duty or approved equal	910	LB	1.35000	1,228.50	1.63000	1,483.30	1.56000	1,419.60
21	Oil, Gear, EP 320; AGMA #6, ISO 320; 5 gallon pail (35 lb.) 76 Extra Duty EP-6, Total Carter STNA 320 or approved equal	1,750	LB	1.35000	2,362.50	1.65000	2,887.50	1.56400	2,737.00
22	Lubricant, Gear, Multi-Purpose; AGMA #7 ISO 460; 5 gallon pail (35 lb.) 76 Extra Duty EP-7, Total Carter STNA 4601-28167 or approved equal	735	LB	1.35000	992.25	1.67000	1,227.45	1.56700	1,151.75
23	Lubricant, Gear, Multi-Purpose; AGMA #8 ISO 680; 5 gallon pail, (35 lb.) Fina Pontonic N Gear/Total Carter-ST-NA 680 28168, Total Carter STNA 680 1-28168 or approved equal	1,050	LB	1.35000	1,417.50	1.68000	1,764.00	1.58700	1,666.35
24	Oil, Gear, 680-7; ISO 680-7; 5 gallon pail (35 lb.), Chevron Cylinder Oil 680, 76 Extra Duty or approved equal	70	LB	1.35000	94.50	1.75000	122.50	1.61100	112.77
25	Gear Lube, 85W-140, 55 gallon drum (400lb.), Fina Pontonic MPX Gear/Total Transmission-MDL-NA 28159, Excel High Performance 85W140 GL5 or approved equal	800	LB	1.49000	1,192.00	1.65000	1,320.00	1.34600	1,076.80
26	Gear Lube, 85W-140, 16 gal. keg (120 lb.), Fina Pontonic MPX Gear/Total Transmission-MDL-NA 28159, Excel High Performance 85W140 GL5 or approved equal	240	LB	1.69000	405.60	1.73000	415.20	1.42000	340.80
27	Gear Lube, 85W-140, 5 gallon pail (35 lb.), Fina Pontonic MPX Gear/Total Transmission-MDL-NA 28159, Excel High Performance 85W140 GL5 or approved equal	175	LB	2.19000	383.25	1.80000	315.00	1.42700	249.73
28	Gear Lube, 80W-90; 5 gallon pail (35 lb.), 76 MP Gear 80W90, Excel High Performance 80W90 845 13124-25 or approved equal	105	LB	2.19000	229.95	1.74000	182.70	1.42100	149.21
29	Grease, multi-purpose, EP-2, 10 - 14oz. tubes/box; Citgo Premium Lithium EP -2 or approved equal	22	BOX	104.13000	2,290.86	20.50000	451.00	13.50000	297.00

City of St. Petersburg
Bid Tabulation
 Procurement and Supply Management

Item No.	Description*	Est. Qty.	UOM**	Florida Chemical Supply, Inc.		Lancaster Oil Company, Inc.		Ward Oil Company, Inc.	
				Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
30a.	Grease, multi-purpose; JT-6; 55 gallon drum (400 lb.), Mystik JT-6 MP Hi Temp Grease (No Substitute)	8,000	LB	2.09000	16,720.00	1.88000	15,040.00	2.49600	19,968.00
30b.	Grease, multi-purpose; JT-6; 16 gallon keg (120 lb.), Mystik JT-6 MP Hi Temp Grease (No Substitute)	4,800	LB	2.19000	10,512.00	1.91000	9,168.00	2.53000	12,144.00
30c.	Grease, multi-purpose; JT-6; 5 gallon pail (35 lb.), Mystik JT-6 MP Hi Temp Grease (No Substitute)	175	LB	2.19000	383.25	2.00000	350.00	2.64000	462.00
30d.	Grease, multi-purpose; JT-6; 10 - 14oz. tubes/box; Mystik JT-6 MP Hi Temp Grease (No Substitute)	30	BOX	130.38000	3,911.40	21.00000	630.00	24.10000	723.00
31	Oil, Turbine, R & O 32; 5 gallon pail (35 lb.), Fina Eolan/Total Cirkan R & O 32 1-15160 or approved equal	350	LB	1.76000	616.00	1.34000	469.00	1.44300	505.05
32	Oil, Turbine, R & O 68; 5 gallon pail (35 lb.), Fina Eolan/Total Cirkan R & O 68 1-15162 or approved equal	350	LB	1.76000	616.00	1.37000	479.50	1.44300	505.05
33	Oil, Turbine, R & O 100; ISO 100; 5 gallon pail (35 lb.), Fina Eolan/Total Cirkan R & O 100 15163 or approved equal	385	LB	1.76000	677.60	1.45000	558.25	1.44300	555.56
34	Oil, Turbine, R & O 220; 5 gallon pail (35 lb.), Fina Eolan/Total Cirkan R & O 220 15165 or approved equal	8,820	LB	1.96000	17,287.20	1.49000	13,141.80	1.48400	13,088.88
35	Oil, Food Grade ISO VG 200; 5 gallon pail (35 lb.), Citgo Clarion White, Fina Vestan 210 White Mineral Oil or approved equal	275	GAL	26.01000	7,152.75	13.60000	3,740.00	11.99000	3,297.25
36	Oil, Gear, R & O 150; 5 gallon pail (35 lb.), Fina Eolan R & O 150 1-15164/Total Cirkan R & O 220 15165 or approved equal	280	LB	1.45000	406.00	1.49000	417.20	1.48400	415.52
37	Oil, Gear, N 320; 5 gallon pail (35 lb.), 76 Heavy Duty EP-6, Total Carter ST NA320 1-28166 or approved equal	840	LB	1.73000	1,453.20		No Bid	1.58300	1,329.72
38	Grease, 1 Temp Lithium base; ISO EP-2, 10 - 14 oz. tubes/box; Citgo Lithoplex RT or approved equal	2	BOX	110.00000	220.00	22.00000	44.00	21.00000	42.00
39	Gear Lube, Synthetic, 75W-90, 30 LB; 16 gallon keg (120 lb.), 76 Citgo Syn Gear 75W90, Amalie Elixer Full Synthetic or approved equal	2,400	LB	2.94000	7,056.00	1.11000	2,664.00	2.92600	7,022.40
40a.	Gear Lube, Synthetic, 80W-140, 400 LB; 55 gallon drum (400 lb.), Citgo Syn 80W140, Triton 76 or approved equal	8,000	LB	2.84000	22,720.00	3.20000	25,600.00	3.52000	28,160.00
40b.	Gear Lube, Synthetic, 80W-140, 120 LB; 16 gallon keg (120 lb.), Citgo Syn 80W140, Triton 76 or approved equal	6,000	LB	2.94000	17,640.00	1.11000	6,660.00	3.49300	20,958.00
Total:					\$381,845.31		\$383,617.70		\$396,619.48

AGMA = American Gear Manufacturers Association
 ISO = International Standards Organization

** UOM Key:
 Tube = 14 oz.
 Pail = 5 gallons
 Keg = 16 gallons
 Drum = 55 gallons
 Gal = Gallon, bulk delivery

City of St. Petersburg
Bid Tabulation
 Procurement and Supply Management

Item No.	Description*	Est. Qty.	UOM**	J.H. Williams Oil Company, Inc.		Port Consolidated, Inc.		Applied Industrial Technologies - Dixie, Inc.	
				Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
1	Oil, Motor, synthetic blend, bulk, 5W20; Citgo Supergard, 76 Super or approved equal	4,000	GAL	\$7.65000	\$30,600.00	\$7.74000	\$30,960.00		No Bid
2	Oil, Motor, synthetic blend, bulk, 5W30; Citgo Supergard, 76 Super or approved equal	4,000	GAL	7.53000	30,120.00	7.74000	30,960.00		No Bid
3	Oil, Motor, SAE 10W, high detergent, 5 gallon pail, Fina Universal Plus/Total Rubia S10 1-11810 or approved equal	100	GAL	14.31000	1,431.00	11.93000	1,193.00		No Bid
4	Oil, Motor, bulk, 15W-40, CJ-4, TBN 8 minimum, 1% or less sulfated ash; 76 Fleet Supreme or approved equal	8,000	GAL	7.95000	63,600.00	7.97000	63,760.00		No Bid
5a.	Oil, Engine, SAE 15W 40, CJ-4, TBN 8 minimum, 1% or less sulfated ash; 55 gallon drum, 76 T5X or approved equal	220	GAL	9.24000	2,032.80	8.59000	1,889.80		No Bid
5b.	Oil, Engine, SAE 15W 40; 5 gallon pail, TBN 8 minimum, 1% or less sulfated ash, Kappa Premium 15W-40 CJ-4, 76 Fleet Supreme or approved equal	220	GAL	12.34000	2,714.80	8.59000	1,889.80		No Bid
6a.	Oil, Motor, SAE 30W, ISO 100, 55 gallon drum, Fina Universal Plus/Total Rubia 1-11830 or approved equal	220	GAL	8.85000	1,947.00	8.48000	1,865.60	17.15000	3,773.00
6b.	Oil, Motor, SAE 30W, ISO 100, 5 gallon pail, Fina Universal Plus/Total Rubia S30 1-11830 or approved equal	230	GAL	9.34000	2,148.20	8.48000	1,950.40	19.80000	4,554.00
7a.	Oil, Motor, heavy duty, bulk, SAE 40W; ISO 150; 76 TX5, Total Rubio 1-11840 or approved equal	560	GAL	8.85000	4,956.00	8.38000	4,692.80		No Bid
7b.	Oil, Motor, heavy duty, SAE 40W; ISO 150; 55 gallon drum, Fina Universal Plus/Total Rubia 11840, 76 T5X or approved equal	385	GAL	8.85000	3,407.25	8.38000	3,226.30	17.15000	6,602.75
7c.	Oil, Motor, heavy duty, SAE 40W; ISO 150; 5 gallon pail, Fina Universal Plus/Total Rubia S40 1-11840 or approved equal	120	GAL	9.34000	1,120.80	8.38000	1,005.60	19.80000	2,376.00
8a.	Oil, Tractor hydraulic fluid, bulk, Amalie Tractor Hyd or approved equal	450	GAL	6.97000	3,136.50	8.05000	3,622.50		No Bid
8b.	Oil, Tractor hydraulic fluid, 55 gallon drum, Fina Universal Transdraulic Fluid/Total Dynatran SMP 14100, Amalie Tractor Hyd or approved equal	1,375	GAL	8.35000	11,481.25	8.08000	11,110.00	16.59000	22,811.25
8c.	Oil, Tractor hydraulic fluid, 5 gallon pail, Fina Universal Transdraulic Fluid/TotalDynatran SMP 14100, Amalie Tractor Hyd, Xcel Super Universal Plus 845-0345-25 or approved equal	110	GAL	8.89000	977.90	8.08000	888.80	19.04000	2,094.40
9	Oil, Hydraulic, heavy duty AW32; ISO 32; 5 gallon pail, Fina Hydran/Total Azollazs 15060, Xcel Premium Hydraulic AW32-845-04124-25 or approved equal	50	GAL	7.90000	395.00	8.89000	444.50	15.34000	767.00
10	Oil, Hydraulic, heavy duty AW46; ISO 46; 5 gallon pail, Fina Hydran/Total Azollazs 15061, Xcel Premium Hyd AW46 845-0413-25 or approved equal	60	GAL	8.10000	486.00	8.89000	533.40	15.34000	920.40
11a.	Oil, Hydraulic, bulk, T SAE AW 68; ISO 68; Citgo Milemaster, 76 Megaflow or approved equal	8,000	GAL	6.75000	54,000.00	8.89000	71,120.00		No Bid
11b.	Oil, Hydraulic, T SAE AW 68; ISO 68; 55 gallon drum, Fina Hydran/Total Azollazs premium AW 68 15062, 76 Megaflow or approved equal	110	GAL	8.10000	891.00	8.89000	977.90	13.15000	1,446.50
11c.	Oil, Hydraulic, T SAE AW 68; ISO 68; 5 gallon pail, Fina Hydran/Total Azollazs premium AW 68 15062, 76 Megaflow or approved equal	415	GAL	8.10000	3,361.50	8.89000	3,689.35	15.34000	6,366.10
12	Oil, Hydraulic, heavy duty AW 150; ISO 150; 5 gallon pail, Fina Hydran/Total Azollazs Premium AW 150 15064, 76 Unax, Citgo AW or approved equal	100	GAL	12.53000	1,253.00	10.39000	1,039.00	15.34000	1,534.00
13	Fluid, Transmission, automatic, bulk, multi-purpose, H III; (Old Dexron III, Mercon) (No Substitute)	3,000	GAL	6.90000	20,700.00	7.78000	23,340.00		No Bid
14	Fluid, Transmission, automatic, bulk; Mercon V (No Substitute)	2,000	GAL	9.88000	19,760.00	12.55000	25,100.00		No Bid

City of St. Petersburg
Bid Tabulation
 Procurement and Supply Management

Item No.	Description*	Est. Qty.	UOM**	J.H. Williams Oil Company, Inc. Tampa, FL Terms: Net 30 Delivery: 2 Days		Port Consolidated, Inc. Tampa, FL Terms: Net 30 Delivery: 2 Days		Applied Industrial Technologies - Dixie, Inc. Tampa, FL Terms: Net 30 Delivery: 14 Days	
				Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
15	Oil, Transmission, synthetic; 5 gallon pail, Allison TES 295 approved products only; Castrol TranSynd AN-011001, BP Autran Syn 295 AN-031002, Cognis Emgard 2805 AN-031003, International Fleetrite Synthetic ATF AN-031004, Mobil Delvac Synthetic ATF AN-051005	20	GAL	34.50000	690.00	22.86000	457.20		No Bid
15a	Oil, Transmission, synthetic; 55 gallon drum, Allison TES 295 approved products only; Castrol TranSynd AN-011001, BP Autran Syn 295 AN-031002, Cognis Emgard 2805 AN-031003, International Fleetrite Synthetic ATF AN-031004, Mobil Delvac Synthetic ATF AN-051005	330	GAL	30.20000	9,966.00	22.86000	7,543.80		No Bid
16	Oil, Gear, EP 68; AGMA #2, ISO 68; 5 gallon pail (35 lb.) Fina Pontonic N Gear/Total Carter-ST-NA 68 28162, Citgo EP Compound or approved equal	175	LB	2.00000	350.00	1.97000	344.75	126.47000	22,132.25
17	Oil, Gear, EP 100; AGMA #3, ISO 100; 5 gallon pail (35 lb.) Fina Pontonic N Gear/Total Carter-ST-NA 100 28163 or approved equal	420	LB	2.00000	840.00	1.97000	827.40	137.20000	57,624.00
18	Oil, Gear, EP 150; AGMA #4, ISO 150; 5 gallon pail (35 lb.) 76 Extra Duty EP-4 or approved equal	1,470	LB	2.01000	2,954.70	1.97000	2,895.90	126.47000	185,910.90
19	Oil, Gear, extra heavy, 150; ISO 150; 5 gallon pail (35 lb.) Fina Eolan/Total Cirkan R & O 150 15164, 76 Extra Duty or approved equal	280	LB	2.01000	562.80	2.04000	571.20	126.47000	35,411.60
20	Oil, Gear, EP 220; AGMA #5, ISO 220; 5 gallon pail (35 lb.) Fina Pontonic N Gear/Total Carter-ST-NA 220 28165, Citgo EP Compound, 76 Extra Duty or approved equal	910	LB	2.00000	1,820.00	1.97000	1,792.70	124.14000	112,967.40
21	Oil, Gear, EP 320; AGMA #6, ISO 320; 5 gallon pail (35 lb.) 76 Extra Duty EP-6, Total Carter STNA 320 or approved equal	1,750	LB	2.00000	3,500.00	1.97000	3,447.50	158.20000	276,850.00
22	Lubricant, Gear, Multi-Purpose; AGMA #7 ISO 460; 5 gallon pail (35 lb.) 76 Extra Duty EP-7, Total Carter STNA 4601-28167 or approved equal	735	LB	2.01000	1,477.35	1.97000	1,447.95	126.47000	92,955.45
23	Lubricant, Gear, Multi-Purpose; AGMA #8 ISO 680; 5 gallon pail, (35 lb.) Fina Pontonic N Gear/Total Carter-ST-NA 680 28168, Total Carter STNA 680 1-28168 or approved equal	1,050	LB	2.04000	2,142.00	2.00000	2,100.00	126.47000	132,793.50
24	Oil, Gear, 680-7; ISO 680-7; 5 gallon pail (35 lb.), Chevron Cylinder Oil 680, 76 Extra Duty or approved equal	70	LB	2.00000	140.00	2.16000	151.20	124.14000	8,689.80
25	Gear Lube, 85W-140, 55 gallon drum (400lb.), Fina Pontonic MPX Gear/Total Transmission-MDL-NA 28159, Excel High Performance 85W140 GL5 or approved equal	800	LB	1.48000	1,184.00	1.71000	1,368.00	1,281.32000	1,025,056.00
26	Gear Lube, 85W-140, 16 gal. keg (120 lb.), Fina Pontonic MPX Gear/Total Transmission-MDL-NA 28159, Excel High Performance 85W140 GL5 or approved equal	240	LB	1.49000	357.60	1.71000	410.40	424.00000	101,760.00
27	Gear Lube, 85W-140, 5 gallon pail (35 lb.), Fina Pontonic MPX Gear/Total Transmission-MDL-NA 28159, Excel High Performance 85W140 GL5 or approved equal	175	LB	1.56000	273.00	1.71000	299.25	126.47000	22,132.25
28	Gear Lube, 80W-90; 5 gallon pail (35 lb.), 76 MP Gear 80W90, Excel High Performance 80W90 845 13124-25 or approved equal	105	LB	1.66000	174.30	1.94000	203.70	137.20000	14,406.00
29	Grease, multi-purpose, EP-2, 10 - 14oz. tubes/box; Citgo Premium Lithium EP -2 or approved equal	22	BOX	16.71000	367.62	2.10000	46.20	47.00000	1,034.00

City of St. Petersburg
Bid Tabulation
 Procurement and Supply Management

Item No.	Description*	Est. Qty.	UOM**	J.H. Williams Oil Company, Inc. Tampa, FL Terms: Net 30 Delivery: 2 Days		Port Consolidated, Inc. Tampa, FL Terms: Net 30 Delivery: 2 Days		Applied Industrial Technologies - Dixie, Inc. Tampa, FL Terms: Net 30 Delivery: 14 Days	
				Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
30a.	Grease, multi-purpose; JT-6; 55 gallon drum (400 lb.), Mystik JT-6 MP Hi Temp Grease (No Substitute)	8,000	LB	2.12000	16,960.00	3.18300	25,464.00		No Bid
30b.	Grease, multi-purpose; JT-6; 16 gallon keg (120 lb.), Mystik JT-6 MP Hi Temp Grease (No Substitute)	4,800	LB	2.22000	10,656.00	3.25300	15,614.40		No Bid
30c.	Grease, multi-purpose; JT-6; 5 gallon pail (35 lb.), Mystik JT-6 MP Hi Temp Grease (No Substitute)	175	LB	2.20000	385.00	3.26500	571.38		No Bid
30d.	Grease, multi-purpose; JT-6; 10 - 14oz. tubes/box; Mystik JT-6 MP Hi Temp Grease (No Substitute)	30	BOX	39.00000	1,170.00	3.12600	93.78		No Bid
31	Oil, Turbine, R & O 32; 5 gallon pail (35 lb.), Fina Eolan/Total Cirkan R & O 32 1-15160 or approved equal	350	LB	2.01000	703.50	1.97500	691.25	76.27000	26,694.50
32	Oil, Turbine, R & O 68; 5 gallon pail (35 lb.), Fina Eolan/Total Cirkan R & O 68 1-15162 or approved equal	350	LB	2.01000	703.50	1.97500	691.25	76.27000	26,694.50
33	Oil, Turbine, R & O 100; ISO 100; 5 gallon pail (35 lb.), Fina Eolan/Total Cirkan R & O 100 15163 or approved equal	385	LB	2.05000	789.25	2.01400	775.39	76.27000	29,363.95
34	Oil, Turbine, R & O 220; 5 gallon pail (35 lb.), Fina Eolan/Total Cirkan R & O 220 15165 or approved equal	8,820	LB	2.07000	18,257.40	1.97500	17,419.50		No Bid
35	Oil, Food Grade ISO VG 200; 5 gallon pail (35 lb.), Citgo Clarion White, Fina Vestan 210 White Mineral Oil or approved equal	275	GAL	14.00000	3,850.00	13.31000	3,660.25	23.62000	6,495.50
36	Oil, Gear, R & O 150; 5 gallon pail (35 lb.), Fina Eolan R & O 150 1-15164/Total Cirkan R & O 220 15165 or approved equal	280	LB	2.07000	579.60	2.03700	570.36		No Bid
37	Oil, Gear, N 320; 5 gallon pail (35 lb.), 76 Heavy Duty EP-6, Total Carter ST NA320 1-28166 or approved equal	840	LB	2.00000	1,680.00	1.96500	1,650.60	158.20000	132,888.00
38	Grease, 1 Temp Lithium base; ISO EP-2, 10 - 14 oz. tubes/box; Citgo Lithoplex RT or approved equal	2	BOX	18.75000	37.50	2.66000	5.32	46.86000	93.72
39	Gear Lube, Synthetic, 75W-90, 30 LB; 16 gallon keg (120 lb.), 76 Citgo Syn Gear 75W90, Amalie Elixer Full Synthetic or approved equal	2,400	LB	4.00000	9,600.00	4.00900	9,621.60		No Bid
40a.	Gear Lube, Synthetic, 80W-140, 400 LB; 55 gallon drum (400 lb.), Citgo Syn 80W140, Triton 76 or approved equal	8,000	LB	3.43800	27,504.00	4.71800	37,744.00		No Bid
40b.	Gear Lube, Synthetic, 80W-140, 120 LB; 16 gallon keg (120 lb.), Citgo Syn 80W140, Triton 76 or approved equal	6,000	LB	3.49000	20,940.00	4.71800	28,308.00		No Bid
Total:					\$401,135.12		\$452,046.98		\$2,365,198.72

AGMA = American Gear Manufacturers Association
 ISO = International Standards Organization

** UOM Key:
 Tube = 14 oz.
 Pail = 5 gallons
 Keg = 16 gallons
 Drum = 55 gallons
 Gal = Gallon, bulk delivery