

City of St. Petersburg
Bid Tabulation
 Procurement and Supply Management

Description	UOM	EAQ	Life Extension Clinics, Inc. dba Life Scan Wellness Centers Tampa, FL Terms: Net 30 Delivery: 1 Day		Lakeside Occupational Medical Centers, Inc. Largo, FL Terms: Net 30 Delivery: Immediately		Company Care Occupational Health Services dba Edward White Hospital St. Petersburg, FL Terms: Net 30 Delivery: 45 Days	
			Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
Group I - Non-Fire/Non-Police Personnel Employment/Post Offer, Promotional, and Re-employment Physical Examinations								
1 Personal History and Medical Examination/Inquiry Form including Physician's Medical Examination Form	EA	120	No Bid	\$0.00	No Charge	\$0.00	No Charge	\$0.00
2 Medical Examination by Physician Measurements and Screenings: Resting Heart Rate Systolic/Diastolic Blood Pressure Height/Weight Temperature Pulmonary Function Test (FEV, FVC, Hearing, Whisper Test Vision	EA	120	No Bid	\$0.00	\$65.00	\$7,800.00	\$70.00	\$8,400.00
3 Back Screen/Evaluation (need determined by essential job functions - only in conjunction with Medical Examination by Physician)	EA	120	No Bid	\$0.00	\$20.00	\$2,400.00	\$15.00	\$1,800.00
4 Laboratory Test, RPF Serology, VDRL	EA	120	No Bid	\$0.00	\$10.00	\$1,200.00	\$13.00	\$1,560.00
5 Laboratory Test, Baseline Testing, Hep A/B/C	EA	120	No Bid	\$0.00	\$65.00	\$7,800.00	\$70.00	\$8,400.00
6 Optional Laboratory Test, Hep B Titer	EA	10	No Bid	\$0.00	\$25.00	\$250.00	\$18.00	\$180.00
7 Optional Hep B Vaccine (per dose)	EA	30	No Bid	\$0.00	\$35.00	\$1,050.00	\$55.00	\$1,650.00
8 Tetanus Vaccine (if not current)	EA	80	No Bid	\$0.00	\$15.00	\$1,200.00	\$25.00	\$2,000.00
9 Laboratory Test, Urinalysis	EA	120	No Bid	\$0.00	\$5.00	\$600.00	\$5.00	\$600.00
10 Laboratory Test, Liver Functions Test	EA	120	No Bid	\$0.00	\$25.00	\$3,000.00	\$12.00	\$1,440.00
11 Diagnostics Tests, Chest X-Ray (PA only)	EA	40	No Bid	\$0.00	\$25.00	\$1,000.00	\$70.00	\$2,800.00
12 Optional Controlled Substance Screening, 5-Panel, HRS Urine Drug Screen	EA	90	No Bid	\$0.00	\$28.00	\$2,520.00	\$35.00	\$3,150.00
13 Optional Controlled Substance Screening, NIDA Urine Drug Screen	EA	60	No Bid	\$0.00	\$28.00	\$1,680.00	\$35.00	\$2,100.00
(Group I) SUBTOTAL				\$0.00		\$30,500.00		\$34,080.00
Group II - Fire Department Personnel Employment/Post Offer Physical Examinations								
14 Personal History and Medical Examination/Inquiry Form including Physician's Medical Examination Form	EA	30	Included	\$0.00	No Charge	\$0.00	No Charge	\$0.00
15 Medical Examination by Physician Measurements and Screenings: Resting Heart Rate Systolic/Diastolic Blood Pressure Height/Weight Temperature Pulmonary Function/Spirometry Audiometric Screening Vision/Titmus II Color Vision Test Baseline Heavy Metals Screen Body Fat Test	EA	30	\$135.00	\$4,050.00	\$250.00	\$7,500.00	\$265.00	\$7,950.00
16 Back Screen/Evaluation (need determined by essential job functions - only in conjunction with Medical Examination by Physician)	EA	120	Included	\$0.00	\$20.00	\$2,400.00	\$15.00	\$1,800.00
17 Laboratory Test, Blood Chemical 24+	EA	30	\$17.00	\$510.00	\$17.00	\$510.00	\$18.00	\$540.00
18 Laboratory Test, Liver Function Test	EA	30	Included	\$0.00	\$25.00	\$750.00	\$12.00	\$360.00
19 Laboratory Test, CBC - Complete Blood Count	EA	30	\$11.00	\$330.00	\$11.00	\$330.00	\$12.00	\$360.00
20 Laboratory Test, HDL Cholesterol and LDL Cholesterol	EA	30	\$11.00	\$330.00	\$24.00	\$720.00	\$20.00	\$600.00
21 Laboratory Test, Coronary Risk Profile (Cholesterol Fractionation)	EA	30	\$24.00	\$720.00	\$24.00	\$720.00	\$20.00	\$600.00
22 Laboratory Test, Tuberculosis PPD/Mantoux Test	EA	30	\$10.00	\$300.00	\$10.00	\$300.00	\$10.00	\$300.00
23 Laboratory Test, Baseline Testing, Hep A/B/C	EA	30	\$65.00	\$1,950.00	\$65.00	\$1,950.00	\$70.00	\$2,100.00
24 Optional Laboratory Test, Hep B Titer	EA	30	\$20.00	\$600.00	\$20.00	\$600.00	\$18.00	\$540.00
25 Optional Hep B Vaccine (per dose)	EA	24	\$45.00	\$1,080.00	\$35.00	\$840.00	\$55.00	\$1,320.00
26 Tetanus Vaccine (if not current)	EA	30	\$15.00	\$450.00	\$15.00	\$450.00	\$25.00	\$750.00
27 Laboratory Test, Urinalysis	EA	30	\$5.00	\$150.00	\$5.00	\$150.00	\$5.00	\$150.00
28 Optional MMR Vaccine	EA	10	\$40.00	\$400.00	\$50.00	\$500.00	\$95.00	\$950.00
29 Diagnostic Test, Chest X-Ray, AP and Lateral (2 views)	EA	30	\$60.00	\$1,800.00	\$43.00	\$1,290.00	\$85.00	\$2,550.00
30 Optional Diagnostic Test, X-Ray Lumbosacral Spine (3 views)	EA	30	\$60.00	\$1,800.00	\$60.00	\$1,800.00	\$100.00	\$3,000.00
31 Diagnostic Test, Stress Test	EA	30	\$125.00	\$3,750.00	\$100.00	\$3,000.00	\$275.00	\$8,250.00
32 Diagnostic Test, Resting 12-lead Electrocardiogram (EKG)	EA	30	\$31.50	\$945.00	\$30.00	\$900.00	\$35.00	\$1,050.00

City of St. Petersburg
Bid Tabulation
Procurement and Supply Management

Description	UOM	EAQ	Life Extension Clinics, Inc. dba Life Scan Wellness Centers Tampa, FL Terms: Net 30 Delivery: 1 Day		Lakeside Occupational Medical Centers, Inc. Largo, FL Terms: Net 30 Delivery: Immediately		Company Care Occupational Health Services dba Edward White Hospital St. Petersburg, FL Terms: Net 30 Delivery: 45 Days	
			Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
33 Laboratory Test-Tuberculosis-Blood test	EA	30	\$65.00	\$1,950.00	\$160.00	\$4,800.00	\$70.00	\$2,100.00
34 Liver, Pancreas, Gall Bladder, Spleen, Kidney, Bladder Ultrasound	EA	30	\$18.00	\$540.00	\$110.00	\$3,300.00	\$145.00	\$4,350.00
35 Carotid Ultrasound	EA	30	\$18.00	\$540.00	\$60.00	\$1,800.00	\$200.00	\$6,000.00
36 Aortic Aneurysm Ultrasound	EA	30	\$18.00	\$540.00	\$60.00	\$1,800.00	\$200.00	\$6,000.00
37 Thyroid Ultrasound	EA	30	\$18.00	\$540.00	\$60.00	\$1,800.00	\$145.00	\$4,350.00
38 Pelvic Ultrasound (woman)	EA	10	\$18.00	\$180.00	\$60.00	\$600.00	\$145.00	\$1,450.00
39 Testicular Ultrasound	EA	20	\$18.00	\$360.00	\$60.00	\$1,200.00	\$145.00	\$2,900.00
40 Controlled Substance Screening, Urine Drug Screen (8-panel)	EA	30	\$28.00	\$840.00	\$20.00	\$600.00	\$35.00	\$1,050.00
(Group II) SUBTOTAL				\$24,655.00		\$40,610.00		\$61,370.00
Group III - Fire Department Personnel Annual Physical Exams								
41 Personal History and Medical Examination/Inquiry Form including Physician's Medical Examination Form	EA	335	Included	\$0.00	No Charge	\$0.00	No Charge	\$0.00
42 Coronary Risk Profile (Cholesterol Fractionation)	EA	335	\$24.00	\$8,040.00	\$24.00	\$8,040.00	\$20.00	\$6,700.00
43 Homocystine Profile (every three years)	EA	335	\$28.00	\$9,380.00	\$72.80	\$24,388.00	\$25.00	\$8,375.00
44 Medical Examination by Physician Measurements and Screenings: Resting Heart Rate Systolic/Diastolic Blood Pressure Height/Weight Temperature Body Fat Test Pulmonary Function/Spirometry Audiometric Screening Vision/Titmus II Color Vision Test	EA	335	\$70.00	\$23,450.00	\$100.00	\$33,500.00	\$265.00	\$88,775.00
45 Laboratory Test, Blood Chemical 24+	EA	335	\$17.00	\$5,695.00	\$17.00	\$5,695.00	\$18.00	\$6,030.00
46 Laboratory Test, Baseline Testing, Hep A/B/C	EA	335	\$65.00	\$21,775.00	\$65.00	\$21,775.00	\$70.00	\$23,450.00
47 Comprehensive Metabolic Panel	EA	335	Included	\$0.00	\$17.00	\$5,695.00	\$18.00	\$6,030.00
48 Cardiac C - Reactive Protein	EA	335	\$20.00	\$6,700.00	\$24.00	\$8,040.00	\$19.00	\$6,365.00
49 Thyroid Panel	EA	335	\$10.00	\$3,350.00	\$85.00	\$28,475.00	\$24.00	\$8,040.00
50 Optional Laboratory Test, Hep B Titer	EA	40	\$20.00	\$800.00	\$20.00	\$800.00	\$18.00	\$720.00
51 Optional Hep B Vaccine (per dose)	EA	60	\$45.00	\$2,700.00	\$35.00	\$2,100.00	\$55.00	\$3,300.00
52 Tetanus Vaccine (if not current)	EA	50	\$15.00	\$750.00	\$15.00	\$750.00	\$25.00	\$1,250.00
53 Laboratory Test, Liver Function Test	EA	335	Included	\$0.00	\$25.00	\$8,375.00	\$12.00	\$4,020.00
54 Laboratory Test, CBC - Complete Blood Count	EA	335	\$11.00	\$3,685.00	\$11.00	\$3,685.00	\$12.00	\$4,020.00
55 Laboratory Test, HDL Cholesterol and LDL Cholesterol	EA	335	\$11.00	\$3,685.00	\$24.00	\$8,040.00	\$20.00	\$6,700.00
56 Laboratory Test, Tuberculosis PPD/Mantoux Test	EA	335	\$10.00	\$3,350.00	\$10.00	\$3,350.00	\$10.00	\$3,350.00
57 Laboratory Test, Urinalysis	EA	335	\$5.00	\$1,675.00	\$5.00	\$1,675.00	\$5.00	\$1,675.00
58 Laboratory Test, Baseline Heavy Metals Screen	EA	335	\$65.00	\$21,775.00	\$150.00	\$50,250.00	\$30.00	\$10,050.00
59 Optional MMR Vaccine	EA	40	\$40.00	\$1,600.00	\$50.00	\$2,000.00	\$95.00	\$3,800.00
60 Diagnostic Test, Resting 12-lead Electrocardiogram (EKG)	EA	335	\$31.50	\$10,552.50	\$30.00	\$10,050.00	\$35.00	\$11,725.00
61 Diagnostic Test, Cardiac Stress Test	EA	335	\$125.00	\$41,875.00	\$100.00	\$33,500.00	\$275.00	\$92,125.00
62 Optional Medical Evaluations/Tests, Chest X-Ray (2 Views) (Every 5 years)	EA	160	\$60.00	\$9,600.00	\$40.00	\$6,400.00	\$85.00	\$13,600.00
63 Optional Medical Evaluations/Tests, X-Ray Lumbosacral Spine (3 views)	EA	160	\$60.00	\$9,600.00	\$60.00	\$9,600.00	\$100.00	\$16,000.00
64 Optional Medical Evaluations/Tests, Breast Examination/Mammogram - Female	EA	50	\$90.00	\$4,500.00	\$125.00	\$6,250.00	\$152.00	\$7,600.00
65 Optional Medical Evaluations/Tests, Cervical Cancer Exam - Female	EA	50	\$47.00	\$2,350.00	\$100.00	\$5,000.00	\$75.00	\$3,750.00
66 Optional Medical Evaluations/Tests, Rectal Cancer Exam (Digital Rectal Exam and Hemocult included in exam)	EA	335	\$27.00	\$9,045.00	No Charge	\$0.00	\$50.00	\$16,750.00
67 Optional Medical Evaluations/Tests, Prostate Exam - Male (Prostatic Specific Antigen - PSA)	EA	285	\$25.00	\$7,125.00	\$30.00	\$8,550.00	\$50.00	\$14,250.00
68 Liver, Pancreas, Gall Bladder, Spleen, Kidney, Bladder Ultrasound	EA	335	\$18.00	\$6,030.00	\$110.00	\$36,850.00	\$145.00	\$48,575.00
69 Carotid Ultrasound	EA	335	\$18.00	\$6,030.00	\$60.00	\$20,100.00	\$200.00	\$67,000.00
70 Aortic Aneurysm Ultrasound	EA	335	\$18.00	\$6,030.00	\$60.00	\$20,100.00	\$200.00	\$67,000.00
71 Thyroid Ultrasound	EA	335	\$18.00	\$6,030.00	\$60.00	\$20,100.00	\$145.00	\$48,575.00
72 Pelvic Ultrasound (woman)	EA	50	\$18.00	\$900.00	\$60.00	\$3,000.00	\$145.00	\$7,250.00
73 Testicular Ultrasound	EA	285	\$18.00	\$5,130.00	\$60.00	\$17,100.00	\$145.00	\$41,325.00
74 HIV Screening	EA	335	\$15.00	\$5,025.00	\$36.00	\$12,060.00	\$25.00	\$8,375.00
75 Skin Screening-Cancer	EA	335	Included	\$0.00	No Charge	\$0.00	\$40.00	\$13,400.00
76 Lab Test- Blood Sample- Tuberculosis, QuantiFeron Gold	EA	335	\$65.00	\$21,775.00	\$160.00	\$53,600.00	\$70.00	\$23,450.00

City of St. Petersburg
Bid Tabulation
Procurement and Supply Management

Description	UOM	EAQ	Life Extension Clinics, Inc. dba Life Scan Wellness Centers Tampa, FL Terms: Net 30 Delivery: 1 Day		Lakeside Occupational Medical Centers, Inc. Largo, FL Terms: Net 30 Delivery: Immediately		Company Care Occupational Health Services dba Edward White Hospital St. Petersburg, FL Terms: Net 30 Delivery: 45 Days	
			Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
77 Medical Evaluations/Tests, Stress 12-Lead Electrocardiogram	EA	10	\$125.00	\$1,250.00	\$100.00	\$1,000.00	\$275.00	\$2,750.00
78 Diabetes Test	EA	335	Included	\$0.00	\$10.00	\$3,350.00	\$17.00	\$5,695.00
79 Pulmonary Function Test	EA	335	Included	\$0.00	\$25.00	\$8,375.00	\$35.00	\$11,725.00
80 Breast Exam for Men	EA	335	Included	\$0.00	No Charge	\$0.00	\$40.00	\$13,400.00
81 Echocardiogram	EA	335	\$18.00	\$6,030.00	\$60.00	\$20,100.00	\$428.00	\$143,380.00
82 Hemmocult Study	EA	335	Included	\$0.00	\$5.00	\$1,675.00	\$25.00	\$8,375.00
83 OSHA Respirator Medical Clearance	EA	335	Included	\$0.00	\$20.00	\$6,700.00	\$35.00	\$11,725.00
84 Personal Consultation with review of testing results	EA	335	Included	\$0.00	No Charge	\$0.00	\$35.00	\$11,725.00
(Group III) SUBTOTAL				\$277,287.50		\$520,093.00		\$902,175.00
Group IV - Police Department Personnel Employment/Post offer Physical Examinations								
85 Personal History and Medical Examination/Inquiry Form including Physician's Medical Examination Form	EA	30	Included	\$0.00	No Charge	\$0.00	No Charge	\$0.00
86 Medical Examination by Physician Measurements and Screenings: Resting Heart Rate Systolic/Diastolic Blood Pressure Height/Weight Temperature Pulmonary Function/Spirometry Vision/Titmus II Color Vision Test Body Fat Test Audiometric Screening	EA	30	\$70.00	\$2,100.00	\$130.00	\$3,900.00	\$135.00	\$4,050.00
87 Back Screen/Evaluation (need determined by essential job functions - only in conjunction with Medical Examination by Physician)	EA	120	Included	\$0.00	\$20.00	\$2,400.00	\$15.00	\$1,800.00
88 Laboratory Test, Blood Chemical 24+	EA	30	\$17.00	\$510.00	\$17.00	\$510.00	\$18.00	\$540.00
89 Laboratory Test, Liver Function Test	EA	30	Included	\$0.00	\$25.00	\$750.00	\$12.00	\$360.00
90 Laboratory Test, CBC - Complete Blood Count	EA	30	\$11.00	\$330.00	\$11.00	\$330.00	\$12.00	\$360.00
91 Laboratory Test, HDL Cholesterol and LDL Cholesterol	EA	30	\$11.00	\$330.00	\$24.00	\$720.00	\$20.00	\$600.00
92 Laboratory Test, Coronary Risk Profile (Cholesterol Fractionation)	EA	30	\$24.00	\$720.00	\$24.00	\$720.00	\$20.00	\$600.00
93 Laboratory Test, Tuberculosis PPD/Mantoux Test	EA	30	\$10.00	\$300.00	\$10.00	\$300.00	\$10.00	\$300.00
94 Laboratory Test, Baseline Testing, Hep A/B/C	EA	30	\$65.00	\$1,950.00	\$65.00	\$1,950.00	\$70.00	\$2,100.00
95 Optional Laboratory Test, Hep B Titer	EA	30	\$20.00	\$600.00	\$20.00	\$600.00	\$18.00	\$540.00
96 Optional Hep B Vaccine (per dose)	EA	24	\$45.00	\$1,080.00	\$35.00	\$840.00	\$55.00	\$1,320.00
97 Tetanus Vaccine (if not current)	EA	30	\$15.00	\$450.00	\$15.00	\$450.00	\$25.00	\$750.00
98 Laboratory Test, Urinalysis	EA	30	\$5.00	\$150.00	\$5.00	\$150.00	\$5.00	\$150.00
99 MMR Vaccine (optional)	EA	10	\$40.00	\$400.00	\$50.00	\$500.00	\$95.00	\$950.00
100 Diagnostic Test, Chest X-Ray, AP and Lateral (2 views)	EA	30	\$60.00	\$1,800.00	\$40.00	\$1,200.00	\$85.00	\$2,550.00
101 Diagnostic Test, X-Ray LumboSacral Spine (3 views)	EA	30	\$60.00	\$1,800.00	\$60.00	\$1,800.00	\$100.00	\$3,000.00
102 Optional Diagnostic Test, Stress Test	EA	10	\$125.00	\$1,250.00	\$100.00	\$1,000.00	\$275.00	\$2,750.00
103 Diagnostic Test, Resting 12-lead Electrocardiogram (EKG)	EA	30	\$31.50	\$945.00	\$30.00	\$900.00	\$35.00	\$1,050.00
104 Controlled Substance Screening, Urine Drug Screen (8-panel)	EA	30	\$28.00	\$840.00	\$20.00	\$600.00	\$35.00	\$1,050.00
(Group IV) SUBTOTAL				\$15,555.00		\$19,620.00		\$24,820.00
Group V - Police Department Personnel Health Examinations								
105 Personal History and Medical Examination/Inquiry Form including Physician's Medical Examination Form	EA	97	Included	\$0.00	No Charge	\$0.00	No Charge	\$0.00
106 Coronary Risk Profile (Cholesterol Fractionation)	EA	97	\$24.00	\$2,328.00	\$24.00	\$2,328.00	\$20.00	\$1,940.00
107 Homocystine Profile (every three years)	EA	97	\$28.00	\$2,716.00	\$72.80	\$7,061.60	\$25.00	\$2,425.00
108 Medical Examination by Physician Measurements and Screenings: Resting Heart Rate Systolic/Diastolic Blood Pressure Height/Weight Temperature Body Fat Test Pulmonary Function/Spirometry Audiometric Screening Vision/Titmus II Color Vision Test	EA	97	\$70.00	\$6,790.00	\$100.00	\$9,700.00	\$150.00	\$14,550.00
109 Laboratory Test, Blood Chemical 24+	EA	97	\$17.00	\$1,649.00	\$17.00	\$1,649.00	\$18.00	\$1,746.00
110 Laboratory Test, Baseline Testing, Hep A/B/C	EA	97	\$65.00	\$6,305.00	\$65.00	\$6,305.00	\$70.00	\$6,790.00

City of St. Petersburg
Bid Tabulation
Procurement and Supply Management

Description	UOM	EAQ	Life Extension Clinics, Inc. dba Life Scan Wellness Centers Tampa, FL Terms: Net 30 Delivery: 1 Day		Lakeside Occupational Medical Centers, Inc. Largo, FL Terms: Net 30 Delivery: Immediately		Company Care Occupational Health Services dba Edward White Hospital St. Petersburg, FL Terms: Net 30 Delivery: 45 Days	
			Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
111 Optional Laboratory Test, Hep B Titer	EA	10	\$20.00	\$200.00	\$20.00	\$200.00	\$18.00	\$180.00
112 Optional Hep B Vaccine (per dose)	EA	30	\$45.00	\$1,350.00	\$35.00	\$1,050.00	\$55.00	\$1,650.00
113 Tetanus Vaccine (if not current)	EA	97	\$15.00	\$1,455.00	\$15.00	\$1,455.00	\$25.00	\$2,425.00
114 Laboratory Test, Liver Function Test	EA	97	Included	\$0.00	\$20.00	\$1,940.00	\$12.00	\$1,164.00
115 Laboratory Test, CBC - Complete Blood Count	EA	97	\$11.00	\$1,067.00	\$11.00	\$1,067.00	\$12.00	\$1,164.00
116 Laboratory Test, HDL Cholesterol and LDL Cholesterol	EA	97	\$11.00	\$1,067.00	\$24.00	\$2,328.00	\$20.00	\$1,940.00
117 Laboratory Test, Tuberculosis PPD/Mantoux Test	EA	97	\$10.00	\$970.00	\$10.00	\$970.00	\$10.00	\$970.00
118 Laboratory Test, Urinalysis	EA	97	\$5.00	\$485.00	\$5.00	\$485.00	\$5.00	\$485.00
119 MMR Vaccine (optional)	EA	30	\$15.00	\$450.00	\$50.00	\$1,500.00	\$95.00	\$2,850.00
120 Diagnostic Test, Resting 12-lead Electrocardiogram (EKG)	EA	97	\$31.50	\$3,055.50	\$30.00	\$2,910.00	\$35.00	\$3,395.00
121 Diagnostic Test, Stress Test	EA	97	\$125.00	\$12,125.00	\$100.00	\$9,700.00	\$275.00	\$26,675.00
122 Diagnostic Test, Chest X-Ray (2 views)	EA	97	\$60.00	\$5,820.00	\$40.00	\$3,880.00	\$85.00	\$8,245.00
123 Optional Skin Screening-Cancer	EA	97	Included	\$0.00	No Charge	\$0.00	\$40.00	\$3,880.00
124 Optional HIV Screening	EA	97	\$15.00	\$1,455.00	\$36.00	\$3,492.00	\$25.00	\$2,425.00
125 Optional Diagnostic Test, X-Ray Lumbosacral Spine (3 views)	EA	97	\$60.00	\$5,820.00	\$60.00	\$5,820.00	\$100.00	\$9,700.00
126 Optional Medical Evaluations/Tests, Breast Examination/Mammogram - Female	EA	24	\$90.00	\$2,160.00	\$125.00	\$3,000.00	\$152.00	\$3,648.00
127 Optional Medical Evaluations/Tests, Cervical Cancer Exam - Female	EA	24	\$47.00	\$1,128.00	\$100.00	\$2,400.00	\$75.00	\$1,800.00
128 Optional Medical Evaluations/Tests, Rectal Cancer Exam (Digital Rectal Exam and Hemoccult included in exam)	EA	97	\$27.00	\$2,619.00	No Charge	\$0.00	\$50.00	\$4,850.00
129 Optional Medical Evaluations/Tests, Prostate Exam - Male (Prostatic Specific Antigen - PSA)	EA	97	\$25.00	\$2,425.00	\$30.00	\$2,910.00	\$50.00	\$4,850.00
130 Optional Medical Evaluations/Tests, Stress 12-Lead Electrocardiogram	EA	97	\$125.00	\$12,125.00	\$100.00	\$9,700.00	\$275.00	\$26,675.00
(Group V) SUBTOTAL				\$75,564.50		\$81,850.60		\$136,422.00
Group VI - Police Steroid Testing								
131 Anabolic Steroid Test	EA	25	\$150.00	\$3,750.00	\$100.00	\$2,500.00	\$160.00	\$4,000.00
(Group VI) SUBTOTAL				\$3,750.00		\$2,500.00		\$4,000.00
Group VII - Respirator Examinations (OSHA/NIOSH Mandated)								
132 Respirator Physical Examination Form/Respirator Medical History Form	EA	47	No Bid	\$0.00	\$10.00	\$470.00	\$15.00	\$705.00
133 Respirator Examinations by Physician Measurements and Screenings: Resting Heart Rate Height/Weight Temperature Vision Screen Pulmonary Function Test (FEV, FVC, Hearing Whisper Test	EA	47	No Bid	\$0.00	\$145.00	\$6,815.00	\$55.00	\$2,585.00
(Group VII) SUBTOTAL				\$0.00		\$7,285.00		\$3,290.00
Group VIII - Independent Medical Evaluation								
134 Medical Record Review and Written Report of Findings	EA	4	No Bid	\$0.00	\$150.00	\$600.00	\$150.00	\$600.00
135 Referral(s) to Sub-specialist (i.e. orthopedist, neurologist)	EA	4	No Bid	\$0.00	No Charge	\$0.00	No Charge	\$0.00
(Group VIII) SUBTOTAL				\$0.00		\$600.00		\$600.00
Group IX - Representation								
136 Representation at administrative hearings for challenged results of medical examinations	EA	1	No Bid	\$0.00	\$250.00/hr	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
137 Expert testimony in a court of law for challenged results of medical examinations	EA	1	No Bid	\$0.00	\$300.00/hr	\$300.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
(Group IX) SUBTOTAL				\$0.00		\$550.00		\$500.00
Group X - Controlled Substance Testing								
138 Controlled Substance Testing, DOT 5 panel urine screen, initial and confirmation of all positives	EA	225	No Bid	\$0.00	\$20.00	\$4,500.00	\$35.00	\$7,875.00
139 Controlled Substance Screening, Urine Drug Screen (8-panel)	EA	30	No Bid	\$0.00	\$20.00	\$600.00	\$35.00	\$1,050.00
140 Alcohol Testing, DOT blood alcohol (evidential breath alcohol BAT)	EA	50	No Bid	\$0.00	\$35.00	\$1,750.00	\$20.00	\$1,000.00

City of St. Petersburg
Bid Tabulation
Procurement and Supply Management

Description	UOM	EAQ	Life Extension Clinics, Inc. dba Life Scan Wellness Centers Tampa, FL Terms: Net 30 Delivery: 1 Day		Lakeside Occupational Medical Centers, Inc. Largo, FL Terms: Net 30 Delivery: Immediately		Company Care Occupational Health Services dba Edward White Hospital St. Petersburg, FL Terms: Net 30 Delivery: 45 Days	
			Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
141 Controlled Substance Testing, DOT Split Sample Lab Second Opinion (usually ordered by employee)	EA	4	No Bid	\$0.00	\$250.00	\$1,000.00	\$200.00	\$800.00
142 Controlled Substance Testing, Non-DOT 5 panel urine screen, initial and confirmation of all positives	EA	300	No Bid	\$0.00	\$20.00	\$6,000.00	\$35.00	\$10,500.00
143 Alcohol Testing, Non DOT blood alcohol (evidential breath alcohol BAT)	EA	20	No Bid	\$0.00	\$35.00	\$700.00	\$25.00	\$500.00
144 Alcohol Testing, Blood Alcohol Test (blood draw)	EA	20	No Bid	\$0.00	\$35.00	\$700.00	\$90.00	
145 After Hours Fee	EA	10	No Bid	\$0.00	\$50.00	\$500.00	\$75.00	\$750.00
146 Drug Screen Litigation Records Packet	EA	10	No Bid	\$0.00	\$250.00	\$2,500.00	\$75.00	\$750.00
(Group X) SUBTOTAL				\$0.00		\$18,250.00		\$23,225.00
Group XI - Miscellaneous Vaccines and Tests								
147 Tetanus Vaccine	EA	20	No Bid	\$0.00	\$15.00	\$300.00	\$25.00	\$500.00
148 Laboratory Test, Baseline Heavy Metals Screen	EA	20	No Bid	\$0.00	\$150.00	\$3,000.00	\$30.00	\$600.00
149 Laboratory Test, Baseline Testing for Hep A/B/C	EA	10	No Bid	\$0.00	\$65.00	\$650.00	\$70.00	\$700.00
150 Laboratory Test, Baseline Testing for Hep A/B	EA	4	No Bid	\$0.00	\$65.00	\$260.00	\$70.00	\$280.00
151 Laboratory Test, Baseline Testing for Hep C	EA	4	No Bid	\$0.00	\$24.00	\$96.00	\$21.00	\$84.00
152 Laboratory Test, Hep B Titer	EA	50	No Bid	\$0.00	\$20.00	\$1,000.00	\$18.00	\$900.00
153 Hep A Vaccine (per dose)	EA	30	No Bid	\$0.00	\$80.00	\$2,400.00	\$80.00	\$2,400.00
154 Hep B Vaccine (per dose)	EA	30	No Bid	\$0.00	\$35.00	\$1,050.00	\$55.00	\$1,650.00
155 TwinRix Vaccine (per dose)	EA	50	No Bid	\$0.00	\$78.00	\$3,900.00	\$105.00	\$5,250.00
156 MMR Vaccine	EA	4	No Bid	\$0.00	\$50.00	\$200.00	\$95.00	\$380.00
157 Chest X-Ray (PA only)	EA	4	No Bid	\$0.00	\$30.00	\$120.00	\$70.00	\$280.00
158 X-Ray Lumbosacral Spine (3 views)	EA	4	No Bid	\$0.00	\$60.00	\$240.00	\$100.00	\$400.00
159 Back Screen/Evaluation (need determined by essential job functions - only in conjunction with Medical Examination by Physician)	EA	10	No Bid	\$0.00	\$20.00	\$200.00	\$15.00	\$150.00
160 DOT Physical	EA	56	No Bid	\$0.00	\$35.00	\$1,960.00	\$60.00	\$3,360.00
161 Flu Vaccine	EA	30	No Bid	\$0.00	\$20.00	\$600.00	\$25.00	\$750.00
162 Diagnostic Test, Stress Test	EA	10	No Bid	\$0.00	\$100.00	\$1,000.00	\$275.00	\$2,750.00
(Group XI) SUBTOTAL				\$0.00		\$16,976.00		\$20,434.00
Group XII - Training								
163 On Site Instructor, DOT Supervisor Training	EA	1	No Bid	\$0.00	\$500.00	\$500.00	\$150.00	\$150.00
164 On Site Instructor, Infectious Disease Control	EA	1	No Bid	\$0.00	\$150.00	\$150.00	\$150.00	\$150.00
(Group XII) SUBTOTAL				\$0.00		\$650.00		\$300.00
(All Groups) TOTAL				\$396,812.00		\$739,484.60		\$1,211,216.00