

Vendor	Size	Make	Model	Per unit price	Extended Price	Total
Egg PC	15	SVA	VR-15E	259.00	10,101.00	43,208.00
	17	A-Open	F75PS	359.00	31,951.00	
	19	AOC	LM-914	578.00	1,156.00	
SDF Professional Computers, Inc.	15	KDS	RAD-SC	265.00	10,335.00	43,732.00
	17	KDS	RAD-7GS	363.00	32,307.00	
	19	KDS	RAD-9P	545.00	1,090.00	
JPK Micro Supply, Inc.	15	Microtek	C593	275.00	10,725.00	43,777.00
	17	Microtek	C783GM	358.00	31,862.00	
	19	Advueu	190DT	595.00	1,190.00	
Southern Computer Warehouse	15	Hyundai	L505.29	270.63	10,554.57	44,033.35
	17	Hyundai	L705.26	363.24	32,328.36	
	19	Hyundai	L90D.29	575.21	1,150.42	
Shea PC	15	SVA-VR15E	VR15E	258.00	10,062.00	44,488.00
	17	Viewsonic	Q170	374.00	33,286.00	
	19	AOC	LM914	570.00	1,140.00	
Haynes E-Government Resources	15	Hewlett Packard	L15022TONE	281.00	10,959.00	45,334.00
	17	Hewlett Packard	L1702	373.00	33,197.00	
	19	Hewlett Packard	L17925-TC099	589.00	1,178.00	
Network Engineering Solutions, Inc.	15	Hewlett Packard	L1502	281.00	10,959.00	45,334.00
	15	Hewlett Packard	L1530	300.00	33,197.00	
	17	Hewlett Packard	L1702	373.00	1,178.00	
PCMC	15	Microtek	C593	278.00	10,842.00	46,497.00
	17	Northgate	VT7V71	385.00	34,265.00	
	19	CTX	C962A	695.00	1,390.00	
Network Engineering Solutions, Inc.	17	Hewlett Packard	L1925	385.00	11,700.00	47,143.00
	19	Hewlett Packard	L1730	589.00	34,265.00	
	19	Hewlett Packard	L1925	589.00	1,178.00	
CompUSA	15	Microtek	C593	269.63	10,515.57	47,247.10
	17	Microtek	710S	399.05	35,515.45	
	19	CTX	5962A	608.04	1,216.08	
Data America	15	Microtek	C593	272.50	10,627.00	47,411.72
	17	Microtek	710S	399.98	35,598.00	
	19	Cornea		593.00	1,186.00	
Sigma Systems, Inc	15	Microtek	C593	271.50	10,588.50	47,603.20
	17	Microtek	710S	402.30	35,804.70	
	19	Microtek	C997	605.00	1,210.20	
WYSIWYG The Computer Center	15	NEC	LCD1560V+BK	313.00	12,207.00	48,560.00
	17	Microtek	1104-03-990177	395.00	35,155.00	
	19	Cornea	CT1904B	599.00	1,198.00	
Gateway Companies, Inc	15	Gateway	15" LCD	300.00	11,700.00	48,742.00
	17	Gateway	17" LCD	402.00	35,778.00	
	19	Gateway	19" LCD	632.00	1,264.00	
Business Technology Center	15	Microtek	C593	278.50	10,861.50	48,985.85
	17	Microtek	710S	412.65	36,725.85	
	19	CTX	SV900MD	699.25	1,398.50	
Multiwave	15	Microtek	C593	283.50	11,056.50	48,997.20
	17	Microtek	C783GM	426.30	37,940.70	
	19	No-Bid	No-Bid	No-Bid	No Bid	
Compserve	15	Microtek	C593	280.00	10,920.00	49,065.00
	17	Microtek	710S	415.00	36,935.00	
	19	Microtek	C997	605.00	1,210.00	

Vendor	Size	Make	Model	Per unit price	Extended Price	Total
Megabyte International	15	Microtek	C593	285.60	11,138.40	49,245.40
	17	Microtek	C783GM	413.80	36,828.20	
	19	Microtek	C997SD	639.40	1,278.80	
Data Solutions	15	Microtek	C593	297.41	11,598.99	49,299.94
	17	Microtek	C783GM	410.16	36,504.60	
	19	Microtek	C9975D	598.17	1,196.35	
CSS Laboratories	15	Microtek	C593	284.00	11,076.00	49,382.00
	17	Microtek	715C	418.00	37,202.00	
	19	Microtek	V95	552.00	1,104.00	
Custom Fit, Inc	15	Microtek		282.00	10,998.00	49,427.00
	17	Microtek		417.00	37,113.00	
	19	Microtek		658.00	1,016.00	
Troxell Communications	15	Microtek	C593	284.00	11,076.00	49,433.00
	17	Microtek	C177	417.00	37,113.00	
	19	Samsung	193S	622.00	1,244.00	
Information Service NY, Inc.	15	Ben Q	FP557SVER2	344.99	13,454.16	49,463.25
	17	Ben Q	FP731	389.99	34,709.11	
	19	NEC-Mitsubishi	ASLCD9V	649.99	1,299.98	
Q Systems Computers	15	Microtek	C593	287.00	11,193.00	49,859.00
	17	Microtek	C783GM	418.00	37,202.00	
	19	Sony	SDM-X93	732.00	1,464.00	
Global Gov't Education Solutions	15	Microtek	C593	294.75	11,495.25	50,319.72
	17	Microtek	C783GM	436.23	38,824.47	
	19	No-Bid	No-Bid	No-Bid	No-Bid	
Amherst Technologies	15	Samsung	Sync Master 152N	359.00	14,001.00	52,448.50
	17	Samsung	Sync Master 173S	418.50	37,246.50	
	19	Samsung	Sync Master 193S	600.00	1,201.00	
Boulder Corporation	15	Iiyama	E383-W/B	325.55	12,696.45	55,583.80
	17	Ben Q	FP767VER2	466.65	41,531.85	
	19	Viewsonic	VG900B	677.75	1,355.50	
Tek Visions	15		710A	375.00	14,625.00	58,250.00
	17		821A	475.00	42,275.00	
	19			675.00	1,350.00	